BID RESULTS

CKO9MERCER2019-23 DIESEL FUEL AND WINTER MIX AND DEF FOR THE COUNTY OF MERCER AND THE MERCER COUNTY COOPERATIVE MEMBERS

BID OPENING DATE: OCTOBER 8,2019

NUMBER OF RESPONDENTS

4

NAME OF BIDDER

PETROLEUM TRADERS CORPORATION

RIGGINS, INC.

MAJESTIC OIL COMPANY, INC.

J. SWANTON FUEL OIL CO., INC.

ADDRESS

PO BOX 2357

3938 S. MAIN STREET

2104 FAIRFAX AVENUE

37 CENTER AVENUE

CITY, STATE, ZIP

FORT WAYNE, IN 46801

VINELAND, NJ 08360

CHERRY HILL, NJ 08003

ATLANTIC HIGHLANDS, NJ 07716

CONTACT GAYLE NEWTON STEVEN RIGGINS LISA D. TILORY JIM ANDERSON
TELEPHONE 888-637-7661 856- 825- 7600 856 -751- 8801 732 -708- 0075

FAX 260 -203 -3820 856 -825- 2270 856 -751 -8824 732-708-0175

E-MAIL GNEWTON@PETROLEUMTRADERS.COM RPRIGGINS@RIGGINSOIL.COM MAJESTICOILNJ@GMAIL.COM CUSTOMERSERVICE@SWANTONFUEL.COM
WILL EXTEND TO THE COOP MEMBERS YES NO YES YES

ADDENDUM ONE & TWO

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

INSURANCE CERTIFICATE

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

IRAN CERTIFICATION

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

INDEMNIFICATION AND INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP DISCLOSURE

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION

oK

oK

OK

OK

EIC

23095 EXPIRES 6.15.22

2940 EXPIRES 11.15.19

7090 EXPIRES 3.15.20

44199 EXPIRES 10.15.23

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

EXHIBIT A

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

HOLD BEYOND 60 DAYS

YES

YES

NO

YES

CONTINUITY OF SERVICE

YES.INCLUDED

YES, INCLUDED

YES, INCLUDED

YES, INCLUDED

EMERGENCY SERVICE FOR COUNTY OF MERCER

YES

YES

YES

YES

VARIOUS TO INCLUDE GLOBAL,

BIDDER'S SOURCE OF SUPPLY BUCKEYE, SUN COMPANY, VALERO, PBF PBFX PAULSBORO SUNOCO, UNITED ENERGY PRODUCTS SHELL,GULF,BUCKEYE, SUNOCO
ETC.

EXCEPTIONS YES NONE NONE NONE

FATAL FLAW NO NO NO NO
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CKO9MERCER2019-23 DIESEL FUEL AND WINTER MIX AND DEF FOR THE COUNTY OF MERCER AND THE MERCER COUNTY COOPERATIVE MEMBERS

PETROLEUM TRADERS CORP. RIGGINS , INC. MAJESTIC OIL COMPANY J. SWANTON FUEL CO.
OPIS PRODUCTION, OIL PRICE DAILY SEPTEMBER 10,2019; ULS DIESEL, AVERAGE OF HIGH
AND LOW PHILADELPHIA PRICING
285,000 GALLONS DIESEL FOR THE COUNTY OF MERCER
105,600 GALLONS PARK COMMISSION
1.97885
POSTED PRICE PER GALLON ON SEPTEMBER 10,2019; AVERAGE BETWEEN 2.0152 AND 1.9425 1.97885 1.97885 1.97885 1.97885
'E)AIT'I:IIEJ/ET_Y) CHARGE OR DISCOUNT PER GALLON AS INDICATED BY EITHER A PLUS (+) OR 0.06150 0.03400 0.05060 0.03140
TOTAL PRICE (A PLUS B) PER GALLON FOR COOP MEMBERS 2.04035 2.01285 2.02945 2.01025
TOTAL COST FOR 390,600 GALLONS FOR THE COUNTY OF MERCER'S REQUIREMENTS 796,960.71 786,219.21 792,703.17 785,203.65
COST PER GALLON FOR WINTER MIX FOR COUNTY AND THE COOP MEMBERS
KEROSENE OR CHEMICAL CHEMICAL CHEMICAL CHEMICAL FUEL OX COLD FLOW
POSTED PRICE PER GALLON 1.97885 1.97885 1.97885 1.97885
'I?AIT'I::EJ/EIT_Y) CHARGE OR DISCOUNT PER GALLON AS INDICATED BY EITHER A PLUS (+) OR 0.08650 0.04900 0.069460 0.04140
TOTAL PRICE (A PLUS B) PER GALLON 2.06535 2.02785 2.04845 2.02025
COST OF DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID FOR THE COUNTY OF MERCER AND COOP
5,000 GALLONS OF DEF FOR THE COUNTY OF MERCER, MOTOR POOL
30 GALLONS DIESEL FOR THE COUNTY OF MERCER, PARK COMMISSION
COST PER GALLON INCLUDING DELIVERY NO BID 1.58 NO BID 2.44
TOTAL COST FOR 5,030 GALLONS NO BID 7,947 .40 NO BID 12,273.20




