
NUMBER OF RESPONDENTS 2

NAME OF BIDDER RISE& GO CATERING CAFÉ DU PAIN BAKERY, LLC 

ADDRESS 101 SCALES PLAZA 2495 BRUNSWICK PIKE UNIT 12

CITY, STATE, ZIP CLIFTON, NJ 07013 LAWRENCEVILLE, NJ 08648

CONTACT CHRISTOPHER CONOSCIENTI JUDITH REGISTRE/MARIE ONYEANI

TELEPHONE 201-957-5727 609-323-7555

WEBSITE OR E-MAIL RISEANDGO@GMAIL.COM JUDITHE@CAFEDUPAINBAKERY,COM 

ADDENDUM NO ONE SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

INSURANCE AND INDEMNIFICATIONS REQUIREMENTS SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

INSURANCE CERTIFICATE REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED 

BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK

EIC REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED 

EXHIBIT A REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED 

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP DISCLOSURE SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

IRAN CERT SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS YES YES 

REFERENCES INCLUDED INCLUDED 

SERVSAFE CERTIFCATE INCLUDED INCLUDED

SAMPLE MENU INCLUDED INCLUDED 

QUALIFICATION STATEMENT INCLUDED INCLUDED 

EXCEPTIONS NONE  NONE  

FATAL FLAW NO  NO  

RFP RESULTS

RFP 2019-08 CAFÉ SERVICES FOR 4TH FLOOR CAFETARIA 

PROPOSAL OPENING DATE: NOVEMBER 13,2019

mailto:RISEANDGO@GMAIL.COM
mailto:JUDITHE@CAFEDUPAINBAKERY,COM


BIDS RECEIVED 2

NAME OF BIDDER MOUNT CONSTRUCTION CO.INC. IEW CONSTRUCTION GROUP INC. 

ADDRESS 427 S. WHITE HORSE PIKE 75 SCULPTORS WAY 

CITY, STATE, ZIP BERLIN, NJ 08009 HAMILTON, NJ 08619

CONTACT MICHAEL MAZZERELLA HARRY W. COLEMAN JR

TELEPHONE 856 768 8493 609 586 5005

FAX 856 753 1453 609 586 0356

E-MAIL
MMAZZARELLA@MOUNTCONSTRUCTION.

COM 
H.COLEMAN@IEWCOMSTRUCTION.COM 

ADDENDUM NO ONE SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

ADDENDUM NO TWO SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

BID BOND
LIBERTY MUTUAL INSURANCE COMPANY 

10% NTE 20K

LIBERTY MUTUAL INSURANCE COMPANY 10% 

NTE 20K

CONSENT OF SURETY R.H SHEPHERD, JR. AIF WITH POA JOHN P. SEDOR, AIF WITH POA 

INSURANCE CERTIFICATE REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED 

INDEMNIFICATION AND INSURANCE SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

IRAN CERT SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

PREVAILING WAGE CERTIFICATION OK OK

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP DISCLOSURE SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

EXHIBIT B INCLUDED INCLUDED 

AA201 FORM REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED

PW CONTRACTOR REG. 605531 EXPIRES 6.5.20 605640 EXPIRES 5.08.20

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK

NON-COLLUSION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

SAFETY CERT SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

EQUIPMENT CERT SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

 THREE REFERENCES INCLUDED PC TO REVIEW INCLUDED PC TO REVIEW 

HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS YES YES 

TOTAL BID AMOUNT  $                                            1,895,093.20  $                                                    2,948,502.80 

EXCEPTIONS NONE NONE 

FATAL FLAW NO NO

BID RESULTS

AB2019-43B REBID OF MERCER MEADOWS UPLAND TRAIL IMPROVEMENTS AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS 

BID OPENING DATE:  NOVEMBER 14,2019

mailto:MMAZZARELLA@MOUNTCONSTRUCTION.COM
mailto:MMAZZARELLA@MOUNTCONSTRUCTION.COM
mailto:H.COLEMAN@IEWCOMSTRUCTION.COM


Item No. Description                Quantity Unit UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST 

2
FURNISH, INSTALL MAINTAIN AND REMOVE 

STABILZED CONSTRUCTION ENTRANCE 
1284 SY 20.05$               25,744.20$        57.00$           73,188.00$       

3
FURNISH, INSTALL MAINTAIN AND REMOVE SILT 

FENCING 
8790 LF 5.00$                 43,950.00$        8.00$                70,320.00$       

4
FURNISH, INSTALL MAINTAIN AND REMOVE 

STOCKPILING
2082 CY 30.00$               62,460.00$        99.00$           206,118.00$     

5
FURNISH, INSTALL AND MAINTAIN REMOVE  INLET 

FILTER PROTECTION 
1 EA 350.00$             350.00$             536.00$            536.00$            

6 FURNISH, INSTALL AND REMOVE HAYBALES 324 LF 15.00$               4,860.00$          16.00$           5,184.00$         

7
FURNISH INSTALL MAINTAIN AND REMOVE 

FLOATING TURBIDITY BARRIER 
1 LS 7,500.00$          7,500.00$          4,922.00$      4,922.00$         

8
FURNISH INSTALL MAINTAIN AND REMOVE 

STREAM DIVERSION 
1 LS 25,000.00$        25,000.00$        51,750.00$     51,750.00$       

9
FURNISH, INSTALL, MAINTAIN EROSION CONTROL 

MATTING 
1308 SY 5.00$                 6,540.00$          11.00$           14,388.00$       

10 FURNISH AND INSTALL RIP RAP 170 CY 150.00$             25,500.00$        1,529.00$      259,930.00$     

11 FURNISH AND INSTALL SCOUR HOLES 21 CY 1,000.00$          21,000.00$        1,324.00$      27,804.00$       

12 TOPSOIL STRIPPING 2093 CY 15.00$               31,395.00$        24.00$              50,232.00$       

13 FURNISH AND INSTALL PLUGS, COMPLETE 1318 SY 10.00$               13,180.00$        36.00$              47,448.00$       

14 FURNISH AND INSTALL SEEDING COMPLETE 120 MSF 300.00$             36,000.00$        712.00$            85,440.00$       

15
FURNISH AND INSTALL MEADOW VEGETATION, 

COMPLETE 
9.8 MSF 450.00$             4,410.00$          731.00$            7,163.80$         

16
FURNISH AND INSTALL CONCRETE (4" THICK) 

COMPLETE 
168 SY 150.00$             25,200.00$        119.00$            19,992.00$       

17
FURNISH AND INSTALL PRE CAST B INLET 

COMPLETE 
1 EA 5,000.00$          5,000.00$          6,906.00$         6,906.00$         

18 FURNISH AND INSTALL 24" HEADWALL COMPLETE 2 LF 5,000.00$          10,000.00$        6,650.00$         13,300.00$       

19 FURNISH AND INSTALL 24"  RCP PIPE COMPLETE 12 LF 150.00$             1,800.00$          122.00$            1,464.00$         

20 FURNISH AND INSTALL 20"  HEADWALL COMPLETE 2 EA 5,000.00$          10,000.00$        6,650.00$         13,300.00$       

21 FURNISH AND INSTALL 20" RCP PIPE COMPLETE 12 LF 150.00$             1,800.00$          116.00$            1,392.00$         

22 FURNISH AND INSTALL 18" HEADWALL  COMPLETE 4 EA 4,500.00$          18,000.00$        6,650.00$         26,600.00$       

23 FURNISH AND INSTALL 18" RCP PIPE COMPLETE 20 LF 150.00$             3,000.00$          120.00$            2,400.00$         

24 FURNISH AND INSTALL 15" HEADWALL  COMPLETE 2 EA 3,000.00$          6,000.00$          6,650.00$         13,300.00$       

25 FURNISH AND INSTALL 15" RCP PIPE  COMPLETE 10 LF 120.00$             1,200.00$          118.00$            1,180.00$         

26 FURNISH AND INSTALL 12" HEADWALL  COMPLETE 35 EA 120.00$             4,200.00$          6,646.00$         232,610.00$     

27 FURNISH AND INSTALL 12" RCP PIPE COMPLETE 76 LF 120.00$             9,120.00$          119.00$            9,044.00$         

28 FURNISH AND INSTALL 10" RCP PIPE COMPLETE 20 LF 120.00$             2,400.00$          99.00$              1,980.00$         

29
FURNISH AND INSTALL 10" HDPE DRAINAGE PIPE  

COMPLETE 
110 LF 120.00$             13,200.00$        110.00$            12,100.00$       

30
FURNISH AND INSTALL 8" HDPE DRAINAGE PIPE  

COMPLETE 
24 LF 100.00$             2,400.00$          91.00$              2,184.00$         

31
FURNISH AND INSTALL 10"  DUCTILE IRON PIPE, 

COMPLETE  
50 LF 150.00$             7,500.00$          132.00$            6,600.00$         

32 MILLING OF PAVEMENT (2" THICK) COMPLETE 6503 SY 5.00$                 32,515.00$        7.00$                45,521.00$       

33
HOT MIX ASPHALT 9.5 M64 SURFACE COURSE (1 

1/2 THICK ) COMPLETE 
180 TON 200.00$             36,000.00$        217.00$            39,060.00$       

34
HOT MIX ASPHALT 19M64 BASE COURSE (2 1/2 

THICK ) COMPLETE 
300 TON 200.00$             60,000.00$        203.00$            60,900.00$       

35
HOT MIX ASPHALT 9.5 M64 SURFACE COURSE (2 

THICK ) COMPLETE 
1101 TON 120.00$             132,120.00$      135.00$            148,635.00$     

36
HOT MIX ASPHALT 19M64 BASE COURSE (3 THICK 

) COMPLETE 
484 TON 120.00$             58,080.00$        169.00$            81,796.00$       

37
DENSE GRADED AGGREGATE BASE COURSE 4" 

THICK) COMPLETE 
5178 SY 15.00$               77,670.00$        8.00$                41,424.00$       

38 FULL DEPTH ASPHALT PAVEMENT REMOVAL 263 SY 40.00$               10,520.00$        67.00$              17,621.00$       

39 3" NJDOT #10 STONE, COMPLETE 26413 SF 3.00$                 79,239.00$        1.00$                26,413.00$       

40 GEOTEXTILE FABRIC, COMPLETE 2935 SY 4.00$                 11,740.00$        19.00$              55,765.00$       

41
PAINT TRAFFIC SYMBOLS AND 4" STRIPING 

COMPLETE 
1 LS 5,000.00$          5,000.00$          20,302.00$       20,302.00$       

42
FURNISH AND INSTALL PARKING SIGNS, 

COMPLETE 
5 EA 150.00$             750.00$             1,000.00$         5,000.00$         

43
FURNISH AND INSTALL TIMBER WHEELSTOPS, 

COMPLETE 
18 EA 75.00$               1,350.00$          560.00$            10,080.00$       

44
FURNISH AND INSTALL CONCRETE BOLLARDS, 

COMPLETE 
4 EA 1,000.00$          4,000.00$          2,100.00$         8,400.00$         

45 FULL DEPTH GRAVEL TRAIL REMOVAL 5305 LF 10.00$               53,050.00$        30.00$              159,150.00$     

46 FURNISH AND INSTALL 180" PREDESTRAIN BRIDGE 1 LS 500,000.00$      500,000.00$      524,000.00$      524,000.00$     

47 FURNISH AND INSTALL 3-SIDED CULVERT 1 LS 201,000.00$      201,000.00$      129,000.00$      129,000.00$     

48 REMOVE EXISTING CONRETE PIPE CULVERT 1 LS 50,000.00$        50,000.00$        27,200.00$       27,200.00$       

49 GUIDERAIL RELOCATION 95 LF 100.00$             9,500.00$          20.00$              1,900.00$         

50 GRADING 22025 SY 6.00$                 132,150.00$      12.00$              264,300.00$     

51
FURNISH , INSTALL, MAINTAIN AND REMOVE TREE 

ROTECTION FENCING 
780 LF 15.00$               11,700.00$        17.00$              13,260.00$       

AB2019-43B REBID OF MERCER MEADOWS UPLAND TRAIL IMPROVEMENTS  

PROPOSAL 
MOUNT CONSTRUCTION IEW CONSTRUCTION 

TOTAL  $                     1,895,093.20  $                      2,948,502.80 



NUMBER OF BIDDERS 11

BIDDERS LEVITT'SS LLC SYNATEK REED PERRINE SALES INC. MAIN POOL AND CHEMICAL COMPANY INC. FISHER + SON COMPANY INC. 
HELENA AGRI-ENTERPRISES, LLC. NORTHEAST 

SPECIALTY WAREHOUSE

ADDRESS 621 EDWARDS ROAD 737 HAGEY CENTER DR UNIT A P.O BOX 100 MAIN STREET 110 COMMERCE ROAD 110 SUMMIT DRIVE 4 KILLDEER COURT SUITE 100

CITY, STATE, ZIP PARSIPPANY, NJ 04054 SOUDERTON, PA 18964 TENNENT, NJ 07763 DUPONT, PA 18641 EXTON, PA 19341 SWEDESBORO, NJ 08085

CONTACT BARRY LEVITT RACHEL MURPHY ROBERT BULKONSKI THOMAS O'MALLEY ROBERT JOHNSON NICK ADAMS

TELEPHONE 973.227.0552 267.203.1620 732.446.6363 570.655.7211 800.262.2127 856.241.2070

FAX 973.227.3174 267.203.1613 732.446.1344 570.655.7488 610.363.0563 856.241.2086

EMAIL BARRY@LEVITTSLLC.COM MGRUBMAN@SYNATEKSOLUTIONS.COM BOBB@REEDANDPERRINE.COM SANDY@MAINPOOLCHEMICAL.COM BIDS@FISHERANDSON.COM ADAMSN@HELENAGRI.COM

EXTEND TO COOP YES YES YES YES YES YES

CERTIFICATION TO HOLD SIXTY DAYS YES YES YES YES YES YES

CONTINUITY OF SERVICE DURING EMERGENCIES YES YES YES YES DID NOT CHECK YES OR NO YES

NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK OK OK OK OK

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP OK OK OK OK OK OK

NON-COLLUSION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

EIC 42457 EXPIRES 8.15.22 36716 EXPIRES 4.15.26 8058 EXPIRES 5.15.26 32670 EXPIRES 7.15.23 14339 EXPIRES 5.15.21 11885 EXPIRES 8/15/20

EXHIBIT A INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED OK

IRAN CERTIFICATION OK OK OK OK OK OK

INSURANCE INDEMNIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE INCLUDED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED

EXECUTIVE  ORDER 98-1 SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED

EXCEPTIONS NONE NONE NONE NONE SEE EXCEPTIONS PAGE NONE

FATAL FLAW NO NO NO NO NO NO

RESPONDENT SEETON TURF WAREHOUSE, LLC GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS, INC. NUTRIEN AG SOLUTIONS INC. PLANT FOOD COMPANY INC. ALL UNIQUE GIFTS T/A TURF TRADE

ADDRESS 25 ROLAND AVENUE 4 MIDDLEBURY BLVD SUITE 7 1470 JERSEY AVE 38 HIGHTSTOWN- CRANBURY STATION RD 517 FRANKLINVILLE ROAD

CITY, STATE, ZIP MOUNT LAUREL,NJ 08054 RANDOLPH, NJ 07869 NORTH BRUNSWICK, NJ 08902 CRANBURY, NJ 08512 MULLICA HILL, NJ 08062

CONTACT LANDON T. SEETON KEITH E. KUBIK THOMAS HUGHES THEODORE T. PLATZ KATHY CONARD

TELEPHONE 856.273.5939 973 252 6634 732 735 5092 609 448 0935 609.477.0471

FAX 856.273.0998 973 252 6630 888 883 3070 609 443 8038

EMAIL BILLC@SEETONTURF.COM KEITH.KUBIK@GRITURF.COM TOM.HUGHES@NUTRIEN.COM SBEREZANSKY@PLANTFOODCO.COM KATHYC@THETURFTRADE.COM

EXTEND TO COOP YES YES YES YES YES

CERTIFICATION TO HOLD SIXTY DAYS YES YES YES YES YES

CONTINUITY OF SERVICE DURING EMERGENCIES YES YES YES YES YES

NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK OK OK REQUIRED IF AWARDED

STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE OK OK OK OK OK

NON-COLLUSION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

EIC 32194 EXPIRES 04.15.23 11885 EXPIRES 08.15.20 38168 EXPIRES 01.15.21 28913 EXPIRES 08.15.21

EXHIBIT A INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED 

IRAN CERTIFICATION OK OK OK OK OK

INSURANCE INDEMNIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED

EXECUTIVE  ORDER 98-1 SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

EXCEPTIONS YES, PC TO REVIEW NONE YES, PC TO REVIEW NONE NONE

FATAL FLAW NO NO NO NO NO

BID RESULTS

CK09MERCER2019-29 GOLF COURSE AND PARK MAINTENANCE MATERIALS FOR THE MERCER COUNTY PARK COMMISSION AND SEWAGE TREATMENT CHEMICALS FOR THE MERCER COUNTY CORRECTION CENTER AND THE MERCER COUNTY COOPERATIVE CONTRACT PURCHASING SYSTEM FOR A PERIOD OF ONE (1) YEAR 

NOVEMBER 14,2019

mailto:BARRY@LEVITTSLLC.COM
mailto:MGRUBMAN@SYNATEKSOLUTIONS.COM
mailto:BOBB@REEDANDPERRINE.COM
mailto:SANDY@MAINPOOLCHEMICAL.COM
mailto:BIDS@FISHERANDSON.COM
mailto:ADAMSN@HELENAGRI.COM
mailto:BILLC@SEETONTURF.COM
mailto:KEITH.KUBIK@GRITURF.COM
mailto:TOM.HUGHES@NUTRIEN.COM
mailto:SBEREZANSKY@PLANTFOODCO.COM
mailto:KATHYC@THETURFTRADE.COM


ITEM NO. PRODUCT DESCRIPTION COUNTY SIZE 

REQUIREMENT

UNIT COST BASED 

UPON COUNTY 

SIZE/PACKAGING

IF BIDDING AN EQUIVALENT 

PRODUCT, STATE NAME 

BELOW AND SUMBIT 

PRODUCT CUT SHEET WITH 

BID

BIDDER'S 

PACKAGING 

IF NOT 

CONSISENT 

WITH 

COLUMN C

BIDDER'S UNIT COST 

IF PACKAGING IS 

NOT CONSISTENT 

WITH COUNTY'S 

PACKAGING

UNIT COST 

BASED 

UPON 

COUNTY 

SIZE/PACKA

GING

IF BIDDING AN EQUIVALENT PRODUCT, 

STATE NAME BELOW AND SUMBIT 

PRODUCT CUT SHEET WITH BID

BIDDER'S 

PACKAGING 

IF NOT 

CONSISENT 

WITH 

COLUMN C

BIDDER'S UNIT COST 

IF PACKAGING IS 

NOT CONSISTENT 

WITH COUNTY'S 

PACKAGING

UNIT COST BASED 

UPON COUNTY 

SIZE/PACKAGING

IF BIDDING AN 

EQUIVALENT PRODUCT, 

STATE NAME BELOW AND 

SUMBIT PRODUCT CUT 

SHEET WITH BID

BIDDER'S 

PACKAGING IF 

NOT CONSISENT 

WITH COLUMN C

BIDDER'S UNIT COST 

IF PACKAGING IS 

NOT CONSISTENT 

WITH COUNTY'S 

PACKAGING

UNIT COST BASED 

UPON COUNTY 

SIZE/PACKAGING

IF BIDDING AN 

EQUIVALENT PRODUCT, 

STATE NAME BELOW AND 

SUMBIT PRODUCT CUT 

SHEET WITH BID

BIDDER'S 

PACKAGING IF 

NOT CONSISENT 

WITH COLUMN C

BIDDER'S UNIT 

COST IF 

PACKAGING IS 

NOT CONSISTENT 

WITH COUNTY'S 

PACKAGING

UNIT COST BASED 

UPON COUNTY 

SIZE/PACKAGING

IF BIDDING AN EQUIVALENT 

PRODUCT, STATE NAME BELOW 

AND SUMBIT PRODUCT CUT 

SHEET WITH BID

BIDDER'S 

PACKAGING IF NOT 

CONSISENT WITH 

COLUMN C

BIDDER'S UNIT 

COST IF 

PACKAGING IS 

NOT 

CONSISTENT 

WITH COUNTY'S 

PACKAGING

UNIT COST BASED 

UPON COUNTY 

SIZE/PACKAGING

IF BIDDING AN 

EQUIVALENT 

PRODUCT, STATE 

NAME BELOW AND 

SUMBIT PRODUCT CUT 

SHEET WITH BID

BIDDER'S 

PACKAGING IF NOT 

CONSISENT WITH 

COLUMN C

BIDDER'S UNIT COST 

IF PACKAGING IS 

NOT CONSISTENT 

WITH COUNTY'S 

PACKAGING

UNIT COST BASED 

UPON COUNTY 

SIZE/PACKAGING

IF BIDDING AN 

EQUIVALENT PRODUCT, 

STATE NAME BELOW 

AND SUMBIT PRODUCT 

CUT SHEET WITH BID

BIDDER'S 

PACKAGING IF NOT 

CONSISENT WITH 

COLUMN C

BIDDER'S UNIT COST IF 

PACKAGING IS NOT 

CONSISTENT WITH 

COUNTY'S PACKAGING

UNIT COST BASED 

UPON COUNTY 

SIZE/PACKAGING

IF BIDDING AN 

EQUIVALENT PRODUCT, 

STATE NAME BELOW AND 

SUMBIT PRODUCT CUT 

SHEET WITH BID

BIDDER'S PACKAGING IF 

NOT CONSISENT WITH 

COLUMN C

BIDDER'S UNIT COST IF 

PACKAGING IS NOT 

CONSISTENT WITH 

COUNTY'S 

PACKAGING

UNIT COST BASED 

UPON COUNTY 

SIZE/PACKAGING

IF BIDDING AN EQUIVALENT PRODUCT, 

STATE NAME BELOW AND SUMBIT 

PRODUCT CUT SHEET WITH BID

BIDDER'S PACKAGING IF NOT CONSISENT 

WITH COLUMN C

BIDDER'S UNIT 

COST IF 

PACKAGING IS 

NOT CONSISTENT 

WITH COUNTY'S 

PACKAGING

UNIT COST BASED UPON 

COUNTY 

SIZE/PACKAGING

IF BIDDING AN 

EQUIVALENT PRODUCT, 

STATE NAME BELOW AND 

SUMBIT PRODUCT CUT 

SHEET WITH BID

BIDDER'S PACKAGING IF 

NOT CONSISENT WITH 

COLUMN C

BIDDER'S UNIT COST IF 

PACKAGING IS NOT 

CONSISTENT WITH 

COUNTY'S PACKAGING

UNIT COST BASED 

UPON COUNTY 

SIZE/PACKAGING

IF BIDDING AN 

EQUIVALENT 

PRODUCT, STATE 

NAME BELOW AND 

SUMBIT PRODUCT 

CUT SHEET WITH 

BID

BIDDER'S 

PACKAGING IF NOT 

CONSISENT WITH 

COLUMN C

BIDDER'S UNIT COST IF 

PACKAGING IS NOT 

CONSISTENT WITH 

COUNTY'S PACKAGING

FOLLOWING ITEMS FOR THE MERCER COUNTY PARK COMMISSION

1 W eed and Feed 50 LB BAG NO BID NO BID 16.94$                            18-0-2 W /.81% TRIMEC 50# NO BID 22.00$                                15-0-8 W / MILLENIUM NO BID NO BID  LEBANON PROSCAPE 20 0 

7 25% METHEX TRIMEC 
40 LB BAG $17.65 NO BID NO BID 16.25$                              22-0-4 W / 25% 

PCSCU, TRIMEC 

2 18-0-4 w ith .17% Dimension, 20%SCU 50 LB BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 16.00$                                17-0-0 .15 DIMENSION NO BID $22.00 $22.70  LEBANON PROSCAPE 15-0-

5 40%  .15 DIMENSION 
NO BID NO BID 20.50$                             

 18-0-6 W / 30% 

PCSCU,.15% 

DIMENSION 

3 Pellet ized Lime 50 LB BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 4.50$                                 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 4.75$                      

4 Hi Cal Lime applied at 1 ton is adequate for 1 acre Ton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 298.00$                           20 ACRE MINIMUM FOR APPLICATION ON OPEN FIELD AREA ONLY 298.00$                     NO BID NO BID

5 20-10-10 w ith corn micronutrient package 50 LB BAG NO BID NO BID 13.45$                            REED PERRINE BRAND  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 15.20$                             15.20$                        NO BID NO BID

6 10-20-20 w ith corn micronutrient package 50 LB BAG NO BID NO BID 14.90$                            REED PERRINE BRAND  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 16.30$                             16.30$                        NO BID NO BID

7 20-0-8 50% organic 50 LB BAG NO BID NO BID  $                            14.95  REED PERRINE BRAND  NO BID 11.00$                                18-2-4 50 % ORGANIC NO BID NO BID $15.70  LEBANON PRO 25-0-6 30% 

PCU 2%FE BIOSOLIDS 
NO BID NO BID NO BID

8 Propiconazole 4x 1gal/case 270.00$                         PROPICONAZOLE 14.3 NO BID NO BID NO BID  DORADO  2X2 GALLON 250.40$                  2X2 .5 GAL 219.95$                        NO BID SYNGENTA DORADO  2X2 GALLONS/CASE $237.00 NO BID 232.00$                                     PROPICONAZIE 

14.3 
2X2.5 GAL/CS 192.50$                                   

9 Fluazinam 2x 2.5gal/cs 2,300.00$                      FLUAZINAM 40 SC  2,050.00$    NO BID NO BID 2,100.00$                        1,807.45$                          ROTATOR 4X1 GAL/CASE $1,596.00 $3,085.00 SYNGENTA SECURE NO BID 1,980.00$                                $1,875.00

10 Clorothalonil720 2x 2.5gal 230.00$                         CHLOROTHALONIL 72D 205.00$        NO BID NO BID 180.00$                             ECHO 199.95$                              $320.00  SYNGENTA DACONIL 

W EATHERSTIK 
NO BID 188.00$                                    $190.00

11 Dimension  2x 2.5gal/case NO BID 1,077.50$    NO BID NO BID 1,077.50$                        1,077.50$                          $1,077.50 $1,077.50  DOW  (CORTEVA) 

DIMENSION 2EW  
NO BID NO BID $1,077.50

12 Xzemplar 2x 114oz/cs NO BID 2,952.60$    NO BID NO BID 3,691.32$                        2,872.60$                          $2,952.60 $2,952.60 PER SPEC NO BID 2,952.60$                                $2,952.60

13 Merit  75W SP 4x 4x 1.16oz NO BID NO BID  CS NO BID 64.00$                                ZENITH 62.22$                                CRITERION 75 W SP NO BID $70.00 PROKOZ ZENITH 75W SP NO BID NO BID $64.00  CRITERION 75W SP 

(SYNGENTA) 

14 Primo Max x 2x 1gal/cs  TRIN-PAC SELECT  2X1 GAL  275.00$                        NO BID 206.52$                         GROOM 2X1 GR/CS NO BID 580.00$                            580.00$                              NO BID $250.00  SYNGENTA PODIUM NO BID NO BID $205.00  TNEX (QUALI  PRO) 

15 Signature 4x 5.5lb/cs  FOSAL SELECT 4X5.5
353.00$                        NO BID NO BID NO BID 660.00$                            

8X5 .5 LB
1,220.00$                    NO BID  PER SPEC   44 POUND CASE 

$1,220.00 NO BID NO BID $299.50  FOSETYL-AL 80 

W DG (QUALI  PRO) 
16 Chlorpy rifos 2x 2.5gal/case 273.00$                         CHLORPYILOS 4E NO BID NO BID NO BID 235.00$                            249.95$                              NO BID  NO BID NO BID 230.00$                                    $235.00

17 Mefanox am 2x 1gal/case NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 740.00$                            699.98$                              NO BID $1,076.00  SYNGENTA SUBDUE MAXX NO BID NO BID $335.00

18 Max t ima 4x 26oz/cs NO BID 728.00$        NO BID NO BID 728.00$                            728.00$                              728.00$                           $728.00  PER SPEC NO BID NO BID $728.00

19 Py lex 4oz. Bott le NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 255.84$                            255.84$                              $255.84                                   255.84  PER SPEC NO BID 255.84$                                    $255.84

20 Cheetah Pro 2x 2.5gal/case X-OUT 2X2.5 280.00$                        NO BID NO BID NO BID 284.20$                            224.95$                              800.00$                           284.00$                              PER SPEC NO BID NO BID 263.15$                          

21 Lex icon 4x 21oz/cs NO BID 2,003.40$    NO BID NO BID 2,003.40$                        2,003.40$                          2,003.40$                       2,003.40$                          PER SPEC NO BID 2,003.40$                                2,003.40$                      

22 Celero 1lb bott le NO BID 165.00$        NO BID NO BID 173.80$                            173.80$                              173.80$                           $173.80  PER SPEC NO BID 177.58$                                    $173.80

23 Acelpryn 750ml NO BID 1,011.50$     .5 GAL JUG 1,011.50$                    NO BID NO BID 1,011.50$                         2 QT 1,011.50$                    NO BID  PER SPEC (SYNGENTA 

ACELEPRYN) 
 64 FL. OZ. JUG 1,011.50$                           NO BID NO BID $1,011.50 64 OZ $1,011.50

24 Threesome 2x 2.5gal/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 117.50$                            
VESSEL

101.95$                              MECAMINE D 159.00$                           UTA IP238 $134.00  PROKOZ VESSEL NO BID NO BID $97.50  TRIMEC 992 

25 Ronstar G 50 LB BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 78.00$                               NO BID NO BID $80.00  PER SPEC NO BID 60.50$                                       $75.00

26 Iprodione 2x 2.5gal/case 300.00$                         IPRODIONE 2F NO BID NO BID NO BID 194.00$                             CHIPCO 26019 232.20$                              NO BID $250.00  BAYER CHIPCO 26019 FLO NO BID NO BID $188.75  CHIPCO 26019 FLO 

(BAYER) 

27 Honor 6x 3lbs/case NO BID 2,707.74$    NO BID NO BID 2,707.74$                        2,707.74$                          $2,707.74 $2,707.74  PER SPEC NO BID 2,707.74$                                451.29$                          

28 Earthw orks Replenish 5-4-5 SGN 90 50 LB BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 30.00$                               29.75$                                GROGANICS 5-4-5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

29 Earthw orks Replenish 8-2-2 SGN 160 50 LB BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 22.00$                               NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

30 Earthw orks Renovate Plus 50 LB BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 40.00$                               NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

31 Grren T Impulse 4-0-0 2x 2.5gal/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID 167.50$                           167.50$                     NO BID NO BID

32 Armortech 45 2x 2.5gal/case NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 250.00$                            NO BID NO BID NO BID 95.00$                             
 ELEMAX FOLIAR 

PHOSHPITE 0-28-26 

(HELENA) 
33 Ecolite 50 LB BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 16.00$                               NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID 67.50$                              HYDRA HUME DG 

(HELENA) 

34 Bio Mas + Si, 25lb pail NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID 375.00$                                    

35 28-8-18 Soluble/ Sprayable 25lb bag NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 250.00$                           $34.25  PER SPEC (PLANT MARVEL 

BENT SPECIAL) 
NO BID 26.50$                                       $22.00  PRO SOL 

36 Hydrat ion A plus 2x 2.5gal/ case NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID 293.00$                           293.00$                     NO BID 240.00$                           FIRM UP (HELENA) 

37 Sea 3 275 gal Tote NO BID 14,500.00$  BRANDT SEAW OOD MAX  5 GAL CASE $52.77 PER GAL NO BID NO BID 7,825.00$                        NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID

38 Sugar Cal 2x 2.5gal/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 150.00$                             REGEN-ECAL NO BID NO BID  NO BID 118.00$                           118.00$                     NO BID  AXILO CA 8 X 5 LB/CS 340.00$                                   

39 Liquid Fert ilizer 9-0-0 Ca Ton NO BID 585.00$        NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID 567.00$                           567.00$                     NO BID  TRACITE 6% CA 4-0-

0 
2X2.5 GAL/CS 50.00$                                      

40 26-6-12, 50%SRN 50 LB BAG NO BID NO BID 14.90$                           REED PERRINE BRAND NO BID 14.00$                               28-0-3 50% XCU NO BID NO BID  NO BID 22.30$                             26-6-12 50% UFLEXX W / 1% S 50LB BAG 22.30$                        NO BID $17.00
 24-0-10 W /40% 

SRN, AXILLO 

MINORS  

41 12-3-12 liquid fert ilizer 50%SRN 2x 2.5gal/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 50.00$                               18-3-6 50% SRN NO BID NO BID  NO BID $62.95 $62.95 NO BID 62.50$                              CORON 14-2-14 

50% SRN 

42 Polyphosphite 30 2x 2.5 gal/case NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 90.00$                               IMMUNIPHITE 0-0-26 72.20$                                STARPHITE NO BID  $                              122.50  BRANDT GRO-PHITE 0-0-25 149.00$                           149.00$                     145.00$                                    AMINOPHYTE 95.00$                             
 ELEMAX FOLIAR 

PHOSHPITE 0-28-26 

(HELENA) 

43 Athlet ic Field grass seed mix , TTTF, KBG, PR 50 LB BAG ATHLETIC  50 LB BAG 79.65$                          NO BID 69.95$                           DROUGHT 80 NO BID 70.00$                               PERFORMANCE MIX 67.95$                                70.00$                              $                                 81.00 
 LEBANON PROSCAPE 

SPORTS TURF MIX 
NO BID NO BID 84.00$                             

44 Perrenial Rye, KBG mix 50 LB BAG BLUE/RYE 50/50 50 LB BAG 99.00$                          NO BID 72.25$                           S HOLD CASE NO BID 94.00$                               GOAL 86.45$                                119.00$                            $                                 81.50  GRI  75/25 SEED MIX NO BID NO BID NO BID

45 Fairw ay  Bentgrass blend 25 LB BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 160.00$                            PROGRESSER 157.75$                              210.00$                           NOBLE CENTERCUT  $                              164.00 
 LEBANON PATRIOT 

BENTGRASS 
NO BID NO BID NO BID

46 Perrenial Rye GLS resistant 50 LB BAG PANGEA GLR 50 LB BAG 63.00$                          NO BID NO BID NO BID 64.00$                               TOURNAMENT I I 59.79$                                77.00$                             PERFORMANCE RYE  $                                 66.50 
 A-LIST APPROVED TRIFECTA 

GLSR PER. RYE BLEND 
NO BID NO BID NO BID

47 007 Bentgrass 25 LB BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 360.00$                            261.25$                              275.00$                           LUMINARY  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

48 Bunker sand GC300 Ton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

49  Tee and Fairw ay  Divot Mix   6-2-2 Ton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

50  Green Divot Mix Ton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID 325.00$                                    365.00$                           FERTILE SOIL 
51 USGA Greens topdressing 100% sand Ton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

52 Beam Clay  Baseball Diamond Mix Ton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

53 Beam Clay  3/16" Red W arning Track mix Ton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

54  Infield Condit ioner 50 LB BAG NO BID 10.00$           10.75$                             MR. MAGIC 11.00$                               NO BID 18.00$                             11.55$                                 PROFILE TURFACE MVP NO BID NO BID NO BID

55  Infield Dry ing Agent 50 LB BAG NO BID 10.00$           NO BID 9.75$                               SIMPLE & SAFE 11.00$                               NO BID 17.00$                              $                                 11.55 
 PROFILE TURFACE QUICK 

DRY 
NO BID NO BID NO BID

56 Screened Top Soil Ton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

57 Crumb Rubber Playground mulch Ton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

58 Coarse Angular sand for riding rings Ton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

59 GGT Foot ing - Competit ion Blend NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

60 GGT Foot ing - Pleasure Blend Ton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

61 GGT Foot ing - Dressage Blend Ton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

FOLLOWING ITEMS FOR MERCER COUNTY BUILDINGS AND GROUNDS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

62  Ice melter Calcium Magnesium Acetate 50 LB BAG NO BID 10.50$           NO BID NO BID 10.00$                               NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

63  Ice Melter Calcium Chloride Acetate 50 LB BAG NO BID 10.50$           NO BID 11.00$                               NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

64 Aluminum Sulfate GALLON NO BID NO BID NO BID 1.64$                      NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

65 Caust ic Soda (25%) 55 GALLON DRUM NO BID NO BID NO BID 127.60$                  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

66 Caust ic Soda (50%) 55 GALLON DRUM NO BID NO BID NO BID 208.45$                  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

67 Sulfur Diox ide Gas 100 POUND CYLINDER NO BID NO BID NO BID 262.50$                  150 # CYLINDERS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

68 EHC Dried Bacteria Cultures (require approx . 21 pails annually ) 50 ct. pail NO BID NO BID NO BID 374.00$                  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

69 Hydrated Lime (require approx . 125 bags annually ) 50 LB BAG NO BID NO BID 10.80$                           Hydrated lime 15.00$                    NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

70 Sodium Hypochlorite 15% solut ion GALLON NO BID NO BID NO BID 1.87$                      NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

71 MISCELLANEOUS DISCOUNT OFF LIST PRICE -$                                 45% % % % % % 5%
 NOT APPLICABLE ON 

AGENCY OR FLOOR PRICE 

PRODUCTS 

% % 5%

HELENA AGRI-ENTERPRISES, LLC. NORTHEAST SPECIALTY WAREHOUSESEETON TURF WAREHOUSE, LLC GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS, INC.NUTRIEN AG SOLUTIONS INC. PLANT FOOD COMPANY INC. ALL UNIQUE GIFTS T/A TURF TRADELEVITT'SS LLC SYNATEK REED PERRINE SALES INC. MAIN POOL AND CHEMICAL COMPANY INC. FISHER + SON COMPANY INC. 



NO. OF RESPONDENTS: 7

NAME OF RESPONDENT ACTUARIAL & TECHNICAL SOLUTIONS, INC. HUGGINS ACTURIAL SERVICES INC. SQ RISK LLC AMI RISK CONSULTANTS INC. THE ACTUARIAL ADVANTAGE, INC. PINNACLE ACTUARIAL RESOURCES INC. 
LEWIS& ELLIS ACTUARIES AND 

CONSULTANTS 

ADDRESS 3900 VETERAN MEMORIAL HIGHWAY SUITE 300 111 VETERANS SQUARE 1050 WALL STREET WEST 1336 SW 146TH CT 111 VETERANS SQUARE, FIRST FLOOR 3109 CORNELIUS DRIVE 11225 COLLGE BLVD, SUITE 320

CITY, STATE, ZIP BOHEMIA , NY 11716 MEDIA , PA 19063 LYNDHURST, NJ 07071 MIAMI, FL 33784 MEDIA , PA 19063 BLOOMINGTON, IL 61704 OVERLAND PARK, KS 66210

CONTACT DAVID K. RAIKOWSKI TODD DASHOFF BENJAMIN S. NEWVILLE  AGUEDO M. INGCO ERIC G. BAUSE DEREK W. FREIHAUT KATHRYN KOCH 

TELEPHONE 631-471-8655 610-892-1826 201-935-3434 305-273-1589 610-627-0704 309-807-2300 913-766-9127

FAX 631-471-9404 610-892-1827 201-936-3618 702-359-0926 309-807-2301 913-491-3388

E-MAIL DRAIKOWSKI@ACTURIALSOLUTIONS.COM TODD.DASHOFF@HUGGINSACTURIAL.COM NEWVILLE@SGRISK.COM BOBINGOCO@AMIRISK.COM EBAUSE@TAA-INC.COM 
DFREIHAUT@PINNACLEACTUARIES.CO

M 
KKOCH@LEWISELLIS.COM 

INSURANCE INDEMNIFICATION PAGE REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

ADDENDUM NO ONE SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

ADDENDUM NO TWO SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

ADDENDUM NO THREE SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP DISCLOSURE SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 
SIGNED AND DATED/MUST CHECK YES 

OR NO 
SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE OK OK REQUIRED IF AWARDED OK OK REQUIRED IF AWARDED OK

EIC REQUIRED IF AWARDED 45386 EXPIRES 8.15.24 REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED 31156 EXPIRES 8.15.22 REQUIRED IF AWARDED 56634 EXPIRES 10.15.22

EXHIBIT A REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED 

IRAN CERTIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED
SIGNED AND DATED/WILL HAVE TO 

CHECK YES OR NO 
SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

CERTIFICATION OF POLITICAL CONTRIBUTIONS SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS YES YES YES YES YES YES DID NOT INCLUDE 

 CONTINUITY OF OPERATIONS YES YES YES YES YES YES YES 

REFERENCES INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED 

FATAL FLAW NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE 

EXCEPTIONS NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE 

QUALIFICATION STATEMENT INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED 

COST FOR SERVICES YEAR ONE  $                                                                    7,500.00  $                                                                       7,500.00  $                                                   13,500.00  $                                                      7,300.00  $                                                      7,959.00  $                                                      8,500.00  $                                             7,500.00 

COST FOR SERVICES YEAR TWO (OPTION)  $                                                                    7,000.00  $                                                                       7,500.00  $                                                   13,500.00  $                                                      7,300.00  $                                                      8,118.00  $                                                      8,500.00  $                                             7,500.00 

COST FOR SERVICES YEAR THREE (OPTION)  $                                                                    7,000.00  $                                                                       7,500.00  $                                                   13,500.00  $                                                      7,300.00  $                                                      8,280.00  $                                                      8,500.00  $                                             7,500.00 

PROPOSAL RESULTS

RFP2019-04 ACTUARIAL SERVICES FOR THE MERCER COUNTY INSURANCE COMMISSION 

NOVEMBER 15,2019
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