
BID RESULTS
AB2013-23 FESTIVAL GROUNDS PLAZA PROJECT

JULY 11, 2013

POSTPONED UNTIL JULY 25, 2013



Work will commence within Ten (10) Calendar Days after receipt of written "Notice to
Proceed" and be substantially completed by SEPTEMBER 20, 2013. LD in the amount of
$1,000.00 per CD. Must name Electrical and Structural Steel Subs 

NO. OF RESPONDENTS: 3

NAME OF BIDDER WATERS AND BUGBEE, INC. RED OAK BUILDING, LLC. IEW CONSTRUCTINO GROUP, INC.

ADDRESS 75 SOUTH GOLD DRIVE 27 DUBLIN ROAD 75 SCULPTORS WAY

CITY, STATE, ZIP HAMILTON, NJ 08691 PENNINGTON, NJ 08534 TRENTON, NJ 08619

CONTACT CHARLES P. WATERS JATIN AMIN HARRY W. COLEMAN JR.

TELEPHONE 609 584 1100 732 796 9500 609 586 5005

FAX 609 584 2200 732 796 9501 609 586 0356

E-MAIL BIDS@WATERSANDBUGBEE.COM JATIN@REDOAKBUILDING.ORG H.COLEMAN@IEWCONSTRUCTION.COM

INSURANCE REQUIRED FROM AWARDED VENDOR REQUIRED IF AWARDED

RECEIPT OF ADDENDUM NO. ONE SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

BID GUARANTEE FIDELITY AND DEPOSIT COMPANY OF MARYLAND 10% NTE 
20K NGM INSURANCE COMPANY 10% NTE 20K LIBERTY MUTAL INSURANCE COMPANY 10% NTE 20K 

CONSENT OF SURETY ANNMARIE KEANE AIF WITH POA DAWN M. JONES AIF WITH POA ALAN R. HEIN AIF WITH POA 

REFERENCES AND EXPERIENCE INCLUDED PC TO CHECK INCLUDED INCLUDED

PW CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION 60176 EXPIRES 4/14/14 667169 EXPIRES 11/9/14 605640 EXPIRES 5/8/14

DEBARRED NO NO NO

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK OK

ELECTRICAL SUBCONTRACTOR PW & BRC CATARI ELECTRIC, INC. 36465 EXPIRES 8/30/13; LICENSE 
34EB00530600 EXPIRES 3/31/15

DFW ELECTRIC INC. 606079 EXPIRES 6/18/14; LICENSE 
34EB01009500 EXPIRES 3/31/15

QPI ELECTRICAL CO., INC. 64769 EXPIRES 5/7/14; LICENSE 
34EB01070500 EXPIRES 3/31/15

STRUCTURAL STEEL SUBCONTRACTOR PW & BRC CAPITOL STEEL PRODUCTS, INC. 608424 EXPIRES 8/22/15 IN-HOUSE IN-HOUSE

STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE OK OK OK

EQUIPMENT CERT OK OK OK

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 OK OK OK

EXHIBIT B OK REQUIRED IF AWARDED OK

AA201 REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED

SAFETY CERT OK OK OK

OVERALL BASE BID 160,681.55 245,510.00 303,800.00

ALTERNATE ONE: POWER RECEPTACLES AND LIGHTING FOR CLOCK ENTRANCE                                                                                          19,872.48                                                                                          16,000.00                                                                                          31,800.00 

ALTERNATE TWO: POWER AND LIGHTING FOR FLAG ENTRANCE                                                                                          29,538.48                                                                                          25,000.00                                                                                          29,400.00 

TOTAL WITH ALTERNATES                                                                                        210,092.51                                                                                        286,510.00                                                                                        365,000.00 

HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS  YES  YES  YES 

EXCEPTIONS NONE NONE NONE

COMMENTS ELECTRICAL PW CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION EXPIRES IN 
AUGUST 2013, REQUIRE NEW CERT

FATAL FLAW NO NO NO

JULY 11, 2013

BID RESULTS
AB2013-24 NEW SITE ENTRANCES AT THE FESTIVAL GROUNDS AT THE MERCER COUNTY PARK
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AWARD ONE YEAR WITH OPTION TO EXTEND ONE YEAR; 
WARRANTY OEM PARTS - AS PER MANUFACTURER; LABOR: SIX 
MONTHS; MUST BE LOCATED WITHIN 30 MINUTE COMMUTE 
FROM 300 SCOTCH ROAD, EWING TOWNSHIP

NUMBER OF BIDDERS 3

NAME OF BIDDER LUCKY'S AUTO BODY AND REPAIR TRENTON AZ AUTO RADIATOR, INC DBA AZ
AUTO RADIATOR & AIR COND. INC. FREEHOLD FORD, INC.

ADDRESS 1108 DIVISION STREET 1788 CALHOUN STREET 3572 US ROUTE 9

CITY, STATE, ZIP TRENTON, NJ 08611 TRENTON, NJ 08638 FREEHOLD, NJ 07728

CONTACT JOHN LUCKY JOSEPH ZAMPINI STEVE GLANTZBERG

TELEPHONE 609 695 6979 609 394 3722 732 462 2982

FAX 609 695 6979 609 394 3746 732 761 0832

WEBSITE OR E-MAIL LUCKYSAUTOBODY@AOL.COM AZRADIATOR@HOTMAIL.COM REVELX2@YAHOO.COM

EXTEND TO COOP YES YES YES

INSURANCE REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK OK

EMERGENCY SERVICE WILL PROVIDE WILL PROVIDE WILL PROVIDE

STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE OK OK OK

EIC 31712 EXPIRES 12/15/15 20228 EXPIRES 12/15/16 13453 EXPIRES 1/15/14

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 OK OK OK

EXHIBIT A OK OK OK

MANUFACTURER'S ALL ALL FORD 

FACTORY CERTIFICATION MP TO CHECK MP TO CHECK

REPAIR CATEGORIES

ALL CATEGORIES WITH THE EXCEPTIONS 
OF ENGINE REPAIR MAJOR, AUTOMATIC 

TRANSMISSION REPAIRS, MANUAL 
TRANSMISSION REPAIRS, AND ENGINE 

CONTROL SYSTEM

COOLING AND HEATING SYSTEMS AND 
AIR CONDITIONING SYSTEMS (OEM) ONLY ALL; FORD ONLY

DISTANCE 18 MINUTES, 10.7 MILES 12 MINUTES, 6.5 MILES 44 MINUTES, 41.3 MILES

HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS YES YES YES

EXCEPTIONS NO BID ON DISCOUNT FOR OEM PARTS 
WHEN PICKED UP WITHOUT REPAIR NONE YES, 25% DISCOUNT FOR ENGINE AND 

TRANSMISSION ASSEMBLIES

FATAL FLAW NO NO NOT WITHIN 30 MINUTE COMMUTE 

BID RESULTS
CK09MERCER2013-11 VEHICLE AND TRUCK REPAIR WITH OEM PARTS

JULY 12, 2013

mailto:LUCKYSAUTOBODY@AOL.COM�
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CK09MERCER
2013-11 
VEHICLE AND 

DESCRIPTION FORD CHEVROLET BUICK PONTIAC DODGE JEEP TOYOTA GMC

LUCKY'S AUTO BODY AND REPAIR
1 CARS LABOR RATE 30.00 30.00 30.00 30.00 30.00 30.00 30.00 30.00 
2 TRUCKS, VANS AND BUSES  UP TO  14,500 GVW GAS 30.00 30.00 30.00 30.00 30.00 30.00 30.00 30.00 
3 TRUCKS, VANS AND BUSES UP TO   14,500 GVW DIESEL 30.00 30.00 30.00 30.00 30.00 30.00 30.00 30.00 
4 HYBRID – LABOR RATE 30.00 30.00 30.00 30.00 30.00 30.00 30.00 30.00 
5 DIAGNOSTIC TIME NO REPAIRS 30.00 30.00 30.00 30.00 30.00 30.00 30.00 30.00 
6 PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT FOR OEM PARTS FOR REPAIR 50% 50% 50% 50% 50% 50% 50% 50%
7 PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT FOR OEM PARTS OVER THE COUNTER N/A NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

TRENTON AZ RADIATOR - RADIATOR, HEATING AND COOLING
1 CARS LABOR RATE 45.00 45.00 45.00 45.00 45.00 45.00 45.00 45.00 
2 TRUCKS, VANS AND BUSES  UP TO  14,500 GVW GAS 45.00 45.00 45.00 45.00 45.00 45.00 45.00 45.00 
3 TRUCKS, VANS AND BUSES UP TO   14,500 GVW DIESEL 45.00 45.00 45.00 45.00 45.00 45.00 45.00 45.00 
4 HYBRID – LABOR RATE 45.00 45.00 45.00 45.00 45.00 45.00 45.00 45.00 
5 DIAGNOSTIC TIME NO REPAIRS 45.00 45.00 45.00 45.00 45.00 45.00 45.00 45.00 
6 PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT FOR OEM PARTS FOR REPAIR 25% 25% 25% 25% 25% 25% 25% 25%
7 PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT FOR OEM PARTS OVER THE COUNTER N/A 25% 25% 25% 25% 25% 25% 25%

FREEHOLD FORD, INC. 
1 CARS LABOR RATE 60.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 TRUCKS, VANS AND BUSES  UP TO  14,500 GVW GAS 60.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 TRUCKS, VANS AND BUSES UP TO   14,500 GVW DIESEL 60.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 HYBRID – LABOR RATE 60.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 DIAGNOSTIC TIME NO REPAIRS 60.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

6 PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT FOR OEM PARTS FOR REPAIR WITH 
EXCEPTION

39.2% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

7 PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT FOR OEM PARTS OVER THE COUNTER N/A NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ENGINE AND TRANSMISSION ASSEMBLIES ARE DISCOUNTED AT 25%

PROPOSAL FOR VEHICLE REPAIRS AND PARTS

LUCKY'S AUTO BODY AND REPAIR

TRENTON AZ RADIATOR - RADIATORS, HEATING AND COOLING SYSTEMS AND PARTS

FREEHOLD FORD, INC; BEYOND 30 MINUTE COMMUTE



AWARD FOR A PERIOD OF TWO (2) YEARS; BASED UPON DAILY AVERAGE FOR ULTRA LOW 
SULFUR DIESEL FUEL AS PUBLISHED BY THE OPIS OIL PRICE DAILY WILL NOT EXTEND TO COOP MEMBERS

NUMBER OF RESPONDENTS 4
NAME OF BIDDER ALLIED OIL, LLC. MAJESTIC  OIL COMPANY, INC. RIGGINS, INC. EAST RIVER ENERGY

ADDRESS 25 OLD CAMPLAIN ROAD 2104 FAIRFAX AVENUE 3938 S. MAIN STREET 401 SOUNDVIEW ROAD - P.O. BOX 388

CITY, STATE, ZIP HILLSBOROUGH, NJ 08844 CHERRY HILL, NJ 08003 VINELAND, NJ 08360 GUILFORD, CT 06437

CONTACT ROBERT GOLDSTEIN GENE RAYMOND R. PAUL RIGGINS DONALD M. HERZOG

TELEPHONE 908 575 7577 856 751 8801 856 825 7600 800 336 3762

FAX 908 575 8833 856 751 8824 856 825 2270 203 453 3899

E-MAIL RGOLDSTEIN@ALLIEDOILCO.COM MAJESTICOILNJ@GMAIL.COM RPRIGGINS@RIGGINSOIL.COM DMH@EASTRIVERENERGY.COM

ACKNOWLEDGE RECEIPT OF ADDENDUM NO. ONE SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED

STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE OK OK OK OK

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK OK OK

EIC 2483 EXPIRES 12/15/18 7090 EXPIRES 3/15/20 2940 EXPIRES 11/15/13 45909 EXPIRES 12/15/13

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 OK OK OK OK

EXHIBIT A OK OK OK REQUIRED IF AWARDED

HOLD BEYOND 60 DAYS YES YES YES YES

CONTINUITY OF SERVICE  YES WILL ATTEMPT TO YES YES

EMERGENCY SERVICE FOR COUNTY OF MERCER YES WILL NOT PROVIDE YES YES

WILL EXTEND TO THE COOP MEMBERS NO YES YES YES

OPIS PRODUCTION, OIL PRICE DAILY JULY 1, 2013; ULS DIESEL, AVERAGE OF HIGH AND LOW 
PHILADELPHIA PRICING

281,600 GALLONS DIESEL FOR THE COUNTY OF MERCER 

105,600 GALLONS PARK COMMISSION

POSTED PRICE PER GALLON ON JULY 1, 2013 AVERAGE OF 2.88 AND 2.9597 2.9199 2.9199 2.9199 2.9199

DELIVERY CHARGE OR DISCOUNT PER GALLON AS INDICATED BY EITHER A PLUS (+) OR 
MINUS (-) 0.027                                                     0.0287                                                     0.0390                                                          0.0591 

TOTAL PRICE (A PLUS B) PER GALLON FOR COOP MEMBERS 2.947 2.9486 2.9589 2.9790

TOTAL COST FOR 387,200 GALLONS FOR THE COUNTY OF MERCER'S REQUIREMENTS 1,141,175.20 1,141,678.56 1,145,666.72 1,153,449.44

COST PER GALLON FOR WINTER MIX FOR COUNTY AND THE COOP MEMBERS

KEROSENE OR CHEMICAL CHEMICAL

POSTED PRICE PER GALLON 2.9199 2.9199 2.9199 2.9199 
DELIVERY CHARGE OR DISCOUNT PER GALLON AS INDICATED BY EITHER A PLUS (+) OR 
MINUS (-) 0.0279 0.0477                                                                                                        0.0530 0.0741

TOTAL PRICE (A PLUS B) PER GALLON 2.9478                                                     2.9676                                                     2.9729 2.9940

BIDDER'S SOURCE OF SUPPLY GULF OR EQUAL SUNOCO/HESS PES TERMINALS IN PA AND NJ; SOURCE NOT 
LISTED 

EXCEPTIONS WILL NOT EXTEND TO COOP MEMBERS; 
ERROR ON OPIS PRICING NONE; MATH ERROR NONE; MATH ERROR DELIVERY TERMS; MATH ERROR

FATAL FLAW NO NO NO NO

BID RESULTS

CK09MERCER2013-12 DIESEL FUEL AND WINTER MIX FOR MERCER COUNTY AND COOPERATIVE MEMBERS

BID OPENING DATE:  JULY 12, 2013
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AB2013-23 FEST GR PLAZA

		BID RESULTS

		AB2013-23 FESTIVAL GROUNDS PLAZA PROJECT

		JULY 11, 2013

		POSTPONED UNTIL JULY 25, 2013





AB2013-24 ENTRANCE FESTIVAL GRO

		BID RESULTS

		AB2013-24 NEW SITE ENTRANCES AT THE FESTIVAL GROUNDS AT THE MERCER COUNTY PARK

		JULY 11, 2013

		Work will commence within Ten (10) Calendar Days after receipt of written "Notice to Proceed" and be substantially completed by SEPTEMBER 20, 2013. LD in the amount of $1,000.00 per CD. Must name Electrical and Structural Steel Subs

		NO. OF RESPONDENTS:		3

		NAME OF BIDDER		WATERS AND BUGBEE, INC.		RED OAK BUILDING, LLC.		IEW CONSTRUCTINO GROUP, INC.

		ADDRESS		75 SOUTH GOLD DRIVE		27 DUBLIN ROAD		75 SCULPTORS WAY

		CITY, STATE, ZIP		HAMILTON, NJ 08691		PENNINGTON, NJ 08534		TRENTON, NJ 08619

		CONTACT		CHARLES P. WATERS		JATIN AMIN		HARRY W. COLEMAN JR.

		TELEPHONE		609 584 1100		732 796 9500		609 586 5005

		FAX		609 584 2200		732 796 9501		609 586 0356

		E-MAIL		BIDS@WATERSANDBUGBEE.COM		JATIN@REDOAKBUILDING.ORG		H.COLEMAN@IEWCONSTRUCTION.COM

		INSURANCE REQUIRED FROM AWARDED VENDOR		REQUIRED IF AWARDED

		RECEIPT OF ADDENDUM NO. ONE		SIGNED AND DATED		SIGNED AND DATED		SIGNED AND DATED

		BID GUARANTEE		FIDELITY AND DEPOSIT COMPANY OF MARYLAND 10% NTE 20K		NGM INSURANCE COMPANY 10% NTE 20K		LIBERTY MUTAL INSURANCE COMPANY 10% NTE 20K

		CONSENT OF SURETY		ANNMARIE KEANE AIF WITH POA		DAWN M. JONES AIF WITH POA		ALAN R. HEIN AIF WITH POA

		REFERENCES AND EXPERIENCE		INCLUDED PC TO CHECK		INCLUDED		INCLUDED

		PW CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION		60176 EXPIRES 4/14/14		667169 EXPIRES 11/9/14		605640 EXPIRES 5/8/14

		DEBARRED		NO		NO		NO

		NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION		OK		OK		OK

		ELECTRICAL SUBCONTRACTOR PW & BRC		CATARI ELECTRIC, INC. 36465 EXPIRES 8/30/13; LICENSE 34EB00530600 EXPIRES 3/31/15		DFW ELECTRIC INC. 606079 EXPIRES 6/18/14; LICENSE 34EB01009500 EXPIRES 3/31/15		QPI ELECTRICAL CO., INC. 64769 EXPIRES 5/7/14; LICENSE 34EB01070500 EXPIRES 3/31/15

		STRUCTURAL STEEL SUBCONTRACTOR PW & BRC		CAPITOL STEEL PRODUCTS, INC. 608424 EXPIRES 8/22/15		IN-HOUSE		IN-HOUSE

		STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE		OK		OK		OK

		EQUIPMENT CERT		OK		OK		OK

		EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1		OK		OK		OK

		EXHIBIT B		OK		REQUIRED IF AWARDED		OK

		AA201		REQUIRED IF AWARDED		REQUIRED IF AWARDED		REQUIRED IF AWARDED

		SAFETY CERT		OK		OK		OK

		OVERALL BASE BID		160,681.55		245,510.00		303,800.00

		ALTERNATE ONE: POWER RECEPTACLES AND LIGHTING FOR CLOCK ENTRANCE		19,872.48		16,000.00		31,800.00

		ALTERNATE TWO: POWER AND LIGHTING FOR FLAG ENTRANCE		29,538.48		25,000.00		29,400.00

		TOTAL WITH ALTERNATES		210,092.51		286,510.00		365,000.00

		HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS		YES		YES		YES

		EXCEPTIONS		NONE		NONE		NONE

		COMMENTS		ELECTRICAL PW CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION EXPIRES IN AUGUST 2013, REQUIRE NEW CERT

		FATAL FLAW		NO		NO		NO



H.COLEMAN@IEWCONSTRUCTION.COM

BIDS@WATERSANDBUGBEE.COM

JATIN@REDOAKBUILDING.ORG



CK09MERCER2013-11 OEM REPAIRS

		BID RESULTS

		CK09MERCER2013-11 VEHICLE AND TRUCK REPAIR WITH OEM PARTS

		JULY 12, 2013

		AWARD ONE YEAR WITH OPTION TO EXTEND ONE YEAR; WARRANTY OEM PARTS - AS PER MANUFACTURER; LABOR: SIX MONTHS; MUST BE LOCATED WITHIN 30 MINUTE COMMUTE FROM 300 SCOTCH ROAD, EWING TOWNSHIP

		NUMBER OF BIDDERS		3

		NAME OF BIDDER		LUCKY'S AUTO BODY AND REPAIR		TRENTON AZ AUTO RADIATOR, INC DBA AZ AUTO RADIATOR & AIR COND. INC.		FREEHOLD FORD, INC.

		ADDRESS		1108 DIVISION STREET		1788 CALHOUN STREET		3572 US ROUTE 9

		CITY, STATE, ZIP		TRENTON, NJ 08611		TRENTON, NJ 08638		FREEHOLD, NJ 07728

		CONTACT		JOHN LUCKY		JOSEPH ZAMPINI		STEVE GLANTZBERG

		TELEPHONE		609 695 6979		609 394 3722		732 462 2982

		FAX		609 695 6979		609 394 3746		732 761 0832

		WEBSITE OR E-MAIL		LUCKYSAUTOBODY@AOL.COM		AZRADIATOR@HOTMAIL.COM		REVELX2@YAHOO.COM

		EXTEND TO COOP		YES		YES		YES

		INSURANCE REQUIRED IF AWARDED		REQUIRED IF AWARDED		REQUIRED IF AWARDED

		NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION		OK		OK		OK

		EMERGENCY SERVICE		WILL PROVIDE		WILL PROVIDE		WILL PROVIDE

		STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE		OK		OK		OK

		EIC		31712 EXPIRES 12/15/15		20228 EXPIRES 12/15/16		13453 EXPIRES 1/15/14

		EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1		OK		OK		OK

		EXHIBIT A		OK		OK		OK

		MANUFACTURER'S		ALL		ALL		FORD

		FACTORY CERTIFICATION		MP TO CHECK		MP TO CHECK

		REPAIR CATEGORIES		ALL CATEGORIES WITH THE EXCEPTIONS OF ENGINE REPAIR MAJOR, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION REPAIRS, MANUAL TRANSMISSION REPAIRS, AND ENGINE CONTROL SYSTEM		COOLING AND HEATING SYSTEMS AND AIR CONDITIONING SYSTEMS (OEM) ONLY		ALL; FORD ONLY

		DISTANCE		18 MINUTES, 10.7 MILES		12 MINUTES, 6.5 MILES		44 MINUTES, 41.3 MILES

		HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS		YES		YES		YES

		EXCEPTIONS		NO BID ON DISCOUNT FOR OEM PARTS WHEN PICKED UP WITHOUT REPAIR		NONE		YES, 25% DISCOUNT FOR ENGINE AND TRANSMISSION ASSEMBLIES

		FATAL FLAW		NO		NO		NOT WITHIN 30 MINUTE COMMUTE



LUCKYSAUTOBODY@AOL.COM

REVELX2@YAHOO.COM

AZRADIATOR@HOTMAIL.COM



PROPOSAL

		PROPOSAL FOR VEHICLE REPAIRS AND PARTS

		CK09MERCER2013-11 VEHICLE AND TRUCK REPAIR WITH OEM PARTS		DESCRIPTION		FORD		CHEVROLET		BUICK		PONTIAC		DODGE		JEEP		TOYOTA		GMC

				LUCKY'S AUTO BODY AND REPAIR		LUCKY'S AUTO BODY AND REPAIR

		1		CARS LABOR RATE		30.00		30.00		30.00		30.00		30.00		30.00		30.00		30.00

		2		TRUCKS, VANS AND BUSES  UP TO  14,500 GVW GAS		30.00		30.00		30.00		30.00		30.00		30.00		30.00		30.00

		3		TRUCKS, VANS AND BUSES UP TO   14,500 GVW DIESEL		30.00		30.00		30.00		30.00		30.00		30.00		30.00		30.00

		4		HYBRID – LABOR RATE		30.00		30.00		30.00		30.00		30.00		30.00		30.00		30.00

		5		DIAGNOSTIC TIME NO REPAIRS		30.00		30.00		30.00		30.00		30.00		30.00		30.00		30.00

		6		PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT FOR OEM PARTS FOR REPAIR		50%		50%		50%		50%		50%		50%		50%		50%

		7		PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT FOR OEM PARTS OVER THE COUNTER		N/A		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID

				TRENTON AZ RADIATOR - RADIATOR, HEATING AND COOLING		TRENTON AZ RADIATOR - RADIATORS, HEATING AND COOLING SYSTEMS AND PARTS

		1		CARS LABOR RATE		45.00		45.00		45.00		45.00		45.00		45.00		45.00		45.00

		2		TRUCKS, VANS AND BUSES  UP TO  14,500 GVW GAS		45.00		45.00		45.00		45.00		45.00		45.00		45.00		45.00

		3		TRUCKS, VANS AND BUSES UP TO   14,500 GVW DIESEL		45.00		45.00		45.00		45.00		45.00		45.00		45.00		45.00

		4		HYBRID – LABOR RATE		45.00		45.00		45.00		45.00		45.00		45.00		45.00		45.00

		5		DIAGNOSTIC TIME NO REPAIRS		45.00		45.00		45.00		45.00		45.00		45.00		45.00		45.00

		6		PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT FOR OEM PARTS FOR REPAIR		25%		25%		25%		25%		25%		25%		25%		25%

		7		PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT FOR OEM PARTS OVER THE COUNTER		N/A		25%		25%		25%		25%		25%		25%		25%

				FREEHOLD FORD, INC.		FREEHOLD FORD, INC; BEYOND 30 MINUTE COMMUTE

		1		CARS LABOR RATE		60.00		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID

		2		TRUCKS, VANS AND BUSES  UP TO  14,500 GVW GAS		60.00		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID

		3		TRUCKS, VANS AND BUSES UP TO   14,500 GVW DIESEL		60.00		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID

		4		HYBRID – LABOR RATE		60.00		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID

		5		DIAGNOSTIC TIME NO REPAIRS		60.00		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID

		6		PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT FOR OEM PARTS FOR REPAIR WITH EXCEPTION		39.2%		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID

		7		PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT FOR OEM PARTS OVER THE COUNTER		N/A		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID

				ENGINE AND TRANSMISSION ASSEMBLIES ARE DISCOUNTED AT		25%





CK09MERCER2013-12 DIESEL FUEL

		BID RESULTS

		CK09MERCER2013-12 DIESEL FUEL AND WINTER MIX FOR MERCER COUNTY AND COOPERATIVE MEMBERS

		BID OPENING DATE:  JULY 12, 2013

		AWARD FOR A PERIOD OF TWO (2) YEARS; BASED UPON DAILY AVERAGE FOR ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL FUEL AS PUBLISHED BY THE OPIS OIL PRICE DAILY		WILL NOT EXTEND TO COOP MEMBERS

		NUMBER OF RESPONDENTS		4

		NAME OF BIDDER		ALLIED OIL, LLC.		MAJESTIC  OIL COMPANY, INC.		RIGGINS, INC.		EAST RIVER ENERGY

		ADDRESS		25 OLD CAMPLAIN ROAD		2104 FAIRFAX AVENUE		3938 S. MAIN STREET		401 SOUNDVIEW ROAD - P.O. BOX 388

		CITY, STATE, ZIP		HILLSBOROUGH, NJ 08844		CHERRY HILL, NJ 08003		VINELAND, NJ 08360		GUILFORD, CT 06437

		CONTACT		ROBERT GOLDSTEIN		GENE RAYMOND		R. PAUL RIGGINS		DONALD M. HERZOG

		TELEPHONE		908 575 7577		856 751 8801		856 825 7600		800 336 3762

		FAX		908 575 8833		856 751 8824		856 825 2270		203 453 3899

		E-MAIL		RGOLDSTEIN@ALLIEDOILCO.COM		MAJESTICOILNJ@GMAIL.COM		RPRIGGINS@RIGGINSOIL.COM		DMH@EASTRIVERENERGY.COM

		ACKNOWLEDGE RECEIPT OF ADDENDUM NO. ONE		SIGNED AND DATED		SIGNED AND DATED		SIGNED AND DATED		SIGNED AND DATED

		INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS		REQUIRED IF AWARDED		REQUIRED IF AWARDED		REQUIRED IF AWARDED		REQUIRED IF AWARDED

		STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE		OK		OK		OK		OK

		NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION		OK		OK		OK		OK

		EIC		2483 EXPIRES 12/15/18		7090 EXPIRES 3/15/20		2940 EXPIRES 11/15/13		45909 EXPIRES 12/15/13

		EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1		OK		OK		OK		OK

		EXHIBIT A		OK		OK		OK		REQUIRED IF AWARDED

		HOLD BEYOND 60 DAYS		YES		YES		YES		YES

		CONTINUITY OF SERVICE		YES		WILL ATTEMPT TO		YES		YES

		EMERGENCY SERVICE FOR COUNTY OF MERCER		YES		WILL NOT PROVIDE		YES		YES

		WILL EXTEND TO THE COOP MEMBERS		NO		YES		YES		YES

		OPIS PRODUCTION, OIL PRICE DAILY JULY 1, 2013; ULS DIESEL, AVERAGE OF HIGH AND LOW PHILADELPHIA PRICING

		281,600 GALLONS DIESEL FOR THE COUNTY OF MERCER

		105,600 GALLONS PARK COMMISSION

		POSTED PRICE PER GALLON ON JULY 1, 2013 AVERAGE OF 2.88 AND 2.9597		2.9199		2.9199		2.9199		2.9199

		DELIVERY CHARGE OR DISCOUNT PER GALLON AS INDICATED BY EITHER A PLUS (+) OR MINUS (-)		0.027		0.0287		0.0390		0.0591

		TOTAL PRICE (A PLUS B) PER GALLON FOR COOP MEMBERS		2.947		2.9486		2.9589		2.9790

		TOTAL COST FOR 387,200 GALLONS FOR THE COUNTY OF MERCER'S REQUIREMENTS		1,141,175.20		1,141,678.56		1,145,666.72		1,153,449.44

		COST PER GALLON FOR WINTER MIX FOR COUNTY AND THE COOP MEMBERS

		KEROSENE OR CHEMICAL						CHEMICAL

		POSTED PRICE PER GALLON		2.9199		2.9199		2.9199		2.9199

		DELIVERY CHARGE OR DISCOUNT PER GALLON AS INDICATED BY EITHER A PLUS (+) OR MINUS (-)		0.0279		0.0477		0.0530		0.0741

		TOTAL PRICE (A PLUS B) PER GALLON		2.9478		2.9675		2.9728		2.9940

		BIDDER'S SOURCE OF SUPPLY		GULF OR EQUAL		SUNOCO/HESS		PES		TERMINALS IN PA AND NJ; SOURCE NOT LISTED

		EXCEPTIONS		WILL NOT EXTEND TO COOP MEMBERS; ERROR ON OPIS PRICING		NONE; MATH ERROR		NONE; MATH ERROR		DELIVERY TERMS; MATH ERROR

		FATAL FLAW		NO		NO		NO		NO



RPRIGGINS@RIGGINSOIL.COM

RGOLDSTEIN@ALLIEDOILCO.COM

DMH@EASTRIVERENERGY.COM

MAJESTICOILNJ@GMAIL.COM



