BID RESULTS

AB2013-54 PASSENGER SEATING FOR THE TRENTON-MERCER AIRPORT

OCTOBER 18, 2013

NO BIDS RECEIVED




BID RESULTS

CKO9MERCER2013-17 LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE FOR THE MERCER COUNTY LIBRARY SYSTEM AND COUNTY CO-OP

OCTOBER 16, 2013

[AWARD TWO YEARS, THROUGH 10.15.15; AWARD FOR|
LIBRARY; LOW BID AND LOW BID FOR CO-OP HOURLY
RATE

INO. OF RESPONDENTS: 6
NAME OF BIDDER INTERSTATE LANDSCAPE GREENLEAF LANDSCAPE SYSTEMS & SERVICES, INC. CNS CLEANING CO,, INC. TOTAL LAWN CARE & LANDSCAPE SERVICES, LLC GREENSCAPE LANDSCAPE CONTRACTORS INC. DONOFRIO & SON
[ADDRESS 28 TIMBERLANE DRIVE 276 PINE BROOK ROAD 501 CAMBRIA AVENUE, SUITE 131 471 ELIZABETH AVENUE 733 WILLOW GROVE AVENUE 47 VAN NESS TER

CITY, STATE, ZIP

PENNINGTON, NJ 08534

EATONTOWN, NJ 07724

BENSALEM, PA 19020-7213

SOMERSET, NJ 08873

GLENSIDE, PA 19038

MAPLEWOOD, NJ

CONTACT JERRY BRECKO SCOTT LAURENCE AUDREY SMITH KEVIN KRAFT ROBERT DAMERJIAN DIANE DONOFRIO
TELEPHONE 800 766 9751 EXT 700 732935 1010 856 488 8883 OR 800 227 9069 732302 0303 215881 7103 973 763 8911

FAX 609 288 8440 7329351212 856 488 5538 732 356 2427 215 881 7107 908 810 9050

E-MAIL JERRYBRECKO@YAHOO.COM GREENLEAFMAIL@AOL.COM CNSCLEANINGCO@AOL.COM KSNOWDOG69@AOL.COM GREEN39398@AO0L.COM DONOFRIOLANDSCAPING@COMCAST.NET

INSURANCE REQUIRED FROM AWARDED VENDOR

INJ DEP COMMERCIAL PESTICIDE APPLICATOR
BUSINESS LICENSE

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

96602A EXPIRES 10/31/13 AND 20228B EXPIRES

REFERENCES DID NOT INCLUDE INCLUDED, DICK TO EVALUATE NONE INCLUDED INCLUDED, DICK TO EVALUATE INCLUDED, DICK TO EVALUATE INCLUDED, DICK TO EVALUATE

EXTEND TO CO-OP HOURLY RATE ONLY YES YES YES YES YES YES

INEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION oK OK oK OK oK oK

STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE oK OK oK OK oK oK

EXHIBIT A REQUIRED IF AWARDED OK OK REQUIRED IF AWARDED oK

EMPLOYEE INFORMATION CERTIFICATE REQUIRED IF AWARDED 22422 EXPIRES 2/15/14 33470 EXPIRES 1/15/2016 46529 EXPIRES 4/15/18 34494 EXPIRES 9/15/17 18747 EXPIRES 3/15/16

YEAR ONE: 4.15.2014 THROUGH 10.5.2014 17,999.00 19,840.00 20,750.00 20,496.00 19,800.00 52,408.00
YEAR TWO: 4.15.2015 THROUGH 10.5.2015 17,999.00 19,840.00 20,750.00 20,496.00 19,800.00 52,408.00
(COST FOR FERTILIZING AND VEGETATION CONTROL 2,000.00 2,000.00 2,750.00 5,500.00 14,000.00 9,500.00
TOTAL AMOUNT 37,998.00 41,680.00 44,250.00 46,492,00 53,600.00 114,316.00
(COST PER HOUR FOR LANDSCAPING SERVICES 19.00 38.00 50.00 32.00 30.00 45.00
CONTINUITY OF SERVICE YES YES YES DID NOT RESOND YES YES

HOLD PRICING CONSIDERATION BEYOND 60 DAYS YES YES YES YES YES YES

EXCEPTIONS NONE NONE NONE REFERENCED NONE NONE NONE

FATAL FLAW NO NO NO NO NO NO




BID RESULTS

CKO9MERCER2013-19 OEM AND NON-OEM AUTO PARTS

OCTOB

ER 18, 2013

CONTRACT AWARD TWO (2) YEARS; MUST BE
WITHIN 45 MINUTE COMMUTE FROM 300
SCOTCH ROAD FOR WALK IN SERVICES;
FRANK TO EVALUATE

NUMBER OF BIDDERS 5
DFFLM, LLC., T/A DITSCHMAN FLEMINGTON EASTERN WAREHOUSE DISTRIBUTORS DBA
NAME OF BIDDER FORD FREEHOLD FORD INC. FRED BEANS PARTS NATIONAL PARTS SUPPLY COMPANY TRENTON AUTO PARTS WAREHOUSE

ADDRESS

215 ROUTE 202 & ROUTE 31

3572 US ROUTE 9

131 DOYLE STREET

535 MILLTOWN ROAD

146 LOOMIS AVENUE

CITY, STATE, ZIP

FLEMINGTON, NJ 08822

FREEHOLD, NJ 07728

DOYLESTOWN, PA 18901

NORTH BRUNSWICK, NJ 08902

TRENTON, NJ 08610

CONTACT HOWARD MEEKS STEVE GLANTZBERG GEORGE R. WRIGHT JOHN WARREN KEITH GRASER
TELEPHONE 908 782 3673 732 462 2982 267 716 0230 732247 5171 EXT. 5114 609 890 9009
FAX 908 806 8670 732 761 0832 267 898 9438 732 448 0039 609 890 9222

WEBSITE OR E-MAIL

HMEEKS@FLEMINGTON.COM

REVELX2@YAHOO.COM

GWRIGHT@FREDBEANS.COM

JWARREN411@GMAIL.COM

KGRASER@EAPW.COM

INSURANCE CERTIFICATION

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

EXTEND TO COOP YES YES YES YES YES

HOLD CONSIDERATION BEYOND 60 DAYS YES YES YES YES YES
DELIVERY AGREEMENT YES YES YES YES YES
CONTINUITY OF SERVICES WILL PROVIDE WILL PROVIDE WILL PROVIDE WILL PROVIDE WILL PROVIDE

CD OR PRICE LIST DID NOT PROVIDE CD CD'S INCLUDED CD

BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE OK OK OK OK OK

EXHIBIT A INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

EIC 6512 EXPIRES 1/15/16 13453 EXPIRES 1/15/14 46579 EXPIRES 4/15/14 8403 EXPIRES 5/15/16 45567 EXPIRES 9/15/17
STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE OK OK OK OK OK
LOCATION(S) 215 ROUTE 202 & ROUTE 31 FLEMINGTON, NJ 3572 US ROUTE 9 FREEHOLD, NJ 131 DOYLE STREET DOYLESTOWN, PA VARIOUS 146 LOOMIS AVENUE TRENTON, NJ
DISTANCE FROM MOTOR POOL 30 MINUTES 44 MINUTES 43 MINUTES 25 - 35 MINUTES 14 MINUTES
EXCEPTIONS NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE

EATAL FLAW YES, DID NOT PROVIDE PRICE SHEETS OR NO NO NO NO

PRICING ON CD AS REQUIRED IN THE BID




DITSCHMAN - OEM - NON-RESPONSIVE

FREEHOLD FORD - OEM

JOBBER PRICE LIST

ITEM NO. AND CATEGORY MFG OEM NUMBER/DATE UPCHARGE % MFG OEM JOBBER PRICE LIST NUMBER/DATE UPCHARGE %
Category 1: Alternators & Starters Ford/Motorcraft/AC Delco OEM 10/1/2013 7% FORD/MOTORCRAFT OEM FPS3642-1013 3%
Category 2: Bearings, Ball, & Roller Ford/Motorcraft/AC Delco OEM 10/1/2013 7% FORD/MOTORCRAFT OEM FPS3642-1013 3%
Category 3: Batteries Ford/Motorcraft/AC Delco OEM 10/1/2013 7% FORD/MOTORCRAFT OEM FPS3642-1013 3%
Category 4: Belts, Hoses, & Clamps Ford/Motorcraft/AC Delco OEM 10/1/2013 7% FORD/MOTORCRAFT OEM FPS3642-1013 3%
Category 5: Brakes Ford/Motorcraft/AC Delco OEM 10/1/2013 7% FORD/MOTORCRAFT OEM FPS3642-1013 3%
Category 6: Caps & Thermostats Ford/Motorcraft/AC Delco OEM 10/1/2013 7% FORD/MOTORCRAFT OEM FPS3642-1013 3%
Ejal;?gaor:i':: Chemicals, Automotive Ford/Motorcraft/AC Delco OEM 10/1/2013 7% FORD/MOTORCRAFT OEM FPS3642-1013 3%
Category 8: Coolant & Antifreeze Ford/Motorcraft/AC Delco OEM 10/1/2013 7% FORD/MOTORCRAFT OEM FPS3642-1013 3%
Category 9: Electrical & Ignition Ford/Motorcraft/AC Delco OEM 10/1/2013 7% FORD/MOTORCRAFT OEM FPS3642-1013 3%
Category 10: Emissions & Exhaust Ford/Motorcraft/AC Delco OEM 10/1/2013 7% FORD/MOTORCRAFT OEM FPS3642-1013 3%
Category 11: Filters Ford/Motorcraft/AC Delco OEM 10/1/2013 7% FORD/MOTORCRAFT OEM FPS3642-1013 3%
Category 12: Gaskets & Seals Ford/Motorcraft/AC Delco OEM 10/1/2013 7% FORD/MOTORCRAFT OEM FPS3642-1013 3%
Category 13: Heater & Air Conditioning Ford/Motorcraft/AC Delco OEM 10/1/2013 7% FORD/MOTORCRAFT OEM FPS3642-1013 3%
S:‘rtsgmy 14:Lamps, Lighting, Mirrors & Body | ¢4 /104 orcraft/AC Delco OEM 10/1/2013 7% FORD/MOTORCRAFT OEM FPS3642-1013 3%
Category 15: Power Steering Pumps Ford/Motorcraft/AC Delco OEM 10/1/2013 7% FORD/MOTORCRAFT OEM FPS3642-1013 3%
Category 16: Pumps, Fuel, & Water Ford/Motorcraft/AC Delco OEM 10/1/2013 7% FORD/MOTORCRAFT OEM FPS3642-1013 3%
Category 17: Steering & Suspension Ford/Motorcraft/AC Delco OEM 10/1/2013 7% FORD/MOTORCRAFT OEM FPS3642-1013 3%
Category 18: Universal Joints Ford/Motorcraft/AC Delco OEM 10/1/2013 7% FORD/MOTORCRAFT OEM FPS3642-1013 3%
Category 19: Wipers & Washer Fluid Ford/Motorcraft/AC Delco OEM 10/1/2013 7% FORD/MOTORCRAFT OEM FPS3642-1013 3%
Category 20: Wheel Accessories Ford/Motorcraft/AC Delco OEM 10/1/2013 7% FORD/MOTORCRAFT OEM FPS3642-1013 3%
Category 21: Transmissions Ford/Motorcraft/AC Delco OEM 10/1/2013 5% FORD/MOTORCRAFT OEM FPS3642-1013 3%
Category 22: Motor Engines Ford/Motorcraft/AC Delco OEM 10/1/2013 5% FORD/MOTORCRAFT OEM FPS3642-1013 3%
Category 23: Mechanic Hand Tools and Ford/Motorcraft/AC Delco OEM 10/1/2013 FORD/MOTORCRAFT OEM FPS3642-1013 3%
Diagnostic Tools 7%
gle;t\tlegsory 24: Mechanic's Disposable Nitrile NA NA NA NA FORD/MOTORCRAFT OEM FPS3642-1013 3%

FRED BEAN - OEM FORD MOTORCRAFT FRED BEAN - OEM CHRYSLER DODGE JEEP
JOBBER PRICE LIST(S)

ITEM NO. AND CATEGORY MANUFACTURER OEM NUMBER/DATE UPCHARGE % MANUFACTURER OEM JOBBER PRICE LIST(S) NUMBER/DATE| UPCHARGE %
Category 1: Alternators & Starters Ford Motor Co./MOTORCRAF| OEM FPS3642CD 010ct13 9.80% Chrysler/Dodge/Jeep OEM ChryslerDealer Price List 010ct13 14.80%
Category 2: Bearings, Ball, & Roller Ford Motor Co./MOTORCRAFT| OEM FPS3642CD 010ct13 9.80% Chrysler/Dodge/Jeep OEM ChryslerDealer Price List 010ct13 14.80%
Category 3: Batteries Ford Motor Co./MOTORCRAF| OEM FPS3642CD 010ct13 9.80% Chrysler/Dodge/Jeep OEM ChryslerDealer Price List 010ct13 14.80%
Category 4: Belts, Hoses, & Clamps fFord Motor Co./MOTORCRAFT| OEM FPS3642CD 010ct13 9.80% Chrysler/Dodge/Jeep OEM ChryslerDealer Price List 010ct13 14.80%
Category 5: Brakes Ford Motor Co./MOTORCRAFT| OEM FPS3642CD 010ct13 9.80% Chrysler/Dodge/Jeep OEM ChryslerDealer Price List 010ct13 14.80%
Category 6: Caps & Thermostats Ford Motor Co./MOTORCRAF| OEM FPS3642CD 010ct13 9.80% Chrysler/Dodge/Jeep OEM ChryslerDealer Price List 010ct13 14.80%
Ejal;?gaor:i':: Chemicals, Automotive Ford Motor Co./MOTORCRAFT OEM FPS3642CD 010ct13 9.80% Chrysler/Dodge/Jeep OEM ChryslerDealer Price List 010ct13 14.80%
Category 8: Coolant & Antifreeze Ford Motor Co./MOTORCRAF| OEM FPS3642CD 010ct13 9.80% Chrysler/Dodge/Jeep OEM ChryslerDealer Price List 010ct13 14.80%
Category 9: Electrical & Ignition fFord Motor Co./MOTORCRAFT| OEM FPS3642CD 010ct13 9.80% Chrysler/Dodge/Jeep OEM ChryslerDealer Price List 010ct13 14.80%
Category 10: Emissions & Exhaust Ford Motor Co./MOTORCRAFT| OEM FPS3642CD 010ct13 9.80% Chrysler/Dodge/Jeep OEM ChryslerDealer Price List 010ct13 14.80%
Category 11: Filters Ford Motor Co./MOTORCRAFT| OEM FPS3642CD 010ct13 9.80% Chrysler/Dodge/Jeep OEM ChryslerDealer Price List 010ct13 14.80%
Category 12: Gaskets & Seals Ford Motor Co./MOTORCRAFT| OEM FPS3642CD 010ct13 9.80% Chrysler/Dodge/Jeep OEM ChryslerDealer Price List 010ct13 14.80%
Category 13: Heater & Air Conditioning Ford Motor Co./MOTORCRAFT| OEM FPS3642CD 010ct13 9.80% Chrysler/Dodge/Jeep OEM ChryslerDealer Price List 010ct13 14.80%
S:‘rtsgmy 14:Lamps, Lighting, Mirrors & Body Ly 1o¢0r 0o /MOTORCRAF] OEM FPS3642CD 010ct13 9.80% Chrysler/Dodge/Jeep OEM ChryslerDealer Price List 010ct13 14.80%
Category 15: Power Steering Pumps Ford Motor Co./MOTORCRAF| OEM FPS3642CD 010ct13 9.80% Chrysler/Dodge/Jeep OEM ChryslerDealer Price List 010ct13 14.80%
Category 16: Pumps, Fuel, & Water Ford Motor Co./MOTORCRAF| OEM FPS3642CD 010ct13 9.80% Chrysler/Dodge/Jeep OEM ChryslerDealer Price List 010ct13 14.80%
Category 17: Steering & Suspension Ford Motor Co./MOTORCRAF] OEM FPS3642CD 010ct13 9.80% Chrysler/Dodge/Jeep OEM ChryslerDealer Price List 010ct13 14.80%
Category 18: Universal Joints Ford Motor Co./MOTORCRAF| OEM FPS3642CD 010ct13 9.80% Chrysler/Dodge/Jeep OEM ChryslerDealer Price List 010ct13 14.80%
Category 19: Wipers & Washer Fluid Ford Motor Co./MOTORCRAF| OEM FPS3642CD 010ct13 9.80% Chrysler/Dodge/Jeep OEM ChryslerDealer Price List 010ct13 14.80%
Category 20: Wheel Accessories Ford Motor Co./MOTORCRAFT| OEM FPS3642CD 010ct13 9.80% Chrysler/Dodge/Jeep OEM ChryslerDealer Price List 010ct13 14.80%
Category 21: Transmissions Ford Motor Co./MOTORCRAFT| OEM FPS3642CD 010ct13 9.80% Chrysler/Dodge/Jeep OEM ChryslerDealer Price List 010ct13 8.90%
Category 22: Motor Engines Ford Motor Co./MOTORCRAF] OEM FPS3642CD 010ct13 9.80% Chrysler/Dodge/Jeep OEM ChryslerDealer Price List 010ct13 8.90%
Category 23: Mechanic Hand Tools and . .

Diagnostic Tools fFord Motor Co./MOTORCRAF| OEM FPS3642CD 010ct13 9.80% Chrysler/Dodge/Jeep OEM ChryslerDealer Price List 010ct13 14.80%
Category 24: Mechanic's Disposable Nitrile NO BID NO BID

Gloves




FRED BEAN - OEM GM/AC-DELCO

FRED BEAN - OEM TOYOTA

JOBBER PRICE LIST(S)

ITEM NO. AND CATEGORY MANUFACTURER OEM NUMBER/DATE UPCHARGE % MANUFACTURER OEM JOBBER PRICE LIST(S) NUMBER/DATE| UPCHARGE %
Category 1: Alternators & Starters GM / AC-Delco OEM SPO Dealer Price List 01oc 9.80% TOYOTA OEM US DEALER PRICE OCT 1, 2013 19.80%
Category 2: Bearings, Ball, & Roller GM / AC-Delco OEM SPO Dealer Price List 010cCt 9.80% TOYOTA OEM US DEALER PRICE OCT 1, 2013 19.80%
Category 3: Batteries GM / AC-Delco OEM SPO Dealer Price List 01oc 9.80% TOYOTA OEM US DEALER PRICE OCT 1, 2013 19.80%
Category 4: Belts, Hoses, & Clamps GM / AC-Delco OEM SPO Dealer Price List 010cCt 9.80% TOYOTA OEM US DEALER PRICE OCT 1, 2013 19.80%
Category 5: Brakes GM / AC-Delco OEM SPO Dealer Price List 01oc 9.80% TOYOTA OEM US DEALER PRICE OCT 1, 2013 19.80%
Category 6: Caps & Thermostats GM / AC-Delco OEM SPO Dealer Price List 01oc 9.80% TOYOTA OEM US DEALER PRICE OCT 1, 2013 19.80%
Ejatfg;?t’;: Chemicals, Automotive GM / AC-Delco OEM WsPO Dealer Price List 010c 9.80% TOYOTA OEM US DEALER PRICE OCT 1, 2013 19.80%
Category 8: Coolant & Antifreeze GM / AC-Delco OEM SPO Dealer Price List 01oc 9.80% TOYOTA OEM US DEALER PRICE OCT 1, 2013 19.80%
Category 9: Electrical & Ignition GM / AC-Delco OEM SPO Dealer Price List 01oc 9.80% TOYOTA OEM US DEALER PRICE OCT 1, 2013 19.80%
Category 10: Emissions & Exhaust GM / AC-Delco OEM SPO Dealer Price List 01oc 9.80% TOYOTA OEM US DEALER PRICE OCT 1, 2013 19.80%
Category 11: Filters GM / AC-Delco OEM SPO Dealer Price List 01oc 9.80% TOYOTA OEM US DEALER PRICE OCT 1, 2013 19.80%
Category 12: Gaskets & Seals GM / AC-Delco OEM SPO Dealer Price List 01oc 9.80% TOYOTA OEM US DEALER PRICE OCT 1, 2013 19.80%
Category 13: Heater & Air Conditioning GM / AC-Delco OEM SPO Dealer Price List 01oc 9.80% TOYOTA OEM US DEALER PRICE OCT 1, 2013 19.80%
g;tt‘:gory 14: Lamps, Lighting, Mirrors & Body GM / AC-Delco OEM MSPO Dealer Price List 010c 9.80% TOYOTA OEM US DEALER PRICE OCT 1, 2013 19.80%
Category 15: Power Steering Pumps GM / AC-Delco OEM SPO Dealer Price List 0loci 9.80% TOYOTA OEM US DEALER PRICE OCT 1, 2013 19.80%
Category 16: Pumps, Fuel, & Water GM / AC-Delco OEM SPO Dealer Price List 0loci 9.80% TOYOTA OEM US DEALER PRICE OCT 1, 2013 19.80%
Category 17: Steering & Suspension GM / AC-Delco OEM SPO Dealer Price List 0loci 9.80% TOYOTA OEM US DEALER PRICE OCT 1, 2013 19.80%
Category 18: Universal Joints GM / AC-Delco OEM SPO Dealer Price List 0loci 9.80% TOYOTA OEM US DEALER PRICE OCT 1, 2013 19.80%
Category 19: Wipers & Washer Fluid GM / AC-Delco OEM SPO Dealer Price List 0loci 9.80% TOYOTA OEM US DEALER PRICE OCT 1, 2013 19.80%
Category 20: Wheel Accessories GM / AC-Delco OEM SPO Dealer Price List 0loci 9.80% TOYOTA OEM US DEALER PRICE OCT 1, 2013 19.80%
Category 21: Transmissions GM / AC-Delco OEM SPO Dealer Price List 0loci 9.80% TOYOTA OEM US DEALER PRICE OCT 1, 2013 19.80%
Category 22: Motor Engines GM / AC-Delco OEM SPO Dealer Price List 0loci 9.80% TOYOTA OEM US DEALER PRICE OCT 1, 2013 19.80%

: i T ) .
Category 23: Mechanic Hand Tools and GM / AC-Delco OEM WSPO Dealer Price List 01oc TOYOTA OEM US DEALER PRICE OCT 1, 2013 19.80%
Diagnostic Tools 9.80%
Category 24: Mechanic's Disposable Nitrile NO BID NO BID
Gloves
NATIONAL PARTS SUPPLY
OEM AND NON- JOBBER PRICE LIST(S)

ITEM NO. AND CATEGORY MANUFACTURER OEM NUMBER/DATE DISCOUNT

Category 1 Alternators & Starters ACDelco, BBB OEM & Non OEM Less 18%

Category 2 Bearings, Ball & Roller ACDelco, SKF OEM & Non OEM Less 18%

Category 3 Batteries ACDelco OEM & Non OEM Less 15%

Category 4 Belts, Hoses, & Clamps ACDelco, Ideal OEM & Non OEM Less 20%

Category 5 Brakes elco, Bendix, Centrics, Best Bl OEM & Non OEM OEM Less 10%, Non OEM Less 25%
Category 6 Caps & Thermostats ACDelco, Motorad OEM & Non OEM Less 15%

Category 7 Chemicals CRC, Permatex, Valvoline Non OEM Less 15%

Category 8 Coolant & Antifreeze No Bid OEM & Non OEM No Bid

Category 9 Electrical & Ignition

CDelco, Standard, Motorcral

OEM & Non OEM

Motorcraft less 10% all others less 20%

Category 10 Emissions & Exhaust

elco,Standard,Motorcraft,W4g

OEM & Non OEM

Motorcraft less 10% all others less 20%

Category 11 Filters

ACDelco,Fram, Motorcraft

OEM & Non OEM

ACDelco Less 20,Fram less 40%,all others net priced

Category 12 Gaskets & Seals Fel Pro Non OEM Less 18%
Category 13 Heater & Air Conditioning elco,Motorcraft,Four Seasons; OEM & Non OEM Less 15%
Category 14 Lamps, Lighting, & Mirrors ACDelco,Grote,Wagner OEM & Non OEM Less 15%
Category 15 Power Steering Pumps ACDelco, Cardone OEM & Non OEM Less 15%
Category 16 Pumps, Fuel & Water ACDelco,GMB,Airtex, Denso| OEM & Non OEM Less 15%
Category 17 Steering & Suspension ACDelco, Cardone, Monroe| OEM & Non OEM Less 15%
Category 18 Universal Joints SKF, ACDelco OEM & Non OEM Less 15%
Category 19 Wipers ACDelco,Anco OEM & Non OEM ACDelco less 10%, ANCO less 25%
Category 20 Wheel Accessories No Bid No Bid
Category 21 Transmissions No Bid No Bid
Category 22 Motor Engines No Bid No Bid
Category 23 Mechanic Hand Tools No Bid No Bid
Category 24 Mechanics Disposal Nitril Gloves No Bid No Bid




TRENTON AUTO

ITEM NO. AND CATEGORY MANUFACTURER OEM OR NON/OEM|PRICE LIST(S) NUMBER/DATE PRICE LIST DISCOUNT
Category 1 Alternators & Starters Remy Products W & Reman- Non O Remy10113 10/1/13 Jobber -20%
Category 2 Bearings, Ball & Roller National NON - OEM ationa81012| Date 8/01/1 Jobber -10%
Category 3 Batteries DEKA NON - OEM DEKA8313 Date 8/3/13 Special Quote -15%
Category 4 Belts, Hoses, & Clamps Gates NON - OEM Gates 41413 Dates 4/14/13 Jobber 0
Category 5 Brakes Centric NON - OEM Centric 9209 Date 9/02/09 Jobber -7%
Category 5 Brakes Wagner Perfect Stop NON - OEM agner 82313 Date 8/23/1. Jobber -10%
Category 6 Caps & Thermostats Stant NON - OEM Stant 4113 Date 4/1/13 Jobber 0
Category 7 Chemicals PRICE SHEET NOT SUBMITTED NO BID
Category 8 Coolant & Antifreeze PRICE SHEET NOT SUBMITTED NO BID
Category 9 Electrical & Ignition Standard Motor Prod NON - OEM SMP1010 Date 4/5/2010 List -55%
Category 10 Emissions & Exhaust Walker Exhaust NON - OEM alker PF 4113 Date 4/1/13 Jobber -5%
Category 10 Emissions & Exhaust SMP Emissions NON - OEM SMP1113 Date 4/1/13 List -55%
Category 11 Filters WIX NON - OEM WIX 6113 Date 6/1/13 Jobber -30%
Category 12 Gaskets & Seals Fel Pro NON - OEM FelPro 700 Date 8/22/13 As priced on sheet 0
Category 13 Heater & Air Conditioning Four Seasons NON - OEM urSeason61813 Date 6/18/. List -50%
Category 14 Lamps, Lighting, & Mirrors Wagner NON - OEM WL7111 Date 7/1/11 List -60%
Category 14 Lamps, Lighting, & Mirrors Grote NON - OEM Grote 1112 Dated 10/1/13 Jobber 0
Category 15 Power Steering Pumps Cardone NON - OEM A1526 Date 5/26/2008 As priced on sheet 0%
Category 16 Pumps, Fuel & Water Spectra Fuel Pumps NON - OEM 91813 Date 9/18/13 List -45%
Category 16 Pumps, Fuel & Water Gates Water Pumps NON - OEM GAT 81712 Date 8/17/12 Jobber -10
Category 17 Steering & Suspension MOOG Steering NON - OEM 82213 Date 8/22/13 Jobber -5
Category 17 Steering & Suspension Monroe Shocks & Struts NON - OEM roeJobber 41113 Date 4/1 Jobber -10%
Category 18 Universal Joints Precision NON - OEM Precision 8112 Date 8/1/12 Jobber 0
Category 19 Wipers ANCO NON - OEM ANCO 6113 Date 6/1/13 As priced on sheet 0
Category 20 Wheel Accessories Dorman cat9 NON - OEM Dorman Wheels Nuts & Bolt: As priced on sheet -15
Category 21 Transmissions PRICE SHEET NOT SUBMITTED NO BID
Category 22 Motor Engines PRICE SHEET NOT SUBMITTED NO BID
Category 23 Mechanic Hand Tools PRICE SHEET NOT SUBMITTED NO BID
Category 24 Mechanics Disposal Nitril Gloves APW NON - OEM Nitril Gloves As priced on sheet set price in system




BID RESULTS

/AB2013-52 NETWORK CABLING INSTALLATION FOR THE MERCER COUNTY LIBRARY SYSTEM

OCTOBER 17, 2013

Work will commence within Ten (10) CD after receipt of|
wiitten NTP and be substantially completed witin Thirty
(30) CD: LD in the amount of $500.00 per CD; 5 years
experience

NO. OF RESPONDENTS:

6

NAME OF BIDDER

TRICOMM SERVICES CORP.

COASTAL COMMUNICATIONS GROUP, INC.

COMTEC SYSTEMS, INC.

MJF ELECTRICAL CONTRACTING, INC.

C & R COMMUNICATIONS GROUP

ALTEC BUILDING SYSTEMS CORP.

ADDRESS

1247 NORTH CHURCH STREET, SUITE # 8

6820C NORTH CRESCENT BLVD

2658 NORTH WEST BLVD

4800 BOSTON AVENUE

2814 GUILFORD STREET

904 ATLANTIC AVENUE

CITY, STATE, ZIP

MOORESTOWN, NJ 08057

PENNSAUKEN, NJ 08110

VINELAND, NJ 08360

TREVOSE, PA 19053

PHILADELPHIA, PA 19132

PT. PLEASANT, NJ 08742

CONTACT JOSEPH M. WALSH STEPHEN P. SOUCHUCK MICHAEL W. VERTOLLI MICHAEL J. FUCHS MARC CARROLL JAMES E. LAWROSKI JR.
TELEPHONE 856 914 9001 856 910 7991 856 691 5111 215 355 7308 215 480 0130 732 903 6264

FAX 856 914 9065 856 910 7996 856 696 4666 215 355 7309 267 731 1242 732 903 6298

E-MAIL JWALSH@TRICOMMCORP.COM SOUCHUCK@COASTALGRP.COM JDURHAM@COMTECUSA.NET MIKE@MJIFELECTRIC.COM MARC-CARROLL@CANDRCOMMUNICATIONSGROUP.COM INFO@ALTECBUILDINGSYSTEMS.COM

INSURANCE REQUIRED FROM AWARDED VENDOR

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

RECEIPT OF ADDENDUM NO. ONE

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

FIRST INDEMNITY OF AMERICA INSURANCE COMPAN'

THE OHIO CASUALTY INSURANCE COMPANY 10% NTE|

PHILADELPHIA INDEMNITY INSURANCE COMPANY

COMPANION PROPERTY CASUALTY INSURANCE

BID GUARANTEE AEGIS SECURITY INSURANCE COMPANY 10% NTE 20K 10% NTE 20K AEGIS SECUIRTY INSURANCE COMPANY 10% NTE 20K 10% NTE 12K COMPANY 10% NTE 20K

(CONSENT OF SURETY MARY STOLL WALTER AIF WITH POA MARGARET KELLY AIF WITH POA JOHN BORELLI AIF WITH POA SHARON A. SIMPSON AIF WITH POA BRUCE M. ALLEN AIF WITH POA PHILIP S. TOBEY AIF WITH POA

THREE REFERENCES AND FIVE YEARS EXPERIENCE INCLUDED, LIBRARY TO CHECK PAGE 66 INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

PW CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION 604718 EXPIRES 5/16/14 615232 EXPIRES 6/3/14 45046 EXPIRES 4/4/14 619432 EXPIRES 11/27/13 696161 EXPIRES 7/18/14 601102 EXPIRES 8/9/14

DEBARRED NO NO NO NO NO NO

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION oK OK oK OK OK oK

TELEDATA SUBCONTRACTOR LICENSE PW & BRC IN-HOUSE REFERENCED NONE REFERENCED N/A IN-HOUSE IN-HOUSE IN-HOUSE

STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE oK OK oK OK OK oK

EQUIPMENT CERT oK OK oK OK OK oK

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 oK OK oK OK OK oK

EXHIBITB INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED

AA201 REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED

SAFETY CERT oK OK oK OK OK oK

BASE BID: HICKORY CORNER 11,780.00 14,600.00 15,267.01 17,920.00 22,992.67 25,780.00
ALTERNATE ONE: HIGHTSTOWN BRANCH 9,220.00 10,700.00 10,629.99 13,776.00 12,822.83 18,457.00
ALTERNATE TWO: TWIN RIVERS BRANCH 11,450.00 12,900.00 13,146.35 16,240.00 20,339.67 22,624.00
ALTERNATE THREE: ROBBINSVILLE BRANCH 12,230.00 14,800.00 18,490.70 19,600.00 23,434.83 25,848.00
TOTAL AMOUNT WITH ALTERNATES 44,680.00 53,000.00 57,534.05 67,536.00 79,590.00 92,709.00
HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS YES YES YES YES YES YES

EXCEPTIONS NONE REFERENCED NONE NONE NONE NONE REFERENCED NONE

FATAL FLAW NO NO NO NO NO NO
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