
EQUIPMENT SHALL BE NFPA-COMPLIANT; EQUIPMENT SHALL BE DELIVERED 
WITHIN 60 DAYS, F.O.B. AND WARRANTED FOR A PERIOD OF ONE (1) YEAR JIM MCCANN TO REVIEW EXCEPTIONS

NUMBER OF RESPONDENTS 2

RESPONDENT CONTINENTAL FIRE & SAFETY, INC. AIRPOWER INTERNATIONAL INC.

ADDRESS 2740 KUSER ROAD 7303 RIVER ROAD

CITY, STATE, ZIP HAMILTON, NJ 08691 PENNSAUKEN, NJ 08110

CONTACT GREGORY G. GORE STEVEN FURST

WEBSITE OR E-MAIL CONTFIRE1@AOL.COM STEVE@AIRPOWER-INTL.COM

TELEPHONE 609 588 0096 856 663 1711

FAX 609 584 0405 856 663 1784

NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK

STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE OK OK

EIC 6442 EXPIRES 1/15/20 11811 EXPIRES 8/15/20

EXHIBIT A INCLUDED INCLUDED

CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED

CERTIFICATION TO HOLD SIXTY DAYS (60) NO YES

EMERGENCY DELIVERY PROCEDURE WILL PROVIDE WILL PROVIDE

MANUFACTURER'S CUT-OFF DATE NONE N/A

COST FOR ONE MAKO BAM06H-E3 OR EQUIVALENT 19,098.00 21,507.00

COST FOR OPTIONS 21,800.00                                                         22,400.00                                                     

GRAND TOTAL 40,898.00                                                         43,907.00                                                     

COST TO FILL CYLINDERS, IF REQUIRED NO CHARGE DID NOT REFERENCE

EXCEPTIONS NONE

YES; BID EAGLE AIR SYSTEM, RAPTOR 
BREATHING AIR COMPRESSOR RCA10F; 

REFER TO PG. 47, CERTIFIED FOR NEW 5.5 
SCBA 

FATAL FLAW NO NO

AB2013-43 ONE (1) MAKO BAM06H-E3 OR EQUIVALENT BREATHING AIR MODULE WITH OPTIONS FOR THE MERCER COUNTY FIRE ACADEMY 

AUGUST 21, 2013



AWARD ONE YEAR, REFER TO CUT-OFF DATE, DELIVERY IN 120 
DAYS, LOANER IF OUT OF SERVICE MORE THAN 4 DAYS WHILE 
UNDER WARRANTY, BIDDERS MUST PROVIDE THE WARRANTY AS 
STATED IN THE SPECIFICATIONS; PAGE 85 TO FINANCE FOR 
AWARDED VENDORS; NO BID ON TRUCK LIFT (HIREACH OR 
EQUIVALENT)

REFER TO CUT-OFF DATES; EXTENSION TO COOP 
MEMBERS, DOES NOT COVER 60 DAYS MUST BE ORDERED BY 10/1/13 WILL NOT HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS

NUMBER OF BIDDERS 4

BIDDER HARTER EQUIPMENT, INC. STORR TRACTOR COMPANY TRICO EQUIPMENT SERVICES LLC FOLEY, INC.

ADDRESS 615 STATE ROUTE 33 3191 HIGHWAY 22 551 N. HARDING HIGHWAY 855 CENTENNIAL AVENUE

CITY, STATE, ZIP MILLSTONE TWP., NJ 08535 BRANCHBURG, NJ 08876 VINELAND, NJ 08360 PISCATAWAY, NJ 08855

CONTACT VICTOR RIGA MARY LOU DES CHAMPS, CEO STEVEN SCATTOLINI JEFFREY MERLE

WEBSITE OR E-MAIL SALES@HARTERINC.COM KINDYK@STORRTRACTOR.COM SSCATTOLINI@TRICOEQUIPMENT.COM JMERLE@FOLEYINC.COM

TELEPHONE 732-446-7600 908-722-9830 856-697-1414 732-885-5555

FAX 732-446-9255 908-722-9847 856-697-4842 732-885-6655

NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK OK OK

STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE OK OK OK OK

EIC CERT.#6914 EXP. 3/15/20 CERT.#4399 EXP. 10/15/2015 CERT.#40921 EXP. 11/15/2017 CERT.#138 EXP. 5/15/2014

EXHIBIT A INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

CERTIFICATION TO HOLD PRICING BEYOND SIXTY DAYS YES YES YES NO

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 SIGNED SIGNED SIGNED SIGNED

CUT OFF DATE 10/1/2013 12/1/2013 10/1/2013 9/30/2013

CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE NEEDED IF AWARDED NEEDED IF AWARDED NEEDED IF AWARDED NEED IF AWARDED

ADKNOWLEDGEMENT OF ADDENDA - NO ADDENDA

EXTEND TO COOP YES YES YES YES

EMERGENCY DELIVERY PROCEDURE YES YES YES YES

DESCRIPTION NO. OF 
UNITS UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST

1 HIREACH G40F LIFT TRUCK OR EQUIVALENT WITH 
INTERNATIONAL #4300 SBA-4X2 CHASSIS OR EQUIVALENT 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

2 CASE 580SN LOADER BACKHOE OR EQUIVALENT 1  $                                                                   104,500.00 NO BID  $                                                                   105,681.00  $                                                                   108,881.00 

3
ALAMO INTERSTATER TRI FLAIL MOWING SYSTEM OR 
EQUIVALENT INSTALLED ON MCCORMICK TRACTOR MODEL 
MTX120-4 TIER 3

1 NO BID  $                                                                   137,315.00 NO BID NO BID

4
ALAMO INTERSTATER SHOULDER MOWER OR EQUIVALENT 
INSTALLED ON MCCORMICK TRACTOR ODEL T-MAX90 4WD 
WITH WORKSAVER POST POUNDER MODEL HDP-16SHC

1 NO BID  $                                                                     79,513.00 NO BID NO BID

BROCHURE YES YES YES YES

EXCEPTIONS YES, BIDDING JOHN DEERE 310SK LOADER BACKHOE, 
EXCEPTIONS TO BE REVIEWED BY FRANK DAJCZAK

YES, NOTED IN BID SPECIFICATIONS, FRANK DAJCZAK 
TO REVIEW, DELIVERY 120 - 150 DAYS, WARRANTY 

ONE YEAR
 NONE  YES, BIDDING CATERPILLAR 420F IT BACKHOE 

LOADER, FRANK TO REVIEW EXCEPTIONS 

FATAL FLAW  NO  NO   NO  NO 

AUGUST 22, 2013

BID RESULTS

CK09MERCER2013-13 VARIOUS EQUIPMENT FOR MERCER COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION AND INFRASTRUCTURE AND CO-OP



TOC: 180 CALENDAR DAYS FROM NTP, LD $1,000.00; LABOR AND 
PERFORMANCE AND MATERIAL PAYMENT BOND REQUIRED, 
MAINTENANCE BOND UPON ACCEPTANCE 5%, 2 YEARS; STRUCTURAL 
STEEL SUBCONTRACTOR

NUMBER OF RESPONDENTS 9

NAME OF BIDDER LUCAS BROTHERS, INC. MARBRO, INC. COLONNELLI BROS., INC. LOFTUS CONSTRUCTION, INC. RENCOR, INC. J. E. HANNON INC., T/A BIRD 
CONSTRUCTION SOUTH STATE, INC. MONTANA CONSTRUCTION 

CORP., INC. 
CROSSING CONSTRUCTION 

COMPANY, INC.

ADDRESS 80 AMBOY ROAD 127 PINE STREEET, PO BOX 134 409 SO. RIVER STREET 1903 TAYLOR'S LANE 24 TANNERY ROAD, STE. 1-B 105 HARBOR INN ROAD PO BOX 68 80 CONTANT AVENUE P.O. BOX 88

CITY, STATE, ZIP MORGANVILLE, NJ 07751 MONTCLAIR, NJ 07042 HACKENSACK, NJ 07601 CINNAMINSON, NJ 08077 SOMERVILLE, NJ 08876 BAYVILLE, NJ 08721 BRIDGETON, NJ 08302 LODI, NJ 07644 WASHINGTON CROSSING, PA 
18977

CONTACT LUIS LUCAS FRANK MARUCCI, JR. NINO COLONNELLI KEVIN J. LOFTUS ERNEST E. RENDA JAMES HANNON CHESTER J. OTTINGER, JR. LISA S. BALLEIMI MARK E. STITZ

TELEPHONE 732 536 6663 973 744 8383 201 440 1118 856 786 6607 908 534 2131 732 269 1333 856 451 5300 973 478 5200 215 493 0205

FAX 732 536 5831 973 746 5898 201 440 8282 856 786 6641 908 534 5071 732 269 4747 856 455 3461 973 478 7604 215 493 6536

E-MAIL DANIELLUCAS@LUCASBROS.COM MAR9400@COMCAST.NET NCOLONNELLI@COLONNELLI.COM KLOFTUS@LOFTUSCONSTRUCTION.CO
M RENCOR@RENCORINC.NET JIM@BIRDCONSTRUCTIONCO.COM BWIDRICK@SOUTHSTATEINC.COM LSANTAITE@MONTANACONSTRUCTIO

NINC.COM MSTITZ@COSSINGCONST.COM

INSURANCE REQUIRED FROM AWARDED VENDOR

ADDENDUM NO. ONE SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

BID GUARANTEE
NORTH AMERICAN SPECIALTY 

INSURANCE COMPANY 10% NTE 
20K

FIDELITY & DEPOSIT COMPANY 
OF MARYLAND 10% NTE 20K

HUDSON INSURANCE COMPANY 
10% NTE 20K

WESTERN SURETY COMPANY 10% 
NTE 20K

HARTFORD CASUALTY 
INSURANCE COMPANY 10% NTE 

20K

UNITED STATES SURETY 
COMPANY 10% NTE 20K

TRAVELERS CASUALTY AND 
SURETY COMPANY OF AMERICA 

10% NTE 20K

GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE 
COMPANY 10% NTE 20K

LIBERTY  MUTUAL INSURANCE 
COMPANY 10% NTE 20K

CONSENT OF SURETY SANDRA A. PACE AIF WITH POA MICHAEL J. MERWIN AIF WITH 
POA PAMELA BOYLE AIF WITH POA CHARLES MCCABE AIF WITH POA PAMELA J. BOYLE AIF WITH POA SANDRA A. AMORY AIF WITH 

POA
CHESTER J. OTTINGER, JR. AIF 

WITH POA
DONNA J. BORNEMANN AIF 

WITH POA ALAN R. HEIN AIF WITH POA

STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE OK OK OK OK OK OK OK OK OK

EXHIBIT B OK OK OK REQUIRED IF AWARDED OK OK OK OK REQUIRED IF AWARDED

AA201 REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 OK OK OK OK OK OK OK OK OK

PW CONTRACTOR REG. 61591 EXPIRES 7/16/14 607153 EXPIRES 6/13/14 606273 EXPIRES 7/18/14 618584 EXPIRES 12/10/14 605214 EXPIRES 5/8/15 52915 EXPIRES 6/19/14 51407 EXPIRES 4/10/14 61752 EXPIRES 5/5/14 REQUIRED IF AWARDED; 632586 
EXPIRES 9/11/15

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK OK OK OK OK OK OK REQUIRED IF AWARDED

DEBARRED NO NO NO NO NO NO NO NO NO

SAFETY CERT OK OK OK OK OK OK REQUIRED IF AWARDED OK OK

STRUCTURAL STEEL SUB IN-HOUSE IN-HOUSE IN-HOUSE IN-HOUSE IN-HOUSE IN-HOUSE IN-HOUSE IN-HOUSE
PHOENIX REBAR, LLC.; PW 

REQUIRED IF AWARDED; 673240 
EXPIRES 9/24/15

FIVE YEARS EXPERIENCE AND THREE REFERENCES INCLUDED, SUNNY TO CHECK INCLUDED, SUNNY TO CHECK INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

EQUIPMENT CERT OK OK OK OK OK OK OK OK OK

GRAND TOTAL 1,519,105.19 1,591,117.00 1,797,381.00 1,946,012.00 2,036,087.75 2,060,554.50 2,067,927.05 2,292,392.00 2,445,804.55

HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES WILL HOLD UP TO 60 DAYS AND 
MAY AGREE TO LONGER

EXCEPTIONS NONE NONE NONE NONE; MATHEMATICAL ERROR 
LINE #43  NONE NONE; MATHEMATICAL ERROR 

LINE #'S 35, 43 & GRAND TOTAL  NONE  NONE  NOT INCLUDED 

FATAL FLAW NO NO  NO NO  NO NO  NO  NO  NO 

BID RESULTS

AB2013-45 BRIDGE 672.9 TATTLETOWN ROAD OVER DOCTORS CREEK, HAMILTON TOWNSHIP

BID OPENING DATE:  AUGUST 23, 2013


