BID RESULTS

AB2013-56 PREVENTIVE MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR OF IRRIGATION SYSTEMS FOR THE MERCER COUNTY PARK COMMISSION

DECEMBER 17, 2013

NO. OF RESPONDENTS:

NAME OF BIDDER

EASTERN IRRIGATION AND PUMP COMPANY|

ATLANTIC IRRIGATION SPECIALTIES

ADDRESS

130 DEVEREUX ROAD

111 LAFAYETTE AVENUE

CITY, STATE, ZIP

GLENMORE, PA 19343

WHITE PLAINS, NY 10603

CONTACT GEORGE E. LEY Il FRED RAPP
TELEPHONE 610 942 2210 914 686 0008

FAX 610 942 9556 973 556 1596

E-MAIL GLEY@GELCOGOLF.COM FRAPP@ATLANTICIRRIGATION.COM
PRICE LIST DID NOT SUBMIT SUBMITTED

INSURANCE REQUIRED FROM AWARDED VENDOR

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

BID GUARANTEE AND CONSENT OF SURETY FOR REPAIR WORK
(NOT REQUIRED FOR PARTS)

AEGIS SECURITY INSURANCE COMPANY

10% NTE 20K; WILLIAM L. RUSHTON AIF WITH

NOT REQUIRED FOR PARTS

REFERENCES AND EXPERIENCE

INCLUDED - PC TO REVIEW

IRAN CERTIFICATION

SIGNED

SIGNED

PW CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION

616888 EXPIRES 4/15/15

NOT REQUIRED FOR PARTS

PUMP INSTALLER BRC AND PW

TIGER CONSTRUCTION COMPANY 65883
EXPIRES 5/5/15 PW CONTRACTOR
REGISTRATION REQUIRED WITH COPY OF
PUMP INSTALLER LICENSE #0001644

NOT REQUIRED FOR PARTS

LANDSCAPE IRRIGATION BRC AND PW

IN HOUSE 0015602 EXPIRES 1/31/15

NOT REQUIRED FOR PARTS

DEBARRED NO

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK
STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE OK OK
EQUIPMENT CERT OK NOT REQUIRED FOR PARTS
EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 OK OK

EXHIBIT B REQUIRED IF AWARDED EXHIBIT A REQUIRED
AA201 REQUIRED IF AWARDED EIC REQUIRED
SAFETY CERT SIGNED NOT REQUIRED FOR PARTS
HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS YES

EXCEPTIONS

DID NOT SUBMIT PRICE LIST; AWARD FOR
REPAIRS ONLY, NOT PARTS OTC

PARTIAL BID, FOR IRRIGATION SUPPLIES

ONLY

FATAL FLAW

NO

NO




PROPOSAL PAGE AB2013-56 AND COMPANY CONTACT FOR CONTRACTING

NAME OF BIDDER

EASTERN IRRIGATION AND PUMP COMPANY

ATLANTIC IRRIGATION SPECIALTIES

ADDRESS

130 DEVEREUS ROAD

111 LAFAYETTE AVENUE

CITY, STATE, ZIP

GLENMORE, PA 19343

WHITE PLAINS, NY 10603

CONTACT

ARLENE STILLMAN, SERVICE MANAGER

FRED RAPP

WEBSITE OR E-MAIL

SERVICE@SIPGOLF.COM

FRAPP@ATLANTICIRRIGATION.COM

TELEPHONE 610 942 2210 914 686 0008
CELL 610 942 3809 973 332 2585
FAX 610 942 9556 973 556 1596

MERCER COUNTY PARK COMMISSION

IRRIGATION SYSTEM LABOR RATE $ 125.00 NO BID
ESTIMATED NUMBER OF HOURS 1,250

TOTAL $ 156,250.00 NO BID
TWO YEAR PUMPING SYSTEM PREVENTIVE MAINTENANCE:

INCLUDES START-UP, SHUT DOWN, WINTERIZATION $ 13,000.00 NO BID
AND THREE EMERGENCY SERVICE CALL ANNUALLY

GRAND TOTAL FOR PARK COMMISSION $ 169,250.00 NO BID

INSERT LICENSE NUMBER AND PROVIDE

LICENSING INSERT LICENSE NUMBER AND PROVIDE COPIES COPIES
NEW JERSEY LANDSCAPE IRRIGATION (FOR PARK COMMISSION) 0015602 NO BID
PUMP INSTALLER LICENSE 0001644 NO BID

PARK COMMISSION PARTS (PARK COMMISSION PURCHASES DIRECTLY)

UPCHARGE OR DISCOUNT (+/-)

UPCHARGE OR DISCOUNT (+/-)

TORO GOLF CATALOG

PRICE LIST NOT INCLUDED

40% OFF LIST

HUNTER GOLF CATALOG

PRICE LIST NOT INCLUDED

40% OFF LIST

RAINBIRD GOLF CATALOG

PRICE LIST NOT INCLUDED

SEE PRICE LIST, UP TO 30% OFF LIST

MUST INCLUDE CATALOG, WEBSITE OR CD WITH PRICING




BID RESULTS

AB2013-63 ADA COMPLIANT RAMPS FOR DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

DECEMBER 17, 2013

ADDENDUM NO. ONE ISSUED FOR CLASS B CONCRETE AWARD ONE
YEAR, 158 RAMPS

NO. OF RESPONDENTS:

NAME OF BIDDER

JAK CONSTRUCTION CORP. /A DIAMOND CONSTRUCTION

IEW CONSTRUCTION GROUP INC.

ADDRESS

35 BEAVERSON BLVD.

75 SCULPTORS WAY

CITY, STATE, ZIP

BRICK, NJ 08723

TRENTON, NJ 08691

CONTACT JOHN KOVACS HARRY W. COLEMAN, JR.
TELEPHONE 732 262 7449 609 586 5005

FAX 732 262 7795 609 586 0356

E-MAIL DIAMONDJOHN@YAHOO.COM H.COLEMAN@IEWCONSTRUCTION.COM

INSURANCE REQUIRED FROM AWARDED VENDOR

RECEIPT OF ADDENDUM NO. ONE

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

BID GUARANTEE AND CONSENT OF SURETY

COMPANION PROPERTY & CASUALTY INSURANCE COMPANY 10%
NTE 20K: PHILIP S. TOBEY AIF WITH POA

LIBERTY MUTUAL INSURANCE COMPANY 10% NTE 20K;
ALAN R. HEIN AIF WITH POA

REFERENCES AND EXPERIENCE

INCLUDED JOHN TO REVIEW

INCLUDED, JOHN TO REVIEW

IRAN CERTIFICATION

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED

PW CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION 69394 EXPIRES 3/7/2014 605640 EXPIRES 5/8/14
DEBARRED NO NO

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK
STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE OK OK
EQUIPMENT CERT OK OK
EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 OK OK

EXHIBIT B OK OK

AA201 REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED
SAFETY CERT SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED
GRAND TOTAL 335,763.25 930,272.13
HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS YES YES

EXCEPTIONS

MATH ERROR, NO EXCEPTIONS

MATH ERROR, NO EXCEPTIONS

FATAL FLAW

NO

NO




ADA RAMP CONSTRUCTION PROPOSAL

ITEM JAK T/A DIAMOND IEW
CONSTRUCTION ITEM DESCRIPTIONS UNIT QUANTITY
NO. UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL

1 |FIELD ENGINEER HOURS 300 1.00 300.00 42.00 12,600.00

2 |EXCAVATION, UNCLASSIFIED cY 130 1.00 130.00 10.00 1,300.00

3 |9” X 18” CONCRETE VERTICAL CURB LF 1150 26.00 29,900.00 100.00 115,000.00
CONCRETE RETAINING CURB, 6" WIDTH

4 BY VARIABLE HEIGHT LF 330 25.00 8,250.00 100.00 33,000.00

5 |CONCRETE SIDEWALK (4" THICK) sy 1100 90.00 99,000.00 204.00 224,400.00

6 |PERVIOUS AREA RESTORATION % 130 1.00 130.00 28.00 3,640.00

7 |TRAFFIC DIRECTORS, FLAGGER HOURS 500 3.00 1,500.00 0.01 5.00
DETECTABLE WARNING SURFACE -

8 INSTALL ONLY sy 80 1.00 80.00 103.00 8,240.00

9 |TRAFFIC CONE UNITS 200 0.50 100.00 12.00 2,400.00

10 |DRUM UNITS 100 1.00 100.00 36.00 3,600.00

11 |CONSTRUCTION SIGNS SF 200 0.50 100.00 10.00 2,000.00
TRAFFIC CONTROL TRUCK WITH

12 MOUNTED CRASH CUSHION UNIT 1 6,000.00 6,000.00 210.00 210.00
BASE BID 68 LOCATIONS 145,590.00 406,395.00
DETECTABLE WARNING SURFACE -

13 FURNISH AND INSTALL sy 110 110.00 12,100.00 215.00 23,650.00

2.325
14 |Total Amount for Items 1 thru 7 X - 323,663.25 906,622.13]
(Multiplier)

BASE BID 68 PLUS 90 ADDITIONAL LOCATIONS (PER JOHN, ADD 335.763.25 930.272.13

LINE 13 + LINE 14) LINE 14 FACTORS BASE BID

Page 4 of 14



BID RESULTS

AB2013-59 SLUDGE AND SEPTIC REMOVAL AND SEWER LINE CLEANING FOR THE COUNTY OF MERCER

DECEMBER 18, 2013

AWARD TWO YEARS

NO. OF RESPONDENTS:

NAME OF BIDDER

ACCURATE WASTE SYSTEMS INC.

RUSSELL REID WASTE HAULING AND DISPOSAL
SERVICE INC.

ADDRESS

226 PROSEPCT POINT ROAD

200 SMITH STREET PO BOX 130

CITY, STATE, ZIP

LAKE HOPATCONG, NJ 07849

KEASBEY, NJ 08832

CONTACT DAN CAREY DAVID J. DAM
TELEPHONE 973 252 8400 800 356 4468

FAX 973 252 0006

E-MAIL AWS.DANC@GMAIL.COM DDAM@RUSSELLREID.COM

NJ DEP LICENSE FOR TRANSPORT

NJDEP VEHICLE REGISTRATION NUMBER 12032

NJDEP VEHICLE REGISTRATION NUMBER 07911

INSURANCE REQUIRED FROM AWARDED VENDOR

RECEIPT OF ADDENDUM NO. ONE AND TWO OK OK
NUMBER OF TRUCKS IN FLEET 20 15
CERTIFICATION THAT TRUCKS HAVE 7000 GALLON CAPACITY YES YES
NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK
STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE OK OK
EXHIBIT A OK OK

CERTIFICATE OF EMPLOYEE INFORMATION

13294 EXPIRES 1.15.21

6723 EXPIRES 1.15.15

GRAND TOTAL 201,865.00 281,133.00
HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS YES YES

CONTINUITY OF OPERATION DURING EMERGENCIES YES YES

EXCEPTIONS NONE REFERENCED; MATH ERROR NONE

FATAL FLAW NO NO




SEPTAGE REMOVAL FOR THE MERCER COUNTY CORRECTION CENTER

ACCURATE WASTE

RUSSELL REID

YEAR ONE SLUDGE

COST PER GALLON

TOTAL YEAR ONE

COST PER GALLON

TOTAL YEAR ONE

Approx. 500,000 gallons per year $ 0.0500 | $ 25,000.00 0.0530 | $ 26,500.00
YEAR TWO SLUDGE COST PER GALLON TOTAL YEAR TWO COST PER GALLON TOTAL YEAR TWO
Approx. 500,000 gallons per year $ 0.0500 | $ 25,000.00 0.0530 | $ 26,500.00
YEAR ONE SEPTIC COST PER GALLON TOTAL YEAR ONE COST PER GALLON TOTAL YEAR ONE
Approx. 156,000 gallons per year $ 0.1100 | $ 17,160.00 0.1449 | $ 22,604.40
YEAR TWO SEPTIC COST PER GALLON TOTAL YEAR TWO COST PER GALLON TOTAL YEAR TWO
Approx. 156,000 gallons per year $ 0.1100 | $ 17,160.00 0.1449 | $ 22,604.40
GRAND TOTAL COST FOR YEAR ONE & TWO FOR SLUDGE $ 84,320.00 $ 08,208.80

AND SEPTAGE REMOVAL

JET CLEANING TERMINAL BUILDING PIPING, SEWER LINES, SEWER PITS, REMOVAL OF GREASE, AND SEPTIC SYSTEM PUMPING FOR T

HE TRENTON MERCER

AIRPORT
ANNUAL COST YEAR ONE $ 5,300.00 $ 7,600.00
ANNUAL COST YEAR TWO $ 5,300.00 $ 7,600.00
SEPTIC SYSTEM PUMPING FOR 250 GALLON TANK TO BE
PUMPED ONCE EVERY OTHER WEEK YEAR ONE $ 4,290.00 YEAR ONE $ 1,410.50
SEPTIC SYSTEM PUMPING FOR 250 GALLON TANK TO BE
PUMPED ONCE EVERY OTHER WEEK YEAR TWO $ 4,290.00 YEAR TWO $ 1,410.50
TOTAL COST FOR THE TWO YEARS PERIOD $ 19,180.00 $ 18,021.00
ADDITIONAL WORK COST PER HOUR COST PER HOUR
HOURLY RATE FOR MISCELLANOUS WORK ESTIMATED AT s 150,00 | $ 7.500.00 175.00 | $ 8.750.00
50 HOURS
GRAND TOTAL FOR THE CORRECTION CENTER $ 84,320.00 $ 98,208.80
GRAND TOTAL FOR THE TRENTON-MERCER AIRPORT $ 19,180.00 $ 18,021.00
GRAND TOTAL FOR THE PARK COMMISSION (FROM PARK COMMISSION SS) $ 90,865.00 $ 156,153.20
COST FOR MISC WORK (BASED UPON HOURLY RATE) $ 7,500.00 $ 8,750.00
GRAND TOTAL ALL LOCATIONS $ 201,865.00 $ 281,133.00

GRAND TOTAL IN THE WRITTEN WORD




MERCER COUNTY PARK COMMISSION LOCATIONS

FACILITIES REQUIRED DESCRIPTION OF WORK AND TANK SIZE SERVICE PER YEAR | COSTPERFACILITY | COST PER FACILITY COST PER FACILITY | COST PER FACILITY
ACCURATE WASTE RUSSELL REID
1 YR, 2" YR, 1 YR, 2V YR,

MERCER COUNTY SKATING RINK Pumping & Jet Washing 2X PER YR. $ 1,450.00 | $ 1,450.00 | $ 1,652.00 | $ 1,652.00
WEST WINDSOR, NJ 08550 3,000 GALLONS
CONTACT PERSON:
ROB DOHERTY: 609-448-1975
MERCER COUNTY TENNIS COMPLEX Septic Tank
334 SOUTH POST ROAD 1,500 GALLONS 2X PER YR. $ 750.00 | $ 750.00 | $ 1,001.00 | $ 1,001.00
WEST WINDSOR NJ 08550 1,000 GALLONS 2X PER YR. $ 500.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 784.00 | $ 784.00
ROB DOHERTY PUMP TANK 1,500 GALLONS 2X PER YR. $ 750.00 | $ 750.00 | $ 1,001.00 | $ 1,001.00
609-448-1975
MERCER COUNTY TENNIS FACILITY PUMPING & JET WASHING
(CLUBHOUSE) SEPTIC SYSTEM
334 SOUTH POST ROAD 2,000 GALLON SEPTIC TANK 2X PER YR. $ 1,080.00 | $ 1,080.00 | $ 1,218.00 | $ 1,218.00
WEST WINDSOR, NJ 08550 2,000 GALLON PUMP TANK 2X PER YR. $ 1,080.00 | $ 1,080.00 | $ 1,218.00 | $ 1,218.00
CONTACT PERSON:
MARC VECCHIOLLA
609-448-2088
MERCER COUNTY PARK FIELD HOUSE PUMPING & JET WASHING 2X PER YR. $ 590.00 | $ 590.00 | $ 567.00 | $ 567.00
334 SOUTH POST ROAD SEPTIC SYSTEM
WEST WINDSOR, NEW JERSEY 08550 500 GALLONS
CONTACT PERSON:
ROB DOHERTY
609-448-1975
MERCER COUNTY PARK SOFTBALL PUMPING & JET WASHING 2X PER YR. $ 590.00 | $ 590.00 | $ 567.00 | $ 567.00
PRESSBOX/CONCESSION STAND SEPTIC SYSTEM
334 SOUTH POST ROAD 500 GALLONS
WEST WINDSOR, NEW JERSEY 08550
CONTACT PERSON:
ROB DOHERTY
609-448-1975
MERCER COUNTY WEST PICNIC AREA PUMPING & JET WASHING 2X PER YR. $ 1,450.00 | $ 1,450.00 | $ 1,652.00 | $ 1,652.00
334 SOUTH POST ROAD PUMPING STATION
WEST WINDSOR, NJ 08550 3,000 GALLONS
CONTACT PERSON:
BOB DOHERTY
609-448-1975
MERCER COUNTY RECREATION CENTER PUMPING & JET WASHING 2X PER YR.
1638 OLD TRENTON ROAD SEPTIC SYSTEM $ 590.00 | $ 590.00 | $ 567.00 | $ 567.00
WEST WINDSOR, NJ 08550 500 GALLONS
CONTACT PERSON:
MIKE MELKER
609-426-1312
MERCER COUNTY MAINTENANCE WKSP
1638 OLD TRENTON ROAD PUMPING & JET WASHING 2X PER YR. $ 590.00 | $ 590.00 | $ 567.00 | $ 567.00
WEST WINDSOR, NJ 08550 SEPTIC SYSTEM
CONTACT PERSON: 500 GALLONS
MIKE MELKER
609-426-1312
MERCER COUNTY EAST PICNIC AREA PUMPING & JET WASHING 2X PER YR. $ 1,450.00 | $ 1,450.00 | $ 1,652.00 | $ 1,652.00
DUTCH-NECK EDINBURG ROAD PUMPING STATION
WEST WINDSOR, NJ 08550 3,000 GALLONS
CONTACT PERSON:
ROB DOHERTY
609-448-1975
MERCER OAKS CLUBHOUSE PUMPING & JET WASHING 2X PER YR. $ 590.00 | $ 590.00 | $ 567.00 | $ 567.00
725 VILLAGE ROAD WEST PUMPING STATION
WEST WINDSOR, NJ 08550 500 GALLONS
CONTACT PERSON:
JAY LONG
718-496- 6900
PRINCETON COUNTRY CLUB GARAGE PUMPING & JET WASHING 2 PTNY&UML?RCH $ 710.00 | $ 710.00 | $ 784.00 | $ 784.00
1 WHEELER WAY- (OFF ROUTE 1) SEPTIC SYSTEM
PRINCETON, NJ 08540 1,000 GALLONS
CONTACT PERSON:
JAY LONG
718.496.6900
HOWELL FARM BIRNUM HOUSE PUMPING & JET WASHING 1X EVERY 2 YEARS | $ 450.00 | $ - s B 500.50
84 PLEASANT VALLEY ROAD SEPTIC SYSTEM
TITUSVILLE, NJ 08560 1,500 GALLONS




MERCER COUNTY PARK COMMISSION LOCATIONS

FACILITIES REQUIRED

DESCRIPTION OF WORK AND TANK SIZE

SERVICE PER YEAR

COST PER FACILITY

COST PER FACILITY

COST PER FACILITY

COST PER FACILITY

ACCURATE WASTE RUSSELL REID

1 YR, 2" YR, 1 YR, 2V YR,
CONTACT PERSON:
GARY HOUGHTON
609-737-3299
HOWELL LIVING HISTORY FARM PUMPING & JET WASHING 1X EVERY 2 YEARS | $ 450.00 | $ - s K 500.50
101 HUNTER ROAD SEPTIC SYSTEM
TITUSVILLE, NJ 08560 1,500 GALLONS
CONTACT PERSON:
GARY HOUGHTON
609-737-3299
HOWELL FARM TESAURO HOUSE
93 VALLEY ROAD SEPTIC SYSTEM 1X EVERY 2 YEARS | $ 185.00 | $ K - s 217.00
TITUSVILLE, NJ 08560 1,000 GALLONS
CONTACT PERSON:
GARY HOUGHTON
609-737-3299
HOWELL FARM WOODENS HOUSE PUMPING & JET WASHING 1X EVERY $ 450.00 | $ - s - s 500.50
78 PLEASANT VALLEY ROAD SEPTIC SYSTEM 2 YRS
TITUSVILLE, NJ 08560 1,500 GALLONS
CONTACT PERSON:
GARY HOUGHTON
609-737-3299
HOWELL FARM FARMHOUSE PUMPING & JET WASHING 1X EVERY $ 450.00 | $ - s - s 500.50
17 VALLEY ROAD SEPTIC SYSTEM 2 YRS
TITUSVILLE, NJ 08560 1,500 GALLONS
CONTACT PERSON:
GARY HOUGHTON
609-737-3299
HOWELL FARM WORKSHOP PUMPING & JET WASHING 1X EVERY $ 450.00 | $ - s K 500.50
17 VALLEY ROAD SEPTIC SYSTEM 2 YRS
TITUSVILLE, NJ 08560 1,500 GALLONS
CONTACT PERSON:
GARY HOUGHTON
609-737-3299
HOWELL FARM VISITOR'S CENTER PUMPING & JET WASHING 1X EVERY $ 540.00 | $ K K 609.00
70 WOODENS LANE SEPTIC SYSTEM 2 YRS
TITUSVILLE, NJ 08560 2,000 GALLONS
CONTACT PERSON:
GARY HOUGHTON
609-737-3299
MERCER COUNTY ROSEDALE PARK PUMPING SEPTIC SERVICE 2X PER YR. $ 370.00 | $ 370.00 | $ 217.00 | $ 217.00
FEDERAL CITY ROAD 500 GALLONS
HOPEWELL, NJ 08534
CONTACT PERSON:
JEFF PIVOVARNICK
609-426-1181
MERCER COUNTY EQUESTRIAN CENTER PUMPING & JET WASHING 1X PER YR
4318 FEDERAL CITY ROAD 3,000 GALLON PUMP TANK $ 725.00 | $ 725.00 | $ 826.00 | $ 826.00
PENNINGTON, NJ 08534 1,500 GALLON PUMP TANK $ 450.00 | $ 450.00 | $ 500.50 | $ 500.50
CONTACT PERSON: 2,000 GALLON SEPTIC TANK $ 540.00 | $ 540.00 | $ 609.00 | $ 609.00
CHRISTINE CARDINAL 1,000 GALLON SEPTIC TANK $ 355.00 | $ 355.00 | $ 392.00 | $ 392.00
609-730-9059 1,250 GALLON SEPTIC TANK $ 400.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 446.25 | $ 446.25
MOUNTAINVIEW GOLF COURSE GARAGE PUMPING & JET WASHING 1X PER YR
BEAR TAVERN ROAD SEPTIC SYSTEM
EWING, NJ 08638 1,000 GALLONS $ 355.00 | $ 355.00 | $ 392.00 | $ 392.00
CONTACT PERSON:
CHRIS SCHUSTER
609-882-2392
MERCER COUNTY VALLEY RD. PICNIC AREA PUMPING HOLDING TANK 10X PER YR $ 2,405.00 | $ 2,405.00 | $ 2,821.00 | $ 2,821.00
VALLEY ROAD 1,300 GALLONS
TITUSVILLE, NJ 08560
CONTACT PERSON:
JEFF PIVOVARNICK
609-426.1181
MERCER COUNTY WILDLIFE CENTER PUMP & JET WASH
1750 RIVER ROAD 1,500 GALLONS 2 X PER YEAR $ 895.00 | $ 895.00 | $ 1,001.00 | $ 1,001.00
TITUSVILLE, NJ 08560 1,500 GALLONS 2 X PER YEAR $ 895.00 | $ 895.00 | $ 1,001.00 | $ 1,001.00

CONTACT PERSON:

DIANE NICKERSON




MERCER COUNTY PARK COMMISSION LOCATIONS

FACILITIES REQUIRED DESCRIPTION OF WORK AND TANK SIZE SERVICE PER YEAR | COSTPERFACILITY | COST PER FACILITY COST PER FACILITY | COST PER FACILITY
ACCURATE WASTE RUSSELL REID
2 YR, 2'° YR. YR 2"° YR,

609-883-6606
BALDPATE MTN. VISITORS CENTER PUMPING & JET WASHING 1X PER YR $ 540.00 | $ 540.00 | $ 609.00 | $ 609.00
28 FIDDLERS CREEK ROAD 2,000 GAL.
TITUSVILLE, N.J. 08560
CONTACT PERSON:
JEFF PIVOVARNICK
609-426 -1181
BALDPATE MTN. EDUCATIONAL CTR 1,750 GAL. 1X PER YR $ 495.00 | $ 495.00 | $ 554.75 | $ 554.75
(LODGE) (SAME ADDRESS AS ABOVE)
HISTORIC HUNT HOUSE PUMPING & JET WASHING
197 BLACKWELL ROAD 1,250 GAL. SEPTIC TANK 1X PER YR $ 400.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 446.25 | $ 446.25
PENNINGTON, N.J. 08534
CONTACT PERSON:
FRANK ZABAWA
609-303-0708
MERCER MEADOWS RESTROOMS 1, 2, 3, 4 PUMPING 1X
197 BLACKWELL ROAD 2-1000 GAL. TANKS (PER RESTROOM) EVERY 3 WKS $ 15,640.00 | $ 15,640.00 | $ 30,153.90 | $ 30,153.90
PENNINGTON, N.J. 08534 4000 GALS. TOTAL
CONTACT PERSON: ADD 100 GALLONS OF WATER
FRANK ZABAWA AFTER EVERY PUMP OUT
609-303-0708 JET WASHING 3X PER YR
MERCER COUNTY PARK QUAKERBRIDGE ROAD FIELDS RESTROOM PUMPING
4025 QUAKERBRIDGE ROAD 2-1000 GAL. TANKS 1X $ 7,310.00 | $ 7,310.00 | $ 22,645.70 | $ 22,645.70
WEST WINDSOR, N.J. 08550 ADD 100 GALLONS OF WATER EVERY 3 WKS
CONTACT PERSON: AFTER EVERY PUMP OUT
FRANK ZABAWA JET WASHING 3X PER YR
609-303-0708
TOTAL $ 46,920.00 | $ 43,945.00 | $ 76,412.35 | $ 79,740.85
GRAND TOTAL FOR TWO YEARS FOR PARK COMMISSION $ 90,865.00 $ 156,153.20




BID RESULTS

AB2013-65 TAX DATA SERVICE

DECEMBER 19, 2013

NO BIDS RECEIVED




BID RESULTS

AB2013-64 ALTERATIONS TO THE MERCER COUNTY MEDICAL EXAMINER'S FACILITY

DECEMBER 20,

2013

Work will commence within Ten (10) Calendar Days after receipt of]
wiitten "Notice to Proceed" and be substantially completed in 145 CD.
LD in the amount of $250.00 per CD; The County is in process of]
lawarding a contract for MOPEC equipment. The awarded contractor
shall coordinate with the contractor furishing the equipment.

INO. OF RESPONDENTS:

13

INAME OF BIDDER

JH. WILLIAMS ENTERPRISES, INC.

HELIOS CONSTRUCTION, INC.

3R PAINTING AND CONTRACTING CO., INC.

CONSTRUCTONOMICS LLC

ADDRESS

231 HAINES DRIVE

1321A ALLENHURST AVENUE

122 DRUMMOND AVENUE

1926 CHRISTIAN STREET

CITY, STATE, ZIP

MOORESTOWN, NJ 08057

OCEAN, NJ 07712

NEPTUNE, NJ 07753

PHILADELPHIA, PA 19146

CONTACT JAMES H. WILLIAMS STEVE SOURIAS SUZANNE FUSCO JOHN POOLE
TELEPHONE 856 793 7114 732 663 0200 732 775 4369 215 834 5155
FAX 856 222 0017 732 663 0206 732 775 3978 215 392 2909
E-MAIL MPW@JIMWILLIAMSBUILDERS.COM HELIOS CONSTRUCTION, INC. oL.com JPOOLE@CONSTRUCTON! com

INSURANCE REQUIRED FROM AWARDED VENDOR

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

RECEIPT OF ADDENDUM NO. ONE

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

BID GUARANTEE

THE OHIO CASUALTY INSURANCE COMPANY 10% NTE 20K

NGM INSURANCE COMPANY 10% NTE 20K

UNITED STATES SURETY COMPANY 10% NTE 20K

NOT SUBMITTED

CONSENT OF SURETY

RICHARD K. STRONG AIF WITH POA

DAWN M. JONES AIF WITH POA

CHELSEA L. ODDI AIF WITH POA

NOT SUBMITTED

REFERENCES AND EXPERIENCE

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

PW CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION

20496 EXPIRES 11/19/15

604425 EXPIRES 4/3/14

42992 EXPIRES 7/19/14

NOT REGISTERED AS A PW CONTRACTOR

DEBARRED

NO

NO

NO

NO

INEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION

oK

oK

oK

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

ELECTRICAL SUBCONTRACTOR LICENSE PW & BRC

QPI ELECTRIC 64769 EXPIRES 5/7/14; LICENSE #
34EB01070500 EXPIRES 3/31/15; BRC OK

SUN ELECTRIC CONSTRUCTION CORP. 55273 EXPIRES
3/31/14; LICENSE # 34EB00714600 EXPIRES 3/31/15; BRC

SUN ELECTRIC CONSTRUCTION CORP. 55273 EXPIRES
3/31/14; LICENSE # 34EB00714600 EXPIRES 3/31/15; BRC

QPI ELECTRIC 64769 EXPIRES 5.7.14

PLUMBING SUBCONTRACTOR LICENSE PW & BRC

CHAPPELLE MECHANICAL 653735 EXPIRES 10/3/14;
LICENSE # 36BI01091900 EXPIRES 6/30/15; BRC OK

CHAPPELLE MECHANICAL 653735 EXPIRES 10/3/14;
LICENSE # 36BI01091900 EXPIRES 6/30/15; BRC OK

RANDY E. PANICK LLC 639215 EXPIRES 8/22/14; LICENSE #
36BI01052900 EXPIRES 6/30/15; BRC OK

NATIONAL PLUMBING & HEATING 636703 EXPIRES 8.1.14

HVAC SUBCONTRACTOR PW & BRC

CHAPPELLE MECHANICAL 653735 EXPIRES 10/3/14; BRC

PHOENIX HVAC LLC 664465 EXPIRES 7/5/14; BRC OK

COMFORT MECHANICAL CORP. 605670 EXPIRES 7/11/14;

WEST JERSEY AIR CONDITIONING & HEATING 624252

oK EXPIRES 5.15.14

[STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE oK oK oK oK

EQUIPMENT CERT oK oK oK oK

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 oK oK oK oK

EXHIBIT 8 INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED

AA201 REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED

SAFETY CERT oK oK oK oK

GRAND TOTAL 154,400, 170,525.7] 171,991, 172,404.0,

HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS YES YES YES YES

EXCEPTIONS NONE NONE REFERENCED; MATHEMATICAL ERROR LINE # 74 NONE NONE; NO SUBCONT:G;\;}‘T’TRESDPW' BRC. ORLICENSE
YES, FAILURE TO SUBMIT A BID GUARANTEE AND CONSENT

FATAL FLAW NO NO NO OF SURETY, N.J.S.A. 40A:11-21; BIDDERS IS NOT REGISTERED)

AS A PW CONTRACTOR, N.J.S.A. 34:11-56.48 et seq

INAME OF BIDDER

ALIANO BROTHERS GENERAL CONTRACTORS, INC.

TRI-FORM CONSTRUCTION, INC.

PREMIER BUILDERS, INC.

ASKARI CONSTRUCTION, INC.

| ADDRESS 2560 INDUSTRIAL WAY 119 LIBERTY STREET 1015 BIG OAK ROAD 416 WOODBURY DRIVE
CITY, STATE, ZIP VINELAND, NJ 08360 METUCHEN, NJ 08840 YARDLEY, PA 19067 WYCKOFF, NJ 07481
CONTACT MICHAEL ALIANO, JR. ROBERT KARABINCHAK MUHAMMAD IQBAL
TELEPHONE 856 794 9490 732 548 8161 215 295 4640 908 821 5880

FAX 856 794 9492 732548 8164 215 295 8512 201 891 5808

E-MAIL L oL.com TRIE com com com

INSURANCE REQUIRED FROM AWARDED VENDOR

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

RECEIPT OF ADDENDUM NO. ONE

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

BID GUARANTEE

ALLEGHENY CASUALTY COMPANY 10% NTE 20K

LIBERTY MUTUAL INSURANCE COMPANY 10% NTE 20K

COLONIAL SURETY COMPANY 10% NTE 20K

COMPANION PROPERTY & CASUALTY 10%

CONSENT OF SURETY

CHRISTOPHER J. RUCK AIF WITH POA

DONNA J. BORNEMANN AlF WITH POA

ANTHONY J. CIMASKO AIF WITH POA

PHILIP S. TOBEY AIF WITH POA

REFERENCES AND EXPERIENCE

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

PW CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION

589865 EXPIRES 3/6/14

68597 EXPIRES 3/25/14

53306 EXPIRES 1/15/14

692275 EXPIRES 12/5/14

DEBARRED

NO

NO

NO

NO

INEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION

oK

oK

oK

oK

ELECTRICAL SUBCONTRACTOR LICENSE PW & BRC

G.M. WHITE ELECTRICAL CONTRACTOR, INC. 44938
EXPIRES 4/24/14; LICENSE # 34EB01307700 EXPIRES
3/31/15; BRC OK

MJF ELECTRICAL CONTRACTING, INC. 619432 EXPIRES
10/10/15; LICENSE # 34EB01289200 EXPIRES 3/31/15; BRC
oK

QPIELECTRICAL CO., INC. 64769 EXPIRES 5/7/14; LICENSE
#34EB01070500 EXPIRES 3/31/15; BRC OK

SUN POWER ELECTRICAL CONTRACTOR LLC 697220
EXPIRES 9/12/14; LICENSE # 36EB00862100 EXPIRES
3/31/15; BRC OK

PLUMBING SUBCONTRACTOR LICENSE PW & BRC

DRISCOLL MECHANICAL LLC 639312 EXPIRES 8/15/15;
LICENSE # 36BI01194800 EXPIRES 6/30/15; BRC OK

RANDY E. PANICK LLC 639215 EXPIRES 8/22/14; LICENSE #
368101052900 EXPIRES 6/30/15; BRC OK

FALASCA MECHANICAL, INC. 64699 EXPIRES 5/2/15;
LICENSE # 36BI01039600 EXPIRES 6/30/15; BRC OK

FALASCA MECHANICAL, INC. 64699 EXPIRES 5/2/15;
LICENSE # 36BI01039600 EXPIRES 6/30/15; BRC OK

HVAC SUBCONTRACTOR PW & BRC

COMFORT MECHANICAL CORP. 605670 EXPIRES 7/11/14;

WEST JERSEY AR CONDITIONING & HEATING CO. 624252
EXPIRES 5/15/14; BRC OK

WEST JERSEY AR CONDITIONING & HEATING CO. 624252
EXPIRES 5/15/14; BRC OK

FALASCA MECHANICAL, INC. 64699 EXPIRES 5/2/15; BRC

[STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE oK oK oK oK

EQUIPMENT CERT oK oK REQUIRED IF AWARDED oK

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 oK oK oK oK

EXHIBIT 8 INCLUDED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED

AA201 REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED

SAFETY CERT oK oK oK oK

GRAND TOTAL 190,672.9) 199,940, 201,955.9 207,905,
HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS YES YES YES YES

EXCEPTIONS NONE NONE NOT INCLUDED; MATH ERRORS NONE; MATHEMATICAL ERRORS|

ATAL FLAW NO NON-RESPONSIVE, DID NOT PROVIDE UNIT COSTS ON NO NO

PROPOSAL PAGE




shall coordinate with the contractor furnishing the equipment.

[Work will commence within Ten (10) Calendar Days after receipt of
lwiitten "Notice to Proceed" and be substantially completed in 145 CD,
LD in the amount of $250.00 per CD; The County is in process of
awarding a contract for MOPEC equipment. The awarded contractor

NO. OF RESPONDENTS:

NAME OF BIDDER

FLAGSHIP CONTRACTING, INC.

ROCON CONSTRUCTION GROUP, INC.

GOLDEN CROWN CONTRACTORS, INC.

ADDRESS

171 LAKE AVENUE

705 ROUTE 71

4099 SOUTH BROAD STREET

CITY, STATE, ZIP

COLONIA, NJ 07067

BRIELLE, NJ 08730

YARDVILLE, NJ 08620

[CONTACT GAVRANG SHAH L. SCHIEDER JOSEPH J. LUIZZIA
TELEPHONE 732207 2118 732528 4710 609 585 0265

FAX 908 753 9959 732528 4714 609 585 2775

E-MAIL GMSHAHS8@AOL.COM LARRY@ROCON.COM sou NET

INSURANCE REQUIRED FROM AWARDED VENDOR

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

[RECEIPT OF ADDENDUM NO. ONE

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

BID GUARANTEE

CCOMPANION PROPERTY & CASUALTY INSURANCE
COMPANY 10% NTE 20K

CCOMPANION PROPERTY & CASUALTY INSURANCE
COMPANY 10%

PENNSYLVANIA NATIONAL MUTUAL CASUALTY INSURANCE!
COMPANY 10% NTE 20K

[ CONSENT OF SURETY PHILIP S. TOBEY AIF WITH POA PHILIP S. TOBEY AIF WITH POA DEBORAH L. SERETIS AIF WITH POA
[REFERENCES AND EXPERIENCE REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

PW CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION 694352 EXPIRES 4/8/14 680479 EXPIRES 7/22/14 603521 EXPIRES 3/31/14
DEBARRED NO NO NO

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION REQUIRED IF AWARDED oK oK

ELECTRICAL SUBCONTRACTOR LICENSE PW & BRC

ALTEC BUILDING SYSTEMS CORP. 601102 EXPIRES 8/9/14;
LICENSE # 34EB01107300 EXPIRES 3/31/15; BRC REQUIRED

SUN ELECTRIC CONSTRUCTION CORP. 55273 EXPIRES
3/31/14; LICENSE # 34EB00714600 EXPIRES 3/31/15; BRC

CATARI ELECTRIC, INC. 36456 EXPIRES 8/30/14; LICENSE #
34EB00530600 EXPIRES 3/31/15; BRC REQUIRED

[PLUMBING SUBCONTRACTOR LICENSE PW & BRC

B & B MAINTENANCE 662871 EXPIRES 4/2/14; LICENSE #
36BI01178500 EXPIRES 6/30/15; BRC REQUIRED

RANDY E. PANICK LLC 639215 EXPIRES 8/22/14; LICENSE #
368101052900 EXPIRES 6/30/15; BRC OK

FALASCA MECHANICAL, INC. 64699 EXPIRES 5/2/15;
LICENSE # 36BI01039600 EXPIRES 6/30/15; BRC REQUIRED

HVAC SUBCONTRACTOR PW & BRC

ENVIRONMENTAL CLIMATE CONTROL 604557 EXPIRES

FALASCA MECHANICAL, INC. 64699 EXPIRES 5/2/15; BRC
oK

FALASCA MECHANICAL, INC. 64699 EXPIRES 5/2/15; BRC

7/16/14; BRC REQUIRED REQUIRED
STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE TO VERIFY, WRONG BOX CHECKED OK OK
EQUIPMENT CERT REQUIRED IF AWARDED oK oK
[EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 REQUIRED IF AWARDED OK oK

EXHIBIT B REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED

AA201 REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED

[SAFETY CERT REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED oK

GRAND TOTAL 179,240.1] 182,685.8| 190,306.7]
HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS YES YES YES

NOT INCLUDED; MATHEMATICAL ERROR LINE GENERAL

NOT INCLUDED; MATHEMATICAL ERRORS; PW CERT

CITY, STATE, ZIP

TRENTON, NJ 08638

JACKSON, NJ 08527

[CONTACT LEONARD J. SCOZZARI SAVVAS KYRIACOU
TELEPHONE 609 989 1221 732 961 6011

FAX 609 989 1262 732 961 6026
E-MAIL LSCOZZARI@SCOZZARLCOM SAVVAS1@OPTONLINE.NET

INSURANCE REQUIRED FROM AWARDED VENDOR

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

[RECEIPT OF ADDENDUM NO. ONE

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

BID GUARANTEE

ARCH INSURANCE COMPANY 10% NTE 20K

AMERICAN CONTRACTORS INDEMNITY COMPANY 10%
NTE 20K

[CONSENT OF SURETY JASON COOPER AIF WITH POA BRUCE M. ALLEN AIF WITH POA
[REFERENCES AND EXPERIENCE INCLUDED INCLUDED

[PW CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION 589040 EXPIRED 4/17/14 657877 EXPIRES 5/22/14
DEBARRED NO NO

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION oK oK

ELECTRICAL SUBCONTRACTOR LICENSE PW & BRC

CATARI ELECTRIC, INC. 36465 EXPIRES 8/30/14; LICENSE #
34EB00530600 EXPIRES 3/31/15; BRC OK

S & SELECTRIC 652773 EXPIRES 10/26/15; LICENSE #
34EI01141300 EXPIRES 3/31/15; BRC OK

[PLUMBING SUBCONTRACTOR LICENSE PW & BRC

J.W. POOLE. INC. 48566 EXPIRES 4/25/15; NO MASTER
PLUMBER LICENSE; BRC OK

GABE SGANGA, INC. 603508 EXPIRES 3/31/14; LICENSE #
368100946900 EXPIRES 6/30/15; BRC OK

HVAC SUBCONTRACTOR PW & BRC

CHAPPELLE MECHANICAL, INC. 653735 EXPIRES 10/3/14;

GABE SGANGA, INC. 603508 EXPIRES 3/31/14; BRC OK

AND N.J.A.C. 13:32-1.4 et seq LAUREN CALLED CONSUMER
AFFAIRS NO LICENSE AS PLUMBER

STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE OK OK
[EQUIPMENT CERT oK oK
[EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 OK OK
EXHIBIT B INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED
AA201 REQUIRED F AWARDED REQUIRED F AWARDED
[SAFETY CERT oK oK
GRAND TOTAL 227,192.7) 700,000.0)
HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS YES, LIMITED TO 60 DAYS NO
[excepTioNs NONE REFERENCED NONE REFERENCED
YES, PLUMBING SUBCONTRACTOR IS NOT REGISTERED AS A
ATAL FLAW MASTER PLUMBER; REQUIRED BY N.JS.A. 45:14C-1 etseq | NON-RESPONSIVE, DID NOT PROVIDE UNIT COSTS ON

PROPOSAL PAGE

EXCEPTIONS DEMOLITION SUBTOTAL; PW CERTS REQUIRED FOR SUBS NOTINCLUDED REQUIRED FOR SUBS IF AWARDED
FATAL FLAW NO NO NO

NAME OF BIDDER SCOZZARI BUILDERS, INC ARISTA BUILDERS AND DESIGNERS, INC.

ADDRESS 1891 NORTH OLDEN AVENUE 329 JACKSON MILLS ROAD




PROPOSAL PAGE AB2013-64
[ [ [ FATAL FLAW
| | J.H. WILLIAMS HELIOS 3R PAINTING CONSTRUCTONOMICS FLAGSHIP ROCON
item [D ) [ Unit_| Quantity | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total UnitPrice | Total UnitPrice | Total UnitPrice | Total Unit Price | Total
General Demolition
1 GC Demolition - Office Partitions LF 45 $21.00| $945.00| $25.00 $1,125.00] $25.00 $1,125.00] $25.00 $1,125.00] $24.00| $1,080.00] $28.00] $1,260.00]
2 GC Demolition - Door, Frame and Associated Hardware EA 4 $110.00 $440.00) $150.00 $600.00) $260.00 $1,040.00 $100.00 $400.00) $175.00 $700.00| $50.00 $200.00|
3 GC Demolition - Interior Glazing and Associated Trim EA 3 $12.00] $36.00] $100.00 $300.00} $50.00] $150.00} $100.00 $300.00} $150.00 $450.00} $40.00] $120.00}
4 GC Demolition - Fiberglass Clad Gypsum Wallboard SF 1,430 $2.00 $2,860.00] $1.50 $2,145.00] $4.00 $5,720.00] 2.00) $2,860.00] $1.20 $1,716.00] 1.10] $1,573.00]
5 GC Demolition - Broadloom Carpet & Backing Material plus SF 340 $3.00) $1,020.00} $2.00| $680.00 $3.00| $1,020.00} 4.00) $1,360.00] $2.00| $680.00 0.96/ $326.40
6 GC Demolition - Painted Concrete Floor Finish SF 606 $2.00 $1,212.00] $2.50 $1,515.00] $1.00 $606.00) 2.00) $1,212.00 $2.50 $1,515.00] 2.00 $1,212.00
7 GC Demolition - Select Portions of Masonry Wall SF 5 $110.00 $550.00} $50.00 $250.00} $20.00 $100.00} $100.00 $500.00} $60.00 $300.00} $5.00 $25.00}
8 GC Demolition - Portion of Blank-Off Transom Panel EA 1 $110.00 $110.00| $500.00 $500.00) $50.00 $50.00 $250.00 $250.00) $100.00 $100.00| $1.00 $1.00]
9 GC Demoilition - Concrete Floor Slab Saw-Cutting SF 50 $60.00] $3,000.00f $10.00] $500.00} $10.00] $500.00} $85.00] $4,250.00] $30.00 $1,500.00] $10.00 $500.00}
10 GC Demolition - Portion of Sprinkler Line LF 40 $20.00 $800.00| $50.00 $2,000.00] $100.00 $4,000.00] $25.00 $1,000.00 $10.00 $400.00) $40.00 $1,600.00]
11 |GC Demolition - Suspended Ceiling System plus all Fixtures SF 1,060 $2.00 $2,120.00] $1.50 $1,590.00f $2.00 $2,120.00] $2.00 $2,120.00] $1.80 $1,908.00 $0.90 $954.00}
12 GC Demolition - Suspended Exhaust Hood EA 1 $110.00 $110.00) $400.00 $400.00) $1,000.00] $1,000.00 $250.00 $250.00) $2,500.00] $2,500.00] $175.00 $175.00)
13 |GC Demolition - Casework and Equipment LF 45 $12.00] $540.00} $30.00 $1,350.00 $50.00 $2,250.00 $50.00 $2,250.00 $40.00| $1,800.00] $7.50 $337.50}
14 GC Demolition - Removal of Temporary Partition LF 16 $12.00 $192.00) $20.00 $320.00) $50.00 $800.00| $10.00 $160.00) $20.00 $320.00) $28.00 $448.00)
15 |GC Demolition - Prepare Env. Chamber 119 for new Floor Finish | SF 225 $4.00 $900.00} $3.00 $675.00} $2.00 $450.00} $10.00] $2,250.00] $4.00 $900.00} $3.00 $675.00}
General Demolition Subtotal $14,835.00) $13,950.00 $20,931.0! $20,287.00) $15,869.00) $9,406.90]
General Construction
16 GC Construction - Temporary Partition LF 16 $50.00 $800.00| $30.00 $480.00) $200.00 $3,200.00} $31.25 $500.00) $84.00 $1,344.00 $50.00 $800.00|
17 |GC Construction - Infill Former Large Glazed Opening EA 1 $200.00 $200.00} $1,500.00 $1,500.00] $500.00 $500.00) $200.00 $200.00| $960.00 $960.00| $500.00 $500.00)
18 GC Construction - Infill Former Small Glazed Opening EA 1 $200.00 $200.00) $750.00 $750.00) $400.00 $400.00| $200.00 $200.00| $240.00 $240.00) $200.00 $200.00)
19 |GC Construction - Install Gypsum Wallboard upon Existing SF 1,430 $1.00 $1,430.00] $3.00 $4,290.00 $5.00 $7,150.00 $1.50 $2,145.00] $3.25 $4,647.50) $1,7_5| $2,502.50]
20 GC Construction - Fur-Out Existing Utility Pipe EA 1 $200.00 $200.00) $300.00 $300.00) $500.00 $500.00) $300.00 $300.00) $1,400.00 $1,400.00 $200.00 $200.00)
21 |GC Construction - Infill Masonry Wall at Former Exhaust Duct EA 1 $200.00 $200.00} $300.00 $300.00} $750.00 $750.00} $1,500.00 $1,500.00) $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $200.00 $200.00}
22 GC Construction - Concrete Slab Infil at Former Grease Trap SF 20 $20.00 $400.00) $25.00 $500.00) $30.00 $600.00| $75.00] $1,500.00 $75.00 $1,500.00] $12.00 $240.00)
23 |GC Construction - Partition Type 3 LF 4 $110.00 $440.00} $30.00 $120.00} $100.00 $400.00} $50.00 $200.00} $174.00 $696.00} $50.00 $200.00}
24 GC Construction - Partition Type 5A LF 31 $110.00 $3,410.00] $30.00 $930.00) $150.00 4,650.00] $50.00 1,550.00] $168.00 $5,208.00} $50.00 1,550.00]
25 |GC Construction - Partition Type 58 LF 32 $110.00 $3,520.00 $30.00 $960.00} $150.00 4,800.00] $50.00 1,600.00] $140.00 4,480.00) $50.00] 1,600.00)
26 |[GC Construction - Opening 109-A EA 1 1,000.00 1,000.00} 1,500.00 1,500.00} $2,500.00 2,500.00} 1,400.00] 1,400.00} 1,650.00] 1,650.00} $2,000.00) 2,000.00}
27 |GC Construction - Opening 112-1 EA 1 1,000.00 1,000.00} 1,500.00 1,500.00f $2,500.00] $2,500.00f 1,400.00| 1,400.00] 1,600.00 1,600.00} $2,000.00 $2,000.00
28 [GC Construction - Opening 112-2 EA 1 1,000.00 1,000.00} 1,500.00 1,500.00} $2,500.00) $2,500.00) 1,400.00] 1,400.00} 1,550.00] 1,550.00} $2,000.00) $2,000.00)
29 |GC Construction - Opening 112-3 EA 1 1,000.00] 1,000.00) $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 1,400.00 1,400.00) $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00]
30 [GC Construction - Opening 112-4 EA 1 1,000.00 1,000.00} $1,500.00) $1,500.00) $1,000.00) $1,000.00) 1,400.00] 1,400.00} $1,500.00) $1,500.00) $2,000.00) $2,000.00)
31 |GC Construction - Opening 113-1 EA 1 1,000.00 1,000.00} $1,500.00 $1,500.00) $2,500.00 $2,500.00f 1,400.00| 1,400.00] $1,600.00 $1,600.00) $2,000.00 $2,000.00
32 [GC Construction - Opening 114-1 EA 1 1,000.00 1,000.00} $1,500.00) $1,500.00) $2,500.00) $2,500.00) 1,400.00] 1,400.00} $1,600.00) $1,600.00) $0.00
33 |GC Construction - Carpet Tile 1 SY 49 $60.00 $2,940.00 $65.00 $3,185.00] $50.00 $2,450.00 $35.00 1,715.00) $58.00 $2,842.00] $75.00 $3,675.00
34 GC Construction - Epoxy Floor Paint SF 600 $6.00 $3,600.00] $5.00 $3,000.00} $1.50 $900.00| $2.50 1,500.00] $4.25 $2,550.00] $1.25 $750.00)
35 |GC Construction - Acoustical Suspended Ceiling - Panel Type SF 440 $6.00 $2,640.00 $4.00 $1,760.00 $6.00 $2,640.00 $5.00 $2,200.00 $5.50 $2,420.00] $9.50 $4,180.00
36 GC Construction - Acoustical Suspended Ceiling - Panel Type SF 600 $6.00| $3,600.00] $4.00| $2,400.00 $6.00| $3,600.00] $5.00| $3,000.00 $5.75| $3,450.00 $11.50] $6.900.00]
37 |GC Construction - Reinstall Emergency Eyewash Unit EA 1 $200.00 $200.00} $4,000.00 $4,000.00] $500.00 $500.00} $200.00 $200.00} $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $200.00 $200.00}
38 GC Construction - Lab Coat Rack EA 1 $200.00 $200.00) $700.00 $700.00) $500.00 $500.00) $200.00 $200.00| $1,500.00] $1,500.00] $175.00 $175.00)
39 |GC Construction - Laboratory Dissecting Light EA 1 $200.00 $200.00} $1,500.00 $1,500.00] $400.00 $400.00| $200.00 $200.00| $7,500.00 $7,500.00] $3,150.00 $3,150.00]
40 GC Construction - Visitor Bench in Corridor EA 1 $600.00 $600.00 $1,000.00] $1,000.00 $100.00 $100.00| $200.00 $200.00) $0.00] $750.00 $750.00)
41 |GC Construction - Epoxy Ploor Paint in Env. Chamber 119 SF 225 $5.00 $1,125.00] $5.00 $1,125.00] $2.00 $450.00f $2.00 $450.00} $5.00 $1,125.00] $1.25] $281.25|
General Demolition and Construction Subtotal $32,905.00 $39,800.00 $52,990.00 $29,160.00 $58,262.50 $42,053.75)
Mechanical Demolition and Construction
42 MC Demolition - Remove Ductwork LF 35 $40.00 1,400.00] $20.00 $700.00| $50.00 $1,750.00] $50.00 1,750.00] $50.00 $1,750.00] $68.00 $2,380.00}
43 MC Construction - Install 4" x 4" Galvanived Ductwork LF 14 $90.00 1,260.00) $25.00 $350.00} $100.00 $1,400.00] 100.00 1,400.00) 135.00 $1,890.00 $85.00 $1,190.00]
44 MC Construction - Install 4" Dia. Flexible Ductwork LF 30 $86.00 2,580.00] $25.00 $750.00) $4.00 $120.00| 150.00 4,500.00] 126.00 $3,780.00} $100.00 $3,000.00}
45 MC Construction - Install 14" x 5" Stainless Ductwork LF 13 190.00 $2,470.00] 400.00 $5,200.00 $300.00 $3,900.00 150.00 1,950.00) 141.00 1,833.00) $323.00 4,199.00]
46 MC Construction - Install 16" x 10" Stainless Ductwork LF 15 190.00 $2,850.00] 400.00 $6,000.00} $380.00 $5,700.00} 150.00 2,250.00] 155.00 2,325.00] $280.00 4,200.00]
47 MC Construction - Install 14-1/2" Diameter Stainless Ductwork LF 8 120.00 $960.00} 400.00 $3,200.00 $400.00 $3,200.00] 150.00 1,200.00) 141.00 1,128.00) $200.00 1,600.00)
48 MC Construction - Install 24" x 18" Stainless Ductwork LF 7 120.00 $840.00) $375.00 $2,625.00] $480.00 $3,360.00] 150.00 1,050.00] 160.00 1,120.00] $229.00 1,603.00]
49 MC Construction - Install Existing Supply Diffusers EA 2 $82.00 $164.00} $350.00 $700.00} $50.00 $100.00} $500.00 1,000.00) 120.00 $240.00} $125.00 $250.00}
50 MC Construction - Install New Supply Diffusers EA 2 $80.00 $160.00| $375.00 $750.00) $100.00 $200.00) $500.00 1,000.00] 160.00 $320.00) $175.00 $350.00)
51 MC Construction - Install Existing Return Grilles EA 2 $420.00 $840.00} $300.00 $600.00} $50.00 $100.00} $200.00 $400.00} 150.00 $300.00} $600.00 $1,200.00]
52 MC Construction - Install New Return Grilles EA 1 $420.00 $420.00) $300.00 $300.00) $85.00 $85.00 $400.00 $400.00) 172.00 $172.00) $600.00 $600.00|
53 |MC Construction - Install New Indoor Air Handling Unit EA 2 $4,200.00 $8,400.00] $7,000.00]  $14,000.00) $2,300.00 $4,600.00] $6,000.00[ _$12,000.00) $5,500.00[ _ $11,000.00) $7,200.00 $14,400.00)
54 MC Construction - Install New Exterior Air Condensing Unit EA 1 1,700.00 $1,700.00} $6,000.00 $6.000.00] $2,000.00] $2,000.00] $6,000.00] $6,000.00} $6,400.00 $6,400.00] $3,000.00 $3,000.00}
55 MC Construction - Install New Indoor Exhaust Fan EA 1 1,700.00 $1,700.00] $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,900.00 $2,900.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $1,305.00 $1,305.00] $2,400.00 $2,400.00]
56 MC Construction - Install New Exterior Wall Exhaust Louver EA 1 1,700.00 $1,700.00} $1,500.00] $1,500.00 $400.00 $400.00 $2,500.00] $2,500.00] $1,305.00] $1,305.00} $3,000.00 $3,000.00}
Mechanical Demolition and Construction Subtota $27,444.00 $45,175.00 $29,815.00 $42,400.00 $34,868.00 $43,372.00
Electrical Demolition and Construction
57 EC Demolition - Remove Recessed Fit Light Fixtures EA 19 $25.00 $475.00} $98.00 $1,862.00 $100.00 $1,900.00] $100.00 $1,900.00] $42.00 $798.00} $93.00 $1,767.00]
58 EC Demolition - Remove Wiring, Conduit & Devices LF 275 $3.00 $825.00) $7.00 $1,925.00] $8.00| $2,200.00 $13.00 $3,575.00] $3.95 1,086.25) $7.00 $1,925.00]
57 EC Construction - Install New Clean Room 2x4 Recessed EA 10 $380.00 $3,800.00 430.00 $4,300.00] $370.00 $3,700.00 $500.00 $5,000.00 $478.00 4,780.00] $370.00 $3,700.00
58 EC Construction - Install New Office Pendant Fluorescent Light EA 12 $380.00 $4,560.00] 450.00 $5,400.00 $0.00] $400.00 $4,800.00 $340.00 4,080.00) $1.00| $12.00}
EC Construction - Install Recessed Wall Duplex Outlets EA 10 $380.00 $3,800.00 125.00 $1,250.00 100.00 $1,000.00] $200.00 $2,000.00] $241.00 $2,410.00 100.00 $1,000.00}
60 EC Construction - Install Recessed Wall Quadplex Outlets EA 2 $380.00 $760.00) 125.00 $250.00) 110.00 $220.00) $200.00 $400.00) $873.00 1,746.00] 110.00 $220.00)
61 EC Construction - Install Above Ceiling Duplex Outlets EA 2 $240.00 $480.00} $300.00 $600.00} 100.00 $200.00} $400.00 $800.00} $503.00 1,006.00] 100.00 $200.00}
62 EC Construction - Install Recessed Wall Device Switches EA 5 $280.00 $1,400.00} $125.00 $625.00) 100.00 $500.00) $400.00 $2,000.00 $288.00 1,440.00] 100.00 $500.00)
EC Construction - Install Recessed Junction Boxes EA 2 $280.00 $560.00} $100.00 $200.00} 100.00 $200.00} $300.00 $600.00} $509.00 1,018.00) 100.00 $200.00}
64 EC Construction - Install Emergency Exit Lights w/ Egress Light EA 4 $600.00 $2,400.00} $300.00 $1,200.00 210.00 $840.00) $250.00 $1,000.00 $563.00 2,252.00] 208.00 $832.00)
EC Construction - Install New Wiring within Concealed LF 325 $7.00 $2,275.00] $12.00] $3,900.00 $11.00] $3,575.00 $10.00 $3,250.00 $12.60| 4,095.00] $36.00 $11,700.00)
EC Construction - Install New Lighting in Env. Chamber 119 EA 3 $550.00 $1,650.00] $400.00 $1,200.00 $320.00 $960.00) $500.00 $1,500.00] $734.00] 2,202.00] $320.00 $960.00)
Electrical Demolition and Construction Subtota $22,985.00 $22,712.00 $15,295.00 $26,825.00 $26,913.25| $23,016.00
Plumbing Demolition and Construction
67 PC Demolition - Cap HW & CW Lines at Sink EA 1 $950.00 $950.00} $300.00 $300.00} $500.00 $500.00} $1,000.00 $1,000.00} $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00]
68 PC Demolition - Disconnect and Store Emergency Eyewash EA 1 $950.00 $950.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00} $600.00 $600.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00} $1,500.00 $1,500.00} $2,400.00 $2,400.00
69 PC Demolition - Remove Acid Net 1 Tank EA 1 $950.00 $950.00} $1,500.00 $1,500.00] $700.00 $700.00} $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $2,700.00 $2,700.00
70 PC Construction - Install Piping for New Eyewash Location LF 30 25.00 $750.00) 25.00 $750.00) $50.00 $1,500.00 $200.00 $6,000.00} $70.00 2,100.00] $60.00| $1,800.00
71 PC Construction - Install Piping for New Autopsy Sink LF 20 $120.00 $2,400.00 $125.00 $2,500.00 $100.00 $2,000.00 $150.00 $3,000.00 $90.00 1,800.00) $100.00 $2,000.00}
72 PC Construction - Reinstall Piping for Relocated Sprinkler Line LF 40 75.00 $3,000.00} $165.00 $6,600.00] $35.00 $1,400.00] $125.00 $5,000.00} $110.00 4,400.00] $20.00 $800.00|
73 PC Construction - Install Acid Neutralization Tank EA 1 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $7,500.00 7,500.00] $2,400.00 $2,400.00
74 __|PC Construction - Install Cold Water Line in Env. Chamber 119 LF 40 $50.00 $2,000.00} $25.00 $1,000.00| $60.00 $2,400.00] $100.00 $4,000.00 $30.00 1,200.00) $65.00 $2,600.00]
Plumbing Demolition and Construction Subtotal $17,000.00} $20,350.00} $11,600.00 $27,500.00 $24,500.00 $16,200.0¢
Construction Sub-Total $115,169.00) $141,987.00) $130,631.0( $146,172.00) $160,412.75) $134,048.65|
Contractors' Soft Costs
75 __|GC Final Cleaning Prior to Close-Out % Project $1,151.69] $3,000.00] $2,000.00} $1,461.72) $0.00] $1,000.00]
76 _|Trash and Dumpster Hauling Week 12 $1,225.23] $1,400.00 $3,000.00] $0.00} $3,000.00 $2,100.00
77__|Insurance % | Project $3,000.00) $2,000.00) $2,192.58 $1,500.00)
78 _|Performance Bonds % Project $3,500.00 $5,000.00] $3,654.30) $2,500.00
79 Permits % Project $0.00] $5,000.00} $2,923.44] $1,591.93 $3,000.00}
80 __|Field Office Trailer w/ Utilities, Office Equipment and Supplies Month 5 $2,000.00f $0.00) $0.00) $1,500.00) $2,000.00f
81 _|Contractor Overhead and Profit % Project $15,638.70) $24,360.00) $16,000.00] $7,959.64| $36,537.16
82 Owners' Contingency Allowance % Project
Construction Grand Total $154.400.00] $170,525.70) $171,991.00] $172,404.0: $179,240.11 $182,685.81]
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PROPOSAL PAGE AB2013-64

| [ [ NON-RESPONSIVE FATAL FLAW NON-RESPONSIVE
| | GOLDEN CROWN ALIANO BROTHERS TRI-FORM PREMIER BUILDERS ASKARI SCOZZARI ARISTA
Item _|Description [ Unit [Quantity | UnitPrice [ Total UnitPrice | Total UnitPrice | Total UnitPrice | Total UnitPrice | Total UnitPrice | Total UnitPrice | Total
General Demolition

1 GC Demolition - Office Partitions LF 45 $24411| $1,084.95| $65.00] $2,925.00] $0.00| $31.11] $1,399.95| $12.00] $540.00) $215.00! $9,675.00] $0.00|
2 GC Demolition - Door, Frame and Associated Hardware EA 4 $113.00| $452.00] $400.00] 0.00] $267.50 $1,070.00 $42.00! $168.00] $78.00! $312.00] 0.00]
3 GC Demolition - Interior Glazing and Associated Trim EA 3 $120.53! $675.00 0.00) $226.67! $680.01 $5.00; $15.00] $50.00; $150.00 0.00)
4 GC Demolition - Fiberglass Clad Gypsum Wallboard SF 1,430 2.02] $2,888.60) $1,573.00] 0.00] $3,160.30 $5.00 $7,150.00 $0.94/ $1,344.20] 0.00]
5 GC Demolition - Broadloom Carpet & Backing Material plus SF 340 1.06 $360.40) $510.00) 0.00} $1,149.20 $5.00 $1,700.00 $0.50 $170.00) 0.00}
6 GC Demolition - Painted Concrete Floor Finish SF 606 34.04 $2,448.24] $2,121.00 0.00] $2,048.28| $5.00; $3,030.00] $5.60; $3,393.60) 0.00]
7 GC Demolition - Select Portions of Masonry Wall SF 5 $63.28! $316.40 $600.00 0.00) $680.00 $30.00! 150.00 $74.07; $370.35 0.00)
8 GC Demolition - Portion of Blank-Off Transom Panel EA 1 $203.40 $203.40 $800.00| 0.00] $600.00| $200.00 200.00] $90.00; $90.00 0.00]
9 GC Demolition - Concrete Floor Slab Saw-Cutting SF 50 $22.60; $1,130.00) $1,250.00) 0.00| $1,470.00| $15.00 750.00] $17.00 $850.00) 0.00|
10 GC Demolition - Portion of Sprinkler Line LF 40 $27.76 $1,110.40] $2,000.00 0.00] $720.00| $8.00; $320.00] $7.00; $280.00| 0.00]
11 |GC Demolition - Suspended Ceiling System plus all Fixtures SF 1,060 $2.37 $2,512.20 $1,590.00 0.00} $1,621.80 $3.00 $3,180.00 $0.80 $848.00) 0.00}
12 GC Demolition - Suspended Exhaust Hood EA 1 $90.00; $90.00 $500.00| 0.00] $320.00 $320.00| $445.00 $445.00) 0.00]
13 |GC Demoilition - Casework and Equipment LF 45 $4.00; $180.00 $1,125.00] 0.00) $275.00! $12,375.00 $14.05! $632.25 0.00)
14 GC Demolition - Removal of Temporary Partition LF 16 $22.00. $352.00) $400.00| 0.00] $800.00| $75.00! $1,200.00 $21.20 $339.20) 0.00]
15 |GC Demolition - Prepare Env. Chamber 119 for new Floor Finish SF 225 $12.28 $2,763.00) $1,012.50) 0.00| $1,379.25] $3.00; $675.00 $0.00 0.00)
General Demolition Subtotal $16,253.18 $17,481.50 $16,500.00 $18,899.04] $31,773.00) $18,899.60) 0.00]

General Construction
16 GC Construction - Temporary Partition LF 16 $81.78 $1,308.48| $125.00 $2,000.00 0.00] $125.00 $2,000.00 $15.00! $240.00| $39.12 $625.92| 0.00]
17 |GC Construction - Infill Former Large Glazed Opening EA 1 $350.30! $350.30) $1,700.00| $1,700.00] 0.00) $1,050.00 $1,050.00] $400.00! $400.00 $948.00! $948.00 0.00)
18 GC Construction - Infill Former Small Glazed Opening EA 1 $277.00 $277.00) $650.00 $650.00) 0.00] $700.00 $700.00| $250.00 $250.00) $948.00 $948.00| 0.00]
19 |GC Construction - Install Gypsum Wallboard upon Existing SE 1,430 $4.58 $6,549.40 $5.00 $7,150.00 0.00} $2.71 $3,875.30 $3.00 $4,290.00 $14.03|  $20,062.90} 0.00)
20 GC Construction - Fur-Out Existing Utility Pipe EA 1 $264.00 $264.00) $250.00 $250.00| 0.00] $1,050.00] $1,050.00 $650.00 $650.00) $186.00 $186.00) 0.00]
21 |GC Construction - Infill Masonry Wall at Former Exhaust Duct EA 1 $237.30! $237.30) $200.00! $200.00 0.00) $950.00! $950.00 $150.00! $150.00 $750.00! $750.00 0.00)
22 |GC Construction - Concrete Slab Infil at Former Grease Trap SF 20 $70.00 $1,400.00] $25.00 $500.00 0.00| $90.75, $1,815.00] $175.00! $3,500.00) $50.00 $1,000.00) 0.00|
23 |GC Construction - Partition Type 3 LF 4 $66.00! $264.00 $100.00! $400.00 0.00) $400.00! $1,600.00] $40.00; $160.00 $113.00! $452.00 0.00)
24 GC Construction - Partition Type 5A LF 31 $161.16 $4,995.96 $140.00 $4,340.00 0.00] $200.00 $6,200.00| $60.00; $1,860.00] $186.77 $5,789.87| 0.00]
25 |GC Construction - Partition Type 58 LF 32 $157.26! $5,032.32] $135.00! 34,320.00) 0.00) $173.00! $5,536.00] $75.00; $2,400.00] $560.74! $17,943.68] 0.00)
26 GC Construction - Opening 109-A EA 1 $1,514.10] $1,514.10 1,300.00 1,300.00] 0.00] 1,675.00] $1,675.00] $80.00 $80.00 1,548.00 1,548.00] 0.00]
27 |GC Construction - Opening 112-1 EA 1 $2,227.00| $2,227.00) 1,300.00] 1,300.00] 0.00) 1,780.00 $1,780.00] $425.00 425.00] 1,967.00 1,967.00) 0.00)
28 _|GC Construction - Opening 112-2 EA 1 $1,183.00 $1,183.00) 1,300.00} 1,300.00 0.00) 1,310.00] $1,310.00) 5425.00 425.00] 1,532.00] 1,532.00 0.00)
29 |GC Construction - Opening 112-3 EA 1 $3,782.00] $3,782.00) 1,900.00] 1,900.00 0.00] $3,800.00 $3,800.00] $425.00 425.00] $3,928.00] $3,928.00] 0.00)
30 GC Construction - Opening 112-4 EA 1 $1,099.00] $1,099.00 1,000.00 1,000.00] 0.00] $1,270.00] $1,270.00| $425.00! 425.00] $1,453.00] $1,453.00] 0.00]
31 |GC Construction - Opening 113-1 EA 1 $1,691.00] $1,691.00) 1,300.00] 1,300.00] 0.00] $1,850.00 $1,850.00] $425.00 425.00] $1,936.00) $1,936.00] 0.00)
32 GC Construction - Opening 114-1 EA 1 $1,691.00] $1,691.00 1,300.00 1,300.00] 0.00] $1,850.00] $1,850.00] $425.00! 425.00] $1,936.00] $1,936.00] 0.00]
33 |GC Construction - Carpet Tile 1 SY 49 $106.39! $5,213.11] $68.00! $3,332.00] 0.00) $69.00! $3,381.00] $25.00; $1,225.00] $70.25] $3,442.25] 0.00)
34 GC Construction - Epoxy Floor Paint SF 600 $2.83] $1,698.00] $7.00; $4,200.00| 0.00] $7.84 $4,704.00] $4.00; $2,400.00| $4.00; $2,400.00| 0.00]
35 |GC Construction - Acoustical Suspended Ceiling - Panel Type SF 440 $6.67; $2,934.80) $11.50; $5,060.00] 0.00) $5.68! $2,499.20] $6.00; $2,640.00] $6.63! $2,917.20] 0.00)
36 GC Construction - Acoustical Suspended Ceiling - Panel Type SF 600 $13.65! $8,190.00] $11.50! $6,900.00] 0.00] $8.34, $5,004.00 $6.00! $3,600.00) $6.62] $3,972.00) 0.00)
37 |GC Construction - Reinstall Emergency Eyewash Unit EA 1 $80.00; $80.00] $600.00! $600.00 0.00) 770.00 770.00 $250.00! $250.00 $100.00! $100.00 0.00)
38 GC Construction - Lab Coat Rack EA 1 $214.70 $214.70) $225.00 $225.00) 0.00] 110.00 110.00) $250.00 $250.00) $3,500.00 $3,500.00) 0.00]
39 |GC Construction - Laboratory Dissecting Light EA 1 $200.00! $200.00 $4,800.00 $4,800.00] 0.00) $400.00 400.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00] $400.00! $400.00 0.00)
40 |GC Construction - Visitor Bench in Corridor EA 1 $200.00 $200.00| $800.00 $800.00| 0.00| 200.00 200.00] $1,500.00] $1,500.00) $0.00; $0.00 0.00]
41 |GC Construction - Epoxy Ploor Paint in Env. Chamber 119 SF 225 $2.83; $636.75) $7.00; $1,575.00] 0.00) $9.12; $2,052.00] $5.00; $1,125.00] $4.00; $900.00 0.00)
General Demolition and Construction Subtotal $53,233.22| $58,402.00 $58,070.00 $57,431.50 $36,020.00 $80,637.82 0.00]

Mechanical Demolition and Construction
42 MC Demolition - Remove Ductwork LF 35 $72.00; 520.00) $51.43 $1,800.05 0.00] $67.14 $2,349.90| $70.00; 2,450.00] $28.00 $980.00| $7,000.00]
43 |MC Construction - Install 4" x 4" Galvanived Ductwork LF 14 $90.00; 1,260.00) $107.14 $1,499.96) 0.00} $71.42 $999.88| $85.00! 1,190.00] $56.00; $784.00) $2,000.00]
44 MC Construction - Install 4" Dia. Flexible Ductwork LF 30 $105.00 150.00] $5.00; $150.00| 0.00] $8.50; $255.00) $100.00 ,000.00 $52.00 $1,560.00] $2,000.00]
45 MC Construction - Install 14" x 5" Stainless Ductwork LF 13 $339.23! 54,409.99 $315.39! $4,100.07| 0.00) $392.54! $5,103.02] $325.00! 34,225.00) 102.00 $1,326.00] $8,000.00]
46 MC Construction - Install 16" x 10" Stainless Ductwork LF 15 $339.23 $5,088.45 $393.33 $5,899.95 0.00] $441.33 $6,619.95 $285.00 $4,275.00 132.00 $1,980.00 $8,000.00]
47 MC Construction - Install 14-1/2" Diameter Stainless Ductwork LF 8 $210.00! $1,680.00] $412.50! $3,300.00] 0.00) $225.00! $1,800.00] $210.00! 1,680.00) 122.00 $976.00 $2,000.00]
48 MC Construction - Install 24" x 18" Stainless Ductwork LF 7 $210.00 $1,470.00| $482.14 $3,374.@| 0.00] $1,285.70] $8,999.90| $230.00 1,610.00 148.00 $1,036.00| $8,000.00]
49 MC Construction - Install Existing Supply Diffusers EA 2 $131.25! $262.50 $55.00! 110.00 0.00) $250.00! $500.00 $300.00! $600.00 $95.00! $190.00 $2,000.00]
50 MC Construction - Install New Supply Diffusers EA 2 $183.75 $367.50) $105.00 210.00] 0.00] $150.00 $300.00| $350.00 $700.00| $130.00 $260.00| $1,000.00
51 MC Construction - Install Existing Return Grilles EA 2 $630.00! $1,260.00] $55.00; 110.00 0.00) $200.00! $400.00 $1,250.00 $2,500.00] $120.00! $240.00 $1,000.00
52 MC Construction - Install New Return Grilles EA 1 $630.00 $630.00| $100.00 100.00) 0.00] $200.00 $200.00| $650.00 $650.00) $240.00 $240.00| $2,000.00
53 |MC Construction - Install New Indoor Air Handling Unit EA 2 $7,665.00] $15,330.00] $3,500.00 $7,000.00 0.00} $4,025.00] $8,050.00 $7,500.00]  $15,000.00] $3,000.00] $6,000.00 $30,000.00)
54 __[MC Construction - Install New Exterior Air Condensing Unit EA 1 $3,150.00 $3,150.00) $4,300.00 $4,300.00) 0.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00) $3,500.00 $3,500.00) $7,719.00 $7,719.00) $25,000.00
55 MC Construction - Install New Indoor Exhaust Fan EA 1 $2,520.00| $2,520.00] $3,900.00 $3,900.00] 0.00) $2,700.00| $2,700.00] $2,700.00| $2,700.00] $3,800.00 $3,800.00] $6,000.00]
56 MC Construction - Install New Exterior Wall Exhaust Louver EA 1 $3,150.00] $3,150.00] $1,000.00 $1,000.00] 0.00] $1,200.00 $1,200.00] $3,500.00] $3,500.00 $1,735.00] $1,735.00] $6,000.00]
Mechanical Demolition and Construction Subtota $46,248.44] $36,855.01] $42,000.00 $41,977.65 $47,580.00] $28,826.00] $110,000.00]
Electrical Demolition and Construction
57 __|EC Demolition - Remove Recessed Fluorescent Light Fixtures EA 19 $16.14 $306.66| $52.64; $1,000.16, 0.00} $15.37, $292.03] $100.00; $1,900.00 $15.37, $292.03] 0.00}
58 EC Demolition - Remove Wiring, Conduit & Devices LF 275 $7.14 $1,963.50) $9.64/ $2,651.00] 0.00] $6.80; $1,870.00] $25.00. $6,875.00) $6.80; $1,870.00] 0.00]
57 |EC Construction - Install New Clean Room 2x4 Recessed EA 10 $361.83! $3,618.30] $317.50! $3,175.00] 0.00) $344.60! $3,446.00] $500.00! $5,000.00] $344.60! $3,446.00] 0.00)
58 EC Construction - Install New Office Pendant Fluorescent Light EA 12 $223.21 $2,678.52] $129.17 $1,550.04] 0.00] $212.58 $2,550.96 $650.00 $7,800.00 $212.58 $2,550.96 0.00]
59 |EC Construction - Install Recessed Wall Duplex Outlets EA 10 $73.08! 730.80 $90.00; $900.00 0.00) $69.60! $696.00 $200.00! $2,000.00] $69.60! $696.00 0.00)
60 EC Construction - Install Recessed Wall Quadplex Outlets EA 2 $91.9ﬂ 183.88| $105.00 $210.00] 0.00] $87.50! $175.00] $300.00 $600.00] $87.50! $175.00] 0.00]
61 |EC Construction - Install Above Ceiling Duplex Outlets EA 2 $60.28! 120,@' $100.00! $200.00 0.00) $55.50! $111.00 $250.00! $500.00 $55.50! $111.00 0.00)
62 EC Construction - Install Recessed Wall Device Switches EA 5 $81.90 409.50] $120.00 $600.00| 0.00] $78.00. $390.00| $250.00 $1,250.00] $78.00. $390.00| 0.00]
63 |EC Construction - Install Recessed Junction Boxes EA 2 $59.85! 119.70] $75.00; $150.00 0.00) $57.00; $114.00 $275.00! $550.00 $57.00; $114.00 0.00)
64 EC Construction - Install Emergency Exit Lights w/ Egress Light EA 4 $392.44 $1,569.76| $500.00 $2,000.00 0.00] $373.50 $1,494.00] $490.00 $1,960.00] $373.75 $1,495.00] 0.00]
65 |EC Construction - Install New Wiring within Concealed LF 325 $30.57| $9,935.25 $20.61] $6,698.25] 0.00) $32.19] $10 461.7_5| $35.00; $11,375.00 $29.11] $9,460.75] 0.00)
66 EC Construction - Install New Lighting in Env. Chamber 119 EA 3 $313.95 $941.85| $533.34 $1,600.0: 0.00] $299.00 $897.00) $250.00 $750.00| $299.00 $897.00) 0.00]
Electrical Demolition and Construction Subtota $22,578.28 $20,734.47, $39,770.0Q $22,497.74 $40,560.00 $21,497.74 $60,000.00
Plumbing Demolition and Construction

67 __|PC Demolition - Cap HW & CW Lines at Sink EA 1 $1,575.00] $1,575.00) $1,200.00 1,200.00 0.00) $2,150.00| $2,150.00] $1,800.00] $1,800.00] $1,100.00] $1,100.00] $2,500.00]
68 _[PC Demolition - Disconnect and Store Emergency Eyewash EA 1 $2,520.00 $2,520.00) $1,200.00 1,200.00 0.00) $2,150.00 $2,150.00) $2,800.00 $2,800.00) $1,100.00 $1,100.00) $2,500.00)
69 |PC Demolition - Remove Acid Neutralization Tank EA 1 $2,835.00| $2,835.00] $1,200.00) 1,200.00 0.00) $2,150.00| $2,150.00] $3,100.00| $3,100.00] $1,100.00] $1,100.00] $5,000.00]
70 PC Construction - Install Piping for New Eyewash Location LF 30 70.00! $2,100.00| $110.00; 300.00) 0.00) 70.00! $2,100.00) 70.00! $2,100.00) $33.00) $990.00] $5,000.00)
71 |PC Construction - Install Piping for New Autopsy Sink LF 20 $105.00! $2,100.00] $110.00! $2,200.00] 0.00) $105.00! $2,100.00] $130.00! $2,600.00] $125.00! $2,500.00] $5,000.00]
72 PC Construction - Reinstall Piping for Relocated Sprinkler Line LF 40 $64.76 $2,590.40] $80.00 $3,200.00) 0.00] $112.50! $4,500.00] $50.00) $2,000.00| $150.00 $6,000.00] $5,000.00]
73 __|PC Construction - Install Acid Neutralization Tank EA 1 $2,520.00 $2,520.00] $2,500.00 $2,500.00] 0.00) $3,500.00 $3,500.00] $2,800.00 $2,800.00] $6,000.00 $6,000.00] $10,000.00
74 __|PC Construction - Install Cold Water Line in Env. Chamber 119 LF 40 $78.75] $3,150.00] $110.00! $4,400.00] 0.00| $52.50! $2,100.00] $80.00! $3,200.00| $55.25 $2,210.00) $5,000.00)
Plumbing Demolition and Construction Subtotal $19,390.40, $19,200.00| $14,900.00 $20,750.00, $20,400.00 $21,000.00, $40,000.00]
Construction Sub-Total $157,703.52 $152,672.98| $171,240.00 $161,555.93 $176,333.00, $170,861.16| $210,000.00]

Contractors' Soft Costs
75 GC Final Cleaning Prior to Close-Out % Project $1,000.00 $2,400.00] $1,000.00 $1,500.00 $2,450.00| $4,000.00] 0.00]
76 |Trash and Dumpster Hauling Week 12 $3,084.00 $3,000.00 $1,600.00] $2,400.00 $1,190.00] $8,000.00) 0.00|
77 Insurance % Project 1,963.00) $1,500.00 $0.00 $1,500.00 $5,960.00] $5,000.00] 0.00]
78 _|Performance Bonds % Project 54,458.75) $4,700.00] $3,600.00] $4,500.00] $2,980.00] $8,582.91] 0.00)
79 Permits % Project 3,231.34] $200.00| $0.00 $6,500.00] $1,192.00 $0.00 0.00]
80 _|Field Office Trailer w/ Utilities, Office Equipment and Supplies Month 5 54,815.00] $3,600.00 $0.00 $1,000.00 $800.00| $5,000.00) 0.00)
81 _|Contractor Overhead and Profit % Project $14,051.09 $22,600.00 $22,500.00) $23,000.00 $17,000.00] $25,748.72] 0.00)

82 Owners' Contingency Allowance % Project

Construction Grand Total $190,306.70] $190,672.98| $199,940.00) $201,955.93) $207,905.00) $227,192.79 $700,000.00]
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