BID RESULTS

AB2014-10 REMOTE AREA IMPROVEMENTS AT THE TRENTON-MERCER AIRPORT

March 25, 2014

ADD ALTERNATE 2 COMPLETE WITHIN 3
WORKING DAYS FOLLOWING DELIVERY OF
MATERIAL BY MERCER COUNTY; ADD
ALTNERATE 3 WITHIN 12 WORKING DAYS
FOLLOWING DELIVERY OF MATERIAL BY
MERCER COUNTY

COMPLETION: BASE BID AND ADD ALTERNATE NO. 1, APRIL 25, 2014; ;
$7,500.00 PER CD LD; ELECTRICAL; PERFORMANCE AND LABOR AND
MATERIAL PAYMENT BOND; UPON ACCEPTANCE; 100% OF PROJECT, 5%
MAINTENANCE BOND FOR TWO (2) YEARS; DATAPARK PARKING SYSTEM;
NO ADDENDA ISSUED

NO. OF RESPONDENTS: 1

NAME OF BIDDER WATERS & BUGBEE, INC.
ADDRESS 75 SOUTH GOLD DRIVE
CITY, STATE, ZIP HAMILTON, NJ 08691
CONTACT CHARLES P. WATERS
TELEPHONE 609 584 1100

FAX 609 584 2200
E-MAIL BIDS@WATERSANDBUGBEE.COM
INSURANCE REQUIRED FROM AWARDED VENDOR REQUIRED

FIDELITY AND DEPOSIT COMPANY OF

BID GUARANTEE MARYLAND 10% NTE 20K

CONSENT OF SURETY ROBERT B. PITTS AIF WITH POA
REFERENCES AND EXPERIENCE PAGE 71, ENGINEERING TO REVIEW
PW CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION 60176 EXPIRES 4/14/2016
DEBARRED

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK

HATZEL & BUEHLER INC. 59682 EXPIRES

ELECTRICAL SUBCONTRACTOR PW, LICENSE & BRC 5/15/2014, BRC OK

STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE OK

EQUIPMENT CERT OK

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 OK

EXHIBIT B OK

AA201 REQUIRED IF AWARDED

IRAN CERT SIGNED

PREVAILING WAGE CERT SIGNED

SAFETY CERT OK

PARKING CONTROL CERTIFICATION SIGNED

BASE BID AMOUNT 144,118.00
ADD ALTERNATE NO. 1 55,824.00
ADD ALTERNATE NO. 2 17,685.00
ADD ALTERNATE NO. 3 88,940.00
GRAND TOTAL AMOUNT 306,567.00
HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS YES

EXCEPTIONS NONE

FATAL FLAW NO



mailto:BIDS@WATERSANDBUGBEE.COM

BID RESULTS

AB2014-10 REMOTE AREA IMPROVEMENTS AT THE TRENTON-MERCER AIRPORT

UNIT QUAN WATERS AND BUGBEE

BASE BID LS 1 134,118.00 134,118.00
PARKING CONTROL SYSTEM LS 1 5,000.00 5,000.00
CONTINGENCY LS 1 5,000.00 5,000.00
MOBILIZATION 144,118.00
TOTAL BASE BID

ALTERNATE ONE

EXCAVATION CcY 60 135.00 8.100.00
PAVEMENT REMOVAL SY 246 30.00 7,380.00
DGA BASE COURSE SY 179 47.00 8.413.00
HOT MIX 19M64 TON 65 175.00 11,375.00
HO MIX 9.5Mé4 TON 22 320.00 7,040.00
TRAFFIC MARKING SF 22 100.00 2,200.00
REGULATOR AND WARNING SIGNS SF 9 98.00 882.00
TOPSOIL SY 222 35.00 7,770.00
FERTILIZING AND SEEDING SY 222 10.00 2,220.00
STRAW MULCH SY 222 2.00 444.00
TOTAL ALTERNATE ONE 55,824.00
ALTERNATE TWO

INSTALL GRASS REINF MESH SY 1965 9.00 17,685.00
ALTERNATE THREE

INSTALL GRASS REIN MESH SY 22235 4.00 88,940.00
GRAND TOTAL WITH ALTERNATES 306,567.00




BID RESULTS

AB2014-07 THREE (3) VOTI XR3D-6C X-RAY SCANNERS OR EQUIVALENT AND FOUR (4) CEIA PMD2 PLUS ELLIPTIC METAL DETECTORS OR EQUIVALENT FOR THE MERCER COUNTY SHERIFF'S OFFICE

BID OPENING DATE: ORIGINAL DATE MARCH 12, 2014 POSTPONED TO MARCH 25, 2014

AWARD ONE YEAR; WARRANTY ONE YEAR; AWARDED
VENDOR TO REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL OF CURRENT
INVENTORY IN COMPLIANCE WITH DISPOSAL
INSTRUCTIONS, AND WILL REGISTER NEW MACHINES
WITH NJ DEP, BUREAU OF X-RAY COMPLIANCE

NUMBER OF RESPONDENTS

NAME OF BIDDER

AUTO CLEAR, LLC

RAPISCAN SYSTEMS, INC.

X-RAY IMAGING, INC.

ADDRESS

2 GARDNER ROAD

2900 CRYSTAL DRIVE, SUITE 210

459 WEST MAIN STREET

CITY, STATE, ZIP

FAIRFIELD, NJ 07004

ARLINGTON, VA 22202

WYCKOFF, NJ 07481

CONTACT ALAN MARTIN PETER KANT ROBERT JOESPH
TELEPHONE 9735257312 571227 6784 201 8471311

FAX 973276 6166 571227 6816 201 847 1325
E-MAIL ALANM@A-CLEAR.COM PKANT@RAPISCANSYSTEMS.COM ROBERT@XRAYIMAGINGUSA.COM

HOLD PRICING CONSIDERATION GREATER THAN 60
DAYS

YES

YES

YES

RECEIPT OF ADDENDUM NO. ONE AND TWO

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

CONTINUITY OF SERVICE YES YES YES
INSURANCE REQUIRED FROM AWARDED VENDOR
STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE oK oK oK
NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION oK oK oK
EIC REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED 25839 EXPIRES 12/15/19
EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 oK oK oK
EXHIBIT A INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
IRAN CERTIFICATION oK oK oK
UNIT COST FOR ONE VOTI XR3D-6C X-RAY SCANNER 20,235.00 | $ 23,410.00 33,965.00
TOTAL FOR THREE (3) X-RAY SCANNERS 60,705.00 | $ 70,230.00 101,895.00
UNIT COST FOR ONE CEIA PMD2 PLUS ELLIPTIC METAL
DETECTOR NO BID $ 5,000.00 6,545.00
TOTAL FOR FOUR (4) METAL DETECTORS NO BID S 20,000.00 26,180.00
GRAND TOTAL 60,705.00 | $ 90,230.00 128,075.00
MANUFACTURER: X-RAY SCANNER AUTO CLEAR RAPISCAN voTI
MODEL 6040 620XR XR3D-6C
MANUFACTURER: METAL DETECTOR NO BID RAPISCAN CEIA
MODEL NO BID METOR 6M PMD2 ELLIPTIC

BIDDING METOR 6E METAL DETECTOR; AND RAPISCAN 620XR

SYSTEM REFER TO TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS AND WILL NOT
EXCEPTIONS YES. AUTO CLESERngTUCI)PRAg\ESETFéRN?OC;EDCKGATE METAL REGISTER EQUIPMENT WITH NJ DEP, THE COUNTY WILL HAVE TO NO EXCEPTIONS

" REGISTER WITH THE ASSISTANCE OF RAPISCAN AND REFER TO
PAGE 53

FATAL FLAW NO NO NO
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