BID RESULTS

AB2020-27 CONSTRUCT TAXIWAY D CONNECTOR PHASE ONE FOR TRENTON MERCER AIRPORT

BID OPENING DATE: JUNE 24,2020

NO. OF BIDDERS: 4

NAME OF BIDDER MOUNT CONSTRUCTION CO. INC. C.J. HESSE, INC. EARLE ASPHALT COMPANY HBC COMPANY INC.

ADDRESS 427 SOUTH WHITE HORSE PIKE 25 FIRST AVENUE PO BOX 556 131 WASHINGTON ST.

CITY, STATE, ZIP BERLIN, NJ 08009 ATLANTIC HIGHLANDS, NJ 07716 FARMINGDALE, NJ 07727 LODI, NJ 07644

CONTACT MICHAEL MAZZARELLA LAWRENCE C. HESSE BRIAN M. COOPER G. HOOGENDOORN

TELEPHONE 856 768 8493 732291 8100 7323081113 973777 4472

FAX 856 753 1453 732 495 6225 732308 1034 973777 4828

E-MAIL MMAZZARELLA @ MOUNTCONSTUCTION.COM LHESSE@CJHESSE.COM BCOOPER@EARLECO.COM JHOOGENDOORN@HBCCO.COM

INSURANCE REQUIRED FROM AWARDED VENDOR REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED

INDEMNIFICATION AND INSURANCE SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

ADDENDUM NO. ONE INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

BID GUARANTEE LIBERTY MUTUAL INSURANCE CO. 10% NTE 20K WESTPORT ‘NSURANCZOCKORPORATION 10% NTE FEDERAL INSURANCE COMPANY 10% OF 20K SELECTIVE INSU}!S/;I:SEE 2%% OF AMERICA

CONSENT OF SURETY JOHN P. SEDOR AIF WITH POA DAWN M. JONES AIF WITH POA ERIC STRBA AIF WITH POA DAWN M. JONES AIF WITH POA

THREE REFERENCES INCLUDED AIPORT/ENGINEERING FIRM TO REVIEW INCLUDED AIPOR;{:EVF‘IFGV\VNEERING FIRMTO INCLUDED A\POR;{:E/I]I':GVLNEER\NG FIRMTO INCLUDED AIPOR;{:EVI\IIEVLNEERING FIRMTO

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

PW CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION 605531 EXPIRES 6.23.21 608194 EXPIRES 8.1.21 18315 EXPIRES 5.5.21 603513 EXPIRES 7.31.21

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK oK oK

ELECTRICAL SUBCONTRACTOR P, 8°C 310222 UICENSE # S4E80150860 PIRES 331 2021 | EXPIRES 50002 ICENSE # SAEBD1 146400 | EXPRES 52022, UICENSE # 342801 430 | - HOUSE ICENSE # 34EEDI089000 EXPIRES
BRC OK EXPIRES 3.31.2021; BRC OK EXPIRES 3.31.2021; BRC OK T

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

EXHIBIT B INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

AA201 REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED

IRAN CERT SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

PREVAILING WAGE CERT OK OK oK oK

SAFETY CERT SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

EQUIPMENT CERT OK OK oK oK

DBE STATEMENT SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

BUY AMERICAN CERT SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS YES YES YES YES

BIDDERS LIST COLLECTION FORM INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

CONTRACTOR'S DBE PLAN FORM INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

LETTERS OF INTENT INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

BASE BID S 5,003,181.79| $ 5,078,034.50 | $ 5,161,713.31| § 5,471,088.30

BID ALTERNATE A S 741,090.00( $ 710,210.00 | $ 755,996.50 | $ 776,595.00

EXCEPTIONS NONE NONE NONE NONE

FATAL FLAW NO, MATH ERRORTg.lr\IA(LSg/:Il?TLgLiLTSF BASE BID AND NO NO NO, MATH EI;T?ET?S;EC;@:\:F TOTAL FOR



mailto:LHESSE@CJHESSE.COM
mailto:BCOOPER@EARLECO.COM
mailto:JHOOGENDOORN@HBCCO.COM

Taxiway D Connector Phase 1

Trenton - Mercer Airport (TTN)

PROPOSAL FORM
BASE BID MOUNT CONSTRUCTION CJ HESSE EARLE ASPHALT HBC COMPANY INC
Item FAA Unit Item Unit Item Unit Item Unit Item
ty. Unit
No. [ Specification No. Description Qy Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total
1 C10251a  |EROSION CONTROL BLANKET 15630 | SY |s 5008  78150.00 475|s 7824250 | $ 500 7815000 | $ 300 S 4689000
2 C10251b  |SEDIMENT FILTER LOG 8,580 LF |8 400 s 3432000 435|s 3732300 | $ 000 |8 77,2200 | $ 600 S 5148000
3 C10251c  |STORM DRAIN INLET PROTECTION 21 EA | 25000 | $ 5,250.00 14000 | 8 2,04000 | $ 22500 |$ 472500 | $ 31000 |$ 651000
4 C10251d  |STABILIZED CONSTRUCTION ENTRANCE 1 EA |$  1000000|$ 1000000 3,500.00 | $ 350000 | $ 500000 |$ 500000 |$ 350000 S 350000
5 C10251e  |HAUL ROUTE 2,420 LF |8 2000 $ 4840000 1000 [$ 2420000 | $ 3600 S 8712000 [ $ 2200 |$  53240.00
6 C10252A  [EROSION AND SEDIMENTATION CONTROL - STAGE A 1 LS |$ 1000000 1000000 13500000 | $ 13500000 | § 17500000 | $ 17500000 | $ 920000 | $  9,200.00
7 C102528  |EROSION AND SEDIMENTATION CONTROL - STAGE B 1 LS |$ 1000000 (S 1000000 9,500.00 | $ 950000 | $ 1250000 | $ 1250000 | $ 920000 | $  9,20000
8 C-10252C  |EROSION AND SEDIMENTATION CONTROL - STAGE C 1 LS |$ 1000000 1000000 5,500.00 | $ 550000 | $  30,00000 | $ 3000000 | $ 1100000 | $ 11,0000
9 C10551  [MOBILIZATION 1 LS |$ 24500000 |$ 24500000 30000000 | § 30000000 | $ 25000000 | $ 250,000.00 | $ 35500000 | $  355000.00
10 P-152-41  |UNCLASSIFIED EXCAVATION 51300 | oy |s 2000 [ $ 102600000 3500 [ § 179550000 | $ 3000 | $ 1539,00000 [ § 3500 | $ 1,795,500.00
11 P-15242  |COMMON EMBANKMENT 780 cr |s 2500 [$  19,500.00 2000 [$ 1560000 | $ 100 | s 78000 | $ 3500 |$ 2730000
12 P-152-43  |NONHAZARDOUS SOILIMATERIAL OFF-SITE SPOILING 100 o |s 5000 | $ 5,000.00 50.00 | $ 500000 | $ 1500 [$ 150000 |$ 10500 S  10,500.00
13 P-152-44  |NONHAZARDOUS PETROLEUM CONTAMINATED SOILS OFF-SITE | 400 cy |s 150,00 | $ 15,000.00 4000 | $ 400000 | $ %00 |$ 900000 |S 16500 |$  16,500.00
14 P-152-45  |HAZARDOUS SOILMATERIAL OFF-SITE SPOILING 100 cr |s 35000 | § 3500000 35000 [ § 3500000 | $ 62500 | $ 6250000 | § 22000 | $  22,000.00
15 P-20951  |CRUSHED AGGREGATE BASE COURSE 12" 2,260 cr |s 6000 [$  135600.00 5000 [ § 11300000 | $ 8000 | $ 180,800.00 [ § 7000 | $  158,200.00
16 P-401-811  [BITUMINOUS SURFACE COURSE 4" 1650 | TON | 13500 [ $ 222,750.00 11500 | § 18975000 | $ 12000 [ $ 19800000 | $ 13000 | $  214,500.00
17 P-401-812  |BITUMINOUS BASE COURSE 9" 370 | ToN |s 13500 [ $  500,850.00 11000 | § 40810000 | $ 12000 [ $ 44520000 | $ 12500 | $  463,750.00
18 P-60351  |BITUMINOUS TACK COAT 130 | GAL |s 500 | s 6,600.00 400 | $ 528000 | $ 300 (s 3960008 1000 [$ 1320000
19 P-62051  |RUNWAY AND TAXIWAY MARKING - WATERBORNE, TEMPORARY | 11490 | SF | 100|$ 1149000 250 | s 2872500 | $ 250 | s 2872500 | $ 100 |$ 1149000
20 P-62052  |RUNWAY AND TAXIWAY MARKING - WATERBORNE, PERMANENT | 4950 sF | 150 | $ 7,425.00 330 s 1633500 | $ 340 1683000 | $ 180 |$ 891000
21 P62053  |RINWAYAND TAXIWAY MARKING - THERMOPLASTIC, 800 sFo|s 2500 | $ 20,000.00 33.00 | $ 26,400.00 | $ 3375 |$ 2700000 | $ 2800 |$ 2240000
22 P-6205.4  |RUNWAY AND TAXIWAY MARKING - REMOVAL 1010 sF | 233 s 2,353.30 440 | 8 444400 | 3 450 [ s 454500 |8 230 s 232800
23 P-660-31  |FUEL PRICE ADJUSTMENT (NON AIP) 1 LS |$ 4000000 S  40000.00 4000000 [ § 4000000 | $ 4000000 | $  40,000.00 | § 40,0000 | $  40,000.00
24 P-660-32  |ASPHALT PRICE ADJUSTMENT (NON AIP) 1 LS |$ 10000000 |$  100000.00 100,00000 | $  100,000.00 | $ 100,000.00 | $ 100,00000 | $ 100,00000 | $  100,000.00
25 D-701-5.1a |12 INCH HDPE 170 LFo|s 7000 $ 1190000 5500 | $ 9,350.00 | $ 6600 | $ 1122000 [ $ 8300 |$ 1411000
26 D-701-5.1b |12 INCH RCP 110 LFo|s 7000 | $ 7,700.00 65.00 | $ 7,15000 | $ 7400 [$ 814000 [$ 9000 |$  9900.00
27 D-701-5.1c |15 INCH RCP 600 LFo|s 7000 [$ 4200000 6450 [ 3870000 | $ 7400 [ $ 4440000 [ $ 8300 |$  49,800.00
28 D-701-5.1d |18 INCH RCP 440 LFo|s 7000 $  30800.00 6100 [$ 2684000 | $ 6500 | $ 2860000 [ $ 9000 |$  39,600.00
29 D-701-5.1e  |24INCH RCP 610 LFo|s 8000 [$  48800.00 7300 [$ 4453000 | $ 8000 | $ 4880000 [ $ 10000 |$  61000.00
30 D-701-5.1f |30 INCH RCP 620 LFo|s 10000 [ $  62,000.00 8500 | $ 5270000 | $ 15000 [ $ 9300000 | $ 16500 |$  102,300.00
31 D-701-5.1g |30 INCH RCP UNDER PAVEMENT 80 LFo|s 15000 [ $  12,000.00 11500 | $ 9,20000 | $ 22000 | 1760000 | § 27000 | $  21.600.00
32 D-70152  |PIPE DEMOLITION 2,280 LFo|s 1000 22,800.00 1600 [$ 3648000 | $ 5000 [ $ 11400000 [ $ 2500 |$  57,000.00
33 D-7054.1  [UNDERDRAIN PERFORATED 740 LFo|s 4000|$ 2960000 3500 [$ 2590000 | $ 3700 | $ 2738000 [ $ 4700 |$  34780.00
34 D-7054.2  [UNDERDRAIN NONPERFORATED 270 LF |8 4000|$ 1080000 3500 | $ 9,450.00 | $ 3700 ($ 999000 |$ 4700 |$  12690.00
35 D-75151  [MANHOLES 5 EA |$  1000000|$ 5000000 790000 | § 3950000 | § 900000 | $ 4500000 | $ 620000 | $  31,000.00
36 D-75152  [INLETS 2 EA |$  600000|$ 7200000 670000 | $ 8040000 | $ 570000 | $  68400.00 | $ 550000 | $  66,000.00
37 D-75153  [HEADWALL STRUCTURE 2 EA |$  1000000|$ 2000000 580000 | § 1160000 | $ 1000000 | $  20,000.00 | $  7,50000 | $  15000.00
38 D-75154  |STRUCTURE DEMOLITION 8 EA |$ 100000 (% 8,000.00 35000 | $ 280000 | $ 255000 | $ 2040000 | $ 1600.00 | $ 12,8000
39 T-901-51  |SEEDING 105200 | sy | 100|$ 10520000 105|$ 11046000 | $ 100 |$ 10520000 | $ 060 S 6312000
40 T-90551  [TOPSOILING (ON-SITE EXCAVATED AND REMOVED FROM SITE) | 14600 | ¢cY |$ 2000 [$ 29200000 3500 $  511,00000 | $ 1125 [ $ 16425000 | $ 3600 |$  525600.00
a1 T-90851  [MULCHING 105200 | sy | 100|$ 10520000 085|$ 8942000 | $ 0958  99,94000 | 110 |$ 11572000
42 X10151  [STORMWATER MANAGEMENT FACILITY 1 Ls |$ 75000008 7500000 60000.00 [ § 6000000 | $ 6500000 |$  65000.00 | $ 6500000 | $  65000.00
43 X-101-52  |RIP RAP 110 cr s 10000 [ $  11,000.00 12500 | $ 1375000 | $ 26000 | $ 2860000 | $ 8400 |$ 924000
44 X-107-41  [MAINTENANCE AND PROTECTION OF AIRFIELD TRAFFIC 1 LS |$ 95000000 |$ 95000000 3500000 [ § 3500000 | $ 36009048 | $ 369,090.48 | $ 250,000.00 | $  250,000.00
T1/C NO. 8 AWG 5KV, L-824C CABLE IN CONDUIT OR DUCT BANK,
45 10851 [LUCNO S AWG B, L8240 ChE 6,629 LFo|s 256 s 1697024 275|s 1822865 | B 275|s 1820865 | $ 400 s 2651440
1-1/C NO. 6 AWG, STRANDED GREEN INSULATED COPPER
46 L-108-5.2 SAFETY EQUIPMENT GROUND WIRE IN CONDUIT OR DUCT BANK, 2,767 LF $ 150 | $ 4,150.50 165 $ 4564.73 [ $ 170 | $ 4,703.05 | $ 300 (% 8,299.50
INSTALLED COMPLETE IN PLACE
1-1/C NO. 6 AWG, 600V, SOLID BARE COUNTERPOISE WIRE
ABOVE CONDUIT OR DUCT BANK, INCLUDING 3/4"x10' GROUND
47 L1053 | e N AL GROUND RODS, ANG GROUND 2,767 F s 250 | 8 6,917.50 275 | s 760788 | $ 275|s 760788 | 8 300 (S 829050
CONNECTORS, INSTALLED COMPLETE IN PLACE
1-1/C NO. 6 AWG, 600V WIRE FOR VISUAL AIDS IN CONDUIT OR
48 L10854 L A o e A 4323 Lo |s 200 [ s 8,646.00 220 s 951060 | $ 225(8 9726758 260 S 1123080
1-1/C NO. 8 AWG, 600V WIRE FOR VISUAL AIDS IN CONDUIT OR
49 L10855 L A G R e A 4323 Lo |s 150 [ 8 6.484.50 165 | s 713295 | $ 170|s 734010 s 2208 951060
1-1/C NO. 8 AWG, 600V STRANDED GREEN INSULATED COPPER
50 L-108-5.6 SAFETY EQUIPMENT GROUND WIRE FOR VISUAL AIDS IN 4,323 LF $ 125 (8 5,403.75 140 | 8 6,052.20 | $ 140 | $ 6,052.20 | $ 250 | $ 10,807.50
CONDUIT OR DUCT BANK, INSTALLED COMPLETE IN PLACE
ELECTRICAL CONDUIT, 2 INCH PVC SCHEDULE 40, DIRECT
51 111051 |BURIED CONDUIT IN NON-PAVED AREAS, INSTALLED COMPLETE | 1,000 LF o |s 800 [ s 8,000.00 885 $ 8.850.00 | $ 900[S 900000  2300|$ 2300000
IN PLACE
ELECTRICAL DUCT BANK, 1-2 INCH PVC SCHEDULE 40 CONDUIT
52 11052 |IN PAVED AREA, CONCRETE ENCASED, INSTALLED COMPLETE IN| 368 lFo|s 1800 | § 6,624.00 1990 | 8 732320 | $ 2000($ 736000 [$  2600|$  9568.00
ELECTRICAL DUCT BANK, 2-2 INCH PVC SCHEDULE 40 CONDUITS
53 L1053 R D A e DL 4 oo | 478 o |s 2300 $ 1099400 2500 [$ 1195000 | $ 200 $ 1242800 [$ 7700 |$  36806.00
CONNECTION TO EXISTING LIGHTING FIXTURE, EXISTING
54 11054 | T I T e ks, | 18 EA |$  100000($ 1800000 110000 | $ 19,8000 | $ 34000 | $ 612000 | $ 25000 |$  4500.00
ELECTRICAL DUCT BANK, 4-4 INCH PVC SCHEDULE 40 CONDUITS
55 L1055 | D A irs Faeaao e 10 595 o |s 900 |$ 5355000 10000 [ $ 5950000 | $ 8000 | $ 4760000 [ $ 5000 |$  29,750.00
ELECTRICAL CONDUIT, 2-2 INCH PVC SCHEDULE 40, DIRECT
56 L-110-56  |BURIED CONDUIT IN NON-PAVED AREAS, INSTALLED COMPLETE | 280 LF o |s 950 | 8 2,660.00 1000 | 8 2,80000 | $ 1050 [ $ 2940008 3000(S  8400.00
IN PLACE
57 11551 |JUNCTION BOX PLAZA, INSTALLED COMPLETE IN PLACE 4 EA |$  590000|$ 2360000 650000 | § 2600000 | $ 450000 |  18000.00 [ § 340000 | $  13600.00
58 L-115:52  |AIRCRAFT RATED 4 X 4 X 4 HANDHOLE 4 EA |$  1050000|$ 4200000 1160000 | $ 4640000 [ §  9,750.00 [  39,00000 | 860000 | $  34,400.00
SEMI-FLUSH RUNWAY EDGE LIGHT WITH L-8688 CLASS 1A LIGHT
59 L-125-5.1 |SASE I AC PAVEMENT. NSTALLED COVPLETE W PLACE 1 EA |$  650000|$ 6,500.00 20000 | $ 720000 | $ 500000 |$ 500000 |$ 450000 |$ 450000
ELEVATED TAXIWAY EDGE LIGHT WITH L-867B CLASS 1A LIGHT
60 12552 |BASE WITH CONCRETE MAINTENANCE PAD IN TURF, INSTALLED | 14 EA |$  300000|$ 4200000 330000 | § 4620000 | $ 337500 | $ 47,5000 | $ 330000 | $  46,200.00
COMPLETE IN PLACE
L-867B CLASS 1A LIGHT BASE WITH CONCRETE MAINTENANCE
61 L12553 [ S L L B o 15 EA |$  270000|$ 4050000 300000 | § 4500000 | § 305000 | $ 45750.00 [ § 150000 | $  22,500.00
REMOVE EXISTING COVER PLATE AND INSTALL NEW ELEVATED
62 12554 |TAXIWAY EDGE LIGHT FIXTURE ON EXISTING LIGHT BASE, 1 EA |3 525.00 | § 5,775.00 580.00 | § 6,380.00 | $ 60000 | 660000 | $ 81000 |$ 891000
INSTALLED COMPLETE IN PLACE




Item FAA Description Q. Unit Unit Item Unit Item Unit Item Unit Item
No. [ Specification No. P . Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total
196 L-858Y (L) TAXIWAY GUIDANCE SIGN ON FOUNDATION, ANY
63 L-126-5.1 LENGTH. INSTALLED COMPLETE IN PLACE 4 EA $ 9,900.00 39,600.00 | $ 11,000.00 | $ 44,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 40,000.00 | $ 840000 | $ 33,600.00
|RELOCATE L-858 GUIDANCE SIGN ON NEW FOUNDATION
64 L-126-5.2 INCLUDING REPLACEMENT PANEL(S) FOR NEW MESSAGE, 1 EA $ 9,700.00 9,700.00 | $ 11,000.00 | $ 11,000.00 | $ 8,700.00 | $ 8,700.00 [ $  9,600.00 | $ 9,600.00
INSTAILED COMPI ETE IN PIACE.
65 L-128-4.1 REMOVAL OF CABLE FROM CONDUIT 14,384 LF $ 150 21,576.00 | $ 165 S 23,73360 | $ 055 | $ 7,911.20 | $ 1258 17,980.00
66 L-128-42 REMOVAL OF ELEVATED EDGE LIGHT FIXTURE AND LIGHT BASE 1 EA |s 250.00 25000 | § 275.00 | $ 275.00 | $ 280.00 | $ 280.00 | $ 690.00 | $ 690.00
67 L-128-4.3 REMOVAL OF GUIDANCE SIGN 1 EA $ 800.00 800.00 | $ 885.00 | $ 885.00 | $ 900.00 | $ 900.00 | $  1,780.00 | $ 1,780.00
68 L-128-4.4 REMOVE AND RELOCATE WIND CONE 1 EA $ 4,500.00 4,500.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 2,825.00 | $ 2,825.00 | $  6500.00 | $ 6,500.00
69 L-128-4.5 REMOVE AND RELOCATE AWOS 1 EA $ 16,000.00 16,000.00 | $ 18,000.00 | $ 18,000.00 | $ 6,750.00 | $ 6,750.00 | $  8700.00 | $ 8,700.00
70 L-128-4.6 REMOVAL OF 1W-2" CONDUIT 2548 Ls $ 4.00 10,192.00 | $ 440 | $ 11,211.20 | $ 450 [ $ 11,466.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 25,480.00
71 L-128-4.7 REMOVAL OF JUNCTION BOX 2 LF $ 300.00 600.00 | $ 33000 | $ 660.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 70000 [ $ 1,050.00 | $ 2,100.00
72 L-128-4.8 REMOVAL OF HANDHOLE 2 EA $ 1,850.00 3,700.00 | $ 2,100.00 | $ 4,200.00 [ $ 950.00 | $ 1,900.00 [ $  2,000.00 [ $ 4,000.00
73 L-128-4.9 TEMPORARY ELECTRICAL WORK 1 Ls $ 22,000.00 22,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 13,000.00 | $ 13,000.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 35,000.00
BID TOTAL CONSTRUCTION COST $ 5,003,181.79 | $ 5,078,034.50 ( $ 5161,71331| $ 5,471,088.30
ALTERNATE BID A
— Unit tem Unit tem Unit tem Unit ftem
Item No. | FAA Spec. No. Description ty. Unit ! N N :

em Mo pec. N P i Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total
1A |P-152-4.1 UNCLASSIFIED EXCAVATION 3,250 [ 20.00 65,000.00 35.00 113,750.00 30.00 97,500.00 38.00 123,500.00
2A  [P-209-5.1 CRUSHED AGGREGATE BASE COURSE 12" 1,720 cY 55.00 94,600.00 50.00 86,000.00 80.00 137,600.00 90.00 154,800.00
A [P-401-81.1 BITUMINOUS SURFACE COURSE 4" 1,240 TON 135.00 167,400.00 115.00 142,600.00 120, 148,800.00 120.00 148,800.00
A [P-401-813 BITUMINOUS BASE COURSE 9" 2,800 TON 135.00 378,000.00 110.00 308,000.00 120, 336,000.00 110.00 308,000.00
A P-603- BITUMINOUS TACK COAT 990 GAL 00 4.950.00 4.00 3.960.00 3. 970.00 10.00 ,900.00
A__|D-705-4. UNDERDRAIN PERFORATED 800 LF 40.00 32,000.00 35.00 28,000.00 37, 29,600.00 46.00 36,800.00
A D-705-4. UNDERDRAIN NONPERFORATED 540 LF 40.00 21,600.00 35.00 18.900.00 37.00 19.980.00 46.00 24,840.00
A |T-9015.1 SEEDING (CREDIT) (4,630) Y 00 (4,630.00) .05 (4,861.50) .00 (4,630.00) .50 (2,315.00)
A T-905-531 TOPSOILING (CREDIT) (660) CcY 20.00 (13,200.00) 35.00 (23.100.00) 11.25 (7.425.00) 35.00 (23.,100.00)
10A _[T-9085.1 MULCHING (CREDIT) (4,630) SY 00 (4,630.00) .85 (3,935.50) .95 [ $  (4,398.50) .00 (4,630.00)
ALTERNATE BID A TOTAL CONSTUCTION COST 741,090.00 701,210.00 755,996.50 776,595.00




BID RESULTS

CKO9MERCER2020-08 COUNTWIDE ROOF REPAIRS FOR THE COUNTY OF MERCER AND THE MERCER COUNTY COOPERATIVE CONTRACT PURCHASING SYSTEM

BID OPENING DATE: JUNE 24,2020

AWARD CONTRACT FOR A PERIOD OF TWO (2) YEARS;
AWARD BASED UPON THE LOWEST STRAIGHT TIME
HOURLY RATE TO TWO (2) ROOFING CONTRACTORS;
SUBCONTRACTING IS NOT PERMITTED; BIDDERS SHALL
HAVE FIVE YEARS OF EXPERIENCE AND PROVIDE
THREE REFERENCES, MARKUP 10% ON MATERIALS,
PROPOSALS REQUIRED FOR ALL WORK $7500.00 AND
ABOVE

OF BIDDERS 7
NAME OF BIDDER PHENIX PRO GROUP MIRE ROOFI{__'\L%I“EC' TTAVMG J&E CONTRACTING LLC USA GENERAL CONTRACTORS NORTHEAST ROOF MAINTENANCE, INC. PATRIOT ROOFING INC D.A NOLT, INC.
ADDRESS 1400 CEDAR LANE 288 COX STREET 22 WILLIS DRIVE 980 DEHART PL 649 CATHERINE ST. 2083 JAKSONVILLE JOBSTOWN ROAD 53 CROSS KEYS ROAD
CITY, STATE, ZIP HAMILTON, NJ 08 ROSELLE, NJ 07203 EWING, NJ 08628 ELIZABETH, NJ 072020 PERTH AMBOY, NJ 08861 JOBSTOWN, NJ 08041 BERLIN, NJ 08009
CONTACT WILLIAM E. CORDERO DANIEL JOHNSON KATHLEEN SEREVETAS ANDREW HOOEY DANIEL REILLEY RICH O'BRIEN
TELEPHONE 609 432 9595 908 258 1130 609 802 3398 908 436 3739 732 442 2020 609 723 6688 856 753 9333
FAX 908 258 1133 908 436 1661 732 442 8099 609 723 6867 856 753 4963
E-MAIL WILLIAM@PROPHENIX.COM VMGGROUP@AOL.COM LUSIVIUS@VERIZON.NET INFO@USAGCO,COM INFO@NERM-INC.COM 'DANREILLEY@PATRIOTROOF.COM RICH@DANOLT.COM
YEARS IN BUSINESS 12 23 25 26 25 29 29
EMPLOYEES 12 15 10 20 20 50+ 45
GARLAND, TREMCO, JOHNS MANVILLE,
FIRESTONE, CARLISE, FLEX, SOPREMA,
O S HEE SARAND DUROUST| 0 T 5
MANUFACTURER'S CERTAINTEED, ANDEK COATING, ’ ) p ’ DID NOT PROVIDE : . P : ! . .y . " ’ o "

PRODUCTS, SIPLAST

VERSICO, KEMPER, GARLAND, TAMCO,

PRODUCTS, GARLAND, SOPREMA AND

MERCHANT & EVANS, METL SPAN,UNA

SIPLAST, GENFLEX, VERSICO, SIMON,

VERSICO TREMCO, FIBERTITE, DURALAST SIPLAST CLAD, PETERSEN, PAC CLAD, ATAS, GAF SARNAFIL
MBCI, METAL SALESM DREXEL, WASCO,
HENRY, SIKE SARNAFIL
ESTIMATING SOFTWARE EDGE QB STATE ESTIMATING MANUALS BLUE BEAM & PLANSWIFT NONE DATAFORMA EXCEL

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

INSURANCE CERTIFICATE

REQUIRED FROM AWARDED VENDOR

REQUIRED FROM AWARDED VENDOR

REQUIRED FROM AWARDED VENDOR

REQUIRED FROM AWARDED VENDOR

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED FROM AWARDED VENDOR

REQUIRED FROM AWARDED VENDOR

INDEMNIFICATION AND INSURANCE

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

IRAN CERT

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

PREVAILING WAGE CERTIFICATION

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP

SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED OK
EXHIBIT B INCLUDED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
AA201 REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

PW CONTRACTOR REG.

724492 EXPIRES 6.21.21

624132 EXPIRES 5.9.21

DID NOT PROVIDE

59896 EXPIRES 4.11.21

56793 EXPIRES 4.16.22

67237 EXPIRES 4.8.22

602849 EXPIRES 4.10.22

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION oK oK oK oK oK oK oK
SAFETY CERT SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED
EQUIPMENT CERT oK oK oK oK oK oK
FIVE YEARS EXPERIENCE AND THREE REFERENCES INCLUDED, B&G AND PC TO REVIEW | INCLUDED, B&G AND PC TO REVIEW | INCLUDED, B&G AND PC TO REVIEW INCLUDED, B&G AND PC TO REVIEW INCLUDED, B&G AND PC TO REVIEW INCLUDED, B&G AND PC TO REVIEW INCLUDED, B&G AND PC TO REVIEW
EXTEND TO COUNTY COOPERATIVE MEMBERS YES CHECK BOTH YES AND NO YES YES YES YES
HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
ALL-INCLUSIVE STRAIGHT TIME HOURLY RATE S 6920 | $ 7015 | $ 85.00 | $ 98.00 | $ 17500 | $ 11500 | $ 125.00
EXCEPTIONS NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE

YES, RATE IS UNDER THE PREVAILING | YES, RATE IS UNDER THE PREVAILING YES, NOT REGISTERED AS A NJ PW
FATAL FLAW WAGE RATE AS PER DEPT. OF LABOR | WAGE RATE AS PER DEPT. OF LABOR | CONTRACTOR AT TIME OF BID AS PER NO NO NO NO

RATES POSTED

RATES POSTED

SPECIFICATIONS
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BID RESULTS

CKO9MERCER2020-16 PREVENTIVE MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR OF HVAC SYSTEMS
FOR ALL MERCER COUNTY AGENCIES (EXCLUDING THE LIBRARY SYSTEM) AND THE MERCER COUNTY COOPERATIVE CONTRACT PURCHASING SYSTEM FOR A PERIOD OF TWO (2) YEARS

BID OPENING DATE: JUNE 24, 2020

NUMBER OF BIDDERS

4

NAME OF BIDDER

MULTI-TEMP MECHANICAL INC.

FALASCA MECHANICAL, INC

PETERSON SERVICE COMPANY

MCCLOSKEY MECHANICAL, INC.

ADDRESS 1000 DELSEA DRIVE, SUITE B1 3329 NORTH MILL ROAD 234 ROUTE 70 445 LOWER LANDING ROAD
CITY, STATE, 7IP WESTVILLE, NJ 08093 VINELAND, NJ 08360 MEDFORD, NEW JERSEY 08055 BLACKWOOD, NJ 08012
CONTACT LAURA CUNEO DANIEL FALASCA DAVID WATSON ROBERT L. REEVES
TELEPHONE 856 384 9900 856 794 2010 609 714 3699 856 784 5080

FAX 856 384 9905 856 794 9644 609 714 3682 856 784 8283

E-MAIL LC@MULTITEMPMECH.COM CLOTHIER@FAL(,:A;\(/:'AMECHANICAL. DWATSON@PETESSONSERVICE.CO TADAMS@MCCngI’\(AEYMECHANICAL.
INSURANCE AND INDEMNIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

EXTEND TO COOP YES YES YES YES

THREE REFERENCES AND FIVE YEARS EXPERIENCE

INCLUDED PC/BG TO REVIEW

INCLUDED PC/BG TO REVIEW

INCLUDED PC/BG TO REVIEW

INCLUDED PC/BG TO REVIEW

PW CONTRACTOR CERT

666323 EXPIRES 9.21.21

64699 EXPIRES 05.02.21

601802 EXPIRES 3.21.22

616623 EXPIRES 2.23.22

PLUMBING SUB-CONTRACTOR

KISBY SHORE CORP; LICENSE #
36B100702800 EXPIRES 6.30.21 PW
#604617 EXPIRES 5.5.22; COPY OF

BRC REQUIRED PRIOR TO AWARD OF

CONTRACT

IN-HOUSE LICENSE #36BI01039600
EXPIRES 6.30.21

BROTHERS MECHANICAL LICENSE
#36Bl01281100 COPY OF LICENSE
REQUIRED, PW REQUIRED, BRC

REQUIRED PRIOR TO AWARD OF
CONTRACT

IN-HOUSE; HVACR LICENSE
36BI00758200 EXPIRES 6.30.21

ELECTRICAL SUB-CONTRACTOR

IN-HOUSE LICENSE # 34EB00921800

EXPIRES 3.31.21

DEC ELECTRICAL CONTRACTORS,
INC; LICENSE #34EB00646200 EXPIRES
; PW 589134 EXPIRES 4.3.22 ;BRC OK

IN-HOUSE HVACR LICENSE
#34E100954400 EXPIRES 3.31.21

H.B FRAZER COMPANY;LICENSE
#34EB01406200 EXPIRES 3.31.21;BRC
OK:PW 677998 EXPIRES 5.15.21;

HVAC SUB CONTRACTORS

IN- HOUSE LICENSE #19HC00793300

IN-HOUSE LICENSE # 19HC00019200

LICENSE # 19HC00380500 EXPIRES

LICENSE # 19HC00064900 EXPIRES

EXPIRES 6.30.22 EXPIRES 6.30.22 6.30.22 6.30.22
NUMBER OF EMPLOYEES 28 150 44 99
NUMBER OF YEARS IN BUSINESS 12 21 39 35
NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION oK oK oK oK

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

IRAN CERT SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED
EQUIPMENT CERT SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED
EXHIBIT B INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED
EIC REQUIRED IF AWARDED 28383 EXPIRES 05.15.23 6923 EXPIRES 03.15.27 57560 EXPIRES 05.15.24
AA201 REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED
EXTEND BEYOND 60 DAYS YES YES YES YES
SAFETY CERT SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED
FREON CERTIFICATION: UNIVERSAL REQUIRE IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED
ALL -INCLUSIVE HOURLY RATE-8:30 AM TO 4:30 PM
YEAR ONE S 77.00| S 90.00 90.00| $ 99.00
YEAR TWO S 80.00 | S 90.00 92.00| $ 102.00
EXCEPTIONS NONE NONE NONE NONE

YES, SUBCONTRACTOR FOR PLUMBING
FATAL FLAW NO NO NOT A NJ REGISTERED PW CONTRACTOR NO

AS PER SPECIFCATIONS THE FOLLOWING
IS REQUIRED
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BID RESULTS

AB2020-26 PREVENTIVE MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR OF IRRIGATION SYSTEMS, FOUNTAINS, AND PUMP HOUSES AND THE PURCHASE OF PARTS AND

BID OPENING DATE: JUNE 24, 2020

NUMBER OF BIDDERS

2

BID ON PARTS/SUPPLIES ONLY

BID ON PARTS/SUPPLIES ONLY

NAME OF BIDDER

EWING IRRIGATION

FERGUSON ENTERPRISES LLC

190 OBERLIN AVE N/ 737 RT?

ADDRESS 3441 E. HABOUR DRIVE CORKED RIVER N 03
CITY, STATE, ZIP PHOENIX, AZ 85034 LAKEWOOD, NJ 08701
CONTACT FRED RAPP TODD MAC PHERSON
TELEPHONE 848 225 4618 844 481 8652

FAX 732 578 0065 609 693 5307

E-MAIL FRAPP@EWINGIRRIGATION.COM FACILITIES.RORTHEASTRFERGLS

ON.COM

CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

INSURANCE AND INDEMNIFICATION REQUIREMENTS

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

IRAN CERTIFICATION

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

PREVAILING WAGE CERTIFICATION

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

EIC

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

33467 EXPIRES 01.15.26

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION

OK

OK

PW CONTRACTORS REGISTRATION

BID ON PARTS/SUPPLIES ONLY

BID ON PARTS/SUPPLIES ONLY

STATEMENT OWNERSHIP

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

EXHIBIT B

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

AA201

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

EQUIPMENT CERTIFICATION

BID ON PARTS/SUPPLIES ONLY

BID ON PARTS/SUPPLIES ONLY

PUMP INSTALLER LICENSE, PW, AND BRC

BID ON PARTS/SUPPLIES ONLY

BID ON PARTS/SUPPLIES ONLY

LANDSCAPE IRRIGATION LICENSE, PW, AND BRC

BID ON PARTS/SUPPLIES ONLY

BID ON PARTS/SUPPLIES ONLY

CATALOGS SUBMITTED FOR PARTS FOR PURCHASE BY THE PARK
COMMISSION

YES, PRICE LIST INCLUDED

YES, CATALOG LIST INCLUDED

EXTEND BEYOND 60 DAYS

YES

YES

SAFETY CERTIFICATION

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

REFERENCES AND EXPERIENCE

INCLUDED PC TO REVIEW

INCLUDED PC TO REVIEW

EXCEPTIONS

NONE

NONE

FATAL FLAW

NO

NO
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AB2020-26 PROPOSAL PAGE FOR PREVENTIVE MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR OF IRRIGATION SYSTEMS, FOUNTAINS,
AND PUMP HOUSES AND THE PURCHASE OF PARTS AND SUPPLIES FOR THE MERCER COUNTY PARK COMMISSION FOR

A PERIOD OF TWO (2) YEARS

NAME OF BIDDER

EWING IRRIGATION

FERGUSON ENTERPRISES LLC

190 OBERLIN AVE N/ 737 RT? FORKED

OR CD WITH PRICING

ADDRESS 3441 E. HABOUR DRIVE R N e,
CITY, STATE, ZIP PHOENIX, AZ 85034 LAKEWOOD, NJ 08701
CONTACT FRED RAPP TODD MAC PHERSON
WEBSITE OR E-MAIL FRAPP@EWINGIRRIGATION.CoM | FACILITIES. NORTHEPSTORERGUSOR
TELEPHONE 848 225 4618 844 481 8652
FAX 732 578 0065 609 693 5307
REPAIR LABOR RATE NO BID NO BID
ESTIMATED NUMBER OF HOURS NO BID NO BID
TOTAL NO BID NO BID
YEAR ONE PUMPING SYSTEM
PREVENTIVE MAINTENANCE: NOEb NOEb
INCLUDES START-UP, SHUT DOWN,
WINTERIZATION
AND THREE EMERGENCY SERVICE
CALL ANNUALLY
YEAR TWO PUMPING SYSTEM
PREVENTIVE MAINTENANCE: NOEIb NOBIb
INCLUDES START-UP, SHUT DOWN,
WINTERIZATION
AND THREE EMERGENCY SERVICE
CALL ANNUALLY
TOTAL FOR PUMPING SYSTEM
PREVENTIVE MAINTENANCE NOBID NO BID
GRAND TOTAL FOR TWO (2) YEARS NO BID NO BID
INSERT LICENSE NUMBER AND PROVIDE

LICENSING COPIEs
LANDSCAPE IRRIGATION THROUGH
THE STATE OF NEW JERSEY,
DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL
PROTECTION NO BID NO BID
LICENSING AND PESTICIDE
OPERATIONS
IANDSCAPE IRRIGATION SECTION
POMPINSTATLER THRSUSH THE I ATE
OF NEW JERSEY, DEPARTMENT OF
ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION
DIVISION OF WATER SUPPLY NO BID NO BID
BUREAU OF WATER SYSTEMS & WELL
PERMITTING
PARTS AND SUPPLIES (PARK
COMMISSION PURCHASES DIRECTLY)

UPCHARGE TO WHOLESALE OR

DISCOUNT TO RETAIL

TORO GOLF CATALOG NO BID 40% OFF
HUNTER GOLF CATALOG 41% OFF LIST NO BID
RAINBIRD GOLF CATALOG 30% OF LIST NO BID
MUST INCLUDE CATALOG, WEBSITE NCLUDED NCLUDED
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