
NO. OF BIDDERS: 6

NAME OF BIDDER GOALTEX CORP TABB TEXTILES CO. INC. VICTORY SUPPLY 

ADDRESS 146 SPLIT ROCK RD 511 PLEASANT DRIVE 7025 INDUSTRIAL PARK RD. 

CITY, STATE, ZIP SYOSSET,NY 11791 OPELIKE , AL 36801 MOUNT PLEASANT, TN 38474

CONTACT ROBERT GRUBMAN ALAN FENSTER MARIAH MACHAM 

TELEPHONE 516 682 5775 334 745 6762 888 376 1205 EXT 716 

FAX 516 682 5718 334 745 2377 931 325 5521 

E-MAIL ROBERT@GOALTEX.COM TABB@TEXTILEGROUP.NET MARIAH@VICTORYSUPPLYINC.COM 

INDEMNIFICATION AND INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

IRAN CERTIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

EXHIBIT A INCLUDED INCLUDED NOT INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP DISCLOSURE SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK OK

EIC 31643 EXPIRES 12.15.2022 6811 EXPIRES 12.15.2022 59648 EXPIRES 8.15.2025

DELIVERY CERTIFICATION YES YES YES 

HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS YES YES YES 

CONTINUITY OF SERVICE YES YES YES 

EXCEPTIONS YES,CORRECTIONS TO REVIEW NONE YES,CORRECTIONS TO REVIEW

FATAL FLAW NO/MATH ERROR ON GRAND TOTAL  NO NO

NAME OF BIDDER HR COTTON USA INC. BOB BARKER COMPANY INC. HOLMDEL FOOTWEAR 

ADDRESS 3105 SWEETWATER ROAD, SUITE 220 134 N. MAIN ST. 4 TIMBER LANE UNIT C2 

CITY, STATE, ZIP LAWRENCEVILLE, GEORGIA FUQUAY- VARINA, NC 27526 MARLBORO, NJ 07746

CONTACT SHAHBAZ UDDIN K.NICOLE SAUNDERS WENDY ZAMOFF 

TELEPHONE 770 931 1170 919 346 21514 877 901 3668 

FAX 770 931 1172 800 322 7537 732 810 0416 

E-MAIL BID@HRCOTTON.COM NICOLEMYATT@BOBBARKER,COM HOLMDELFOOTWEAR@OPTIMUM.NET 

INDEMNIFICATION AND INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

IRAN CERTIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

EXHIBIT A INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED 

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP DISCLOSURE SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION  REQUIRED IF AWARDED OK OK 

EIC  REQUIRED IF AWARDED 6211 EXPIRES 12.15.2021 46530 EXPIRES 04.15.2025

DELIVERY CERTIFICATION YES YES YES 

HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS YES YES, 90 DAYS ONLY YES 

CONTINUITY OF SERVICE YES YES YES 

EXCEPTIONS NONE YES,CORRECTIONS TO REVIEW NONE 

FATAL FLAW NO NO/MATH ERROR ON GRAND TOTAL  NONE 

BID RESULTS

AB2020-08  INMATE SUPPLIES FOR THE MERCER COUNTY CORRECTION CENTER FOR A PERIOD OF TWO (2) YEARS    

BID OPENING DATE: JUNE 17,2020

mailto:ROBERT@GOALTEX.COM
mailto:TABB@TEXTILEGROUP.NET
mailto:MARIAH@VICTORYSUPPLYINC.COM
mailto:BID@HRCOTTON.COM
mailto:NICOLEMYATT@BOBBARKER,COM
mailto:HOLMDELFOOTWEAR@OPTIMUM.NET


ITEM 

NUMBE

R

DESCRIPTION SIZE COLOR

TOTAL 

QUANTITY 

REQUIRED

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

COST PER 

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

EXTENDED 

COST

MEETS COLOR 

AND FABRIC 

CONTENT YES 

OR NO

COST PER 

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

EXTENDED 

COST

MEETS COLOR 

AND FABRIC 

CONTENT YES 

OR NO

COST PER 

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

EXTENDED 

COST

MEETS COLOR 

AND FABRIC 

CONTENT YES OR 

NO

COST PER 

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

EXTENDED 

COST

MEETS COLOR 

AND FABRIC 

CONTENT YES 

OR NO

COST PER 

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

EXTENDED 

COST

MEETS COLOR 

AND FABRIC 

CONTENT YES 

OR NO

COST PER 

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

EXTENDED 

COST

MEETS COLOR 

AND FABRIC 

CONTENT YES 

OR NO

1 WORK BOOTS SIZE: 6-16 BLACK 1,100 PAIR $18.41 $20,251.00 YES NO BID $18.24 $20,064.00 YES $19.25 $21,175.00 YES NO BID $16.99 $18,689.00 YES

2 WHITE TUBE SOCKS ONE SIZE WHITE 2,500 DOZEN $4.47 $11,175.00 YES NO BID $4.39 $10,975.00 YES $4.56 $11,400.00 NO NO BID $3.90 $9,750.00 YES 

3 MEN'S CANVAS STEP-IN SIZE: 7-17 ORANGE 5,000 PAIR $2.69 $13,450.00 YES NO BID $2.69 $13,450.00 YES $3.44 $17,200.00 YES NO BID $2.85 $14,250.00 YES 

4 MEN'S LOW TOP VELCRO CANVAS SNEAKER SIZE: 7-17 ORANGE 5,000 PAIR $3.93 $19,650.00 YES NO BID $4.29 $21,450.00 YES $6.30 $31,500.00 YES NO BID NO BID 

5 WOMEN'S CANVAS STEP-IN SIZE:  6-10 ORANGE 75 DOZEN $32.28 $2,421.00 YES NO BID $32.28 $2,421.00 YES $41.28 $3,096.00 YES NO BID $34.20 $2,565.00 YES 

6 WOMEN'S LOW TOP VELCRO CANVAS SNEAKER SIZE:  6-10 ORANGE 75 DOZEN $47.16 $3,537.00 YES NO BID $51.48 $3,861.00 YES $75.60 $5,670.00 YES NO BID NO BID 

7 X-STRAP SHOWER SANDALS SIZE: S,M,L,XL BLACK & WHITE 6,000 DOZEN $11.52 $69,120.00 YES NO BID $6.39 $38,340.00 YES $7.32 $43,920.00 YES NO BID $6.49 $38,940.00 YES 

8 MESH LAUNDRY BAG 30" X 40" 30" X 40" WHITE 1,000 EACH NO BID NO BID $2.52 $2,520.00 YES $39.12 $39,120.00 YES NO BID NO BID 

9 MATRESSES 25"X75"X4' 25"X75"X4" 1,500 EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID $58.22 $87,330.00 YES NO BID NO BID 

10 SHEETS 54"X90" 54" X 90" WHITE 1,050 DOZEN $20.77 $21,808.50 NO $19.50 $20,475.00 YES $21.44 $22,512.00 YES $25.80 $27,090.00 NO $20.75 $21,787.50 YES NO BID 

11 BLANKET 60"X80" 60" X 80" GREY 150 DOZEN NO BID $52.80 $7,920.00 YES NO BID $74.64 $11,196.00 YES $145.00 $21,750.00 YES NO BID 

12  THERMAL BLANKET 66" X 90" WHITE 70 DOZEN NO BID $52.80 $3,696.00 YES NO BID $58.56 $4,099.20 YES $58.20 $4,074.00 YES $54.00 $3,780.00 YES

13 BATH TOWEL 20"X40" 20" X 40" WHITE 1,000 DOZEN $13.85 $13,850.00 YES $7.20 $7,200.00 YES $8.66 $8,660.00 NO/100%COTTON $11.15 $11,150.00 NO $7.85 $7,850.00 YES $8.50 $8,500.00 YES 

14 WASH CLOTHES 12"X12" 12" X 12" WHITE 1,900 DOZEN $1.89 $3,591.00 YES $1.44 $2,736.00 YES $1.79 $3,401.00 NO/100%COTTON $1.76 $3,344.00 NO $1.20 $2,280.00 YES $1.95 $3,705.00 YES

15 WHITE WOMEN'S BRA SIZE: 30-48 WHITE 4,400 EACH $2.18 $9,592.00 YES NO BID $1.28 $5,632.00 NO $1.45 $6,380.00 NO NO BID NO BID 

16 WHITE WOMEN'S BRIEF SIZE:  5-9 WHITE 200 DOZEN NO BID NO BID $6.24 $1,248.00 YES $7.68 $1,536.00 NO NO BID NO BID 
17 WHITE WOMEN'S BRIEF SIZE:  10-16 WHITE 100 DOZEN NO BID NO BID $6.92 $692.00 YES $8.76 $876.00 NO NO BID NO BID 

TOTAL FOR ALL WOMEN'S BRIEFS* $1,940.00 $2,412.00 NO BID

18 MEN'S ORANGE BOXER SHORTS LARGE-XL ORANGE 1,500 DOZEN $14.71 $22,065.00 YES NO BID $12.78 $19,170.00 YES $14.76 $22,140.00 NO NO BID $13.50 $20,250.00 YES 
19 MEN'S ORANGE BOXER SHORTS 2XLARGE-4XL ORANGE 1,570 DOZEN $14.71 $23,094.70 YES NO BID $13.11 $20,582.70 YES $15.96 $25,057.20 NO NO BID $13.50 $21,195.00 YES 
20 MEN'S ORANGE BOXER SHORTS 5XLARGE-7XL ORANGE 90 DOZEN $14.71 $1,323.90 YES NO BID $13.69 $1,232.10 YES $15.96 $1,436.40 NO NO BID $13.50 $1,215.00 YES 

TOTAL FOR ALL MEN'S BOXER SHORTS* $46,483.60 $40,984.80 $48,633.60 $42,660.00

21 ORANGE T-SHIRTS LARGE-XL ORANGE 1,000 DOZEN $28.99 $28,990.00 YES NO BID $23.96 $23,960.00 YES $30.96 $30,960.00 NO NO BID $26.00 $26,000.00 YES 
22 ORANGE T-SHIRTS 2XLARGE-3XL ORANGE 1,300 DOZEN $36.99 $48,087.00 YES NO BID $28.34 $36,842.00 YES $36.00 $46,800.00 NO NO BID $28.00 $36,400.00 YES 
23 ORANGE T-SHIRTS 4XLARGE ORANGE 300 DOZEN $38.99 $11,697.00 YES NO BID $28.34 $8,502.00 YES $40.80 $12,240.00 NO NO BID $29.00 $8,700.00 YES 
24 ORANGE T-SHIRTS 5XLARGE ORANGE 50 DOZEN $41.99 $2,099.50 YES NO BID $30.34 $1,517.00 YES NO BID NO BID $30.00 $1,500.00 YES 
25 ORANGE T-SHIRTS 6XLARGE ORANGE 25 DOZEN $43.99 $1,099.75 YES NO BID $32.99 $824.75 YES $40.80 $1,020.00 NO NO BID $30.00 $750.00 YES 
26 ORANGE T-SHIRTS 7XLARGE ORANGE 25 DOZEN NO BID NO BID $69.00 $1,725.00 YES NO BID NO BID $30.00 $750.00 YES 
27 ORANGE T-SHIRTS 8XLARGE ORANGE 15 DOZEN NO BID NO BID $80.00 $1,200.00 YES NO BID NO BID $30.00 $450.00 YES 
28 ORANGE T-SHIRTS 9XLARGE ORANGE 15 DOZEN NO BID NO BID $90.00 $1,350.00 YES NO BID NO BID $30.00 $450.00 YES 
29 ORANGE T-SHIRTS 10XLARGE ORANGE 15 DOZEN NO BID NO BID $100.00 $1,500.00 YES NO BID NO BID $30.00 $450.00 YES 

TOTAL FOR ALL ORANGE T-SHIRTS* $91,973.25 $77,420.75 $91,020.00 $75,450.00

30 ORANGE COVERALLS LARGE ORANGE 70 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID $154.20 $10,794.00 YES NO BID NO BID 
31 ORANGE COVERALLS XLARGE-3XL ORANGE 1,020 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID $154.20 $157,284.00 YES NO BID NO BID 
32 ORANGE COVERALLS 4XLARGE ORANGE 300 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID $154.20 $46,260.00 YES NO BID NO BID 
33 ORANGE COVERALLS 5XLARGE-7XL ORANGE 450 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID $177.60 $79,920.00 YES NO BID NO BID 

TOTAL FOR ALL ORANGE COVERALLS* $294,258.00

34 YELLOW COVERALLS LARGE YELLOW 10 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 
35 YELLOW COVERALLS XLARGE-3XL YELLOW 40 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 
36 YELLOW COVERALLS 4XLARGE YELLOW 10 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 
37 YELLOW COVERALLS 5XLARGE-8XL YELLOW 54 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

TOTAL FOR ALL YELLOW COVERALLS* NO BID

38 LONG SLEEVE THERMAL TOPS LARGE-3XL OFF-WHITE 163 DOZEN NO BID NO BID $27.05 $4,409.15 YES $29.30 $4,775.90 YES NO BID $27.00 $4,401.00 YES

39 THERMAL UNDERWEAR BOTTOMS Large-2XL OFF-WHITE 140 DOZEN NO BID NO BID $26.17 $3,663.80 YES $26.40 $3,696.00 YES NO BID $26.00 $3,640.00 YES
40 THERMAL UNDERWEAR BOTTOMS 3XLARGE OFF-WHITE 3 DOZEN NO BID NO BID $26.17 $78.51 YES $26.40 $79.20 YES NO BID $26.00 $78.00 YES 

TOTAL FOR ALL THERMAL UNDERWEAR $3,775.20 NO BID $3,718.00

41 ORANGE KNITTED WATCH/SKULL CAPS ONE SIZE ORANGE 30 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID $13.20 $396.00 YES NO BID $18.00 $540.00 YES

42 MEN & WOMEN KHAKI WINTER COATS LARGE-3XL KHAKI 18 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $600.00 $10,800.00 YES 

GRAND TOTAL $326,902.35 $42,027.00 $281,783.01 $768,940.90 $57,741.50 $237,748.00

AB2020-08 INMATE SUPPLIES FOR THE MERCER COUNTY CORRECTION CENTER FOR A PERIOD OF TWO (2) YEARS:                                                                                                                                               AWARDED BY THE LOW BID FOR TOTAL OF EACH CATEGORY

GOALTEX CORP TABB TEXTILES CO. INC. VICTORY SUPPLY BOB BARKER COMPANY INC. HR COTTON USA INC. HOLMDEL FOOTWEAR CK09MERCER2020-06 FUEL OIL NO. 2 FOR THE COUNTY OF MERCER AND THE MERCER COUNTY COOPERATIVE CONTRACT PURCHASING SYSTEM FOR A PERIOD OF TWO (2) YEARS 



NO. OF BIDDERS: 2

NAME OF BIDDER RIGGINS, INC. MAJESTIC OIL COMPANY, INC.

ADDRESS 3938 S MAIN ROAD 2104 FAIRFAX AVE

CITY, STATE, ZIP VINELAND, NJ 08360 CHERRY HILL, NJ 08003

CONTACT STEVEN RIGGINS LISA D. TILORY

TELEPHONE 856 825 7600 856 751 8801

FAX 856 825 2270 856 751 8824

E-MAIL JMERLINO@RIGGINSOIL.COM MAJESTIC OIL COMPANY, INC.

INDEMNIFICATION AND INSURANCE 

REQUIREMENTS
INCLUDED INCLUDED 

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP DISCLOSURE SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

EXHIBIT A INCLUDED INCLUDED

IRAN CERTIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

EIC 2940 EXPIRES 11.15.22 7090 EXPIRES 03.15.2027

HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS YES YES

GALLONS                                         257,891                                              257,891 

OPIS AVEREAGE 05.11.2020 0.8676 0.8676 

BID PRICE PER GALLON 0.8676 0.8676

FIX DELIVERY AND OTHER CHARGES PER 

GALLON 
0.1089 0.162

TOTAL PRICE DEL. PER GALLON 0.9765 1.0296

YEAR ONE: TOTAL COST FOR 257,891 $251,830.56 $265,524.57 

GALLONS                                         257,891                                              257,891 

OPIS AVEREAGE 05.11.2020 0.8676 0.8676 

BID PRICE PER GALLON 0.8676 0.8676

FIX DELIVERY AND OTHER CHARGES PER 

GALLON 
0.1089 0.1620 

TOTAL PRICE DEL. PER GALLON 0.9765 1.0296 

YEAR TWO: TOTAL COST FOR 257,891 

GALLONS 
$251,830.56 $265,524.57 

GRAND TOTAL TWO YEARS $503,661.12 $531,049.15 

EXTEND TO COOP YES YES

CONTINUITY OF SERVICE YES YES

EXCEPTIONS NONE NONE

FATAL FLAW NO NO

PROPOSAL FORM 

YEAR ONE 

YEAR TWO 

BID RESULTS

CK09MERCER2020-06 FUEL OIL NO. 2 FOR THE COUNTY OF MERCER AND THE MERCER COUNTY COOPERATIVE 

CONTRACT PURCHASING SYSTEM FOR A PERIOD OF TWO (2) YEARS 

BID OPENING DATE: JUNE 17,2020 

mailto:JMERLINO@RIGGINSOIL.COM


NO. OF BIDDERS: 11

 BID ON JANITORIAL ONLY

NAME OF BIDDER INTERBORO PACKAGING CORPORTATION BOB BARKER COMPANY INC W.B. MASON CO., INC. R 2 PHYTO CORPORATION UNITED SALES USA CORP

ADDRESS 114 BRACKEN ROAD 7925 PURFOY ROAD 21 COMMERCE DRIVE 20 WEST AVENUE 185 30TH ST

CITY, STATE, ZIP MONTGOMERY, NY 12549 FUQUAY-VARINA, NC 27526 CRANBURY, NJ 08512 ATLANTIC HIGHLANDS, NJ 07716 BROOKLYN NY 11232

CONTACT FRADY MENDLAVIC K. NICOLE SAUNDERS TARA McCORD RAYMOND GUERRY PINNY ZIEGLER 

TELEPHONE 845-782-6800 919-346-2154 888-926-2766 732-567-4388 718-709-5900

FAX 845-781-2450 800-322-7537 866-399-1018 718-709-7705

E-MAIL INTERBORO@FRONTIERNET.NET NICOLEMYATT@BOBBARKER.COM TARA.MCCORD@WBMASON.COM RAYG@R2PHYTO.COM      RAYG@RBTECHNA.COM BIDS@UNITEDSALESUSA.COM

INSURANCE CERTIFICATE INCLUDED INCLUDED REQUIRED FROM AWARDED VENDOR REQUIRED FROM AWARDED VENDOR REQUIRED FROM AWARDED VENDOR
INDEMNIFICATION AND 

INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS
SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS 

REGISTRATION
OK OK OK NOT INCLUDED OK

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP 

DISCLOSURE 
OK OK OK OK OK

EXHIBIT A INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED

IRAN CERTIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

EIC 9387 EXPIRES 1.15.27 6211 EXPIRES 12.15.21 28060 EXPIRES 4.15.20 NOT INCLUDED 50005 EXPIRES 01.15.27
HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 

DAYS
YES YES YES YES YES

EXTEND TO COOP YES YES YES YES YES

CONTINUITY OF SERVICE YES YES YES YES YES

EXCEPTIONS NONE

ITEM #10 PRIVATE ISSUE BY BOB BARKER COMPANY, 

ITEM #4 BRAND: PRIME SOURCE, ITEM #89 BRAND: 

IVORY CASE PACK:72 BARS, ITEM #91 BRAND: 

AUSTINS, ITEM #92 BRAND: LUCKY. CASE PACK: 6 PER 

CASE. SIZE: 64 FL OZ.

NONE NONE NONE

FATAL FLAW NO NO  NO NO

BID ON JANITORIAL ONLY

NAME OF BIDDER CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORP. SPRUCE INDUSTRIES
COOPERFRIEDMAN ELECTRIC SUPPLY CO. 

INC
ALL AMERICAN POLY UNIPAK CORP

ADDRESS 2400 BEDLE PLACE 759 EAST LINCOLN AVENUE 1 MATRIX DRIVE 40 TURNER PLACE PO BOX 300027

CITY, STATE, ZIP LINDEN, NJ 07036 RAHWAY, NJ 07065 MONROE, NJ 08831 PISCATAWAY, NJ 08854 BROOKLYN, NY 11230

CONTACT ANDREW HOFFER DAN JOSEPH TANIA RODRIGUEZ ZEKE ROSENWASSER BRIAN MARCUS

TELEPHONE 908 862 7570 908-296-7441 732 752 3200 EXT. 1124 888 808 5120

FAX 908 862 9019 732 388 9585 732-308-4606 732 752 2305 718 677 9371

E-MAIL BIDS@CENTRALPOLY.COM DANIEL.JOSEPHS@SPRUCEINDUSTRIES.COM GOVBIDS@COOPER-ELECTRIC.COM ZEKE@ALLAMPOLY.COM CUSTOMERCARE@UNIPAK.NET

INSURANCE CERTIFICATE INCLUDED INCLUDED CK REQUIRED FROM AWARDED VENDOR INCLUDED
INDEMNIFICATION AND 

INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS
SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS 

REGISTRATION
OK OK OK OK OK

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP 

DISCLOSURE 
OK OK OK OK OK

EXHIBIT A INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

IRAN CERTIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

EIC 9010 EXPIRES 11.15.26 8426 EXPIRES 5.15.26 1237 EXPIRES 4.15.22 4729 EXPIRES 4.15.23 23255 EXPIRES 07.15.25
HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 

DAYS
YES YES YES YES YES

EXTEND TO COOP YES YES YES YES YES

CONTINUITY OF SERVICE NO YES YES YES YES

EXCEPTIONS YES, SEE ATTACHED NONE NONE NONE NONE

FATAL FLAW NO NO NO YES, NO BID PROPOSAL FORM IN BID SUMBISSION NO

NAME OF BIDDER GENERAL CHEMICAL & SUPPLY INC.

ADDRESS 858 N. LENOLA RD, UNIT 1A

CITY, STATE, ZIP MOORESTOWN, NJ 08057

CONTACT DAVID MCDONOUGH

TELEPHONE 856 778 5550

FAX 856 778 7381

E-MAIL DMCDONOUGH@GCSNJ.US

INSURANCE CERTIFICATE INCLUDED

INDEMNIFICATION AND 

INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS
SIGNED AND DATED

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS 

REGISTRATION OK

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP 

DISCLOSURE OK

EXHIBIT A REQUIRED IF AWARDED

IRAN CERTIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 SIGNED AND DATED

EIC 57491 EXPIRES 05.15.24

HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 

DAYS YES

EXTEND TO COOP NO

CONTINUITY OF SERVICE YES

EXCEPTIONS NONE

FATAL FLAW NO

BID RESULTS

CK09MERCER2020-07 JANITORIAL AND PAPER HOUSEHOLD SUPPLIES FOR THE COUNTY OF MERCER AND THE MERCER  COUNTY COOPERATIVE CONTRACT PURCHASING SYSTEM FOR A PERIOD OF TWO (2) YEARS

BID OPENING DATE: JUNE 17, 2020

mailto:INTERBORO@FRONTIERNET.NET
mailto:NICOLEMYATT@BOBBARKER.COM
mailto:TARA.MCCORD@WBMASON.COM
mailto:RAYG@R2PHYTO.COM
mailto:BIDS@UNITEDSALESUSA.COM
mailto:BIDS@CENTRALPOLY.COM
mailto:DANIEL.JOSEPHS@SPRUCEINDUSTRIES.COM
mailto:GOVBIDS@COOPER-ELECTRIC.COM
mailto:ZEKE@ALLAMPOLY.COM
mailto:CUSTOMERCARE@UNIPAK.NET
mailto:DMCDONOUGH@GCSNJ.US


LINE 

ITEM

PAPER HOUSEHOLD PRODUCT DESCRIPTION - THE COUNTY WILL ACCEPTS THE BRANDS 

REFERENCED OR AN EQUIVALENT BRAND
BRAND CASE/  

PACKAGING
COUNT

TOTAL NO. 

OF CASES

UNIT COST PER 

CASE BASED UPON 

COUNTY 

SIZE/PACKAGING 

AND COUNT

TOTAL PRODUCT NAME PRODUCT NUMBER

UNIT COST 

PER CASE 

BASED 

UPON 

COUNTY 

SIZE/PACK

AGING 

AND 

COUNT

TOTAL PRODUCT NAME
PRODUCT 

NUMBER

UNIT COST 

PER CASE 

BASED 

UPON 

COUNTY 

SIZE/PACK

AGING 

AND 

COUNT

TOTAL
PRODUCT 

NAME

PRODUCT 

NUMBER

UNIT COST PER 

CASE BASED 

UPON COUNTY 

SIZE/PACKAGIN

G AND COUNT

TOTAL
PRODUCT 

NAME

PRODUCT 

NUMBER

UNIT COST PER 

CASE BASED 

UPON COUNTY 

SIZE/PACKAGIN

G AND COUNT

TOTAL
PRODUCT 

NAME

PRODUCT 

NUMBER

UNIT COST 

PER CASE 

BASED 

UPON 

COUNTY 

SIZE/PACK

AGING 

AND 

COUNT

TOTAL
PRODUCT 

NAME

PRODUCT 

NUMBER

UNIT COST PER 

CASE BASED 

UPON COUNTY 

SIZE/PACKAGIN

G AND COUNT

TOTAL PRODUCT NAME

1 2 PLY BATH TISSUE, ECOSOFT#61600, 100% RECYCLED, 3 3/4" X 4", 48 ROLLS/CS ECOSOFT CASE 48 325 25.88$                  8,411.00$         NITTANY PAPER WIN2405  $              26.40  $           8,580.00 Nittany 486162r 37.97$      12,340.25$        VONDREHLE RR600

2 BAGS, KRAFT PAPER, BULWARK#25, 500/BDL DURO BUNDLE 500 2 8.58$                    17.16$              KRAFT BAG25
 $      37.98  $                           -   Duro DUM30926 

 $                   -    $                     -   

3 CUP, PAPER, 4 OZ., CONE BOTTOM, SOLO 4 #SCC4BR, 5,000/CS KONIE CASE 5000 156 38.68$                  6,034.08$         KONIE 4F
 $      64.89  $                           -   Solo SCC4BRCT

 $                     -   

4 CUP, STYROFOAM, 8OZ., DART #8J8, 1,000/CS DART CASE 1000 46 24.99$                  1,149.54$         DART DCC8j8
 $      23.04  $                           -   Dart DCC8J8

 $                     -   

5 ECOSOFT GREEN SEAL JRT JR. TOILET TISSUE, WHITE 2 PLY, 3.5" X 9" ROLL, 12 ROLLS/CS ATLAS CASE 12 510 22.35$                  11,398.50$       OASIS OAS23725
 $      11.84  $                           -   Atlas ALM800

 $              14.00  $           7,140.00 Nittany 73,041,000.00     $               22.66  $ 11,556.60 Atlas 700 32.50$      16,575.00$        VONDREHLE 2109  $              27.00  $               972.00 RUBBERMAID FG9C03060000

6 ECO-SOFT ROLL TOWELS, BAY WEST 314, 800'/ROLL, 6 ROLLS/CS BAY WEST CASE 6 363 18.95$                  6,878.85$         NITTANY PAPER NP-6800EN

no bid no bid

 $              17.60  $           6,388.80 Morcon w6800  $             -   32.61$      11,837.43$        VONDREHLE 880-BS  $              34.26  $            3,597.30 RUBBERMAID FG638300BLUE

7 FLATWARE, WHITE PLASTIC, SPOON DISPOSABLE, 5¾”, MED., 1,000/CS CASE 1000 2 8.50$                    17.00$              DART PLATSPOON
 $        5.00  $                           -   crystalware CSWTSPPWP1000

 $                     -    $             -    $                       -   

8 PAPER TOWELS - 2 PLY PERFORATED, ATLAS 585GREEN HERITAGE #APM-585GREEN, 85 SHEETS/ROLL, 30 

ROLLS/CS
ATLAS CASE 30 166 19.10$                  3,170.60$         NITTANY PAPER GCP-HHRT

 $      15.57  $                           -   Marcal MRC06350
 $              18.00  $           2,988.00 Nittany 3,085.00              $               22.77  $   3,779.82 Marcal 6350 25.59$      4,247.94$          VONDREHLE 4100  $              21.82  $            3,971.24 RUBBERMAID 2040053

9 PROTECTIVE LINERS FOR STURDY STATION BABY CHANGING TABLE, RUBBERMAID #7817-00, 320/PACK BUNZL PACK 320 9 40.00$                  360.00$            KOALA KARE KK15099  $                     -    $             -    $              12.00  $               240.20 RUBBERMIAD FG636100LAC & FG9B2200BRN

10 SANITARY NAPKINS, INDIVIDUAL, HOSPITAL REG. STAYFREE #25136895 MAXIPADS, 576 PADS/CS STAYFREE CASE 576 212 41.10$                  8,713.20$         HOST HOST M-4  $      31.68  $              6,716.16 
 Private Issue 

Sanitary Napkin 
SN12-C  $                     -    $             -    $              33.36  $            2,168.40 RUBBERMAID FG9B3600YEL

11 TISSUE, FACIAL, 2 PLY, 8" X 8", BOARDWALK FACIAL#14632, 100/BX, 30BX/CS BOARDWALK CASE 30 2 11.00$                  22.00$              NITTANY PAPER GCP-FACIAL
 $      11.60  $                           -   crystalware CSWT1002P30

 $              11.56  $                23.12 Elegant 826-100  $               13.97  $        27.94 Central Poly 2930  $              11.40  $               342.00 RUBBERMAID FG648200COBLT

12 TISSUE, TOILET RENOWN “GREEN SEAL CERTIFIED”, 500-SHEETS 96 ROLLS/CS RENOWN CASE 96 26 32.30$                  839.80$            NITTANY PAPER GCP-275
 $      24.59  $                           -   Atlas ALM275

 $              24.00  $              624.00 Nittany 962-U  $               40.00  $   1,040.00 Atlas 235  $                       -   

13 TISSUE, TOILET, 2 PLY, 1,000/ROLL, 96 ROLLS/CS CASE 96 741 42.25$                  31,307.25$       NITTANY PAPER GCP-1 PLY
 $      24.59  $                           -   Atlas ALM275

 $              24.00  $         17,784.00 Nittany 962-U  $                     -    $             -    $                5.75  $               345.00 RUBBERMAID FG261400GRAY

14 TISSUE, TOILET, SINGLE ROLL, 2 PLY,  RENOWN # REN06125-WB, 865/ROLL, 36 ROLLS/CS RENOWN CASE 36 200 32.40$                  6,480.00$         NITTANY PAPER

GCP-VCBT  $      34.99  $                           -   Alliance ALIC42882SC
 $                   -    $                     -    $                     -    $             -   

15 TOILET SEAT COVERS, HOSPITAL SPECIALTY COMPANY#4830, 5,000/CS HOSPECO CASE 5000 18 32.50$                  585.00$            HOSPECO GCP-Tt-COVER
 $      30.68  $                           -   Boardwalk BWKK5000

 $                   -    $                     -    $                     -    $             -   

16 TOWELS, HAND PAPER, WHITE, MULTI-FOLD, 9¾” X 9½”, BOARDWALK # BWK10 GREEN, 4,000/CS

(RECYCLED)
BOARDWALK CASE 4000 339 17.17$                  5,820.63$         NITTANY PAPER GCP-P200B

 $      14.41  $                           -   Marcal MRCP200B
 $              15.67  $           5,312.13 Nittany 5,301.00              $               17.55  $   5,949.45 Marcal P200B 19.88$      6,739.32$          VONDREHLE 548-W

17 TOWELS, HAND, PAPER WHITE C-FOLD, 10¼” X 13¾”, BOARDWALK # BWK11 GREEN, 4,000/CS

(RECYCLED)
BOARDWALK CASE 4000 596 15.20$                  9,059.20$         NITTANY PAPER GCP-102400

 $      12.69  $                           -   Marcal MRCP100B
 $              12.00  $           7,152.00 Marcal` P100B  $               28.31  $ 16,872.76 Marcal P100B 18.09$      10,781.64$        VONDREHLE 524-W

18 TOWELS, PAPER, ROLL 11" X 125', BOARDWALK #21 GREEN, 30 ROLLS/CS (RECYCLED) BOARDWALK CASE 30 661 NO BID NO BID
 $      15.29  $                           -   Marcal MRC06350

 $              18.00  $         11,898.00 Nittany 3,085.00              $                     -    $             -   25.59$      16,914.99$        VONDREHLE 4100

19 TOWELS, PAPER, ROLL, 8" X 350', BOARDWALK #14 GREEN, 350'RL/12 CS(RECYCLED) BOARDWALK CASE 12 827 22.30$                  18,442.10$       NITTANY PAPER GCP-8003FWRT
 $      12.69  $                           -   Marcal MRCP720N

 $              13.87  $         11,470.49 Nittany 12350EN  $               18.30  $ 15,134.10 Marcal P720N 22.97$      18,996.19$        VONDREHLE 835-B

20 WHITE TOWELS, WIPING,12" X 14" MDI#87007, 12X13", 800/CS CHAMPION CASE 800 50 NO BID NO BID
 $      21.39  $                           -   Legacy LGC105010

21 INSERT DISOUNT FOR ADDITIONAL ITEMS NOT REFLECTED IN SPECIFICATIONS 3% 0% 0% 0%

118,705.91$     6,716.16$               

80,444.68$               

79,360.54$         54,360.67$ 98,432.76$        11,636.14$        

SPRUCE INDUSTRIES, INC. COOPERFRIEDMAN ELECTRIC SUPPLY CO INC.

GRAND TOTAL

BOB BARKER COMPANY INC W.B.MASON CO., INC. UNITED SALES USA CORP CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORPORATIONGENERAL CHEMICAL & SUPPLY
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1 XLERATOR HAND DRYER OR EQUIVALENT , XL-SB 16 LBS, 11 3/4" LG. X 12 11/16" HIGH X 6 11/16" DEEP EXCEL EACH EACH 1

2 AIR FRESHENER NON-AEROSOL TROPICAL 32OZ. 12/CS CASE 12/32 OZ 90
 $  43.57  $                 3,921.30 NCL142836-magic breeze lavender, 12/CT  $      -   

106.57$               9,591.30$                       850005814160

3 AMMONIA, 4 GAL./CS CASE 4/1 GAL 140
 $  10.12  $                 1,416.80 KIK19704085391-ammonia , 1gal/4/CS  $      -   

4 BLEACH, 5.25% SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE SOLUTION, 6/1 GAL CASE 6/1 GAL 701 18.80$                      13,178.80$                 A-1-227063 6/1gal  $           53.40  $      37,433.40 GNA1  $           -   6/1 GAL
 $  11.79  $                 8,264.79 KIK11008635042-bleach 1gal, 6/CS  $      -   

5 BOTTLE, SPRAY, 32 OZ., W /TRIGGER ACTIVATED SPRAY HEAD, TOLCO #5912/40732 12/CS TOLCO CASE 12/32 OZ 36 2.00$                         72.00$                          AC-OFS32c 12/CS
 $      -   

6 BROOM, CORN, 100%, HEAVY DUTY,  W IRE BOUND, 32 LB./DOZ, HAMBURG #9115 3/BOX HAMBURG BOX 3 105 9.02$                         947.10$                       OCED6122 3/BOX
 $  32.38  $                 3,399.90 BWK932CEA  $  10.79 EA

7 BROOM, PUSH, BLOCK SIZE 12 INCHES, ALUMINUM HANDLE 60 INCHES,TOUGH GUY TOUGH GUY EACH EACH 12 10.00$                      120.00$                       NOR 00925118
 $      -   

8 BROOM, PUSH, W /HANDLE, NYLON SPLIT, BRISTLES, 18"X3" TRIM, FLATT #70115, 2/CS FLATT CASE 2 182
 $      -   

9 BROOM, STREET, 14", LONG BRISTLE, AFRICAN BASSINE TRIM, W /HANDLE FLATT #70159 FLATT EACH EACH 20
 $      -   

10 BRUSH, DECK, HARDW OOD BLOCK W ITH TW O HOLES FOR TAPERED END HANDLE BLOCK 9¾” X 2¾”, 

12/CS
CASE 12 65 6.87$                         446.55$                       BRU3310

 $      -   

11 BRUSH, SCRUB, HAND, HARDW OOD BLOCK, PALMETTO, 8" X 2¾” X 1 1/8”  12/CS PALMETTO CASE 12 30
 $      -   

12 BRUSH, W IRE, SCRATCH, DOZEN 12/CS CASE 12 20
 $      -   

13 BUCKET, PLASTIC, 14 QT., W ITH HANDLE RUBBERMAID #2614 RUBBERMAID EACH EACH 60 17.70$                      1,062.00$                   RCP2614
 $      -   

14 CLEANER DEGREASER, 32 OZ. BOTTLE SPRAY HEAD, ROUGH ‘N’ READY #1071, 12/CS ROUGH N READY CASE 12 172 24.20$                      4,162.40$                   NCL107136
 $  22.16  $                 3,811.52 NCL107136-NCL Ruff n Ready , 12/CS  $      -   

132.26$               22,748.72$                     850005814153

15 CLEANER DRAIN, 93% SULFURIC ACID, W EPAK DRAIN COND., 1 QT.@ 12/CS W EPAK CASE 12/1 QT 43
 $      -   

16 CLEANER, BATHROOM BLUE NON-ACID DISINFECTANT 32 OZ. 12/CS CASE 12/32 OZ 61
 $  18.35  $                 1,119.35 NCL172045-Bathroom Plus  $      -   

182.54$               11,134.94$                     850005814146 21.08$   1,285.88$       SPLNABC

17 CLEANER, BATHROOM, W EPAK NON-ACID DISINFECTANT 32 OZ. 12/CS W EPAK CASE 12/32 OZ 297 18.20$                      5,405.40$                   GCS-NADCC
 $  18.35  $                 5,449.95 NCL172045-Bathroom Plus  $      -   

182.54$               54,214.38$                     860000485791 21.08$   6,260.76$       SPLNABC

18 CLEANER, BUTCHER "BRIGHT",DISINFECTANT FOAM, #4095230, 20 OZ AEROSOL, 12/CS  CASE 12/20 OZ 95 24.50$                      2,327.50$                   
SPR4103  $  31.34  $                 2,977.30 NCL2003-Rely Foaming Disinfectant  $      -   

79.89$   7,589.55$       BWBR

19 CLEANER, EZ CLEAN CITRUS SCENT 4/1-GALLON CS CASE 4/1 GAL 14
 $      -   

158.41$               2,217.74$                       860000902205

20 CLEANER, FLOOR DETERGENT / DEGREASER TNT 4/1-GALLON CS CASE 4/1 GAL 83 64.00$                      5,312.00$                   
B-PINAP

5/GAL
 $      -   

152.78$               12,680.74$                     860000902250

21 CLEANER, GERMICIDAL DETERGENT RMC ENVIRO CARE 4 / 1-GALLON CS RMC CASE 4/1 GAL 45
 $      -   

158.41$               7,128.45$                       860000902267

22 CLEANER, GERMICIDAL W /DETERGENT GERMI-KLEEN 128 OZ, 4 GAL/CS GEMI-KLEEN CASE 4/1 GAL 8
 $      -   

158.41$               1,267.28$                       860000485760

23 CLEANER, GERMICIDAL, AEROSOL SPRAY 16 OZ. CAN, CHASE #5196 12/CS CHASE CASE 12/16 OZ 36 43.40$                      1,562.40$                   
CHA5196  $  54.99  $                 1,979.64 NCL2004-Fortress Aerosol Spray  $      -   

24 CLEANER, GLASS, CONCENTRATE, 4 GAL/CS DILUTION RATIO 10 TO 1 CASE 4/1 GAL 23 33.20$                      763.60$                       
B-STAAP  $      -   

180.74$               4,157.02$                       860000485760

25 CLEANER, GLASS, SPRAY, 12 X 1 QT./CS CASE 12/1 QT 176 17.40$                      3,062.40$                   
ASPGLCLC  $  19.55  $                 3,440.80 NCL404536-earth sense rtu  $      -   

149.01$               26,225.76$                     860000485777

26 CLEANER, KNOCK-OUT, #43540, 19 OZ/CAN, 12/CANS/CS CASE 12/19 OZ 45 40.00$                      1,800.00$                   
SA-SD20C  $  32.79  $                 1,475.55 NCL2001-knock out  $      -   

27 CLEANER, PINE OIL, ALL PURPOSE DEO-PINE OIL #1414, 4 GAL/CS DEO-PINE CASE 4/1 GAL 501 23.70$                      11,873.70$                 
PINE1414  $  26.07  $               13,061.07 NCL141429-Deo Pine Oil  $      -   

298.98$               149,788.98$                   860000902236 13.67$   6,847.00$       UNIFIED #1154

28 CLEANER, TOILET, GERMICIDAL W /DETERGENT, W /PUMP, MISCO #3-10D 4 GAL./CS  MISCO CASE 4/1 GAL 40
 $      -   

225.45$               9,018.00$                       860000902229

29 CLEANSER, BABO, 21 OZ.CAN, 24 CANS/CS. BABO CASE 24/21 OZ 80 28.80$                      2,304.00$                   
BABO  $  26.47  $                 2,117.60 CPC14278EA  $   1.10 EA

30 CONTAINER, 56 GAL., BASE, BROW N ONLY, 25 7/8” X 22 7/8” X 31½”H., RUBBERMAID 256B RUBBERMAID EACH EACH 15 74.50$                      1,117.50$                   
RCP2655B  $191.22  $                 2,868.30 RCP256BBRO  $      -   

31 CONTAINER, PLASTIC, 32 GALLON, RUBBERMAID  #2632 W / #2631 LID RUBBERMAID EACH EACH 15 34.50$                      517.50$                       
RCP2632  $      -   

32 DEODORANT BLOCKS, TOILET, 4 OZ. SNAP-ON INDIVIDUAL W RAP, FRESH BOW L #12-3.5 BB, 48/CS FRESH BOW L CASE 48 35
 $      -   

33 DEODORANT BLOCKS, URINAL, NOT SNAP-ON, INDIVIDUAL W RAP, PARA DEODORANT TOSS BLOCK 

4 OZ., 12/BOX

BOX 12/4 OZ 170 32.00$                      5,440.00$                   
BW K40

12/BX
 $   9.69  $                 1,647.30 HOS04901  $      -   

34 DEODORIZER, LIME SCENT, AEROSOL SPRAY, BRITE CITRUS #C-164, 12 X 20 OZ. CANS/CS. BRITE CASE 12/20 OZ 130 26.30$                      3,419.00$                   
SPR-4112

12/20OZ
 $  47.57  $                 6,184.10 NCL2014  $      -   

35 DEVOUR BLO-ENZYMAT DIGEST CLEANER, EAGLE NO.26388,  4 GALLONS/CS EAGLE CASE 4/1 GAL 80 42.80$                      3,424.00$                   
SIM-0086004  $  31.75  $                 2,540.00 NCL180029  $      -   

36 DISINFECTANT, AEROSOL SPRAY, 16 OZ. CAN SST #TS223, 12/CS CASE 12/16 OZ 142 24.45$                      3,471.90$                   
SPR4104

12/CS
 $      -   

37 DISINFECTANT, QUAT PLUS TB, RMC 32OZ BOTTLES 12/CS RMC CASE 12/32 OZ 55
 $      -   

38 DUST PAN, PLASTIC, 8 1/8” X 12¼”, RUBBERMAID RUBBERMAID CASE 12 39 8.15$                         317.85$                       
IMP-2600

EACH
 $  33.03  $                 1,288.17 RCP2005CHA  $   2.75 EA

39 FLOOR FINISH INTEGRA W ET LOOK 4 / 1-GALLON CS CASE 4/1 GAL 23
 $  37.20  $                   855.60 NCL050229  $      -   

40 FLOOR FINISH, COMMON CENTS CC2 @ 55 GAL/DRUM DRUM 55 GAL 10
 $      -   

41 FLOOR MACHINE PAD, 20" DIAMETER POLISHING MICROTON 5/CS MICROTRON CASE 5 7 10.95$                      76.65$                          
TRELEONI-MIC20W

5/CS
 $  10.26  $                     71.82 ACS4120  $      -   

42 FLOOR MACHINE PAD, 20" DIAMETER, SCRUBBING MICROTRON 5/CS MICROTRON CASE 5 7 10.95$                      76.65$                          
TREELONI-MIC-20GC  $  10.26  $                     71.82 ACS5520  $      -   

43 FLOOR MACHINE PAD, 20" DIAMETER, ULTRA HIGH SPEED POLISHING, MICROTRON SPECIAL, 5/CS MICROTRON CASE 5 5 12.20$                      61.00$                          
Treleoni- MIC-20W C  $  10.26  $                     51.30 ACS3320  $      -   

44 FLOOR SEALER RESTORER & SPRAY BUFF HIGH SPEED 4 GAL. CAN CAN 4 GAL 26 32.00$                      832.00$                       
SZCS0725004  $  38.52  $                 1,001.52 NCL57529  $      -   

45 FLOOR STRIPPER, NON-AMMONIATED, BRULIN TALON 2 / 2.5-GALLONS, CASE(5GALLONS) CASE 2/2.5 GAL 28 102.00$                    2,856.00$                   
B-JUG-AP  $  25.77  $                   721.56 NCL105020  $  25.77 EA

46 GLOVES, RUBBER COATED, (NOT DISPOSABLE), LARGE, SUMMITEE SUMMITEE PAIR 2 108
 $   1.05  $                   113.40 AKRH103  $   6.32 BG

47 GRIPPER MOP HANDLE, PLASTIC W /60" HARDW OOD HANDLE EACH EACH 96
 $   6.44  $                   618.24 BWK610  $      -   

48 HANDLE, HARDW OOD, ALUMINUM SCREW -IN THREADED TIP, 60" LONG EACH EACH 40 18.20$                      728.00$                       
RCP-H126  $   2.80  $                   112.00 BWK610  $      -   

49 HANDLE, HARDW OOD, TAPERED END, 54" LONG FOR USE W ITH SCRUB AND HIGHW AY BRUSHES EACH EACH 425
 $   3.19  $                 1,355.75 BWK136  $      -   

50 HOTEL BRILLO PADS -10 PER BOX 12 BOX/CS BRILLO CASE 12/10 EACH BOX 41 32.30$                      1,324.30$                   
BRILLO  $  33.42  $                 1,370.22 PUXW240000CT  $      -   

51 INSECT SPRAY, BEE, W ASP & HORNET, 15 OZ. AEROSOL SPRAY, GOLDEN JET C-012, 12/CS GOLDEN JET CASE 12/ 15 OZ 128 41.10$                      5,260.80$                   
SPR-4108  $      -   

52 INSECT SPRAY, FLYING, CHASE #3012, 20 OZ. AEROSOL SPRAY 12/CS CHASE CASE 12/20 OZ 114 36.80$                      4,195.20$                   
SPR-4106  $  52.90  $                 6,030.60 SJN300816  $      -   

53 LINERS, TRASH CAN 15X9X23 SMALL CLEAR 6MIC .23MIL, 1000/CS CASE 1000 300 14.60$                      4,380.00$                   
UTR-24246  $  11.11  $                 3,333.00 HERV4831RNR01  $      -   

 $               8.98  $               2,694.00 
INT-2424-H Mfr: IBS/Capital As Per Sample # 53 

1,000/Case  $                                   8.30  $            2,490.00 
CP2424N6

 $              -   

54 LINERS, TRASH CAN,  LARGE, 40X48  .62MIL, CLEAR, 45 GALLONG 250/CS CASE 250 50 22.30$                      1,115.00$                   
UTR404816  $  20.00  $                 1,000.00 HERZ8048VKR01  $      -   

 $             14.82  $                  741.00 
INT-4048-H Mfr: IBS/Capital As Per Sample # 54

250/Case  $                                  15.20  $              760.00 
CP4048N16

 $              -   

55 LINERS, TRASH CAN, 22X14X58  1.7ML,  EXTRA HEAVY DUTY,  CLEAR, 100/CS CASE 100 32.00$                      32.00$                          
GG3858X

 $             17.84  $                    17.84 
INT-2214-58-XXH Mfr: IBS/Capital/Glopak As Per Sample # 55

100/Case  $                                  16.10  $                16.10 
CP221458NXH

56 LINERS, TRASH CAN, 22X16X59  4ML,  EXTRA HEAVY DUTY, #C460 W R.53LBS BLACK, 100/CS CASE 100 950 26.78$                      25,441.00$                 
R3858XH  $      -   

16.20$           15,390.00$   $             16.34  $              15,523.00 
INT-221659-Super Exh Mfr: IBS/Capital/Glopak As Per Sample # 56

100/Case  $                                  36.40  $          34,580.00 
CP221659K4

 $          18.20 50.00

57 LINERS, TRASH CAN, 24X24, 23 MIL BLACK, #P242406E (ROLL) HIMOLENE INC. (SMALL) , 1000/CS HIMOLENE CASE 1000 350 15.10$                      5,285.00$                   
UTR24246B  $  10.26  $                 3,591.00 HERZ4824RKR01  $      -   

 $               8.82  $               3,087.00 
INT-2424-H Mfr: IBS/Capital  As Per Sample # 57

1,000/Case  $                                   8.80  $            3,080.00 
CP2424K6

 $              -   

58 LINERS, TRASH CAN, 38X60, S6015C, BLACK, 1.2 MIL SIZE 100 22.60$                      22.60$                          
R38584

 $             12.84  $                    12.84 
INT-3860-Hvy Mfr: IBS/Capital/Glopak As Per Sample # 58

100/Case  $                                  12.30  $                12.30 
CP3860KXH

59 LINERS, TRASH CAN, 24X32 LT W T  .75 MIL BLACK (RECYCLED), 1000/CS CASE 1000 30 28.20$                      846.00$                       
R243315  $  21.09  $                   632.70 HERH4832HK

 $             15.82  $                  474.60 
INT-2433-H Mfr: IBS/Capital  As Per Sample # 59

1,000/Case  $                                  18.90  $              567.00 
CP2432KH

60 LINERS, TRASH CAN, 33X40 1 MIL BLACK, AFFLINK#A13339 , 250/CS AFFLINK CASE 250 30 18.10$                      543.00$                       
Poly  Plast ics-R3339H

250.00
 $  12.62  $                   378.60 HERH6639TK  $      -   

 $             15.24  $                  457.20 
INT-3340-Hvy Mfr: IBS/Capital/Glopak As Per Sample # 60

250/Case  $                                  14.20  $              426.00 
CP3340K1

 $              -   

61 LINERS, TRASH CAN, 33X40 1.8 MIL BLACK (RECYCLED), 250/CS CASE 250 55
 $      -   

 $             19.32  $               1,062.60 
INT-3340-XXH Mfr: IBS/Capital/Glopak As Per Sample # 61

250/Case  $                                  19.10  $            1,050.50 
CP3340KXH

 $              -   

62 LINERS, TRASH CAN, 38X58 1.5 MIL CLEAR, REPUBLIC #S6015C, 200/CS CASE 200 1220 32.15$                      39,223.00$                 
Poly  Plast ics-GG3858x

200.00
 $  23.18  $               28,279.60 HERH7658AC  $      -   

15.50$           18,910.00$   $             18.34  $              22,374.80 
INT-3858-Hvy Mfr: IBS/Capital/Glopak As Per Sample # 62

200/Case  $                                  32.40  $          39,528.00 
CP3858NXH

 $          16.20 100.00

63 LINERS, TRASH CAN, 40X48 RNW 4750 1.25 MIL BLACK(RECYCLED), 100/CS CASE 100 10 16.70$                      167.00$                       
Poly  Plast ics-R40481.4

100.00
 $      -   

 $             11.64  $                  116.40 
INT-3858-Hvy Mfr: IBS/Capital/Glopak As Per Sample # 63

200/Case  $                                  19.10  $              191.00 
CP4048KXH

 $              -   

64 TRASH CAN LINERS, LARGE (55 GALLON) HEAVY DUTY BLACK 2.5MIL 36 X 58, 200/CS CASE 200 530 26.78$                      14,193.40$                 
PolyPlast ics-R3858XH

200.00
 $      -   

 $             13.98  $               7,409.40 
INT-3660-H Mfr: IBS/Capital  As Per Sample # 64

100/Case  $                                  20.60  $          10,918.00 
CP3658KXXH

 $              -   

65 TRASH CAN LINERS, LARGE (60 GALLON) HEAVY DUTY BLACK 2MIL 38 X 58, 100/CS CASE 100 40 26.26$                      1,050.40$                   
Poly  Plast ics- R38602.0

100.00
 $  27.75  $                 1,110.00 HERX7658QK  $      -   

 $             10.32  $                  412.80 
INT-3860-H Mfr: IBS/Capital  As Per Sample # 65

200/Case  $                                  16.00  $              640.00 
CP3858K2

 $              -   

66 TRASH CAN LINERS, MEDIUM (32 GALLON) .9MIL 33 X 44, 500/CS CASE 500 541 35.50$                      19,205.50$                 
Poly  Plast ics-UTR334013B

500.00
 $   9.18  $                 4,966.38 HERH6644TCR01  $      -   

 $             16.24  $               8,785.84 
INT-3344-H Mfr: IBS/Capital  As Per Sample # 66

500/Case  $                                  28.00  $          15,148.00 
CP3344H

 $              -   

67 TRASH CAN LINERS, SMALL (24” X 31”) 1000/CS, BLACK CASE 1000 151 26.15$                      3,948.65$                   
PolyPlast ic-R2432-H

1000.00
 $  11.11  $                 1,677.61 HERV4831RNR01  $      -   

 $             11.84  $               1,787.84 
INT-2433-H Mfr: IBS/Capital  As Per Sample # 67

1,000/Case  $                                  11.60  $            1,751.60 
CP2431K

 $              -   

68 MOP BUCKET W ITH W HEELS, 26 QT. PLASTIC OVAL RUBBERMAID #6111, BLACK, 0.68 MIL RUBBERMAID EACH EACH 17
 $      -   

69 MOP BUCKET W ITH W HEELS, FUNNEL W RINGER, PLASTIC RUBBERMAID EACH EACH 63
 $  42.37  $                 2,669.31 RCP738000YEL  $      -   

70 MOP DUST, LOOPED END COTTON YARN, SIZE 5" X 18", BOURAS #7080, 12/CS BOURAS CASE 12 29 60.00$                      1,740.00$                   
Cre-Mdust18C

12ct
 $127.69  $                 3,703.01 COCPC058018  $      -   

71 MOP W RINGER, DOW NW ARD PRESSURE EACH EACH 30 76.00$                      2,280.00$                   
rcp7577-88yel

each
 $      -   

72 MOP, FLOOR DUST TREATMENT & CLOTH, NON-AEROSOL, 32OZ BOTTLES, 12/CS  CASE 12/32 OZ 25
 $  35.59  $                   889.75 BWK352ACT  $      -   

73 MOP, TOILET BOW L, PLASTIC HANDLE, SYNTHETIC HEAD MFG. HOUSE PRODUCT #1301-02W HOUSE EACH EACH 55 0.78$                         42.90$                          
Impact- Imp204

Each
 $   0.70  $                     38.50 BWK352ACT  $      -   

74 MOP, W ET, 8 PLY COTTON STRING, NO.1 GRADE , 1¼” HEAD BAND 24 OZ., W ILEN #2148-20, 12/CS W ILEN CASE 12 36 52.65$                      1,895.40$                   
Carolina-Sup24C

12ct
 $  79.37  $                 2,857.32 COCPA405124  $      -   

75 MOP, W ET, LOOPED ENDS, NYLON, MEDIUM SIZE, RUBBERMAID #E236 RUBBERMAID EACH EACH 170
 $   6.33  $                 1,076.10 RCPE236  $  75.93 CT

76 ORIGINAL NILLODER EAGLE NO. 26806 6 OZ. CAN 12/CS EAGLE CASE 12/6 OZ 10
 $      -   

77 OVEN CLEANER, 12 CANS PER CASE 16 OZ. CAN, 12/CS CASE 12/16 OZ 2 42.80$                      85.60$                          
Boardw alk-BW K350ACT

12/ct
 $      -   

78 PADS, SCOURING, 6" X 9", MICROTRON #096, 60/CS MICROTRON CASE 60 20 15.25$                      305.00$                       
Microtron-Mic096

60/cs
 $  13.48  $                   269.60 PME75004160  $      -   

79 PADS, SCOURING, STAINLESS STEEL #BS2003, 72/CS CASE 72 6
 $      -   

80 PLUNGER, TOILET, BELL TYPE, TOLCO TOLCO EACH EACH 90 6.10$                         549.00$                       
impact-imp9200

Each
 $      -   

81 POLISH, CLEANER, STAINLESS STEEL NON-AEROSOL, NATURAL SHINE SOY BASED 32OZ. BOTTLE 12/CS CASE 12/32 OZ 5 26.46$                      132.30$                       
Chase-Spr-4111

12/32oz
 $      -   

82 POLISH, FURNITURE NON-AEROSOL SPRAY, 18OZ. 12/CS CASE 12/18 OZ 60 26.99$                      1,619.40$                   
Chase-SPR-4109

12/18oz
 $      -   

83 RAGS, CLEANING, TERRY CLOTH, 50 LB/BALE BALE 50 LB 58 32.45$                      1,882.10$                   
AB W IPER- Rags 39215

50lb
 $      -   

84 RAGS, W IPING, W HITE SHEETING, 50 LB/CS CASE 50 LB 147 24.75$                      3,638.25$                   
Ab W ipers Rags-39212

50lb
 $      -   

85 SANITIZER, HAND, INSTANT FOAM, NON ALCOHOL, DEB #56827, 1 LITER, 6/CS DEB CASE 6/ 1 LITER 30
 $  41.53  $                 1,245.90 NCL044557-REQUIRES NEW DISPENSER (NCL4217) $      -   

132.57$               3,977.10$                       860000902274

86 SCREEN, URINAL, 6"X9" EACH EACH 1147 19.20$                      22,022.40$                 
Egen-Kryegem72mgl

Each
 $   0.70  $                   802.90 HOS03901  $   8.35 DZ

87 SHAMPOO, RUG, DEVOUR  STAIN & ODOR, 128 OZ., 4GAL/CS CASE 4/1 GAL 45
 $      -   

88 SOAP, BAR, 3.0 OZ,. NOT W RAPPED, 200/CS CASE 200/3 OZ 1040  $           42.00  $      43,680.00 
AU3-200

200 / Case
 $  50.42  $               52,436.80 BWKNO3UNWRAPA  $  36.30 

89 SOAP, BAR, 4 OZ., DEODORANT SAFEGUARD, 144/CS W RAPPED SAFEGUARD CASE 144/4 OZ 10  $         144.00  $       1,440.00 
PR4539

 $       72.00 72 / Case
 $105.99  $                 1,059.90 PGC08833  $  35.33 48/CT

90 SOAP, DISHW ASHING LIQUID, PINK LOTIONIZED, LERRO #3074, 1GALLON, 4/CS LERRO CASE 4/1 GAL 7  $           -   
 $  25.20  $                   176.40 NCL110129  $      -   

91 SOAP, HAND, LIQUID, 15% COCONUT OIL BASE, W /LANOLIN, MISCO, 1 GALLON, 4/CASE MISCO CASE 4/1 GAL 115  $           59.00  $       6,785.00 
ZPLS1900

 $           -   4/1 GAL
 $  21.15  $                 2,432.25 NCL030529  $      -   

157.90$               13,225.00$                     860000902212 28.17$   3,239.55$       MISCO #112931

92 SOAP, HAND, REFILL 1200M EAGLE PINK #16812  1200ML 8/CS EAGLE CASE 8/1200 ML 81 67.20$                      5,443.20$                   
B-uckeye-B-90091120

6/1250 ml  $           58.00  $       4,698.00 
LB10038

 $       43.50 6 / Case
 $      -   

122.50$               9,922.50$                       860000485784

93 SOAP, POW DER, SPIC & SPAN 27 OZ.,12/CS SPIC & SPAN CASE 12/27 OZ 425 95.30$                      40,502.50$                 
Spic & Span- PGC 31973

12/27oz
 $  99.52  $               42,296.00 PGC31973CT  $      -   

94 SPONGE, SCRUBBING, 6¼” X 3½” X1”,12/CS                            CASE 12 61 44.11$                      2,690.71$                   
Impact- Imp-7151

12/cs
 $   6.58  $                   401.38 BWK174  $  10.97 20/CT

95 SQUEEGEE, FLOOR, 24" W /HANDLE, STRAIGHT CONTICO #2400 CONTICO EACH EACH 40
 $      -   

96 SQUEEGEE, W INDOW , 12" STEEL W /INTEGRAL HANDLE, ETTORRE #2255 ETTORRE EACH EACH 70
 $  13.36  $                   935.20 UNGPR300  $      -   

97 SYNTHETIC NITRILE EXAM GLOVES, POW DER-FREE, SIZES: SMALL, MEDIUM, LARGE, XLARGE, 1000/CS CASE 1000 944 70.00$                      66,080.00$                 
Emerald- NGPFLC

1000/cs
 $      -   

 $             38.00 $35,872.00 
Aurelia-Sm,Med,Lrg,XL-NPFG-E Mfr: Supermax As Per Sample # 97

1,000/Case

98 TOILET BOW L BRUSH EXTRA HEAVY DUTY RUBBERMAID RUBBERMAID EACH EACH 181 2.98$                         539.38$                       
Rubbermaid- RCP-6310

Each
 $   1.48  $                   267.88 RCP631000WE  $      -   

99 W ASTE PAPER BASKET, METAL 15¾” DIAMETER X 18" HIGH, 44 QT., CONTINENTAL # 74M CONTINENTAL EACH EACH 25
 $      -   

100 W ASTE RECEPTACLE, PLASTIC, RUBBERMAID BRUTE #2634, 32 GALLON W ITH DOLLY RUBBERMAID EACH EACH 4 35.50$                      142.00$                       
Brute- RCP2632

Each
 $      -   

101 W ASTE RECEPTACLE, PLASTIC, RUBBERMAID BRUTE, 50 GALLON RUBBERMAID EACH EACH 2 74.50$                      149.00$                       
Brute- RCP2655

Each
 $  71.08  $                   142.16 RCP9W27GY  $      -   

MERCER COUNTY CORRECTIONAL FACILITY PRODUCTS
 $                         -    $      -   

102 CLEANER & DEODORIZER, NON-BLEACH, BAR KEEPER FRIEND, #BKF-11624, 26 OZ., 6/CS BAR KEEPER FRIEND CASE 6/32 OZ 200 16.60$                      3,320.00$                   
BKF-11624

6/32oz
 $  14.78  $                 2,956.00 BKF11624  $      -   

93.03$                 18,606.00$                     850005814139

103 ONE-STEP DISINFECTANT, BLOOD BORNE PATHOGEN COMPLAINT, HOSPITAL GRADE, SIMPLE GREEN, 

#SMP30501, 1 GALLON, 4 GAL/CS

SIMPLE GREEN CASE 4/1 GAL 200 75.50$                      15,100.00$                 
simple Green-smp30501

4/1gal
 $  63.99  $               12,798.00 SMP30501CT  $      -   

105.00$               21,000.00$                     850005814122

104 GERMICIDAL CLEANER & DEODORANT, VIRAL AND FUNGUS PATHOGEN COMPLAINT, HOSPITAL 

GRADE, SIMPLE GREEN, # SMP3030, 1 GALLON, 6 GAL/CS

SIMPLE GREEN CASE 6/1 GAL 200 75.21$                      15,042.00$                 
simple green- smp30301

6/1gal
 $  82.79  $               16,558.00 SMP01001  $      -   

210.71$               42,142.00$                     850005814115

105 LIQUID SPILL ABSORBENT, SUPER-SORB, SUPER-SORB, # FRS614SS, 12 OZ CAN, 6/BOX SUPER-SORB BOX 6/12 OZ 200 32.83$                      6,566.00$                   
FRS64SS

6/12oz
 $  31.24  $                 6,248.00 FRS614SSBX  $      -   

106 DUST CUP FILTER FOR  BAGLESS UPRIGHT VACUUM CLEANER, 2/CASE ELECTROLUX CASE 2 200 9.60$                         1,920.00$                   
M&M 61825H

2/cs
 $      -   

107 LTX 1200 TOUCH FREE DISPENSING SYSTEM FOR HAND SANITIZER, PURELL, # GOJ192804, 4/CASE PURELL CASE 4 200 6/cs
 $      -   

22.00$   4,400.00$       GOJO#1928-04

108 LTX 1200 REFILL FOR GEL HAND SANITIZER, GREEN CERTIFIED, PURELL, # GOJ190302, 2/CASE PURELL CASE 2 200 82.80$                      16,560.00$                 
B-90051120

6/1250ml
 $      -   

82.50$   16,500.00$      GOJO#1903-02

109 NON ACID, TOILET BOW L ALL IN ONE CLEANER,  1 QUART BOTTLES, 12/CASE CASE 12/1 QT 200 18.20$                      3,640.00$                   
Bullen- GCS-NADCC

12/1qt
 $  18.35  $                 3,670.00 NCL172045  $      -   

132.26$               26,452.00$                     850005814198 21.08$   4,216.00$       SPLNABC

110 FLOOR BRUSH HEAD, BLACK, 2 1/2" TAMPICO FIBER, BOARDW ALK, LENGTH 18", #BW K20218 BOARDW ALK EACH EACH 200 13.40$                      2,680.00$                   
W M-92014

each
 $   8.82  $                 1,764.00 BWK20218  $      -   

111 BLEACH GERMICIDAL W IPES (PREMOISTENED W IPES) CLOREX EACH 150 200 13.00$                      2,600.00$                   
Clorox -4460032348

each

112
NITRILE EXAM GLOVES 

MIDKNIGHT BOX 100 200 9.50$                         1,900.00$                   
Emerald- NGPFLB

10/bx

GREEN PRODUCTS
 $      -   

113 ENVIROX (CONCENTRATE 118, 1GAL) 4 GALLONS TOTAL ENVIROX CASE 4/1 GAL 40 90.00$                      3,600.00$                   
Env irox - 117-04B

4/1gal
 $      -   

158.41$               6,336.40$                       850005814108

114 ENVIROX (H2ORANGE2 CONCENTRATE, 1GAL) 4 GALLONS TOTAL ENVIROX CASE 4/1 GAL 21 110.62$                    2,323.02$                   
Env irox -114-04B

4/1/gal
 $      -   

158.41$               3,326.61$                       850005814092

115 ENVIROX TRIGGER BOTTLE ENVIROX EACH EACH 21 2.02$                         42.42$                          
Env irox -8-550

each
 $      -   

116 ENVIROX COMMERCIAL UNIT (E2 B2 W ALL MOUNT DISPENSER) ENVIROX EACH EACH 1 135.00$                    135.00$                       
Env irox -4-252-117

each
 $      -   

117 SOAP, HAND REFILL, AEROBLUE FOAMING “GREEN SEAL CERTIFIED” 1000 ML, 8/CS AERO BLUE CASE 8/1000ML 170 55.00$                      9,350.00$                   
B-90091120

6/1250ml
 $  49.49  $                 8,413.30 NCL043357  $  37.12 6/CT

111.05$               18,878.50$                     850005814085

118 DISPENSOR FOR SOAP, HAND REFILL, AEROBLUE FOAMING AERO BLUE CASE 6 46
B-99600001

6/cs
 $      -   0 NCL4217  $      -   

119 DISOUNT FOR ADDITIONAL ITEMS NOT REFLECTED IN SPECIFICATIONS 3% 0% 50% off current Catalog 0% 0

 $         439,488.33  $      94,036.40 

 $             290,413.82 

 $ 34,300.00  $            100,829.16  $        111,158.50  $                  474,039.42  $     50,338.74 

SPRUCE INDUSTRIES, INC.

GRAND TOTAL

BOB BARKER COMPANY INC W.B.MASON CO., INC. UNIPAK CORP INTERBORO PACKAGING CORPORATION CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORP R 2 PHYTO CORPGENERAL CHEMICAL & SUPPLY
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33.25$   2,992.50$    CHASE 433-4113

 $                      27.00  $                                 972.00 RUBBERMAID FG9C03060000

 $                      34.26  $                              3,597.30 RUBBERMAID FG638300BLUE

 $                      21.82  $                              3,971.24 
RUBBERMAID 2040053

 $                      12.00  $                                 240.20 RUBBERMIAD FG636100LAC & FG9B2200BRN

 $                      33.36  $                              2,168.40 RUBBERMAID FG9B3600YEL

 $                      11.40  $                                 342.00 RUBBERMAID FG648200COBLT

 $                        5.75  $                                 345.00 RUBBERMAID FG261400GRAY

33.00$   2,013.00$    PRIME SOURCE 75004036

 $                      80.00  $                              1,200.00 
RUBBERMAID FG256B00BRN

 $                      22.35  $                                 334.65 
RUBBERMAID FG2631 & FG2632

 $                      18.00  $                                 702.00 
RUBBERMAID FG200500CHAR

 $                      11.70  $                              1,123.20 
RUBBERMAID FGH216000000

 $                        3.25  $                                 130.00 
RUBBERMAID FG636400LAC

 $                        3.10  $                              1,317.50 
RUBBERMAID FG635200NAT

 $                      32.80  $                                 557.60 
RUBBERMAID 2064914

 $                      55.35  $                              3,487.05 
RUBBERMAID FG759088YEL

 $                      84.24  $                              2,442.96 
RUBBERMAID FGJ15200YL00

 $                      51.75  $                              1,552.50 
RUBBERMAID 2064959

 $                      51.84  $                              1,866.24 
RUBBERMAID FGF21800WH00

 $                        4.38  $                                 744.60 
RUBBERMAID FGE43600WH00

 $                      29.15  $                                 728.75 
RUBBERMAID FHWB44BK

 $                      39.52  $                                 158.08 
RUBBERMAID FG2632 & FG26400

 $                      68.45  $                                 136.90 
RUBBERMAID FG9W2700

0% 0%

 $   5,005.50  $                            28,118.17 

COOPERFRIEDMAN ELECTRIC SUPPLY CO INC.UNITED SALES CORP INC.


