
NO. OF REPONDENTS: 5

COUNTY RESERVES RIGHT TO AWARD UP TO FOUR 

CONTRACTS BASED UPON THE LOWEST COST PER 

CATEGORY

NAME OF BIDDER CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES TRICO EQUIPMENT SERVICES LLC HARTER EQUIPMENT, INC. JESCO, INC. GARDEN STATE BOBCAT, INC.

ADDRESS 35 ROUTE 70 WEST 551 N.HARDING HARDING HIGHWAY 615 STATE ROUTE 33 118 ST. NICHOLAS AVENUE 999 ROUTE 33

CITY, STATE, ZIP MARLTON, NJ 08053 VINELAND, NJ 08360 MILLSTONE TWP., NJ 08535 SOUTH PLAINFIELD, NJ 07080 FREEHOLD, NJ 07728

CONTACT BRAIN C. WRIGHT STEVE SCATTOLINI VICTOR RIGA JOATHAN ROBUSTELLI ROBERT WOODS III

TELEPHONE 856.983.0111 856.697.1414 732.446.7600 908.753.8080 732 780 6880

FAX 856.988.6290 856.697.4842 732.446.9255 908.753.7853 732 780 1205

E-MAIL brian@cherryvalleytractor.com sscattolini@tricoequipment.com sales@harterinc.com JONR@JESCO.US RWOODS@NEWJERSEYBOBCAT.NET

EXTEND TO COOPERATIVE YES YES YES YES YES

INSURANCE AND INDEMNIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

INSURANCE REQUIRED FROM VENDOR EXPIRES 10/5/14 REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK OK OK OK

STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE CERTIFICATION OK OK OK OK OK

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

CUT OFF DATE 12/31/2014 10/1/2014 11/30/14 FOR WHEEL LOADER 1/1/2016 FOR WHEEL LOADER

10/1/14 FOR BACKHOE

12/31/14 FOR TRACTOR

EIC CERT# 5598 EXPIRES 10/15/19 CERT#40921 EXPIRES 11/15/17 CERT#6914 EXPIRES 3/15/20 CERT#2224 EXP 12/15/16 CERT#5758 EXP 10/15/19

EXHIBIT A OK OK OK OK OK

IRAN CERTIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS YES YES YES YES YES

HOLD PRICING ONE YEAR YES NO YES YES YES

CONTINUITY OF SERVICE DURING EMERGENCIES YES YES YES YES YES

EXCEPTIONS FRANK TO REVIEW EXCEPTIONS NONE FRANK TO REVIEW EXCEPTIONS FRANK TO REVIEW EXPEPTIONS NONE

WHEEL LOADERS 90 DAYS

COST FOR ONE NO BID 176,355.00                                                               186,280.00                                                               210,225.00                                                               NO BID

TOTAL FOR TWO 352,710.00                                                               372,560.00                                                               420,450.00                                                               

BRAND CASE HYUNDAI JOHN DEERE

MODEL NUMBER 721FXR HL575XTD-9A 624K HI LIFT

YEAR 2014 2014 2015

DELIVERY DATE APPROXIMATELY 90 DAYS A.R.O 90 DAYS FROM RECEIPT OF PO 60 - 90 DAYS FROM RECEIPT OF PO

BACKHOES 90 DAYS

COST FOR ONE NO BID 92,100.00                                                                 96,634.00                                                                 NO BID NO BID

TOTAL FOR TWO 184,200.00                                                               193,268.00                                                               

BRAND CASE JOHN DEERE

MODEL NUMBER 580N 310K

YEAR 2014 2014

DELIVERY DATE APPROXIMATELY 90 DAYS A.R.O 90 DAYS FROM RECEIPT OF PO

TRACTOR 60 DAYS

COST FOR ONE 50,482.00                                                                 NO BID 49,455.00                                                                 NO BID NO BID

BRAND KUBOTA KUBOTA

MODEL NUMBER L3560HSTC L3560HSTC

YEAR 2014 2014

DELIVERY DATE 60 DAYS FROM RCEEIPT OF PO 90 DAYS FROM RCEEIPT OF PO

EXCAVATOR 90 DAYS

COST FOR ONE 65,109.64                                                                 NO BID NO BID NO BID 62,686.00                                                                 

BRAND KUBOTA BOBCAT

MODEL NUMBER U554R3AP E45 T4

YEAR 2014 2014 - 2015

DELIVERY DATE 90 DAYS FROM RCEEIPT OF PO 90 DAYS

BID  RESULTS

CK09MERCER2014-16 EQUIPMENT FOR MERCER COUNTY MOTOR POOL: TWO CASE 721F, TWO CASE 580N, ONE NEW KUBOTA, ONE BOBCAT

SEPTEMBER 9, 2014
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