
BIDS RECEIVED 2

NAME OF BIDDER ACCENT FENCE INC. GIACORP CONTRACTING INC. 

ADDRESS 1450 BREMAN AVENUE 11 BRADHURST AVENUE 

CITY, STATE, ZIP EGG HARBOAR CITY, NJ HAWTHORNE, NY 10532

CONTACT GREG CARNESALE LISA WALTER CALICCHIA 

TELEPHONE 609-965-6400 914-440-0300

FAX 609-965-6403 914-302-3973

E-MAIL GCARNESALE@ACCENTMENTAL.NET LWX@GIACINC.COM

NJ SAVI DESIGNATION SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE YES, NO DESGINATION LISTED 

BID BOND
AMERICAN SOUTHERN INSURANCE 

CO. 10% NTE TOTAL BID AMOUNT 

ENDURANCE AMERICAN INSURANCE 

CO. 10% NTE TOTAL BID PRICE 

CONSENT OF SURETY DOUGLAS A. OLT AIF WITH POA ANTHONY BASCIANO AIF WITH POA 

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

INSURANCE CERTIFICATE REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED

INDEMNIFICATION AND INSURANCE SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

IRAN CERT SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

PREVAILING WAGE CERTIFICATION OK OK

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

EXHIBIT B INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED

AA201 REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED

PW CONTRACTOR REG. 41444 EXPIRES 5.2.22 714824 EXPIRES 4.2.21

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK

NON-COLLUSION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

SAFETY CERT SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

EQUIPMENT CERT SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS YES YES 

REFERENCES INCLUDED PC TO REVIEW INCLUDED PC TO REVIEW 

TOTAL BID  $                                         118,500.00 182,064.00$                                         

EXCEPTIONS
NONE/MATH ERROR ON GRAND 

TOTAL 

NONE/MATH ERROR ON GRAND 

TOTAL 

FATAL FLAW NO NO

BID RESULTS

AB2020-37 DEER FENCING  FOR THE MERCER COUNTY PARK COMMISSION 

BID OPENING DATE: SEPTEMBER 22,2020 

mailto:GCARNESALE@ACCENTMENTAL.NET
mailto:LWX@GIACINC.COM


UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL 

Estimated 3200’ of 8’ galvanized deer fence with one Hi-tensile top wire

and line posts (COST PER FOOT):
 $                           17.00  $          54,400.00 27.82$                        89,024.00$                                    

Cost for corner posts:  $                         400.00  $               400.00 954.00$                      954.00$                                         

Cost for end braces:  $                         200.00  $               200.00 477.00$                      477.00$                                         

Cost for one 12’ equipment gate and one 4’ pedestrian gate will be 

installed with this exclosure:  $                      2,000.00  $            2,000.00 
4,950.00$                   4,950.00$                                      

Exclosure 1 (~5 acres):

Estimated 2000’of 8’ galvanized deer fence with one Hi-tensile top

wire and line posts (COST PER FOOT):
 $                           20.00  $          40,000.00 27.82$                        55,640.00$                                    

Corner posts:  $                         400.00  $               400.00 954.00$                      954.00$                                         

End braces: 200.00$                         200.00$               477.00$                      477.00$                                         

One 6' equipment gate to be installed with this exclosure:  $                         800.00  $               800.00 2,255.00$                   2,255.00$                                      

Exclosure 2 (< 1 acre):

Estimated 850’of 8’ galvanized deer fence with one Hi-tensile top wire and

line posts (COST PER FOOT):
 $                           22.00  $          18,700.00 27.82$                        23,647.00$                                    

Corner posts: 400.00$                         400.00$               954.00$                      954.00$                                         

End braces: 200.00$                         200.00$               477.00$                      477.00$                                         

One 6' equipment gate to be installed with this exclosure:  $                         800.00  $               800.00 2,255.00$                   2,255.00$                                      

GRAND TOTAL FOR PURCHASE, DELIVERY AND INSTALLATION OF ALL 

LOCATIONS 
 $        118,500.00 182,064.00$                                  

Baldpate Mountain Deer Exclosures:  Project location: 23 Fiddler’s Creek Road, Hopewell Twp., NJ 08530 

Sommer Park Deer Exclosure  Project location: Hopewell - Wertsville Road, Hopewell Twp., NJ 08530

AB2020-37 DEER FENCING FOR THE MERCER COUNTY PARK COMMISSION 

COST PROPOSAL 

COST FOR PURCHASE, DELIVERY AND INSTALLATION:         

GIACORP CONTRACTING ACCENT FENCE INC. 



NO. OF BIDDERS: 4

NAME OF BIDDER TEREX UTILITIES 
BUCKS COUNTY INTERNATIONAL, 

INC
GABRIELLI KENWORTH OF NJ, LLC W.E. TIMMERMAN CO., INC.

ADDRESS 3140 15TH AVE. SE 134 OLD OXFORD VALLEY RD 2306 ROUTE 130N 3554 ROUTE 22 WEST

CITY, STATE, ZIP WATERTOWN, SD 57201 LANGHORNE, PA 19047 DAYTON, NJ 08810 WHITEHOUSE, NJ 08888

CONTACT STEPHANIE EVANS KIM HIEBER HANSHAW PAUL AVVENTO EDWARD K. BIXBY

TELEPHONE 605 882 5604 267 397 4000 732 438 5740 908 534 4126

FAX 215 493 1061 732 438 0739 908 534 2320

E-MAIL STEPHANIE.EVANS@TEREX.COM
KIM@BUCKSCOUNTYINTERNATIONAL.CO

M
PAVVENTO@GABRIELLITRUCK.COM MAIL@TIMMERMANEQUIPMENT.COM

NJ SAVI DESIGNATION N/A N/A N/A N/A 

INSURANCE 

INDEMNIFICATION PAGE 
SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

INSURANCE CERTIFICATE REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

BUSINESS REGISTRATION 

CERTIFICATE
OK OK OK OK

ADDENDUM NO. ONE SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

EIC REQUIRED IF AWARDED 5996 EXPIRES 11.15.26 44468 EXPIRES 02.15.24 5180 EXPIRES 8.15.26

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

IRAN CERTIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 

DAYS
YES YES YES YES

CONTINUITY OF OPERATION YES YES YES YES

UNIT COST FOR ONE (1) 2021 

OR NEWER KENWORTH MODEL 

T370 4X2,

 STANDARD DAY CAB WITH 

ALTEC LR-7-60E70 AERIAL LIFT

 $221, 879.00  $230, 878.00 $288, 312.00  $291, 200.00 

MANUFACTURER TEREX UTILITIES INTERNATIONAL KENWORTH/ALTEC ALTEC/KENWORTH

MODEL XTPRO 60/70 HV507 T370 / LR-7-60E70 LR760E70/ T370

YEAR 2021 2021 2021 2021

DELIVERY DATE 210-270 DAYS- SEE COMMENTS 270 DAYS 300 DAYS AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDER 300 DAYS ARO

EXCEPTIONS YES, MOTOR POOL TO REVIEW YES, MOTOR POOL TO REVIEW YES, MOTOR POOL TO REVIEW NONE

FATAL FLAW NO NO NO NO

BID RESULTS

CK09MERCER2020-20 ONE (1) 2021 KENWORTH MODEL T370 4x2, STANDARD DAY CABWITH ALTEC LR-7-60E70 AERIAL LIFT

FOR USE BY SHADE TREE FOR A PERIOD OF ONE (1) YEAR

BID OPENING DATE : SEPTEMBER 22, 2020

mailto:STEPHANIE.EVANS@TEREX.COM
mailto:KIM@BUCKSCOUNTYINTERNATIONAL.COM
mailto:KIM@BUCKSCOUNTYINTERNATIONAL.COM
mailto:PAVVENTO@GABRIELLITRUCK.COM
mailto:MAIL@TIMMERMANEQUIPMENT.COM
mailto:SEALMASTER.SEAN@VERIZON.NET


NUMBER OF RESPONDENTS 1

NAME OF BIDDER CATHERINE A. ADAMOYURKA

ADDRESS 3015 WALTON ROAD

CITY, STATE, ZIP JAMISON, PA 18929

CONTACT CATHERINE A. ADAMOYURKA

TELEPHONE 215 962 0674

FAX

E-MAIL CATHYICE59@AOL.COM

NJ SAVI DESIGNATION N/A 

INSURANCE AND INDEMNIFICATION REQUIREMENTS SIGNED AND DATED

IRAN CERTIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP SIGNED AND DATED

EXHIBIT A INCLUDED

EIC 42189 EXPIRES 7.15.22

REFERENCES INCLUDED, EVALUATION TEAM WILL REVIEW 

RESUME INCLUDED 

QUALIFICATION STATEMENT INCLUDED 

EXTEND BEYOND 60 DAYS YES

CONTINUITY OF OPERATION YES, SEE PAGE 35 

MEMBERSHIP REQUIREMENTS: 

PSA # 13279 EXPIRES 6.30.21 AND ISI # 0056127 

EXPIRES 8.31.21; US FIGURE SKATING  MEMBER 

# 991005 EXPIRES 6.31.21

NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT SIGNED AND DATED

LESSONS/COMPETITION FEES % PAID TO THE MCPC ON 

ALL FEES COLLECTED 
60%

FLAT FEE, PER LESSON PAID TO THE PARK COMMISSION 

FOR PRIVATE LESSONS (MINIMUM: $3.00)
$3.00 

EXCEPTIONS NONE

FATAL FLAW NO

RFP RESULTS

CC2020-03 SKATING DIRECTOR FOR THE MERCER COUNTY SKATING CENTER 

RFP OPENING: SEPTEMBER 23,2020

mailto:CATHYICE59@AOL.COM


NUMBER OF BIDDERS 12

NAME OF BIDDER M.S.P CONSTRUCTION CORP. EARLE ASPHALT COMPANY VOLLERS EXCAVATING & CONSTRUCTION INC P.M. CONSTRUCTION CORP. PACT ONCE LLC MONTANA CONSTRUCTION PILLARI BROS CONSTRUCTION CORP. C.J HESSE INC. MOUNT CONSTUCTION CO., INC. MAC-ROSE CONTRACTORS, INC. LIMA CHARLIE CONSTUCTION, INC. COLONNELLI BROTHERS INC. 

ADDRESS 19-B MINNEAKONING ROAD P.O BOX 556 3311 ROUTE 22 EAST 1310 CENTRAL CORP PO BOX 74 80 CONTANT AVE 65 SQUANKUM YELLOWBROOK RD. 25 FIRST AVENUE 427 SOUTH WHITE HORSE PIKE 85 RIDGE ROAD 1 BROAD STREET SUITE 4 409 SOUTH RIVER STREET 

CITY, STATE, ZIP FLEMINGTON, NJ 08822 FARMINGDALE ,NJ 07727 NORTH BRANCH, NJ 08876 HILLSIDE, NJ 07205 RINGOES, NJ 08551 LODI, NJ 07644 FARMINGDALE, NJ 07727 ATLANTIC HIGHLANDS, NJ 07716 BERLIN, NJ 08009 BROWN MILLS , NJ 08015 FREEHOLD, NJ 07728 HACKENSACK, NJ 07601

CONTACT ALZERINO PEREIRA BRIAN M. COOPER CHRIS VOLLERS PAULOS MATOS HENRIK P. MAXIAN LISA S. BALLEINI MICHAEL PILLARI LAWRENCE C. HESSE MICHAEL MAZZARELLA LEE ROSENBERG JEFF CANTOR LISA COLONNELLI 

TELEPHONE 973-465-9222 732-308-1113 908-725-1026 908-965-2090 908-788-1985 973-478-5200 732-938-4550 732-291-8100 856-768-8493 609-893-8600 833-242-2427 201-440-1118

FAX 973-465-5586 732-308-1034 908-726-9784 908-964-9648 908-788-5780 973-478-7604 732-938-3198 732-495-6225 856-753-1453 609-893-2102 732-955-8301 201-440-8282

E-MAIL AL@MSPCONSTRUCTION.CORP,COM BCOOPER@EARLECO.COM CHRIS@VOLLERS.CC ESME@PMCONSTRUCTIONCO.COM LSANTAITE@MONTANACONSTRUCTION.COM MPILLARI@PILLARIBROS.COM LHESSE@CJHESSE.COM MMAZZARELLA@MOUNTCONSTRUCTION.COM MACROSECC@AOL.COM ESTIMATING@LIMACHARLIECONSTUCTION.COM LPROP@COLONNELLI.COM 

NJ SAVI DESIGNATION N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A YES, NO DESIGNATION ASSIGNED SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE N/A N/A N/A 
DISABLED VETERAN OWNED SMALL BUSINESS 

ENTERPRISE 
SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE 

ADDENDUM NO ONE INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED 

HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS DID NOT CHECK YES OR NO YES DID NOT CHECK YES OR NO YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES 

BID BOND WESTERN SURETY COMPANY 10% NTE 20K FEDERAL INSURANCE COMPANY 10% NTE 20K BERKLEY INSURANCE CO. 10% NTE 20K NGM INSURANCE CO. 10% NTE 20K 
GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE 10% NTE 

20K 

GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY 

10% NTE 25K 
BERKLEY INSURANCE CO. 10% NTE 20K 

WESTPORT INSURANCE CORPORATION 10% NTE 

20K
LIBERTY MUTUAL INSURANCE CO. 10% NTE 20K FIRST INDEMNITY OF AMERICA INSURANCE CO AEGIS SECURITY INSURANCE COMPANY 10% NTE 20K UNITED STATES FIRE INSURANCE CO. 10% NTE 20K

CONSENT OF SURETY LISA NOSAL AIF WITH POA DONNA M. PLANETA WIF WITH POA THOMAS M. NILAND AIF WITH POA ERIC J. FOLLMAN SR AIF WITH POA JOHN P. SEDOR  AIF WITH POA MELISSA F. SCHMIDIG AIF WITH POA RACHAEL HURLEY AIF WITH POA DAWN M. JONES AIF WITH POA JOHN P. SEDOR AIF WITH POA CARMEN J. CAVALIERE AIF WITH POA RICHARD V. DOBBS AIF WITH POA LISA NOSAL AIF WITH POA 

INDEMNIFICATION AND INSURANCE SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

IRAN CERT SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

PREVAILING WAGE CERTIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

EXHIBIT B INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED 

AA201 REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED 

PW CONTRACTOR REG. 26473 EXPIRES 9.21.22 18315 EXPIRES 5.5.21 607465 EXPIRES 7.31.21 626111 EXPIRES 8.13.22 704080 EXPIRES 3.22.21 61752 EXPIRES 5.5.22 55250 EXPIRES 4.29.22 608194 EXPIRES 8.1.21 605531 EXPIRES 6.23.21 614017 EXPIRES 6.11.22 723226 EXPIRES 4.14.21 606273 EXPIRES 7.18.21

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK OK OK OK OK OK OK OK OK OK OK

NON-COLLUSION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

SAFETY CERT OK OK OK OK OK OK OK OK OK OK OK OK

EQUIPMENT CERT SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

 EXPERIENCE AND REFERENCES INCLUDED  ENGINEER/ TMA  TO REVIEW INCLUDED  ENGINEER/ TMA  TO REVIEW INCLUDED  ENGINEER/ TMA  TO REVIEW INCLUDED  ENGINEER/ TMA  TO REVIEW INCLUDED  ENGINEER/ TMA  TO REVIEW INCLUDED  ENGINEER/ TMA  TO REVIEW INCLUDED  ENGINEER/ TMA  TO REVIEW INCLUDED  ENGINEER/ TMA  TO REVIEW INCLUDED  ENGINEER/ TMA  TO REVIEW INCLUDED  ENGINEER/ TMA  TO REVIEW INCLUDED  ENGINEER/ TMA  TO REVIEW INCLUDED  ENGINEER/ TMA  TO REVIEW 

BASE BID COST 385,635.00$                                                         457,013.13$                                                         470,822.00$                                                           471,780.00$                                            474,382.00$                                                495,500.00$                                                     496,383.00$                                                            512,313.12$                                                            548,280.00$                                                               580,470.00$                                                           615,000.00$                                                                         624,498.00$                                                                   

EXCEPTIONS NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE

FATAL FLAW NO NO NO NO NO NO NO NO NO NO NO NO 

BID RESULTS

AB2020-36 WATER MAIN INSTALLATION PHASE TWO  AT NORTH QUADRANT FOR THE TRENTON MERCER AIRPORT 

BID OPENING DATE: SEPTEMBER 24,2020

mailto:AL@MSPCONSTRUCTION.CORP,COM
mailto:BCOOPER@EARLECO.COM
mailto:CHRIS@VOLLERS.CC
mailto:ESME@PMCONSTRUCTIONCO.COM
mailto:LSANTAITE@MONTANACONSTRUCTION.COM
mailto:MPILLARI@PILLARIBROS.COM
mailto:LHESSE@CJHESSE.COM
mailto:MMAZZARELLA@MOUNTCONSTRUCTION.COM
mailto:MACROSECC@AOL.COM
mailto:LPROP@COLONNELLI.COM


ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UN UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST 

1 MOBILIZATION / DEMOBILIZATION 1 LS 6,500.00$       6,500.00$         15,000.00$    15,000.00$         7,800.00$    7,800.00$          20,000.00$     20,000.00$     25,000.00$         25,000.00$     15,000.00$     15,000.00$     32,000.00$         32,000.00$     49,455.12$       49,455.12$       11,300.00$      11,300.00$     20,000.00$     20,000.00$      62,600.00$  62,600.00$     50,000.00$     50,000.00$     

2 CONCRETE CURB, 6-INCH (if and where directed) 40 LF 1.00$              40.00$              25.00$           1,000.00$           30.00$         1,200.00$          100.00$          4,000.00$       50.00$                2,000.00$       50.00$            2,000.00$       55.00$                2,200.00$       110.00$            4,400.00$         100.00$           4,000.00$       1.00$              40.00$             50.00$         2,000.00$       35.00$            1,400.00$       

3 FIRE HYDRANTS 6 EA 7,000.00$       42,000.00$       8,500.00$      51,000.00$         7,400.00$    44,400.00$        5,000.00$       30,000.00$     5,000.00$           30,000.00$     9,800.00$       58,800.00$     7,500.00$           45,000.00$     7,300.00$         43,800.00$       9,000.00$        54,000.00$     6,540.00$       39,240.00$      10,000.00$  60,000.00$     8,500.00$       51,000.00$     

4 6-INCH, DUCTILE IRON PIPE - CEMENT LINED, FITTINGS & APPURTENANCES 156 LF 100.00$          15,600.00$       40.00$           6,240.00$           95.00$         14,820.00$        110.00$          17,160.00$     85.00$                13,260.00$     50.00$            7,800.00$       75.00$                11,700.00$     135.00$            21,060.00$       100.00$           15,600.00$     150.00$          23,400.00$      150.00$       23,400.00$     120.00$          18,720.00$     

5 10-INCH, DUCTILE IRON PIPE - CEMENT LINED, FITTINGS & APPURTENANCES 2,574 LF 93.00$            239,382.00$     106.18$         273,307.32$       98.00$         252,252.00$      80.00$            205,920.00$   103.00$              265,122.00$   100.00$          257,400.00$   105.00$              270,270.00$   77.00$              198,198.00$     120.00$           308,880.00$   135.00$          347,490.00$    100.00$       257,400.00$   147.00$          378,378.00$   

6 10" ISOLATION VALVES 6 EA 3,000.00$       18,000.00$       3,500.00$      21,000.00$         2,500.00$    15,000.00$        4,000.00$       24,000.00$     2,500.00$           15,000.00$     2,900.00$       17,400.00$     2,600.00$           15,600.00$     2,400.00$         14,400.00$       3,500.00$        21,000.00$     3,000.00$       18,000.00$      3,000.00$    18,000.00$     4,000.00$       24,000.00$     

7 WET TAP 16 X 16 X 10 1 EA 8,000.00$       8,000.00$         8,700.00$      8,700.00$           13,250.00$  13,250.00$        16,000.00$     16,000.00$     10,000.00$         10,000.00$     20,000.00$     20,000.00$     9,800.00$           9,800.00$       9,500.00$         9,500.00$         5,000.00$        5,000.00$       6,500.00$       6,500.00$        25,000.00$  25,000.00$     24,000.00$     24,000.00$     

8 WET TAP 10 X 10 X 10 4 EA 7,500.00$       30,000.00$       8,450.00$      33,800.00$         8,500.00$    34,000.00$        8,000.00$       32,000.00$     6,000.00$           24,000.00$     15,000.00$     60,000.00$     8,600.00$           34,400.00$     9,000.00$         36,000.00$       4,000.00$        16,000.00$     6,500.00$       26,000.00$      13,000.00$  52,000.00$     11,500.00$     46,000.00$     

9 SOIL EROSION AND SEDIMENT CONTROL 1 LS 100.00$          100.00$            5,000.00$      5,000.00$           12,500.00$  12,500.00$        20,000.00$     20,000.00$     5,000.00$           5,000.00$       5,000.00$       5,000.00$       22,500.00$         22,500.00$     30,000.00$       30,000.00$       20,000.00$      20,000.00$     10,000.00$     10,000.00$      5,000.00$    5,000.00$       3,000.00$       3,000.00$       

10 DISINFECTION OF WATER MAIN & TESTING PROCEDURES 1 LS 1,000.00$       1,000.00$         10,000.00$    10,000.00$         2,500.00$    2,500.00$          20,000.00$     20,000.00$     5,000.00$           5,000.00$       17,000.00$     17,000.00$     6,000.00$           6,000.00$       5,000.00$         5,000.00$         20,000.00$      20,000.00$     5,000.00$       5,000.00$        5,000.00$    5,000.00$       1,000.00$       1,000.00$       

11 DISCONNECT & CAP EXISTING FIRE HYDRANTS 3 EA 500.00$          1,500.00$         500.00$         1,500.00$           1,800.00$    5,400.00$          2,500.00$       7,500.00$       1,000.00$           3,000.00$       600.00$          1,800.00$       1,000.00$           3,000.00$       1,800.00$         5,400.00$         1,500.00$        4,500.00$       2,500.00$       7,500.00$        1,200.00$    3,600.00$       500.00$          1,500.00$       

12 CLEANING AND RESTORATION 1 LS 10,000.00$     10,000.00$       12,015.81$    12,015.81$         9,000.00$    9,000.00$          10,000.00$     10,000.00$     7,000.00$           7,000.00$       12,000.00$     12,000.00$     35,000.00$         35,000.00$     30,000.00$       30,000.00$       20,000.00$      20,000.00$     15,000.00$     15,000.00$      15,000.00$  15,000.00$     1,000.00$       1,000.00$       

13 ROAD RECONSTRUCTION SCOTCH ROAD 2" Surface Course 40 SY 150.00$          6,000.00$         30.00$           1,200.00$           45.00$         1,800.00$          500.00$          20,000.00$     100.00$              4,000.00$       20.00$            800.00$          35.00$                1,400.00$       270.00$            10,800.00$       200.00$           8,000.00$       200.00$          8,000.00$        175.00$       7,000.00$       100.00$          4,000.00$       

14 ROAD RECONSTRUCTION OTHER ROADS 6" Base Course 1300 SY 0.01$              13.00$              7.50$             9,750.00$           38.00$         49,400.00$        29.00$            37,700.00$     45.00$                58,500.00$     10.00$            13,000.00$     0.01$                  13.00$            36.00$              46,800.00$       25.00$             32,500.00$     36.00$            46,800.00$      55.00$         71,500.00$     10.00$            13,000.00$     

15 TRAFFIC CONTROL ALLOWANCE 1 LS 7,500.00$       7,500.00$         7,500.00$      7,500.00$           7,500.00$    7,500.00$          7,500.00$       7,500.00$       7,500.00$           7,500.00$       7,500.00$       7,500.00$       7,500.00$           7,500.00$       7,500.00$         7,500.00$         7,500.00$        7,500.00$       7,500.00$       7,500.00$        7,500.00$    7,500.00$       7,500.00$       7,500.00$       

TOTAL:  $                             470,822.00 

MONTANA CONSTRUCTION 

495,500.00$                              

MAC-ROSE CONTRACTORS 

 $                                 474,382.00  $                                 496,383.00 

MOUNT CONSTUCTION CO., 

INC. 

 $                               548,280.00 

P.M. CONSTRUCTION CORP. 

471,780.00$                              512,313.12$                                   $                           615,000.00  $                             624,498.00 

AB2020-36 WATER MAIN INSTALLATION PHASE TWO AT NORTH QUADRANT

PROPOSAL 

PACT ONE LLC 

PILLARI BROS CONSTRUCTION 

CORP. LIMA CONSTRUCTION CO COLONNELLI BROTHERS INC. M.S.P CONSTRUCTION CORP. 

VOLLERS EXCAVATING & 

CONSTRUCTION INC C.J HESSE INC. 

 $                                385,635.00 

EARLE ASPHALT COMPANY 

 $                               580,470.00  $                                 457,013.13 



NO. OF BIDDERS: 10

NAME OF BIDDER CHARM-TEX INC. UNIFORMS MANUFACTURING OF ARIZONA LLC GOALTEX CORP BOB BARKER COMPANY INC. 

ADDRESS 1618 CONEY ISLAND AVENUE 2401 W. BEHREND DRIVE #L-69 146 SPLIT ROCK RD 7925 PURFOY RD

CITY, STATE, ZIP BROOKLYN, NY 11230 PHOENIX, ARIZONA 85027 SYOSSET,NY 11791 FUQUAY- VARINA, NC 27526

CONTACT STAN DANZGER DIANNA KANE ROBERT GRUBMAN K.NICOLE SAUNDERS 

TELEPHONE 718 252 8100 480 368 9316 516 682 5775 919 346 2154

FAX 718 258 8303 480 368 8556 516 682 5718 800 322 7537

E-MAIL STAN@CHARM-TEX.COM DIANNA@UMIDIRECT.COM ROBERT@GOALTEX.COM NICOLEMYATT@BOBBARKER.COM 

NJ SAVI DESIGNATION N/A N/A N/A N/A 

INDEMNIFICATION AND INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

IRAN CERTIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

EXHIBIT A INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED 

ADDENDUM NO. ONE SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK OK OK

EIC 6795 EXPIRES 2.15.2027 12455 EXIRES 10.15.2020 31643 EXPIRES 12.15.2022 6211 EXPIRES 12.15.21

DELIVERY CERTIFICATION YES NO YES YES 

HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS YES YES YES YES 

CONTINUITY OF SERVICE YES YES YES YES 

EXCEPTIONS YES,CORRECTION CENTER TO REVIEW NONE YES,CORRECTION CENTER TO REVIEW YES,CORRECTION CENTER TO REVIEW 

FATAL FLAW NO NO NO NO 

NAME OF BIDDER TABB TEXTILES CO. INC. OSAR, LLC ACME SUPPLY CO. LTD HOLMDEL FOOTWEAR

ADDRESS 511 PLEASANT DRIVE 4787 ARDMORE LANE 10 CEDAR SWAMP RD SUITE 7 4 TIMBER LANE, UNIT C2

CITY, STATE, ZIP OPELIKE , AL 36801 HOSCHTON, GA 30548 GLEN COVE, NY 11542 MARLBORO, NJ 07746

CONTACT ALAN FENSTER DAMON SUGGS ZAHEER SHELK WENDY ZAMKOFF

TELEPHONE 334 745 6762 732 979 8265 800 567 8025 877 901 3668

FAX 334 745 2377 866 818 2232 800 567 8026 732 810 0416

E-MAIL TABB@TEXTILEGROUP.NET DAMON.SUGG@OSARSOLUTIONS.COM BN@ACMESUPPLY.US HOLMDELFOOTWEAR@OPTIMUM.NET

NJ SAVI DESIGNATION N/A N/A MINORITY BUSINESS OWNED ENTERPRISE N/A 

INDEMNIFICATION AND INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

IRAN CERTIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

EXHIBIT A INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

ADDENDUM NO. ONE SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK OK OK 

EIC 6811 EXPIRES 12.15.22 62133 EXPIRES  12.15.26 12903 EXPIRES 11.15.20 46530 EXPIRES 4.15.25

DELIVERY CERTIFICATION YES YES YES YES 

HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS YES YES YES YES 

CONTINUITY OF SERVICE YES YES YES YES 

EXCEPTIONS NONE NONE NONE NONE

FATAL FLAW NO NO NO NO 

NAME OF BIDDER AMERCARE PRODUCTS, INC. VICTORY SUPPLY, LLC

ADDRESS 17661 128TH PL NE 7025 INDUSTRIAL PARK RD

CITY, STATE, ZIP WOODINVILLE, WA 98072 MOUNT PLEASANT, TN 38474

CONTACT WENDY HEMMING MARIAH MACHAM

TELEPHONE 800 556 6322 888 376 1205 EXT 716

FAX 800 525 4042 931 325 5521

E-MAIL SALES@AMERCAREPRODUCTS.NET MARIAH@VICTORYSUPPLYINC.COM

NJ SAVI DESIGNATION N/A N/A 

INDEMNIFICATION AND INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

IRAN CERTIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

EXHIBIT A INCLUDED INCLUDED 

ADDENDUM NO. ONE SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK 

EIC 23716 EXPIRES 8.15.26 59648 EXPIRES 8.15.25

DELIVERY CERTIFICATION YES YES 

HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS YES YES 

CONTINUITY OF SERVICE YES YES 

EXCEPTIONS NONE NONE

FATAL FLAW NO NO 

BID RESULTS

AB2020-08B  REBID OF INMATE SUPPLIES FOR THE MERCER COUNTY CORRECTION CENTER FOR A PERIOD OF TWO (2) YEARS 

BID OPENING DATE: SEPTEMBER 25, 2020
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ITEM 

NUMBE

R

DESCRIPTION SIZE COLOR

TOTAL 

QUANTITY 

REQUIRED

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

COST PER UNIT OF 

MEASURE
EXTENDED COST

MEETS COLOR 

AND FABRIC 

CONTENT YES OR 

NO

COST PER UNIT OF 

MEASURE
EXTENDED COST

MEETS COLOR 

AND FABRIC 

CONTENT YES OR 

NO

COST PER UNIT 

OF MEASURE
EXTENDED COST

MEETS COLOR 

AND FABRIC 

CONTENT YES OR 

NO

COST PER UNIT 

OF MEASURE
EXTENDED COST

MEETS COLOR 

AND FABRIC 

CONTENT YES OR 

NO

COST PER UNIT 

OF MEASURE
EXTENDED COST

MEETS COLOR 

AND FABRIC 

CONTENT YES OR 

NO

COST PER UNIT 

OF MEASURE
EXTENDED COST

MEETS COLOR 

AND FABRIC 

CONTENT YES OR 

NO

COST PER UNIT 

OF MEASURE
EXTENDED COST

MEETS COLOR 

AND FABRIC 

CONTENT YES OR 

NO

COST PER UNIT OF 

MEASURE
EXTENDED COST

MEETS COLOR AND 

FABRIC CONTENT YES 

OR NO

COST PER UNIT OF 

MEASURE
EXTENDED COST

MEETS COLOR AND 

FABRIC CONTENT YES 

OR NO

COST PER UNIT OF 

MEASURE
EXTENDED COST

MEETS COLOR AND 

FABRIC CONTENT YES 

OR NO

1 WORK BOOTS SIZE: 6-16 BLACK 1,100 PAIR NO BID NO BID 

NO BID NO BID

$17.49 $19,239.00 YES $18.41 $20,251.00 YES $18.24 $20,064.00

YES

NO BID NO BID $20.90 $22,990.00 $23.13 $25,443.00 $19.25 $21,175.00 YES $24.00 $26,400.00 YES

2 WHITE TUBE SOCKS ONE SIZE WHITE 2,500 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.05 $10,125.00 YES $4.47 $11,175.00 YES $4.39 $10,975.00 YES $4.78 $11,950.00 YES $4.26 $10,650.00 $4.85 $12,125.00 $4.56 $11,400.00 NO $3.75 $9,375.00 YES

3 MEN'S CANVAS STEP-IN SIZE: 7-17 ORANGE 5,000 PAIR NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.75 $13,750.00 YES $2.61 $13,050.00 YES $2.69 $13,450.00 YES NO BID NO BID $3.54 $17,700.00 $6.62 $33,100.00 $3.44 $17,200.00 YES $3.45 $17,250.00 YES

4 MEN'S LOW TOP VELCRO CANVAS SNEAKER SIZE: 7-17 ORANGE 5,000 PAIR NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.93 $19,650.00 YES $4.29 $21,450.00 YES NO BID NO BID $5.36 $26,800.00 $6.95 $34,750.00 $6.30 $31,500.00 YES $4.25 $21,250.00 YES

5 WOMEN'S CANVAS STEP-IN SIZE:  6-10 ORANGE 75 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $33.00 $2,475.00 YES $2.61 $195.75 YES $32.28 $2,421.00 YES NO BID NO BID $3.54 $265.50 $6.62 $496.50 $41.28 $3,096.00 YES $41.40 $3,105.00 YES

6 WOMEN'S LOW TOP VELCRO CANVAS SNEAKER SIZE:  6-10 ORANGE 75 DOZEN NO BID NO BID 
NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID $32.28 $2,421.00
YES

$51.48 $3,861.00
YES

NO BID NO BID $5.36 $402.00 $6.95 $521.25 $75.60 $5,670.00
YES

$51.00 $3,825.00 YES

7 X-STRAP SHOWER SANDALS SIZE: S,M,L,XL BLACK & WHITE 6,000 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.36 $38,160.00 YES $11.52 $69,120.00 YES $6.39 $38,340.00 YES NO BID NO BID $7.18 $43,080.00 $13.37 $80,220.00 $7.32 $43,920.00 YES $18.00 $108,000.00 YES

8 MESH LAUNDRY BAG 30" X 40" 30" X 40" WHITE 1,000 EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.52 $2,520.00 YES NO BID NO BID $4.18 $4,180.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $3.26 $3,260.00 YES $5.00 $5,000.00 YES

9 MATRESSES W/BUILT IN PILLOW 25"X75"X4.5 25"X75"X4.5 2,000 EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $41.72 $83,440.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $58.22 $116,440.00 NO $57.95 $115,900.00 YES

10 SHEETS 54"X90" 54" X 90" WHITE 1,050 DOZEN NO BID NO BID $19.20 $20,160.00 YES NO BID NO BID $20.77 $21,808.50 NO $21.44 $22,512.00 55/45 PER EMAIL NO BID NO BID $24.54 $25,767.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $25.80 $27,090.00 NO $19.24 $20,202.00 YES

11 BLANKET 60"X80" 60" X 80" GREY 150 DOZEN NO BID NO BID $47.40 $7,110.00 YES NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $59.90 $8,985.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $74.64 $11,196.00 YES $64.00 $9,600.00 YES

12  THERMAL BLANKET 66" X 90" WHITE 70 DOZEN NO BID NO BID $53.76 $3,763.20 YES NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $65.90 $4,613.00 $64.79 $4,535.30 $58.56 $4,099.20 YES $52.20 $3,654.00 YES

13 BATH TOWEL 20"X40" 20" X 40" WHITE 1,000 DOZEN NO BID NO BID $7.10 $7,100.00 YES NO BID NO BID $13.85 $13,850.00 YES $8.66 $8,660.00 YES NO BID NO BID $9.99 $9,990.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $27.60 $27,600.00 NO $7.10 $7,100.00 YES

14 WASH CLOTHES 12"X12" 12" X 12" WHITE 1,900 DOZEN NO BID NO BID $1.50 $2,850.00 YES NO BID NO BID $1.89 $3,591.00 YES $1.79 $3,401.00 YES NO BID NO BID $1.64 $3,116.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $2.62 $4,978.00 NO $1.35 $2,565.00 YES

15 WHITE WOMEN'S BRA SIZE: 30-48 WHITE 4,400 EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.18 $9,592.00 YES $1.28 $5,632.00 YES NO BID NO BID $1.59 $6,996.00 $1.63 $7,172.00 $1.45 $6,380.00 NO $1.80 $7,920.00 YES

16 WHITE WOMEN'S BRIEF SIZE:  5-9 WHITE 200 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.24 $1,248.00 YES $11.75 $2,350.00 YES $6.90 $1,380.00 $7.86 $1,572.00 $7.68 $1,536.00 NO $6.25 $1,250.00 YES

17 WHITE WOMEN'S BRIEF SIZE:  10-16 WHITE 200 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.92 $1,384.00 YES $11.75 $2,350.00 YES $7.90 $1,580.00 $9.57 $1,914.00 $8.76 $1,752.00 NO $6.25 $1,250.00 YES

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2,632.00 $4,700.00 $2,960.00 $3,486.00 $3,288.00 $2,500.00 YES

18 MEN'S ORANGE BOXER SHORTS LARGE-XL ORANGE 1,500 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $13.00 $19,500.00 YES $14.71 $22,065.00 YES $12.78 $19,170.00 YES $24.00 $36,000.00 YES $13.90 $20,850.00 $15.40 $23,100.00 $14.76 $22,140.00 NO $12.75 $19,125.00 YES

19 MEN'S ORANGE BOXER SHORTS 2XLARGE-4XL ORANGE 1,570 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $13.25 $20,802.50 YES $14.71 $23,094.70 YES $13.11 $20,582.70 YES $24.00 $37,680.00 YES $14.54 $22,827.80 $19.33 $30,348.10 $15.96 $25,057.20 NO $12.75 $20,017.50 YES

20 MEN'S ORANGE BOXER SHORTS 5XLARGE-7XL ORANGE 90 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $13.25 $1,192.50 YES $14.71 $1,323.90 YES $13.69 $1,232.10 YES $24.00 $2,160.00 YES $15.90 $1,431.00 $23.26 $2,093.40 $15.96 $1,436.40 NO $12.75 $1,147.50 YES

$0.00 $0.00 $41,495.00 $46,483.60 $40,984.80 $75,840.00 $45,108.80 $55,541.50 $48,633.60 $40,290.00 YES

21 ORANGE T-SHIRTS LARGE-XL ORANGE 1,000 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $25.00 $25,000.00 YES $28.99 $28,990.00 YES $23.96 $23,960.00 YES $60.00 $60,000.00 YES $0.00 $0.00 $23.58 $23,580.00 $30.96 $30,960.00 NO $27.75 $27,750.00 YES

22 ORANGE T-SHIRTS 2XLARGE-3XL ORANGE 1,300 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $28.00 $36,400.00 YES $36.99 $48,087.00 YES $28.34 $36,842.00 YES $60.00 $78,000.00 YES $0.00 $0.00 $30.13 $39,169.00 $36.00 $46,800.00 NO $27.75 $36,075.00 YES

23 ORANGE T-SHIRTS 4XLARGE ORANGE 300 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $29.00 $8,700.00 YES $38.99 $11,697.00 YES $28.34 $8,502.00 YES $60.00 $18,000.00 YES $0.00 $0.00 $32.75 $9,825.00 $40.80 $12,240.00 NO $27.75 $8,325.00 YES

24 ORANGE T-SHIRTS 5XLARGE ORANGE 50 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $30.00 $1,500.00 YES $41.99 $2,099.50 YES $30.34 $1,517.00 YES $60.00 $3,000.00 YES $0.00 $0.00 $34.06 $1,703.00 NO BID NO BID $27.75 $1,387.50 YES

25 ORANGE T-SHIRTS 6XLARGE ORANGE 50 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $30.00 $1,500.00 YES $43.99 $2,199.50 YES $32.99 $1,649.50 YES $60.00 $3,000.00 YES $0.00 $0.00 $39.30 $1,965.00 $40.80 $2,040.00 NO $27.75 $1,387.50 YES

26 ORANGE T-SHIRTS 7XLARGE ORANGE 25 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $30.00 $750.00 YES NO BID NO BID $69.00 $1,725.00 YES $60.00 $1,500.00 YES $0.00 $0.00 $43.23 $1,080.75 NO BID NO BID $27.75 $693.75 YES

27 ORANGE T-SHIRTS 8XLARGE ORANGE 15 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $30.00 $450.00 YES NO BID NO BID $80.00 $1,200.00 YES $60.00 $900.00 YES $0.00 $0.00 $55.68 $835.20 NO BID NO BID $27.75 $416.25 YES

28 ORANGE T-SHIRTS 9XLARGE ORANGE 15 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $30.00 $450.00 YES NO BID NO BID $90.00 $1,350.00 YES $60.00 $900.00 YES $0.00 $0.00 $56.99 $854.85 NO BID NO BID $27.75 $416.25 YES

29 ORANGE T-SHIRTS 10XLARGE ORANGE 15 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $30.00 $450.00 YES NO BID NO BID $100.00 $1,500.00 YES $60.00 $900.00 YES $0.00 $0.00 $59.61 $894.15 NO BID NO BID $27.75 $416.25 YES

$0.00 $0.00 $75,200.00 $93,073.00 $78,245.50 $166,200.00 $0.00 $79,906.95 $92,040.00 $76,867.50 YES

30 ORANGE COVERALLS LARGE ORANGE 70 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $125.00 $8,750.00 YES $162.90 $11,403.00 $179.40 $12,558.00 $154.20 $10,794.00 YES $143.40 $10,038.00 YES

31 ORANGE COVERALLS XLARGE-3XL ORANGE 1,020 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $125.00 $127,500.00 YES $162.90 $166,158.00 $196.68 $200,613.60 $154.20 $157,284.00 YES $143.40 $146,268.00 YES

32 ORANGE COVERALLS 4XLARGE ORANGE 300 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $125.00 $37,500.00 YES $162.90 $50,970.00 $196.68 $59,004.00 $154.20 $46,260.00 YES $143.40 $43,020.00 YES

33 ORANGE COVERALLS 5XLARGE-7XL ORANGE 450 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $125.00 $56,250.00 YES $162.90 $80,955.00 $215.76 $97,092.00 $177.60 $79,920.00 YES $143.40 $64,530.00 YES

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $230,000.00 $309,486.00 $369,267.60 $294,258.00 $263,856.00 YES

34 YELLOW COVERALLS LARGE YELLOW 20 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $125.00 $2,500.00 YES $0.00 $0.00 $179.40 $3,588.00 NO BID NO BID $240.00 $4,800.00 YES

35 YELLOW COVERALLS XLARGE-3XL YELLOW 40 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $125.00 $5,000.00 YES $0.00 $0.00 $196.68 $7,867.20 NO BID NO BID $240.00 $9,600.00 YES

36 YELLOW COVERALLS 4XLARGE YELLOW 40 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $125.00 $5,000.00 YES $0.00 $0.00 $196.68 $7,867.20 NO BID NO BID $240.00 $9,600.00 YES

37 YELLOW COVERALLS 5XLARGE-8XL YELLOW 40 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $125.00 $5,000.00 YES $0.00 $0.00 $215.76 $8,630.40 NO BID NO BID $240.00 $9,600.00 YES

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $17,500.00 $0.00 $27,952.80 $0.00 $33,600.00 YES

38 LONG SLEEVE THERMAL TOPS LARGE-3XL OFF-WHITE 150 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $27.00 $4,050.00 YES NO BID NO BID $27.05 $4,057.50 NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $28.68 $4,302.00 $29.30 $4,395.00 YES $26.00 $3,900.00 YES

39 THERMAL UNDERWEAR BOTTOMS LARGE-2XL OFF-WHITE 150 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $27.00 $4,050.00 YES NO BID NO BID $26.17 $3,925.50 NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $26.55 $3,982.50 $26.40 $3,960.00 YES $26.00 $3,900.00 YES

40 THERMAL UNDERWEAR BOTTOMS 3XLARGE OFF-WHITE 150 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $27.00 $4,050.00 YES NO BID NO BID $26.17 $3,925.50 NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $26.55 $3,982.50 $26.40 $3,960.00 YES $26.00 $3,900.00 YES

$0.00 $0.00 $8,100.00 $0.00 $7,851.00 $0.00 $0.00 $7,965.00 $7,920.00 $7,800.00 YES

41 ORANGE KNITTED WATCH/SKULL CAPS ONE SIZE ORANGE 100 DOZEN $23.40 $2,340.00 NO BID NO BID $720.00 $72,000.00 YES NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $11.90 $1,190.00 $13.10 $1,310.00 $13.20 $1,320.00 YES $0.00 $0.00

42 MEN & WOMEN KHAKI WINTER COATS LARGE-3XL KHAKI 100 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $210.00 $21,000.00 NO BID NO BID $537.00 $53,700.00 YES

43 THRUMPRINT SECURITY TOOTHBRUSHES 100 CASES $43.20 $4,320.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $77.04 $7,704.00 NO BID NO BID $9.90 $990.00 $0.00 $0.00 $3.60 $360.00 YES $0.00 $0.00

44 CLEAR ROLL ON DEODORANT, 1.5 OZ CLEAR 200 CASES $36.10 $7,220.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $31.44 $6,288.00 NO BID NO BID $31.90 $6,380.00 $0.00 $0.00 $32.64 $6,528.00 YES $0.00 $0.00

45 TOOTHPASTE, CLEAR GEL, 6 OZ CLEAR 200 CASES $73.90 $14,780.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $99.36 $19,872.00 NO BID NO BID $15.90 $3,180.00 $0.00 $0.00 $23.86 $4,772.00 YES $0.00 $0.00

46 HIGH SECURITY THRUMPRINT, ORANGE RAZORS ORANGE 200 CASES $39.70 $7,940.00
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $79.90 $15,980.00 $0.00 $0.00 $60.00 $12,000.00

YES $0.00 $0.00

36,600.00$       40,983.20$        284,594.00$       302,189.85$    320,920.80$    506,190.00$    600,517.30$    733,823.65$        749,688.80$              818,584.50$      

BOB BARKER COMPANY INC. ACME SUPPLY CO. LTD PROPOSAL FORM 

GRAND TOTAL

CHARM-TEX INC.

TOTAL FOR ALL YELLOW COVERALLS*

TOTAL FOR ALL THERMAL UNDERWEAR

AB2020-08B REBID OF  INMATE SUPPLIES FOR THE MERCER COUNTY CORRECTION CENTER FOR A PERIOD OF TWO (2) YEARS:                                                                                                                                     

TOTAL FOR ALL WOMEN'S BRIEFS*

TOTAL FOR ALL MEN'S BOXER SHORTS*

TOTAL FOR ALL ORANGE T-SHIRTS*

TOTAL FOR ALL ORANGE COVERALLS*

UNIFORMS MANUFACTURING OF ARIZONA, LLCVICTORY SUPPLY, LLCHOLMDEL FOOTWEAR GOALTEX CORP AMERCARE PRODUCTS, INC. TABB TEXTILES CO. INC. OSAR, LLC


