
NO. OF BIDDERS: 9

NAME OF BIDDER CAPELA CONSTRUCTION INC. COMPASS CONSTRUCTION, INC T.R. WENIGER, INC. BRAYCO INC. KALOGRIDIS CONTRACTING, LLC EARTHWORKS INC. C.J. HESSE INC. OCEAN CONSTRUCTION, LLC EARLE ASPHALT COMPANY 

ADDRESS 20 TRANSQUILTIY CT. PO BOX 191 1900 NEW BRUNSWICK AVE 951 RT. 537 22 MARE HAVEN CT. 13 MORELLO CT. 25 FIRST AVENUE 822 GLASSBORO RD P.O BOX 556

CITY, STATE, ZIP SOUTHHAMPTON, NJ 08088 NEW EGYPT, NJ 08533 PISCATAWAY, NJ 08854 CREAM RIDGE, NJ 08514 NORTH BRUNSWICK, NJ 08902 FARMINGDALE, NJ 07727 ATLANTIC HIGHLANDS, NJ 07716 WILLIAMTOWN, NJ 08094 FARMINGDALE ,NJ 07727

CONTACT JACLYN MUNOZ GLENN GOEBEL TIMOTHY R. WENIGER, JR. DAN HEIMALL JOHN KALOGRIDIS JEFF CIARCIA LAWRENCE C. HESSE JOSEPH RODRIGUEZ BRIAN M. COOPER 

TELEPHONE 609-535-5367 609-286-2235 732-968-3450 609-758-5235 732-297-1491 732-236-1332 732-291-8100 609-653-0133 732-308-1113

FAX 609-801-2533 609-286-2255 732-968-4741 609-758-8180 732-297-1492 732-358-0325 732-495-6225 609-840-6071 732-308-1034

E-MAIL
CAPELACONSTRUTCTIONINC@GM

AIL.COM 

COMPASSCONSTRUCTION@COMC

AST.NET 
INFOR@TRWENIGER.COM SALES@BRAYCOINC.COM JOHN@KALOGRIDISLLC.COM EARTHWORKSNJ@GMAIL.COM LHESSE@CJHESSE.COM JOER@OCEANCONST.COM BCOOPER@EARLECO.COM

NJ SAVI DESIGNATION N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE 
SMALL AND MINORITY OWNED 

BUSINESS ENTERPRISE 
N/A 

ADDENDUM NO.ONE INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED 

ADDENDUM NO.TWO INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED 

ADDENDUM NO.THREE INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED 

INSURANCE AND INDEMNIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

FEDERAL NON-DEBARMENT FORM SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

BID GUARANTEE
ENDURANCE ASSURANCE CORP. 

10% NTE TOTAL BID 

SELECTIVE INSURANCE CO. OF 

AMERICA 10% NTE 20K
UNITED STATE SURETY CO. 10% NTE 20K INTACT INSURANCE SURETY 10% NTE 20K NGM INSURANCE CO. 10% NTE 20K NGM INSURANCE CO. 10% NTE 20K 

WESTPORT INSURANCE CORP. 10% 

NE 20K

PHILADELPHIA INSURANCE CO. 

10% NTE 20K 
FEDERAL INSURANCE CO. 10% NTE 20K 

CONSENT OF SURETY DAMN M. JONES AIF WITH POA DAMN M. JONES AIF WITH POA BRUCE M. ALLEN AIF WITH POA MARIAN MURPHY WEINER AIF WITH POA LISA NOSAL AIF WITH POA DAWN M. JONES AIF WITH POA DAWN M. JONES AIF WITH POA 
GINA M. SEMONELLE AIF WITH 

POA 
DONNA M. PLANETA 

REFERENCES AND EXPERIENCE
INCLUDED ENGINEER FIRM/PC TO 

REVIEW 

INCLUDED ENGINEER FIRM/PC TO 

REVIEW 

INCLUDED ENGINEER FIRM/PC TO 

REVIEW 

INCLUDED ENGINEER FIRM/PC TO 

REVIEW 

INCLUDED ENGINEER FIRM/PC TO 

REVIEW 

INCLUDED ENGINEER FIRM/PC TO 

REVIEW 

INCLUDED ENGINEER FIRM/PC TO 

REVIEW 

INCLUDED ENGINEER FIRM/PC TO 

REVIEW 

INCLUDED ENGINEER FIRM/PC TO 

REVIEW 

IRAN CERTIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

PW CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION 724819 EXPIRES 6.29.21 636492 EXPIRES 3.24.22 667925 EXPIRES 12.17.21 604075 EXPIRES 4.3.22 640808 EXPIRES 10.28.22 691145 EXPIRES 8.30.22 608194 EXPIRES 8.1.21 678723 EXPIRES 9.21.21 18315 EXPIRES 5.5.23

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK OK OK OK OK OK OK OK

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

PREVAILING WAGE CERTIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

EQUIPMENT CERT INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED 

EXHIBIT B REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED 

AA201 REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED 

SAFETY CERT SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

BID TOTAL  $                                     264,055.00  $                                        283,630.00  $                                            358,875.00  $                                              375,222.00  $                                              407,120.00  $                                              412,315.00  $                                    438,438.00  $                                    442,757.00  $                                              460,113.13 

HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES 

EXCEPTIONS NONE 
NONE, MATH ERROR ON GRAND 

TOTAL 
NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE 

FATAL FLAW NO NO NO NO NO NO NO NO 

BID RESULTS

AB2021-07 HOPEWELL VALLEY GOLF COURSE IMPROVEMENTS FOR THE MERCER COUNTY PARK COMMISSION 

BID OPENING DATE: MARCH 23,2021
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ITEM DESCRIPTION 

ESTIMATE

D QTY UN UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

1

FURNISH,INSTALL, MAINTAIN, AND REMOVE CONSTRUCTION STAGING 

AREA AND FENCING 1 LS 25,000.00$          25,000.00$            12,800.00$            12,800.00$         8,000.00$             8,000.00$             7,223.00$         7,223.00$      15,000.00$       15,000.00$          5,000.00$         5,000.00$      10,053.00$    10,053.00$      6,817.08$       6,817.08$        15,000.00$     15,000.00$    

2

FURNISH,INSTALL, MAINTAIN, AND REMOVE STABILIZIED CONSTRUCTION 

ENTRANCE 50 SY 100.00$              5,000.00$              65.00$                   3,250.00$           50.00$                 2,500.00$             66.00$              3,300.00$      1.00$               50.00$                40.00$              2,000.00$      35.00$          1,750.00$        52.69$            2,634.50$        42.00$           2,100.00$      

3 FURNISH,INSTALL, MAINTAIN, AND REMOVE SILT FENCING 400 LF 5.00$                  2,000.00$              3.00$                     1,200.00$           5.00$                   2,000.00$             7.00$               2,800.00$      3.00$               1,200.00$            2.00$               800.00$         7.00$            2,800.00$        5.60$              2,240.00$        6.00$             2,400.00$      

4 FURNISH, INSTALL, MAINTAIN AND REMOVE STOCK PILING 100 CY 50.00$                5,000.00$              6.00$                     600.00$              40.00$                 4,000.00$             36.00$              3,600.00$      20.00$              2,000.00$            30.00$             3,000.00$      28.00$          2,800.00$        85.04$            8,504.00$        0.01$             1.00$            

5 FURNISH, INSTALL, MAINTAIN AND REMOVE TREE PROTECTION FENCING 40 LF 10.00$                400.00$                 20.00$                   800.00$              10.00$                 400.00$                14.00$              560.00$         5.00$               200.00$              20.00$              800.00$         15.00$          600.00$          9.03$              361.20$           5.00$             200.00$         

6 GRADING 1505 SY 2.00$                  3,010.00$              4.00$                     6,020.00$           5.00$                   7,525.00$             6.00$               9,030.00$      9.00$               13,545.00$          6.00$               9,030.00$      2.00$            3,010.00$        48.04$            72,300.20$      3.00$             4,515.00$      

7 EXCAVATION 200 CY 1.00$                  200.00$                 21.00$                   4,200.00$           40.00$                 8,000.00$             27.00$              5,400.00$      35.00$              7,000.00$            20.00$              4,000.00$      30.00$          6,000.00$        48.37$            9,674.00$        20.00$           4,000.00$      

8 ASPHALT PAVEMENT REMOVAL, COMPLETE 325 SY 10.00$                3,250.00$              5.00$                     1,625.00$           20.00$                 6,500.00$             24.00$              7,800.00$      12.00$              3,900.00$            20.00$              6,500.00$      20.00$          6,500.00$        26.40$            8,580.00$        10.00$           3,250.00$      

9 EXISTING BRIDGE STRUCTURE REMOVAL, COMPLETE 1 LS 20,000.00$          20,000.00$            19,000.00$            19,000.00$         20,000.00$           20,000.00$            6,137.00$         6,137.00$      80,000.00$       80,000.00$          10,000.00$       10,000.00$    5,000.00$      5,000.00$        8,112.95$       8,112.95$        20,000.00$     20,000.00$    

10 TREE REMOVAL, COMPLETE 1 EA 1,000.00$           1,000.00$              500.00$                 500.00$              1,000.00$             1,000.00$             911.00$            911.00$         2,300.00$         2,300.00$            1,000.00$         1,000.00$      7,800.00$      7,800.00$        6,448.61$       6,448.61$        6,125.00$       6,125.00$      

11 FURNISH AND INSTALL PEDESTRIAN BRIDGE,COMPLETE W/ALL INCLUSIONS 1 LS 184,500.00$        184,500.00$          212,000.00$          212,000.00$       260,000.00$         260,000.00$          280,889.00$     280,889.00$  250,000.00$     250,000.00$        350,000.00$     350,000.00$  325,000.00$  325,000.00$    263,045.56$   263,045.56$    365,637.13$   365,637.13$  

12 TOPSOIL AND SEEDING, COMPLETE 1195 SY 1.00$                  1,195.00$              3.00$                     3,585.00$           10.00$                 11,950.00$            20.00$              23,900.00$    15.00$              17,925.00$          3.00$               3,585.00$      15.00$          17,925.00$      23.45$            28,022.75$      13.00$           15,535.00$    

13 INSTALL RIP RAP AND FILTER LAYER ,COMPLETE 130 CY 50.00$                6,500.00$              135.00$                 17,550.00$         200.00$                26,000.00$            140.00$            18,200.00$    100.00$            13,000.00$          120.00$            15,600.00$    340.00$         44,200.00$      146.30$          19,019.00$      145.00$         18,850.00$    

14

FURNISH, INSTALL AND MAINTAIN AND REMOVE FLOATING TURBIDITY 

BARRIER COMPLETE 1 LS 7,000.00$           7,000.00$              500.00$                 500.00$              1,000.00$             1,000.00$             5,472.00$         5,472.00$      1,000.00$         1,000.00$            1,000.00$         1,000.00$      5,000.00$      5,000.00$        6,997.15$       6,997.15$        2,500.00$       2,500.00$      

 $                                       283,630.00 BID TOTAL  $                                       264,055.00 358,875.00$                                        375,222.00$                             $                                  407,120.00  $                            412,315.00  $                           438,438.00  $                          460,113.13  $                             442,757.00 

AB2021-07 HOPEWELL VALLEY GOLF COURSE IMPROVEMENTS FOR THE MERCER COUNTY PARK COMMISSION 

PROPOSAL 

BRAYCO INC. EARTHWORKS ,INC 

COMPASS CONSTRUCTION, 

INC C.J. HESSE INC. KALOGRIDIS CONTRACTING, LLC EARLE ASPHALT LLC T.R. WENIGER, INC. CAPELA CONSTRUCTION INC OCEAN CONSTRUCTION, LLC 



NO. OF BIDDERS: 3

BID ONLY ON TASK ONE PORTION OF BID 
BID ON TASK ONE AND TWO PORTIONS OF 

BID 
BID ON TASK ONE AND TWO PORTIONS OF BID 

NAME OF BIDDER ENVIROSCAPES INC APPLIED ECOLOGICAL SERVICES WEEDS INC. 

ADDRESS 4271 ROUTE 27 17921 SMITH ROAD 250 BODLEY ROAD 

CITY, STATE, ZIP PRINCETON, NJ 08540 BRODHEAD, WI 53520 ASTON, PA 19014

CONTACT EDWARD W. BLANAR BEN ZIMMERMAN DREW O' NEIL 

TELEPHONE 732-422-4449 607-731-3484 610-358-9430

FAX 732-422-4450 N/A 610-358-9438

E-MAIL CBLANCA@ENVIROSCAPESINC.COM BEN.ZIMMERMAN@APPLIEDECO,COM WEEDS@WEEDSINC.COM

NJ SAVI DESIGNATION
SMALL BUSINESS OWNED 

ENTERPRISE 
N/A N/A 

ADDENDUM NO.ONE INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED 

ADDENDUM NO.TWO INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED 

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

INSURANCE AND INDEMNIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

DEP PESTICIDE 

COMMERCIAL/APPICATOR LICENSES 
INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED 

IRAN CERTIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK REQUIRED IF AWARDED OK

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

EXHIBIT A REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED 

EIC REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED 25802 EXPIRES 3.15.24

HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS YES YES YES 

EXCEPTIONS YES, PC TO REVIEW NONE NONE 

FATAL FLAW NO NO NO

BID RESULTS

AB2021-09 NATIVE MEADOW ESTABLISHMENT AND RESTORATION IN COUNTY PARKLAND AND OPEN SPACE PROPERTIES FOR THE MERCER COUNTY PARK 

COMMISSION 

BID OPENING DATE: MARCH 24,2021
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Price 

Unit

Year 1 Year 2 P

r

Year 1 Year 2 P

r

Year 1 Year 2

Equipment Mobilization per site
 $         1,400.00  $                1,540.00 

Equipment Mobilization per site
 $                 306.00  $             316.00 

Equipment Mobilization per site
 $              1,350.00  $                  1,350.00 

Herbicide Application (herbaceous 

only)

per acre
 $         2,863.00  $                3,149.30 

Herbicide Application 

(herbaceous only)

per acre
 $                 444.00  $             457.00 

Herbicide Application 

(herbaceous only)

per acre
 $                 250.00  $                     275.00 

Herbicide Application (herbaceous 

&

woody)

per acre

 $         2,973.00  $                3,270.30 

Herbicide Application 

(herbaceous &

woody)

per acre

 $                 711.00  $             733.00 

Herbicide Application 

(herbaceous &

woody)

per acre

 $                 300.00  $                     325.00 

Field mowing per acre  $            839.00  $                   922.90 Field mowing per acre  $                 287.00  $             296.00 Field mowing per acre  $                 250.00  $                     250.00 

Flail mowing per acre  $            839.00  $                   922.90 Flail mowing per acre  $                 458.00  $             466.00 Flail mowing per acre  $                 250.00  $                     250.00 

Brush hogging per acre  $            892.00  $                   981.20 Brush hogging per acre  $                 458.00  $             466.00 Brush hogging per acre  $                 500.00  $                     500.00 

Forestry mowing per acre  $         9,054.00  $                9,959.40 Forestry mowing per acre  $              1,121.00  $          1,139.00 Forestry mowing per acre  $                 500.00  $                     500.00 

disking per acre  $            767.00  $                   843.70 disking per acre  $                 287.00  $             296.00 disking per acre  $                 500.00  $                     500.00 

seeding (no till native seed drill) per acre
 $            798.00  $                   877.80 

seeding (no till native seed 

drill)

per acre
 $                 287.00  $             296.00 

seeding (no till native seed 

drill)

per acre
 $                 350.00  $                     375.00 

Hand seeding per acre
 $            777.00  $                   854.70 

Hand seeding per acre
 $                 514.00  $             532.00 

Hand seeding per acre
 $                 750.00  $                     775.00 

Year 1 Year 2 Year 1 Yea

r 2

Year 1 Year 2

Scientific Name Common Name Scientific Name Common Name Scientific Name Common Name

Achillea millefolium Common Yarrow
NO BID NO BID 

Achillea millefolium Common Yarrow
 $                  50.69  $               52.22 

Achillea millefolium Common Yarrow
 $                   50.00  $                       53.00 

Agastache foeniculum Anise Hyssop NO BID NO BID Agastache foeniculum Anise Hyssop  $                 272.45  $             280.63 Agastache foeniculum Anise Hyssop  $                 265.00  $                     278.25 

Agrostis perennans Autumn Bentgrass
NO BID NO BID 

Agrostis perennans Autumn 

Bentgrass  $                  22.18  $               22.85 

Agrostis perennans Autumn Bentgrass
 $                   22.00  $                       23.10 

Andropogon gerardii Big Bluestem NO BID NO BID Andropogon gerardii Big Bluestem  $                  19.01  $               19.59 Andropogon gerardii Big Bluestem  $                   18.50  $                       19.50 

Aquilegia canadensis Eastern Columbine
NO BID NO BID 

Aquilegia canadensis Eastern 

Columbine  $                 570.24  $             587.35 

Aquilegia canadensis Eastern Columbine
 $                 554.40  $                     583.00 

Asclepias incarnata Swamp Milkweed
NO BID NO BID 

Asclepias incarnata Swamp Milkweed
 $                 253.44  $             261.05 

Asclepias incarnata Swamp Milkweed
 $                 246.00  $                     258.30 

Asclepias syriaca Common Milkweed
NO BID NO BID 

Asclepias syriaca Common 

Milkweed  $                 215.43  $             221.90 

Asclepias syriaca Common Milkweed
 $                 210.00  $                     220.50 

Asclepias tuberosaa Butterfly Milkweed
NO BID NO BID 

Asclepias tuberosaa Butterfly 

Milkweed  $                 570.24  $             587.35 

Asclepias tuberosaa Butterfly Milkweed
 $                 554.00  $                     583.00 

Bouteloua curtipendula Sideoats Grama NO BID NO BID Bouteloua curtipendula Sideoats Grama  $                  22.18  $               22.85 Bouteloua curtipendula Sideoats Grama  $                   22.00  $                       23.10 

Chamaecrista fasciculata Partridge Pea NO BID NO BID Chamaecrista fasciculata Partridge Pea  $                    9.51  $                 9.80 Chamaecrista fasciculata Partridge Pea  $                     9.25  $                         9.75 

Coreopsis lanceolata Lance Leaved Coreopsis
NO BID NO BID 

Coreopsis lanceolata Lance Leaved 

Coreopsis  $                  38.02  $               39.17 

Coreopsis lanceolata Lance Leaved 

Coreopsis  $                   37.00  $                       39.00 

Coreopsis tinctoria Plains Coreopsis
NO BID NO BID 

Coreopsis tinctoria Plains Coreopsis
 $                  25.35  $               26.12 

Coreopsis tinctoria Plains Coreopsis
 $                   25.00  $                       26.50 

Echinacea purpurea Purple Coneflower
NO BID NO BID 

Echinacea purpurea Purple 

Coneflower  $                  57.03  $               58.75 

Echinacea purpurea Purple Coneflower
 $                   55.50  $                       58.25 

Elymus canadensis Canada Wildrye NO BID NO BID Elymus canadensis Canada Wildrye  $                    9.51  $                 9.80 Elymus canadensis Canada Wildrye  $                     9.25  $                         9.75 

Eryngium yuccifolium Rattlesnake Master
NO BID NO BID 

Eryngium yuccifolium Rattlesnake 

Master  $                 392.84  $             404.63 

Eryngium yuccifolium Rattlesnake Master
 $                 382.00  $                     401.10 

Eupatorium rugosum White Snakeroot
NO BID NO BID 

Eupatorium rugosum White Snakeroot
 $                 380.16  $             391.57 

Eupatorium rugosum White Snakeroot
 $                 370.00  $                     388.50 

Eurybia macrophylla Bigleaf Aster NO BID NO BID Eurybia macrophylla Bigleaf Aster  $                 570.24  $             587.35 Eurybia macrophylla Bigleaf Aster  $                 115.00  $                     120.75 

Euthamia graminifolia Grassleaf Goldenrod
NO BID NO BID 

Euthamia graminifolia Grassleaf 

Goldenrod  $                 665.28  $             685.24 

Euthamia graminifolia Grassleaf Goldenrod
 $                 646.80  $                     679.25 

Festuca ovina Hard Fescue NO BID NO BID Festuca ovina Hard Fescue  $                    5.07  $                 5.23 Festuca ovina Hard Fescue  $                     4.95  $                         5.20 

Gaillardia aristata Perennial Blanketflower
NO BID NO BID 

Gaillardia aristata Perennial 

Blanketflower
 $                  50.69  $               52.22 

Gaillardia aristata Perennial 

Blanketflower
 $                   49.50  $                       52.00 

Gaillardia pulchella Annual Gaillardia
NO BID NO BID 

Gaillardia pulchella Annual Gaillardia
 $                  47.52  $               48.95 

Gaillardia pulchella Annual Gaillardia
 $                   46.20  $                       48.50 

Geum canadense White Avens NO BID NO BID Geum canadense White Avens  $                 253.44  $             261.05 Geum canadense White Avens  $                 246.50  $                     258.80 

Helenium autumnale Common Sneezeweed
NO BID NO BID 

Helenium autumnale Common 

Sneezeweed  $                 285.12  $             293.68 

Helenium autumnale Common 

Sneezeweed  $                 277.00  $                     290.00 

Helenium flexuosum Purplehead Sneezeweed
NO BID NO BID 

Helenium flexuosum Purplehead 

Sneezeweed  $                 190.08  $             195.79 

Helenium flexuosum Purplehead 

Sneezeweed  $                 184.80  $                     194.00 

Helianthus angustifolius Narrowleaf Sunflower
NO BID NO BID 

Helianthus angustifolius Narrowleaf 

Sunflower  $                  95.04  $               97.90 

Helianthus angustifolius Narrowleaf 

Sunflower  $                   92.40  $                       97.00 

Heliopsis helianthoides Oxeye Sunflower
NO BID NO BID 

Heliopsis helianthoides Oxeye Sunflower
 $                  44.36  $               45.70 

Heliopsis helianthoides Oxeye Sunflower
 $                   43.00  $                       45.15 

Liatris graminifolia Grassleaf Blazingstar
NO BID NO BID 

Liatris graminifolia Grassleaf 

Blazingstar  $                 570.24  $             587.35 

Liatris graminifolia Grassleaf Blazingstar
 $                 554.40  $                     583.00 

Monarda fistulosa Wild Bergamot NO BID NO BID Monarda fistulosa Wild Bergamot  $                 158.40  $             163.16 Monarda fistulosa Wild Bergamot  $                 154.00  $                     162.00 

Oenothera biennis Evening Primrose
NO BID NO BID 

Oenothera biennis Evening Primrose
 $                  50.69  $               52.22 

Oenothera biennis Evening Primrose
 $                   49.25  $                       51.75 

Panicum clandestinum Deertongue Grass
NO BID NO BID 

Panicum clandestinum Deertongue 

Grass  $                  28.52  $               29.38 

Panicum clandestinum Deertongue Grass
 $                   27.75  $                       29.25 

Panicum clandestinum 'Tioga' Deertongue Grass
NO BID NO BID 

Panicum clandestinum 'Tioga' Deertongue 

Grass  $                  28.52  $               29.38 

Panicum clandestinum 'Tioga' Deertongue Grass
 $                   27.75  $                       29.25 

Panicum virgatum Switchgrass NO BID NO BID Panicum virgatum Switchgrass  $                    7.92  $                 8.16 Panicum virgatum Switchgrass  $                     7.70  $                         8.10 

Panicum virgatum 'Shelter' Switchgrass NO BID NO BID Panicum virgatum 'Shelter' Switchgrass  $                    9.51  $                 9.80 Panicum virgatum 'Shelter' Switchgrass  $                     9.25  $                         9.75 

Penstemon digitalis Tall White Beardtongue
NO BID NO BID 

Penstemon digitalis Tall White 

Beardtongue  $                 253.44  $             261.05 

Penstemon digitalis Tall White 

Beardtongue  $                 246.40  $                     258.75 

Penstemon hirsutus Hairy Beardtongue
NO BID NO BID 

Penstemon hirsutus Hairy 

Beardtongue  $                 633.60  $             652.61 

Penstemon hirsutus Hairy Beardtongue
 $                 616.00  $                     646.80 

Pycnanthemum tenuifolium Narrowleaf Mountainmint
NO BID NO BID 

Pycnanthemum tenuifolium Narrowleaf 

Mountainmint
 $                 221.76  $             228.42 

Pycnanthemum tenuifolium Narrowleaf 

Mountainmint
 $                 215.60  $                     226.80 

Pycnanthemum virginianum Virginia Mountainmint
NO BID NO BID 

Pycnanthemum virginianum Virginia 

Mountainmint  $                 760.32  $             783.13 

Pycnanthemum virginianum Virginia 

Mountainmint  $                 739.20  $                     776.25 

Ratibita pinnata Gray Headed Coneflower
NO BID NO BID 

Ratibita pinnata Gray Headed 

Coneflower  $                 126.72  $             130.53 

Ratibita pinnata Gray Headed 

Coneflower  $                 123.25  $                     129.50 

Rudbeckia hirta Blackeyed Susan
NO BID NO BID 

Rudbeckia hirta Blackeyed Susan
 $                  31.68  $               32.64 

Rudbeckia hirta Blackeyed Susan
 $                   30.80  $                       32.34 

Rudbeckia triloba Browneyed Susan
NO BID NO BID 

Rudbeckia triloba Browneyed Susan
 $                  76.04  $               78.33 

Rudbeckia triloba Browneyed Susan
 $                   73.92  $                       77.60 

Schizachyrium scoparium Little Bluestem NO BID NO BID Schizachyrium scoparium Little Bluestem  $                  25.35  $               26.12 Schizachyrium scoparium Little Bluestem  $                   24.00  $                           25.20 

Senna hebecarpa Wild Senna NO BID NO BID Senna hebecarpa Wild Senna  $                  38.02  $               39.17 Senna hebecarpa Wild Senna  $                   37.00  $                           39.00 

Silphium trifoliatum Whorled Rosinweed
NO BID NO BID 

Silphium trifoliatum Whorled 

Rosinweed  $                 171.08  $             176.22 

Silphium trifoliatum Whorled Rosinweed
 $                 166.25  $                     174.55 

Solidago nemoralis Gray Goldenrod NO BID NO BID Solidago nemoralis Gray Goldenrod  $                 443.52  $             456.83 Solidago nemoralis Gray Goldenrod  $                 431.20  $                     452.75 

Solidago rigida Stiff Goldenrod NO BID NO BID Solidago rigida Stiff Goldenrod  $                 443.52  $             456.83 Solidago rigida Stiff Goldenrod  $                 431.20  $                     452.75 

Solidago speciosa Showy Goldenrod
NO BID NO BID 

Solidago speciosa Showy Goldenrod
 $                 348.48  $             358.94 

Solidago speciosa Showy Goldenrod
 $                 338.80  $                     355.75 

Sorghastrun nutans Indiangrass NO BID NO BID Sorghastrun nutans Indiangrass  $                  25.35  $               26.12 Sorghastrun nutans Indiangrass  $                   24.00  $                       25.25 

Symphyotrichum laeve Smooth Blue Aster
NO BID NO BID 

Symphyotrichum laeve Smooth Blue 

Aster  $                 443.52  $             456.83 

Symphyotrichum laeve Smooth Blue Aster
 $                 431.20  $                     452.75 

Symphyotrichum novae-angliae New England Aster
NO BID NO BID 

Symphyotrichum novae-

angliae

New England 

Aster  $                 443.52  $             456.83 

Symphyotrichum novae-

angliae

New England Aster
 $                 431.20  $                     452.75 

Symphyotrichum oblongifolium Aromatic Aster
NO BID NO BID 

Symphyotrichum 

oblongifolium

Aromatic Aster
 $                 443.52  $             456.83 

Symphyotrichum 

oblongifolium

Aromatic Aster
 $                 431.20  $                     452.75 

Symphyotrichum prenanthoides Zigzag Aster
NO BID NO BID 

Symphyotrichum 

prenanthoides

Zigzag Aster
 $                 570.24  $             587.35 

Symphyotrichum 

prenanthoides

Zigzag Aster
 $                 554.40  $                     583.00 

Tradescantia subaspera Zigzag Spiderwort
NO BID NO BID 

Tradescantia subaspera Zigzag Spiderwort
 $                 126.72  $             130.53 

Tradescantia subaspera Zigzag Spiderwort
 $                 123.20  $                     129.50 

Tridens flavus Purpletop NO BID NO BID Tridens flavus Purpletop  $                  41.19  $               42.43 Tridens flavus Purpletop  $                   40.10  $                       42.10 

Verbena hastata Blue Vervain NO BID NO BID Verbena hastata Blue Vervain  $                  50.69  $               52.22 Verbena hastata Blue Vervain  $                   49.30  $                       51.75 

Verbena stricta Hoary Vervain NO BID NO BID Verbena stricta Hoary Vervain  $                 158.40  $             163.16 Verbena stricta Hoary Vervain  $                 154.00  $                     161.75 

Veronicastrum virginicum Culver's Root NO BID NO BID Veronicastrum virginicum Culver's Root  $              1,013.76  $          1,044.18 Veronicastrum virginicum Culver's Root  $                 985.60  $                  1,034.90 

Y

e

a

Year 2 Y

e

ar 

Year 2 Y

e

ar 

Year 2

Scientific Name Common Name NO BID NO BID Scientific Name Common Name Scientific Name Common Name

Avena sativa oats NO BID NO BID Avena sativa oats  $                    0.65  $                 0.67 Avena sativa oats  $                   0.645  $                       0.677 

Secale cereale cereal rye NO BID NO BID Secale cereale cereal rye  $                    0.44  $                 0.46 Secale cereale cereal rye  $                     0.56  $                       0.588 

Lolium multiflorum annual ryegrass NO BID NO BID Lolium multiflorum annual ryegrass  $                    1.27  $                 1.31 Lolium multiflorum annual ryegrass  $                   1.176  $                       1.235 

Trifolium incarnatum Crimson clover NO BID NO BID Trifolium incarnatum Crimson clover  $                    2.54  $                 2.62 Trifolium incarnatum Crimson clover  $                   2.646  $                       2.778 

Pisum arvense Austrian pea NO BID NO BID Pisum arvense Austrian pea  $                    1.59  $                 1.64 Pisum arvense Austrian pea  $                   1.542  $                       1.620 

Y

e

Year 2 Y

e

Year 2 Y

e

Year 2
NO BID NO BID  $                  46.36  $               47.76  $                   58.75  $                       61.75 

Y Year 2 Y Year 2   Year 2 
NO BID NO BID  $                    5.92  $                 6.10  $                     6.93  $                         7.28 

Y Year 2 Y Year 2   Year 2 
NO BID NO BID  $                  44.38  $               45.72  $                   55.08  $                       57.83 

Y Year 2 Y Year 2 Y Year 2
NO BID NO BID  $                  91.07  $               93.81  $                 116.00  $                     121.80 

Y Year 2 Y Year 2   Year 2 
NO BID NO BID  $                  13.57  $               13.98  $                   16.25  $                       17.10 

Y Year 2 Y Year 2   Year 2 
NO BID NO BID  $                  62.01  $               63.88  $                   74.46  $                       78.20 

Y Year 2 Y Year 2   Year 2 
NO BID NO BID  $                  46.38  $               47.78  $                   58.65  $                       61.60 

Y Year 2 Y Year 2   Year 2 
NO BID NO BID  $                 100.01  $             103.02  $                 115.25  $                     121.00 

Deer Resistant Meadow Mix

*cost per pound for mix

Task 1: Site Prep, Seeding, Establishment & Maintenance Service

Task 2: Provide Native Seeds

Cover Crops

*price per pound for individual species

ENVIROSCAPES INC

Task 1: Site Prep, Seeding, Establishment & Maintenance Service

APPLIED ECOLOGICAL SERVICES

Task 2: Provide Native Seeds

Custom Mix

*price per pound needs to be in Pure Live Seed 

Cover Crops

*price per pound for individual species

AB2021-09 PROPOSAL FORM 

Warm Season Grass Mix Warm Season Grass Mix Warm Season Grass Mix 

Deer Resistant Meadow Mix

*cost per pound for mix

Task 1: Site Prep, Seeding, Establishment & Maintenance Service

WEEDS INC. 

Task 2: Provide Native Seeds

Custom Mix

*price per pound needs to be in Pure Live Seed for 

Cover Crops

*price per pound for individual species

Deer Resistant Meadow Mix

*cost per pound for mix

Custom Mix

*price per pound needs to be in Pure Live Seed for each species 

*cost per pound for mix *cost per pound for mix *cost per pound for mix

Mesic to Dry Pollinator Mix Mesic to Dry Pollinator Mix Mesic to Dry Pollinator Mix 

*cost per pound for mix *cost per pound for mix *cost per pound for mix

Wetland Meadow Mix Wetland Meadow Mix Wetland Meadow Mix 

*cost per pound for mix *cost per pound for mix *cost per pound for mix

Upland Wildlife Mix Upland Wildlife Mix Upland Wildlife Mix 

*cost per pound for mix *cost per pound for mix *cost per pound for mix

Pollinator Garden Mix Pollinator Garden Mix Pollinator Garden Mix 

*cost per pound for mix *cost per pound for mix *cost per pound for mix

Part Shade Mix Part Shade Mix Part Shade Mix 

*cost per pound for mix *cost per pound for mix *cost per pound for mix

*cost per pound for mix *cost per pound for mix *cost per pound for mix

XERCES Mid-Atlantic Pollinator Mix XERCES Mid-Atlantic Pollinator Mix XERCES Mid-Atlantic Pollinator Mix 



NO. OF BIDDERS: 1

NAME OF BIDDER EASTERN LIFT TRUCK CO. INC.

ADDRESS 549 E LINWOOD AVE

CITY, STATE, ZIP MAPLE SHADE, NJ 08052

CONTACT JASON THOMPSON

TELEPHONE 717 515 0628

FAX N/A

E-MAIL JTHOMPSON@EASTERNLIFTTRUCK.COM

NJ SAVI DESIGNATION N/A

INSURANCE INDEMNIFICATION 

PAGE 
SIGNED AND DATED

INSURANCE CERTIFICATE INCLUDED 

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP SIGNED AND DATED

BUSINESS REGISTRATION 

CERTIFICATE
OK

EIC REQUIRED IF AWARDED

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 SIGNED AND DATED

IRAN CERTIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED

HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 

DAYS
YES

CONTINUITY OF OPERATION YES

UNIT COST FOR ONE (1) JLG 

T500J TOWABLE 50’ 

ARTICULATED BOOM WORK LIFT 

OR EQUIVALENT

 $48, 684.47 

MANUFACTURER JLG

MODEL T500J

YEAR 2021

DELIVERY DATE 9/1/2021

EXCEPTIONS NONE

FATAL FLAW NO 

                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                    

AB2021-12 ONE (1) JLG T500J TOWABLE 50’ ARTICULATED BOOM WORK LIFT OR 

EQUIVALENT FOR THE MERCER COUNTY PARK COMMISSION 

BID RESULTS

BID OPENING DATE : MARCH 25, 2021

mailto:JTHOMPSON@EASTERNLIFTTRUCK.COM


PARK COMMISSION EVALUATION TEAM TO 

EVALUATE BASED ON THE WEIGHTED CRITERIA 

AND PREPARE RECOMMENDATION AND 

REPORT OF EVALUATION

NO. OF RESPONDENTS: 2

NAME OF RESPONDENT POOL MANAGEMENT INC. (PMI) USA POOLS OF NEW JERSEY 

ADDRESS 5485 BETHELVIEW ROAD STE.360-305 1595 PEACHTREE PARKWAY 

CITY, STATE, ZIP CUMMINS, GA 30031 CUMMING, GA 30041 

CONTACT KENDLE HOOKS ALISON ABBOTT

TELEPHONE 855-794-6764 877-248-1872

FAX 855-794-6764 N/A 

E-MAIL SALES@POOLMANAGEMENTINC.COM ALISON@USAMANGEMENT.COM

NJ SAVI DESIGNATION N/A N/A 

INSURANCE AND INDEMNIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED 

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

IRAN CERTIFICATION 
SIGNED AND DATED/ MUST CHECK YES 

OR NO 
SIGNED AND DATED/ MUST CHECK YES OR NO 

EXHIBIT A INCLUDED INCLUDED 

EIC REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED 

HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS YES YES 

CONTINUITY OF SERVICE YES YES 

NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

REFERENCES INCLUDED, PC TO REVIEW INCLUDED, PC TO REVIEW 

FLAT FEE YEAR ONE 
BASE -$22,510 +$16.85  HR FOR 

MANAGER AND $14.25 LG HOUR 
 $                                                              64,942.00 

FLAT FEE YEAR TWO
BASE -$22,510 +$16.85 AN HR FOR 

MANAGER AND $14.25 LG HOUR 
 $                                                              64,942.00 

EXCEPTIONS
YES, PROVIDED A BREAK OUT NOT FLAT 

FEE
NONE 

FATAL FLAW NO NO 

RATES TO THE PARK COMMISSION

RFP RESULTS
CC2021-04 POOL MANAGEMENT AND MAINTENANCE SERVICES FOR THE MERCER COUNTY PARK COMMISSION POOL AT HOPEWELL 

VALLEY GOLF COURSE
RFP OPENING: MARCH 26,2021 

mailto:SALES@POOLMANAGEMENTINC.COM
mailto:ALISON@USAMANGEMENT.COM


NO. OF RESPONDENTS: 2

NAME OF BIDDER PELICAN CHEMICALS, INC SCHOENBERG SALT & CHEMICAL CO.,  INC.

ADDRESS 2901 W. BROADWAY, SUITE 200 P.O. BOX 128

CITY, STATE, ZIP MISSOULA, MT 59808 OCEANSIDE, NY 11572

CONTACT JAROD BENNETT NICHOLAS J. TSIGOUNIS

TELEPHONE 406 412 4122 336 766 0600

FAX 336 766 0100

E-MAIL
JAROD.BENNETT@PELICANCHEMICALS.C

OM
TSIGOUNIS@EARTHLINK.NET

NJ SAVI DESIGNATION N/A N/A 

INSURANCE INDEMNIFICATION PAGE SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

INSURANCE CERTIFICATE REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION REQUIRED IF AWARDED OK

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

EXHIBIT A INCLUDED INCLUDED

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

IRAN CERTIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

EIC REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED

HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS NO YES

YEAR ONE SOLID DEICER COST PER 

METRIC TON
 $                                                     1,553.82  $                                                            1,595.00 

TOTAL FOR 40 METRIC TONS  $                                                   62,152.80  $                                                          63,800.00 

YEAR TWO SOLID DEICER COST PER 

METRIC TON
 $                                                     1,553.82  $                                                            1,640.00 

TOTAL FOR 40 METRIC TONS  $                                                   62,152.80  $                                                          65,600.00 

GRAND TOTAL ONE AND TWO YEARS 

SOLID
 $                                                 124,305.60  $                                                        129,400.00 

YEAR ONE LIQUID DEICER COST PER 

GALLON
 $                                                            4.73 6.04$                                                                    

TOTAL FOR 40,000 GALLONS  $                                                 189,200.00  $                                                        241,600.00 

YEAR TWO LIQUID DEICER COST PER 

GALLON
 $                                                            4.73 6.24$                                                                    

TOTAL FOR 40,000 GALLONS  $                                                 189,200.00  $                                                        249,600.00 

GRAND TOTAL ONE AND TWO YEARS 

LIQUID
 $                                                 378,400.00  $                                                        491,200.00 

EMERGENCY SERVICE YES YES

EXCEPTIONS YES, AIRPORT TO REVIEW EXCEPTIONS YES, AIRPORT TO REVIEW EXCEPTIONS 

FATAL FLAW NO NO

BID RESULTS

AB2021-10 UP TO 40 METRIC TONS OF CLARIANT SF (SODIUM FORMATE) SOLID RUNWAY DEICER OR EQUIVALENT AND UP TO 

40,000 GALLONS OF CLARIANT KA LIQUID RUNWAY DEICER OR EQUIVALENT FOR THE TRENTON-MERCER AIRPORT FOR A PERIOD 

OF ONE (1) YEAR WITH THE OPTION TO EXTEND ONE (1) YEAR 

BID OPENING: MARCH 26, 2021

mailto:JAROD.BENNETT@PELICANCHEMICALS.COM
mailto:JAROD.BENNETT@PELICANCHEMICALS.COM
mailto:TSIGOUNIS@EARTHLINK.NET

