
BIDS RECEIVED 12

NAME OF BIDDER RENCOR INC. MARBRO, INC.
CARBRO CONSTRUCTORS 

CORP. 
LIMA CHARLIE CONSTRUCTION COLONNELLI BROTHERS, INC GREEN CONSTRUCTION INC. CRS CONTRACTORS INC. 

STATE LINE CONSTRUCTION CO 

INC. 
SPARWICK CONTRACTING INC. GRADE CONSTRUCTION 

UNDEGROUND UTILITIES CORP. 
MOUNT CONSTRUCTION CO.INC 

ADDRESS 26 TANNERY ROAD 127 PINE STREET P.O. BOX 134 605 OMNI DRIVE 1 BROAD STREET ,SUITE 4 409 SOUTH RIVER STREET 26 ELIZABETH ST. PO BOX 550 315 ROUTE 34 SUITE 137 234 PACIFIC STREET 21 SUNSET INN ROAD 110 PENNSYLVANIA AVENUE 711 COMMERCE ROAD 427 SOUTH WHITE HORSE PIKE 

CITY, STATE, ZIP SOMERVILLE NJ,08876 MONTCLAIR, NJ 07042 HILLSBOROUGH, NJ 08844 FREEHOLD NJ, 07728 HACKENSACK, NJ 07601 SOUTH RIVER NJ,08882 COLTS NECK, NJ 07722 NEWARK, NJ 07114 LAFAYETTE, NJ 07848 PATERSON, NJ 07506 LINDEN, NJ 07036 BERLIN NJ, 08009

CONTACT GEORGE F. MESIHA FRANK MARUCCI JR. ANTHONY CARUSO JR. GEORGE LUCAS LISA COLONNELLI CARLOS M. SANTOS FRANCESCO CANGIALOSI PAULA CECERE MARK FAGERSTEN RALPH DIACO RICH GOMES MICHAEL MAZZARELLA 

TELEPHONE 908-534-2131 973 -744- 8383 908-281-9220 833-242-2427 201-440-118 732-238-9370 732-837-0100 973- 621- 2828 973-300-4709 973-925-4021 908 -862- 8936 856-758-8493

FAX 908-534-5071 973- 746- 5898 908-281-0385 732-955-8301 201-440-8282 732-613-0838 732-683-4075 973 -621- 9066 973-300-4761 973-782-5958 908 -862- 8690 856-753-1453

E-MAIL GEORGEMESIHA@RENCORINC.COM MAR9400@COMCAST.NET
CONTACT@CARBROCONSTRUCTORS

.COM

ESTIMATING@LIMACHARLIECON

STRUCTION.COM 
NGC@COLONNELLI.COM INFO@GREENINCNJ.COM 

FRANCO@CRSCONTRACTORSINC.

COM 
PAULA@STATELINECO.COM MFAGERSTEN@SPARKWICK.COM

RALPH@GRADECONSTRUCTION.N

ET 

RGOMES@UNDERGROUNDUTILITESC

ORP.COM

MMAZZARELLA@MOUNTCONSTRUCTI

ON.COM

NJ SAVI DESIGNATION SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE 
SMALL BUSINESS AND DISABLED 

VETERAN BUSINESSE ENTERPRISE 
N/A SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE N/A N/A SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE N/A SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE 

BID BOND
BERKLEY INSURANCE CO. 10%NTE 

20K

FIDELITY & DEPOSIT CO OF 

MARYLAND 10% NTE 20K

LIBERTY MUTUAL INSURANCE 

CO. 10% NTE 20K 

GREAT MIDWEST INSURANCE CO. 

10% NTE 20K

UNITED STATES FIRE INSURANCE CO. 

10% NTE 20K 

FIDELITY & DEPOSIT CO OF 

MARYLAND 10% NTE 20K

SELECTIVE INSURANCE CO. 

OF AMERICA 10% NTE 20K 

ATLANTIC SPECIALTY INSURANCE 

CO.10%NTE 20K

LIBERTY MUTUAL INSURANCE CO. 

10%NTE 20K 

LIBERTY MUTUAL INSURANCE CO. 

10%NTE 20K 

TRAVELERS  CAS.AND SURETY CO. 

OF AMERICA 10% NTE 20K

LIBERTY MUTUAL INSURANCE CO. 

10%NTE 20K 

CONSENT OF SURETY PAMELA J. BOYLE AIF WITH POA ROCIO VILLA AIF WITH POA LISA NOSAL AIF WITH POA RICHARD V. DOBBS AIF WITH POA LISA NOSAL AIF WITH POA JOHN P. SEDOR AIF WITH POA 
DAWN M, JONES AIF WITH 

POA 
LORI N. BAYBUTT AIF WITH POA LISA NOSAL AIF WITH POA WILLIAM D. HAAS AIF WITH POA 

CHRISTINA VAN LENTEN AIF WITH 

POA 
JOHN P. SEDOR AIF WITH POA 

INDEMNIFICATION AND 

INSURANCE
SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

IRAN CERT SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

PREVAILING WAGE 

CERTIFICATION
INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED 

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

EXHIBIT B INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

AA201 FORM REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED 

PW CONTRACTOR REG. 605214 EXPIRES 5.8.23 607153 EXPIRES 6.13.22 67627 EXPIRES 11.16.21 723226 EXPIRES 4.14.23 606273 EXPIRES 7.18.22 66907 EXPIRES 6.7.22 718716 EXPIRES 3.9.22 624484 EXPIRES 5.28.22 611110 EXPIRES 11.12.22 638293 EXPIRES 9.9.23 55489 EXPIRES 8.25.23 605531 EXPIRES 6.23.22

NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK OK OK OK OK OK OK OK OK OK OK

NON-DEBARMEN FEDERAL 

FORM 
SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

NON-COLLUSION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

SAFETY CERT SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

EQUIPMENT CERT SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

REFERENCES
INCLUDED ENGINEERING TO 

REVIEW 

INCLUDED ENGINEERING TO 

REVIEW 

INCLUDED ENGINEERING TO 

REVIEW 

INCLUDED ENGINEERING TO 

REVIEW 

INCLUDED ENGINEERING TO 

REVIEW 

INCLUDED ENGINEERING TO 

REVIEW 

INCLUDED ENGINEERING TO 

REVIEW 

INCLUDED ENGINEERING TO 

REVIEW 
INCLUDED ENGINEERING TO REVIEW 

INCLUDED ENGINEERING TO 

REVIEW 

INCLUDED ENGINEERING TO 

REVIEW 
INCLUDED ENGINEERING TO REVIEW 

HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES NO DID NOT CHECK YES OR NO YES YES

TOTAL BID AMOUNT  $                                  1,885,277.00  $                         1,917,117.00  $                           2,283,169.25  $                                2,345,345.00  $                                 2,436,974.00  $                        2,450,000.00  $                        2,481,265.00  $                              2,615,274.75  $                                    2,624,568.00  $                               2,626,124.63  $                                  3,378,932.50  $                                     4,496,937.50 

EXCEPTIONS NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE

FATAL FLAW NO NO NO NO NO NO NO NO NO NO NO NO

BID RESULTS

AB2021-40 REPLACEMENT OF BRIDGE #180.1  CARRYING ABANDONED RAILROAD TRAIL 

BID OPENING DATE:  SEPTEMBER 21,2021
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PAY ITEM 

NO.

NJ DOT ITEM 

NO. 
DESCRIPTION UNIT 

CONTRACT 

QUANTITY 

PLAN 

QUANTITY

I& WD 

QUANTITY 
UNIT PRICE COST UNIT PRICE COST UNIT PRICE COST UNIT PRICE COST UNIT PRICE COST UNIT PRICE COST UNIT PRICE COST UNIT PRICE COST UNIT PRICE COST UNIT PRICE COST UNIT PRICE COST UNIT PRICE COST 

1 154003P MOBILIZATION  LS 1 0 1 127,000.00$     127,000.00$        175,000.00$    175,000.00$           225,000.00$       225,000.00$      234,500.00$       234,500.00$             115,000.00$       115,000.00$       410,000.00$    410,000.00$      180,000.00$     180,000.00$     275,000.00$           275,000.00$          260,000.00$          260,000.00$             181,624.96$      181,624.96$           156,000.00$           156,000.00$           10,000.00$         10,000.00$                 

2 158009M HEAVY-DUTY SILT FENCE, ORANGE  LF 600 546 54 7.50$                4,500.00$            9.00$               5,400.00$               19.00$                11,400.00$        4.00$                  2,400.00$                 6.00$                  3,600.00$           7.00$               4,200.00$          12.00$              7,200.00$         1.00$                      600.00$                 7.00$                     4,200.00$                 6.74$                 4,044.00$               7.00$                      4,200.00$               7.50$                  4,500.00$                   

3 158030M INLET FILTER TYPE 2, 4' X 4'  U 6 4 2 265.00$            1,590.00$            86.00$             516.00$                  70.00$                420.00$             150.00$              900.00$                    150.00$              900.00$              150.00$           900.00$             200.00$            1,200.00$         1.00$                      6.00$                     130.00$                 780.00$                    128.54$             771.24$                  125.00$                  750.00$                  135.00$              810.00$                      

4 158063P CONCRETE WASHOUT SYSTEM LS 1 0 1 10,000.00$       10,000.00$          1,500.00$        1,500.00$               1,500.00$           1,500.00$          2,500.00$           2,500.00$                 2,000.00$           2,000.00$           2,500.00$        2,500.00$          4,500.00$         4,500.00$         1.00$                      1.00$                     2,500.00$              2,500.00$                 6,647.14$          6,647.14$               10,000.00$             10,000.00$             8,500.00$           8,500.00$                   

5 158072M OIL-ONLY EMERGENCY SPILL KIT, TYPE 1 U 1 0 1 1,525.00$         1,525.00$            1,000.00$        1,000.00$               1,200.00$           1,200.00$          1.00$                  1.00$                        1,000.00$           1,000.00$           0.01$               0.01$                 750.00$            750.00$            1.00$                      1.00$                     200.00$                 200.00$                    797.66$             797.66$                  500.00$                  500.00$                  1,500.00$           1,500.00$                   

6 158084M EROSION CONTROL SEDIMENT REMOVAL CY 1 0 1 200.00$            200.00$               0.01$               0.01$                      100.00$              100.00$             1.00$                  1.00$                        50.00$                50.00$                0.01$               0.01$                 500.00$            500.00$            1.00$                      1.00$                     300.00$                 300.00$                    388.34$             388.34$                  300.00$                  300.00$                  605.00$              605.00$                      

7 159003M BREAKAWAY BARRICADE U 12 0 12 105.00$            1,260.00$            0.01$               0.12$                      105.00$              1,260.00$          1.00$                  12.00$                      35.00$                420.00$              0.01$               0.12$                 110.00$            1,320.00$         115.00$                  1,380.00$              25.00$                   300.00$                    -$                  -$                        1.00$                      12.00$                    110.00$              1,320.00$                   

8 159006M DRUM U 30 0 30 60.00$              1,800.00$            0.01$               0.30$                      65.00$                1,950.00$          1.00$                  30.00$                      30.00$                900.00$              0.01$               0.30$                 50.00$              1,500.00$         1.00$                      30.00$                   25.00$                   750.00$                    -$                  -$                        1.00$                      30.00$                    65.00$                1,950.00$                   

9 159012M CONSTRUCTION SIGNS SF 400 0 400 20.00$              8,000.00$            12.00$             4,800.00$               50.00$                20,000.00$        15.00$                6,000.00$                 15.00$                6,000.00$           17.00$             6,800.00$          30.00$              12,000.00$       20.00$                    8,000.00$              13.00$                   5,200.00$                 36.16$               14,464.00$             35.00$                    14,000.00$             16.00$                6,400.00$                   

10 159033P POLICE SERVICE CHARGE DOLLAR 10,000 0 10,000 1.00$                10,000.00$          1.00$               10,000.00$             1.00$                  10,000.00$        1.00$                  10,000.00$               1.00$                  10,000.00$         1.00$               10,000.00$        1.00$                10,000.00$       1.00$                      10,000.00$            1.00$                     10,000.00$               1.00$                 10,000.00$             1.00$                      10,000.00$             1.00$                  10,000.00$                 

11 160003M FUEL PRICE ADJUSTMENT DOLLAR 1,000 0 1,000 1.00$                1,000.00$            1.00$               1,000.00$               1.00$                  1,000.00$          1.00$                  1,000.00$                 1.00$                  1,000.00$           1.00$               1,000.00$          1.00$                1,000.00$         1.00$                      1,000.00$              1.00$                     1,000.00$                 1.00$                 1,000.00$               1.00$                      1,000.00$               1.00$                  1,000.00$                   

12 160006M ASPHALT PRICE ADJUSTMENT DOLLAR 5,000 0 5,000 1.00$                5,000.00$            1.00$               5,000.00$               1.00$                  5,000.00$          1.00$                  5,000.00$                 1.00$                  5,000.00$           1.00$               5,000.00$          1.00$                5,000.00$         1.00$                      5,000.00$              1.00$                     5,000.00$                 1.00$                 5,000.00$               1.00$                      5,000.00$               1.00$                  5,000.00$                   

13 201003P CLEARING SITE LS 1 0 1 50,000.00$       50,000.00$          50,000.00$      50,000.00$             50,000.00$         50,000.00$        125,000.00$       125,000.00$             75,000.00$         75,000.00$         209,890.57$    209,890.57$      25,000.00$       25,000.00$       210,000.00$           210,000.00$          401,000.00$          401,000.00$             106,894.28$      106,894.28$           75,000.00$             75,000.00$             44,000.00$         44,000.00$                 

14 202006M EXCAVATION, TEST PIT CY 4 0 4 175.00$            700.00$               750.00$           3,000.00$               350.00$              1,400.00$          250.00$              1,000.00$                 25.00$                100.00$              300.00$           1,200.00$          500.00$            2,000.00$         1.00$                      4.00$                     400.00$                 1,600.00$                 54.83$               219.32$                  500.00$                  2,000.00$               250.00$              1,000.00$                   

15 202009P EXCAVATION, UNCLASSIFIED CY 2,650 2,491 159 30.00$              79,500.00$          1.00$               2,650.00$               1.00$                  2,650.00$          30.00$                79,500.00$               20.00$                53,000.00$         20.00$             53,000.00$        90.00$              238,500.00$     20.00$                    53,000.00$            1.00$                     2,650.00$                 46.26$               122,589.00$           50.00$                    132,500.00$           65.00$                172,250.00$               

16 202015P EXCAVATION, REGULATED MATERIAL CY 2,650 0 2,650 1.00$                2,650.00$            0.01$               26.50$                    1.00$                  2,650.00$          1.00$                  2,650.00$                 5.00$                  13,250.00$         0.01$               26.50$               40.00$              106,000.00$     10.00$                    26,500.00$            1.00$                     2,650.00$                 13.27$               35,165.50$             35.00$                    92,750.00$             65.00$                172,250.00$               

17 202021P REMOVAL OF PAVEMENT SY 412 412 0 30.00$              12,360.00$          27.00$             11,124.00$             20.00$                8,240.00$          10.00$                4,120.00$                 10.00$                4,120.00$           20.00$             8,240.00$          50.00$              20,600.00$       25.00$                    10,300.00$            22.00$                   9,064.00$                 14.52$               5,982.24$               20.00$                    8,240.00$               18.50$                7,622.00$                   

18 202024M DISPOSAL OF REGULATED MATERIAL T 2,200 0 2,200 1.00$                2,200.00$            40.00$             88,000.00$             53.00$                116,600.00$      15.00$                33,000.00$               30.00$                66,000.00$         0.01$               22.00$               55.00$              121,000.00$     1.00$                      2,200.00$              1.00$                     2,200.00$                 30.84$               67,848.00$             60.00$                    132,000.00$           88.00$                193,600.00$               

19 202030M SOIL SAMPLING AND ANALYSES, REGULATED U 6 0 6 1.00$                6.00$                   1,500.00$        9,000.00$               1,200.00$           7,200.00$          750.00$              4,500.00$                 750.00$              4,500.00$           1,500.00$        9,000.00$          1,100.00$         6,600.00$         500.00$                  3,000.00$              500.00$                 3,000.00$                 1,063.54$          6,381.24$               1,950.00$               11,700.00$             1,500.00$           9,000.00$                   

20 202031M SOIL TESTING PL2012 C-73 DOLLAR 2,500 0 2,500 1.00$                2,500.00$            1.00$               2,500.00$               1.00$                  2,500.00$          1.00$                  2,500.00$                 1.00$                  2,500.00$           1.00$               2,500.00$          1.00$                2,500.00$         1.00$                      2,500.00$              1.00$                     2,500.00$                 1.00$                 2,500.00$               1.00$                      2,500.00$               1.00$                  2,500.00$                   

21 203009P I-9 SOIL AGGREGATE CY 1,320 1,206 114 85.00$              112,200.00$        74.00$             97,680.00$             88.00$                116,160.00$      50.00$                66,000.00$               45.00$                59,400.00$         30.00$             39,600.00$        80.00$              105,600.00$     45.00$                    59,400.00$            48.00$                   63,360.00$               77.05$               101,706.00$           55.00$                    72,600.00$             73.00$                96,360.00$                 

22 203021P I-14 SOIL AGGREGATE CY 50 42 8 80.00$              4,000.00$            33.00$             1,650.00$               20.00$                1,000.00$          20.00$                1,000.00$                 45.00$                2,250.00$           0.01$               0.50$                 75.00$              3,750.00$         42.00$                    2,100.00$              48.00$                   2,400.00$                 96.04$               4,802.00$               55.00$                    2,750.00$               73.00$                3,650.00$                   

23 302042P DENSE-GRADED AGGREGATE BASE COURSE, 8" THICK SY 910 830 80 20.00$              18,200.00$          18.00$             16,380.00$             18.00$                16,380.00$        5.00$                  4,550.00$                 20.00$                18,200.00$         9.00$               8,190.00$          20.00$              18,200.00$       15.00$                    13,650.00$            14.00$                   12,740.00$               20.80$               18,928.00$             15.00$                    13,650.00$             19.00$                17,290.00$                 

24 401027M POLYMERIZED JOINT ADHESIVE LF 300 0 300 2.00$                600.00$               5.00$               1,500.00$               3.00$                  900.00$             1.00$                  300.00$                    2.00$                  600.00$              1.00$               300.00$             5.00$                1,500.00$         5.00$                      1,500.00$              3.50$                     1,050.00$                 8.35$                 2,505.00$               3.00$                      900.00$                  5.00$                  1,500.00$                   

25 401030M TACK COAT GAL 25 0 25 1.00$                25.00$                 25.00$             625.00$                  10.00$                250.00$             1.00$                  25.00$                      2.00$                  50.00$                0.01$               0.25$                 10.00$              250.00$            1.00$                      25.00$                   1.00$                     25.00$                      0.01$                 0.25$                      6.00$                      150.00$                  5.00$                  125.00$                      

26 401036M PRIME COAT GAL 25 0 25 1.00$                25.00$                 25.00$             625.00$                  0.01$                  0.25$                 1.00$                  25.00$                      2.00$                  50.00$                0.01$               0.25$                 6.00$                150.00$            0.01$                      0.25$                     1.00$                     25.00$                      0.01$                 0.25$                      1.00$                      25.00$                    5.00$                  125.00$                      

27 401042M HOT MIX ASPHALT 9.5 M 64 SURFACE COURSE T 55 49 6 180.00$            9,900.00$            200.00$           11,000.00$             196.00$              10,780.00$        175.00$              9,625.00$                 165.00$              9,075.00$           135.00$           7,425.00$          220.00$            12,100.00$       250.00$                  13,750.00$            160.00$                 8,800.00$                 212.71$             11,699.05$             175.00$                  9,625.00$               218.00$              11,990.00$                 

28 401096M HOT MIX ASPHALT 19 M 64 BASE COURSE T 220 198 22 175.00$            38,500.00$          150.00$           33,000.00$             196.00$              43,120.00$        125.00$              27,500.00$               145.00$              31,900.00$         105.00$           23,100.00$        150.00$            33,000.00$       250.00$                  55,000.00$            150.00$                 33,000.00$               186.12$             40,946.40$             175.00$                  38,500.00$             148.00$              32,560.00$                 

29 409001P STONE DUST SURFACE COURSE, 2" THICK SY 460 418 42 10.00$              4,600.00$            13.00$             5,980.00$               10.00$                4,600.00$          6.00$                  2,760.00$                 10.00$                4,600.00$           13.00$             5,980.00$          30.00$              13,800.00$       15.00$                    6,900.00$              9.00$                     4,140.00$                 8.64$                 3,974.40$               25.00$                    11,500.00$             15.00$                6,900.00$                   

30 602153M RECONSTRUCTED INLET, TYPE B, USING NEW CASTING U 4 4 0 3,000.00$         12,000.00$          225.00$           900.00$                  3,000.00$           12,000.00$        3,500.00$           14,000.00$               2,850.00$           11,400.00$         1,500.00$        6,000.00$          2,000.00$         8,000.00$         3,500.00$               14,000.00$            2,080.00$              8,320.00$                 1,732.17$          6,928.68$               1,500.00$               6,000.00$               1,100.00$           4,400.00$                   

31 605183P TEMPORARY CHAIN-LINK FENCE, 6' HIGH LF 150 150 0 10.00$              1,500.00$            10.00$             1,500.00$               12.00$                1,800.00$          20.00$                3,000.00$                 30.00$                4,500.00$           25.00$             3,750.00$          35.00$              5,250.00$         1.00$                      150.00$                 10.00$                   1,500.00$                 47.72$               7,158.00$               54.85$                    8,227.50$               53.00$                7,950.00$                   

32 606012P CONCRETE SIDEWALK, 4" THICK SY 182 182 0 80.00$              14,560.00$          100.00$           18,200.00$             99.00$                18,018.00$        65.00$                11,830.00$               55.00$                10,010.00$         80.00$             14,560.00$        150.00$            27,300.00$       85.00$                    15,470.00$            80.00$                   14,560.00$               69.63$               12,672.66$             125.00$                  22,750.00$             125.00$              22,750.00$                 

33 607021P 9" X 18" CONCRETE VERTICAL CURB LF 297 297 0 30.00$              8,910.00$            50.00$             14,850.00$             28.00$                8,316.00$          25.00$                7,425.00$                 25.00$                7,425.00$           45.00$             13,365.00$        50.00$              14,850.00$       30.00$                    8,910.00$              35.00$                   10,395.00$               38.12$               11,321.64$             35.00$                    10,395.00$             70.00$                20,790.00$                 

34 610003M TRAFFIC STRIPES, 4" LF 550 459 91 3.00$                1,650.00$            3.00$               1,650.00$               3.30$                  1,815.00$          3.25$                  1,787.50$                 2.00$                  1,100.00$           6.00$               3,300.00$          1.00$                550.00$            5.50$                      3,025.00$              3.00$                     1,650.00$                 3.19$                 1,754.50$               3.00$                      1,650.00$               3.25$                  1,787.50$                   

35 651255M RESET WATER VALVE BOX U 2 1 1 210.00$            420.00$               0.01$               0.02$                      70.00$                140.00$             25.00$                50.00$                      300.00$              600.00$              170.00$           340.00$             200.00$            400.00$            1.00$                      2.00$                     250.00$                 500.00$                    390.13$             780.26$                  300.00$                  600.00$                  30.00$                60.00$                        

36 653084M RESET GAS VALVE BOX U 1 0 1 210.00$            210.00$               0.01$               0.01$                      70.00$                70.00$               1.00$                  1.00$                        300.00$              300.00$              0.01$               0.01$                 200.00$            200.00$            1.00$                      1.00$                     250.00$                 250.00$                    390.13$             390.13$                  300.00$                  300.00$                  30.00$                30.00$                        

37 804002P TOPSOIL SPREADING, 5" THICK (COMPLETE) SY 900 812 88 8.00$                7,200.00$            8.00$               7,200.00$               4.00$                  3,600.00$          6.00$                  5,400.00$                 8.00$                  7,200.00$           8.00$               7,200.00$          8.00$                7,200.00$         1.00$                      900.00$                 8.00$                     7,200.00$                 7.66$                 6,894.00$               11.00$                    9,900.00$               7.00$                  6,300.00$                   

38 807003M TOPSOIL STABILIZATION, TYPE 1 MAT SY 700 637 63 4.00$                2,800.00$            4.00$               2,800.00$               5.00$                  3,500.00$          8.00$                  5,600.00$                 6.00$                  4,200.00$           5.00$               3,500.00$          4.00$                2,800.00$         5.00$                      3,500.00$              4.00$                     2,800.00$                 3.78$                 2,646.00$               6.00$                      4,200.00$               5.50$                  3,850.00$                   

39 154003P CLEARING SITE, BRIDGE (180.1) LS 1 1 0 115,000.00$     115,000.00$        185,260.56$    185,260.56$           25,000.00$         25,000.00$        449,669.50$       449,669.50$             280,000.00$       280,000.00$       150,000.00$    150,000.00$      50,000.00$       50,000.00$       426,000.00$           426,000.00$          500,000.00$          500,000.00$             160,413.24$      160,413.24$           360,000.00$           360,000.00$           290,000.00$       290,000.00$               

40 158030M TEMPORARY SHIELDING LS 1 1 0 1,000.00$         1,000.00$            20,000.00$      20,000.00$             15,000.00$         15,000.00$        10,000.00$         10,000.00$               40,000.00$         40,000.00$         12,500.00$      12,500.00$        35,000.00$       35,000.00$       1.00$                      1.00$                     9,500.00$              9,500.00$                 0.01$                 0.01$                      25,000.00$             25,000.00$             10,500.00$         10,500.00$                 

41 302060P COARSE AGGREGATE, SIZE NO.57 CY 136 136 0 80.00$              10,880.00$          30.00$             4,080.00$               101.00$              13,736.00$        75.00$                10,200.00$               45.00$                6,120.00$           50.00$             6,800.00$          100.00$            13,600.00$       42.00$                    5,712.00$              75.00$                   10,200.00$               85.32$               11,603.52$             55.00$                    7,480.00$               78.00$                10,608.00$                 

42 501003P TEMPORARY SHEETING SF 4,448 4,448 0 7.00$                31,136.00$          0.01$               44.48$                    0.50$                  2,224.00$          1.00$                  4,448.00$                 60.00$                266,880.00$       0.01$               44.48$               40.00$              177,920.00$     20.00$                    88,960.00$            60.00$                   266,880.00$             94.36$               419,713.28$           65.00$                    289,120.00$           90.00$                400,320.00$               

43 504009P REINFORCEMENT STEEL, GALVANIZED LB 101,400 101,400 0 3.00$                304,200.00$        2.00$               202,800.00$           2.00$                  202,800.00$      2.25$                  228,150.00$             3.00$                  304,200.00$       2.25$               228,150.00$      2.50$                253,500.00$     2.10$                      212,940.00$          1.75$                     177,450.00$             2.02$                 204,828.00$           2.50$                      253,500.00$           3.20$                  324,480.00$               

44 504015P CONCRETE FOOTING CY 357 357 0 300.00$            107,100.00$        280.00$           99,960.00$             940.00$              335,580.00$      350.00$              124,950.00$             475.00$              169,575.00$       340.00$           121,380.00$      415.00$            148,155.00$     375.00$                  133,875.00$          285.00$                 101,745.00$             489.08$             174,601.56$           750.00$                  267,750.00$           1,200.00$           428,400.00$               

45 504018P CONCRETE WING WALL CY 152 152 0 800.00$            121,600.00$        775.00$           117,800.00$           1,560.00$           237,120.00$      1,400.00$           212,800.00$             1,200.00$           182,400.00$       1,900.00$        288,800.00$      980.00$            148,960.00$     855.00$                  129,960.00$          1,000.00$              152,000.00$             1,674.90$          254,584.80$           2,000.00$               304,000.00$           2,400.00$           364,800.00$               

46 504024P CONCRETE ABUTMENT WALL CY 172 172 0 500.00$            86,000.00$          700.00$           120,400.00$           1,400.00$           240,800.00$      900.00$              154,800.00$             950.00$              163,400.00$       1,400.00$        240,800.00$      720.00$            123,840.00$     855.00$                  147,060.00$          600.00$                 103,200.00$             834.04$             143,454.88$           1,700.00$               292,400.00$           2,800.00$           481,600.00$               

47 504036P EPOXY WATERPROOFING SY 139 139 0 60.00$              8,340.00$            10.00$             1,390.00$               42.00$                5,838.00$          40.00$                5,560.00$                 26.00$                3,614.00$           50.00$             6,950.00$          40.00$              5,560.00$         8.50$                      1,181.50$              1.00$                     139.00$                    33.65$               4,677.35$               50.00$                    6,950.00$               45.00$                6,255.00$                   

48 505030P PRESTRESSED CONCRETE BOX BEAM, (TYPE BII-48), 48" X 33" LF 333 333 0 700.00$            233,100.00$        850.00$           283,050.00$           553.00$              184,149.00$      550.00$              183,150.00$             550.00$              183,150.00$       750.00$           249,750.00$      600.00$            199,800.00$     650.00$                  216,450.00$          375.00$                 124,875.00$             440.91$             146,823.03$           750.00$                  249,750.00$           1,550.00$           516,150.00$               

49 505031P PRESTRESSED CONCRETE BOX BEAM, (TYPE BII-48), 48" X 33" (ARCH) LF 111 111 0 800.00$            88,800.00$          850.00$           94,350.00$             553.00$              61,383.00$        550.00$              61,050.00$               550.00$              61,050.00$         375.00$           41,625.00$        600.00$            66,600.00$       750.00$                  83,250.00$            1,000.00$              111,000.00$             440.41$             48,885.51$             750.00$                  83,250.00$             1,900.00$           210,900.00$               

50 506006P REINFORCED ELASTOMERIC BEARING ASSEMBLY U 16 16 0 500.00$            8,000.00$            375.00$           6,000.00$               720.00$              11,520.00$        1,200.00$           19,200.00$               1,000.00$           16,000.00$         500.00$           8,000.00$          1,500.00$         24,000.00$       1,200.00$               19,200.00$            1,000.00$              16,000.00$               508.90$             8,142.40$               1,200.00$               19,200.00$             6,000.00$           96,000.00$                 

51 507015P STRIP SEAL EXPANSION JOINT ASSEMBLY LF 68 68 0 300.00$            20,400.00$          265.00$           18,020.00$             420.00$              28,560.00$        275.00$              18,700.00$               250.00$              17,000.00$         400.00$           27,200.00$        300.00$            20,400.00$       500.00$                  34,000.00$            235.00$                 15,980.00$               1,211.23$          82,363.64$             450.00$                  30,600.00$             1,300.00$           88,400.00$                 

52 507021P CONCRETE BRIDGE DECK CY 63 63 0 800.00$            50,400.00$          875.00$           55,125.00$             1,300.00$           81,900.00$        1,000.00$           63,000.00$               950.00$              59,850.00$         1,200.00$        75,600.00$        1,000.00$         63,000.00$       2,500.00$               157,500.00$          800.00$                 50,400.00$               466.15$             29,367.45$             1,800.00$               113,400.00$           2,600.00$           163,800.00$               

53 507036P CONCRETE BRIDGE PARAPET LF 112 112 0 500.00$            56,000.00$          500.00$           56,000.00$             415.00$              46,480.00$        600.00$              67,200.00$               500.00$              56,000.00$         625.00$           70,000.00$        450.00$            50,400.00$       750.00$                  84,000.00$            300.00$                 33,600.00$               469.04$             52,532.48$             850.00$                  95,200.00$             600.00$              67,200.00$                 

54 507060P BRONZE PLAQUE U 1 1 0 3,000.00$         3,000.00$            1,500.00$        1,500.00$               1,500.00$           1,500.00$          2,000.00$           2,000.00$                 1,250.00$           1,250.00$           5,000.00$        5,000.00$          4,500.00$         4,500.00$         2,000.00$               2,000.00$              1,500.00$              1,500.00$                 1,225.23$          1,225.23$               4,000.00$               4,000.00$               3,500.00$           3,500.00$                   

55 509122P CHAIN-LINK FENCE, TYPE IV, PVC-COATED STEEL, BRIDGE, 6'-6" HIGH (BLACK)LF 122 122 0 215.00$            26,230.00$          340.00$           41,480.00$             230.00$              28,060.00$        250.00$              30,500.00$               300.00$              36,600.00$         80.00$             9,760.00$          230.00$            28,060.00$       82.00$                    10,004.00$            220.00$                 26,840.00$               325.44$             39,703.68$             374.00$                  45,628.00$             375.00$              45,750.00$                 

56 515001P VIBRATION MONITORING PROGRAM LS 1 1 0 20,000.00$       20,000.00$          5,000.00$        5,000.00$               12,000.00$         12,000.00$        2,500.00$           2,500.00$                 18,500.00$         18,500.00$         25,000.00$      25,000.00$        30,000.00$       30,000.00$       25,000.00$             25,000.00$            15,000.00$            15,000.00$               15,802.10$        15,802.10$             15,000.00$             15,000.00$             45,000.00$         45,000.00$                 

57 601419P 8" PERFORATED HIGH DENSITY POLYETHYLENE PIPE LF 350 350 0 50.00$              17,500.00$          20.00$             7,000.00$               45.00$                15,750.00$        25.00$                8,750.00$                 38.00$                13,300.00$         20.00$             7,000.00$          50.00$              17,500.00$       35.00$                    12,250.00$            21.00$                   7,350.00$                 22.48$               7,868.00$               45.00$                    15,750.00$             90.00$                31,500.00$                 

58 601200P 24" REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE, CLASS V LF 35 35 0 200.00$            7,000.00$            80.00$             2,800.00$               250.00$              8,750.00$          135.00$              4,725.00$                 100.00$              3,500.00$           150.00$           5,250.00$          240.00$            8,400.00$         75.00$                    2,625.00$              100.00$                 3,500.00$                 90.90$               3,181.50$               150.00$                  5,250.00$               130.00$              4,550.00$                   

59 602180M RECONSTRUCTED MANHOLE, USING EXISTING CASTING U 1 1 0 2,500.00$         2,500.00$            1,000.00$        1,000.00$               500.00$              500.00$             3,500.00$           3,500.00$                 2,385.00$           2,385.00$           1,500.00$        1,500.00$          2,000.00$         2,000.00$         3,500.00$               3,500.00$              1,800.00$              1,800.00$                 1,309.63$          1,309.63$               1,500.00$               1,500.00$               1,000.00$           1,000.00$                   

60 8110208 DECIDUOUS TREE, 6-8' HIGH, #7 CONTAINER U 20 0 20 400.00$            8,000.00$            400.00$           8,000.00$               600.00$              12,000.00$        250.00$              5,000.00$                 750.00$              15,000.00$         400.00$           8,000.00$          400.00$            8,000.00$         650.00$                  13,000.00$            400.00$                 8,000.00$                 380.96$             7,619.20$               1,100.00$               22,000.00$             700.00$              14,000.00$                 

UNDEGROUND UTILITIES CORP. SPARWICK CONTRACTING INC.

 $                                           2,624,568.00  $                                         3,378,932.50 

MOUNT CONSTRUCTION 

CO.INC 

TOTAL  $                                 1,885,277.00  $                                   1,917,117.00  $                             2,450,000.00  $                                  2,436,974.00  $                              2,481,265.00  $                                         2,615,274.75  $                                         4,496,937.50 

AB2021-40 REPLACEMENT OF BRIDGE #180.1  CARRYING ABANDONED RAILROAD TRAIL RENCOR INC. MARBRO INC. 

GREEN CONSTRUCTION 

INC. CRS CONTRACTORS INC. 

STATE LINE CONSTRUCTION CO 

INC. 

CARBRO CONSTRUCTORS 

CORP GRADE CONSTRUCTION 

 $                                    2,626,124.63 

LIMA CHARLIE 

CONSTRUCTION 

 $                                        2,345,345.00  $                                 2,283,169.25 

COLONNELLI BROTHERS, 

INC 



NUMBER OF BIDDERS 6

NAME OF BIDDER  PRINTING SUPPLIES USA LLC OFFICE BASICS, INC. CMF BUSINESS SUPPLIES, INC. PAPER CLIP SUPPLY

SAUDER MANUFACTURING CO. 

DBA SAUDER EDUCATION, DBA 

BUTLER HUMAN SERVICES

W.B MASON

ADDRESS
666 PLAINSBORO ROAD, SUITE 

1237
22 CREEK CIRCLE 3622 KENNEDY ROAD 151 KNICKERBOCKER ROAD 930 W BARRE ROAD 59 CENTRE STREET

CITY, STATE, ZIP PLAINSBORO, NJ 08536 BOOTHWYN, PA 19061 SOUTH PLAINFIELD, NJ 07080 ENGLEWOOD, NJ 07631 ARCHBOLD, OH 43502 BROCKTON, MA 02303

CONTACT LUKE XU KATHERINE HUNTER D.J. HUNSINGER ALEXANDER NUNEZ RACHEL SHORT JOHN VARGA

TELEPHONE 609.799.3800 800.541.5855 908.753.0800 201.966.7894 419.446.4179 888.926.2766 EXT 5179

FAX 609.228.7579 800.255.4049 908.753.0420 916.384.2728 419.446.4945

E-MAIL
CUSTOMERCARE@PRINTINGS

UPPLIESUSA.COM

KHUNTER@OFFICEBASICS.

COM
DJ@CMF.NET CS@PAPERCLIPSUPPLY.COM SALES@SAUDERMFG.COM

JOHN.VARGA@WBMASON.C

OM

NJ SAVI DESIGNATION N/A N/A
SMALL BUSINESS AND 

VETERAN OWNED BUSINESS 

ENTERPRISE 
SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE N/A N/A

ADDENDUM NO.ONE SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

INDEMNIFICATION AND INSURANCE 

REQUIREMENTS
SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

INSURANCE CERTIFICATE INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED OK

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED OK SIGNED AND DATED

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK OK OK OK OK

EIC CERT#45807 EXPIRES 11.15.26 CERT#26687 EXPIRES 6.15.23 CERT#10144 EXPIRES 3.15.27 REQUIRED IF AWARDED CERT#12476 EXPIRES 3.15.24 CERT#28060 EXPIRES 4.15.23

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

EXHIBIT A OK OK OK OK OK OK

IRAN CERT SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

CATALOG PS210915
S.P RICHARDS/ HON 

CATALOG / HON PRICER
ESSENDANT, OFFICESOURCE

ESSENDANT/ LEARNING 

ADVANTAGE / EDUCATORS 

RESOURCE / ACCO/ 

LEARNING RESOURCES

SAUDER EDUCATION 2021 

(VOL.211) CONTRACT PRICE LIST 

AND BUTLER HUMAN SERVICES 

2021 CONTRACT PRICE LIST

ESSENDENT

CONTRACT CONTACT TO ESTABLISH WEB 

ACCESS

LUKE XU 609.799.3800 

WWW.PRINTINGSUPPLIESUSA.COM

KATHERINE HUNTER 

610.633.0980 

KHUNTER@OFFICEBASICS.COM

D.J. HUNSINGER 908.753.0800 / 

CMFSUPPLIES.COM., 

OFFICESOURCEFURNITURE.COM

ALEXANDER NUNEZ/ EMAIL 

PURCHASE ORDER PREFERRED 

SINCE MOST OF OUR ACCOUNTS 

ARE NET 30 TERMS / 

HTTPS:PAPERCLIPSUPPLY.COM

RACHEL SHORT                            

SALES@SAUDERMFG.COM

CAROL SALVA 

CAROL.SALVA@WBMASON.COM

CATEGORIES
INSERT PERCENTAGE (%) DISCOUNT 

FROM RETAIL 

INSERT PERCENTAGE (%) 

DISCOUNT FROM RETAIL 

INSERT PERCENTAGE (%) DISCOUNT 

FROM RETAIL 

INSERT PERCENTAGE (%) DISCOUNT 

FROM RETAIL 

INSERT PERCENTAGE (%) DISCOUNT 

FROM RETAIL 

INSERT PERCENTAGE (%) 

DISCOUNT FROM RETAIL 

1. FURNITURE AND ACCESSORIES NO BID 27% 35% 2% SEE VOLUME DISCOUNT TIER 47.60%

GLOBAL NO BID NO BID NO BID 2% NO BID 40.00%

HON NO BID 60% NO BID 2% NO BID 55.30%

REFERENCE ADDITIONAL BRANDS NO BID NO BID 35% 20% NO BID
55.30% (BASYX), 47.50% 

(ALERA)

2. OFFICE TECHNOLOGY NO BID NO BID 15% 10% NO BID 51.30%

3. DELL TONER AND DELL CARTRIDGES 0-40% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

4. HEWLETT PACKARD TONER AND 

CARTRIDGES
40%-55% TONER, 30%-42% INK NO BID (-) 30% INK, 40 % TONER NO BID NO BID 45.80%

5.OEM TONER AND OEM CARTRIDGES 5-35% NO BID -15% NO BID NO BID 37.10%

6. REMANUFACTURED TONER AND 

CARTRIDGES
80% NO BID -45% 5% NO BID 48.8%

7. GENERAL OFFICE AND SCHOOL SUPPLIES NO BID NO BID
 (-) 40% TO 65% SEE 

EXCEPTIONS 
20% NO BID 67.70%

8. S.P. RICHARDS OFFICE PRODUCTS 

CATALOGUE % DISCOUNT FOR 

CATALOGUE ITEMS NOT LISTED

 NONE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

9. UNITED STATIONERS CATALOGUES % 

DISCOUNT FOR CATALOGUE ITEMS NOT 

LISTED 

NO BID NO BID
 SAME CATALOG AS 

ESSENDENT 
NO BID NO BID 26.20%

10. ESSENDANT COMPANY CATALOGUES % 

DISCOUNT FOR CATALOGUE ITEMS NOT 

LISTED 

NO BID NO BID
 (-) 15% TO 65% SEE 

EXCEPTIONS 
NO BID NO BID 26.20%

INSERT HOURLY RATE BELOW

11. HOURLY RATE FOR DELIVERY AND SET-

UP FOR FURNITURE
NO BID

 $75/ HOUR CHAIR ASSEMBLY 

$25 FIRST CHAIR, EACH 

ADDITIONAL CHAIR $15. 

WHOLE FURNITURE JOBS 10% 

OF CURRENT LIST PRICE. 

$95/HR - $20 CHAIR ASSEMBLY NO BID  8% OF TOTAL NET (MIN $150) 

$45.00 PER HOUR OR MINIMUM 

RATE OF $35 PER CHAIR 

ASSEMBLED

HOLDING PRICE BEYOND 60 DAY YES YES NO YES NO YES

 WILL EXTEND TO COOP MEMBERS YES YES YES YES YES YES

CONTINUITY OF SERVICE  YES YES YES NO YES YES

EXCEPTIONS NONE NONE SEE EXCEPTIONS PAGE SEE EXCEPTIONS PAGE SEE EXCEPTIONS PAGE NONE

FATAL FLAW NO NO NO NO NO NO   

BID RESULTS

CK09MERCER2021-12 OFFICE SUPPLIES FOR THE COUNTY OF MERCER AND CO-OP FOR A PERIOD OF TWO YEARS

BID OPENING DATE  :SEPTEMBER 21,2021 

mailto:CUSTOMERCARE@PRINTINGSUPPLIESUSA.COM
mailto:CUSTOMERCARE@PRINTINGSUPPLIESUSA.COM
mailto:KHUNTER@OFFICEBASICS.COM
mailto:KHUNTER@OFFICEBASICS.COM
mailto:DJ@CMF.NET
mailto:CS@PAPERCLIPSUPPLY.COM
mailto:SALES@SAUDERMFG.COM
mailto:JOHN.VARGA@WBMASON.COM
mailto:JOHN.VARGA@WBMASON.COM


NO. OF BIDDERS: 1

NAME OF BIDDER 
HFT MANAGEMENT INC., DBA 

GATEWAY OUTDOOR 

ADDRESS 18 PLEASANT GROVE RD

CITY, STATE, ZIP LONG VALLEY, NJ 07853

CONTACT CRAIG HEARD

TELEPHONE 908 684 8122

FAX 908 684 8133

E-MAIL
CHEARDJR@GATEWAYOUTDOOR

.COM
NJ SAVI DESIGNATION SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE 

INSURANCE INDEMNIFICATION PAGE SIGNED AND DATED

INSURANCE CERTIFICATE INCLUDED

NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION 

CERTIFICATE
OK

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP SIGNED AND DATED

EIC 51435 EXPIRES 09.15. 27

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 SIGNED AND DATED

IRAN CERTIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED

EXHIBIT A INCLUDED

NON-COLLUSION SIGNED AND DATED

THREE REFERENCES AND EXPERIENCE INCLUDED, TRADE TO REVIEW

HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS YES

PERCENTAGE OF GROSS 

ADVERTISING REVENUE TO COUNTY; 

GENERATED FROM THE SALE OF 

ADVERTISING

55%

CONTINUITY OF OPERATION YES

EXCEPTIONS NONE

FATAL FLAW NO

BID RESULTS

AB2021-31 MERCER COUNTY T.R.A.D.E. VEHICLE ADVERTISING 

BID OPENING DATE: SEPTEMBER 22, 2021

mailto:CHEARDJR@GATEWAYOUTDOOR.COM
mailto:CHEARDJR@GATEWAYOUTDOOR.COM

