
NO. OF BIDDERS: 5

NAME OF BIDDER 
CONTRACT FLOORING SYSTEMS, 

LLC.

COMMERCIAL INTERIORS 

DIRECT 
BUZZY'S CARPET, INC.

ACCESS COMPUTER 

FLOORS,LLC 
BEST VALUE RUGS& CARPET 

ADDRESS 40 COLLEGE STREET 1 S. CORPORATE DRIVE 238 14TH AVE 79 WELLINGTON PL 215 ROUTE 22 EAST 

CITY, STATE, ZIP TRENTON, NJ 08611 RIVERDALE, NJ 07457 SEASIDE PARK, NJ 08752 WESTWOOD, NJ 07675 GREEN BROOK, NJ 08812

CONTACT AMANDA J. DYOTT MAURICE GAYNOR RONALD BUSSEY MANUEL LOPEZ DALJIT CHADHA 

TELEPHONE 609- 393- 0123 973- 839- 8394 732 -656- 1320 201-594-1292 732-752-3528

FAX 609 -393 -0703 973- 839- 8376 732 -656 -1813 201-594-1291 732-529-4641

E-MAIL CONTFLRSYS@AOL.COM
SALES@COMMERCIALINTERIO

RSDIRECT.COM

BUZZYSCARPET@HOTMAIL.CO

M

MLOPEZ@ACCESS-

COMPUTER-FLOORS.COM 
DALJITRUG@AOL.COM 

NJ SAVI DESIGNATION SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE 
MINORITY AND SMALL 

BUSINESS ENTERPRISE 
SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE 

ADDENDUM ONE INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED 

ADDENDUM TWO INCLUDED INCLUDED  INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED 

PUBLIC WORKS CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION 657224 EXPIRES 1.28.22 589927 EXPIRES 05.07.22 612442 EXPIRES 1.30.23 623931 EXPIRES 5.2.22 67545 EXPIRES 10.23.22

INDEMNIFICATION AND INSURANCE 

REQUIREMENTS
SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK OK OK OK

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED OK SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

EXHIBIT A INCLUDED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED 

IRAN CERTIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED
SIGNED AND DATED/MUST 

CHECK YES OR NO 

SIGNED AND DATED/MUST 

CHECK YES OR NO 

PREVAILING WAGE CERTIFICATION OK OK OK OK OK

EIC 43360 EXPIRES 5.15.2023 16761 EXPIRES 06.15.2022 35990 EXPIRES 10.15.25 REQUIRED IF AWARDED 44965 EXPIRES 5.15.24

HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS YES YES YES YES NO

EXTEND TO COOP YES YES YES YES YES 

CONTINUITY OF SERVICE YES YES YES YES YES 

FATAL FLAW NO NO NO NO NO

EXCEPTIONS YES, AGENCIES TO REVIEW NONE NONE ERROR ON PROPOSAL FORM NONE 

BID RESULTS

CK09MERCER2021-22 CARPET AND FLOORING INSTALLATION AND REPAIR FOR THE COUNTY OF MERCER                                                                                                                                                                                                           

AND THE MERCER COUNTY COOPERATIVE CONTRACT PURCHASING SYSTEM FOR A PERIOD OF TWO (2) YEARS WITH THE OPTION TO EXTEND ONE (1) YEAR BASED UPON THE INDEX RATE

BID OPENING DATE: JANUARY 12,2022
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mailto:SALES@COMMERCIALINTERIORSDIRECT.COM
mailto:SALES@COMMERCIALINTERIORSDIRECT.COM
mailto:SALES@COMMERCIALINTERIORSDIRECT.COM
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ITEM NO. TYPE DESCRIPTION
GLUED/DOUBLE 

GLUED OR SELF STICK
BRAND/COLLECTION

 BRAND OR EQUIVALENT ACCEPTABLE 

FOR LINES THAT ARE NOT SHADED, INSERT 

BRAND AND LINE

LABOR COST PER SQUARE 

YARD FOR NEW 

INSTALLATIONS

MATERIALS COST 

DELIVERED FOB 

DESTINATION  PER 

SQUARE YARD FOR NEW 

INSTALLATION

TOTAL FOR LABOR AND 

MATERIALS FOR NEW 

INSTALLATIONS 

DELIVERED AND 

INSTALLED

1 28.0 oz Unitary Back Performance Broadloom GLUED
PHILADELPHIA QUEEN COMMERICAL DIVIDEND J0081 OR 

EQUIVALENT 
MOHAWK CONNECTIC 28OZ  $                                  7.75  $                            10.97  $                           18.72 

2 28.0 oz Unitary Back Performance Broadloom GLUED
PHILADELPHIA QUEEN COMMERICAL VOCATION III 54272 

OR EQUIVALENT 
MOHAWK CONNECTIC 28OZ  $                                  7.75  $                            10.97  $                           18.72 

3 26.0 oz Unitary Back Performance Broadloom GLUED
PHILADELPHIA QUEEN COMMERICAL VOCATION III 54270 

OR EQUIVALENT 
MOHAWK NEW BASICS III 26OZ  $                                  7.75  $                            10.03  $                           17.78 

4 28 oz. Action Back Class 1 Moderate GLUED PATCRAFT/SOCCRATES II 28 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

5 Carpet Tile/Modular 17 oz. GLUED OR SS LEES WORK IT, TILE 17 OR EQUIVALENT MOHAWK NEW BASICS III 18OZ  $                                  7.75                                17.23                               24.98 

6 Carpet Tile/Modular 17 oz. GLUED OR SS LEES BENDING EARTH COLLECTION J+J IMPULSE III 20 OZ  $                                  7.75                                18.25                               26.00 

7 Carpet Tile/Modular 17 oz. GLUED OR SS LEES CLASS ACT MOHAWK FORWARD VISION 20OZ  $                                  7.75                                21.55                               29.30 

8 Carpet Tile/Modular 22 oz. GLUED OR SS LEES FLAMESTITCH III J+J TWEED 25 OZ  $                                  7.75                                23.74                               31.49 

9 Carpet Tile/Modular 26 oz. GLUED OR SS QUEEN/CHANGE IN ATTITUDE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

10 Carpet Tile/Modular 24 oz.   INCLUDED PATRCRAFT/BIG SPLASH/MODULAR NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

11 Carpet Tile/Modular 25 oz. GLUED OR SS MOHAWK NEWCOMER J+J BOUCLE 25 OZ  $                                  7.75  $                            23.74  $                           31.49 

12 Carpet Tile/Modular 26 oz. GLUED OR SS LEES FACULTY REMIX MOHAWK FACULTY REMIX 26OZ  $                                  7.75  $                            25.51  $                           33.26 

13 ROPPE NORTHERN TIMBERS  $                                  1.50  $                              2.64  $                             4.14 

14 ARMSTRONG VINYL COMPOSITION TILE  $                                  1.10  $                              1.00  $                             2.10 

15 ROPPE TYPE 994  $                                  1.50  $                              7.08  $                             8.58 

16 ROPPE TYPE 992  $                                  1.50  $                              6.83  $                             8.33 

17 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

18  $                             9.50 

COST PER SQ. FT. FOR ARMSTRONG RUBBER FLOOR TILE OR EQUIVALENT SQUARE RAISED PATTERN

CK09MERCER2021-22 CARPET AND FLOORING PROPOSAL FOR A PERIOD OF TWO (2) YEARS WITH OPTION TO EXTEND ONE (1) YEAR

CONTRACT FLOORING INC. 

*THE BRANDS REFERENCED BELOW ON LINES FOUR, FIVE, NINE, TEN, AND TWELVE ARE CURRENTLY INSTALLED IN FACILITIES THROUGHOUT THE COUNTY HOWEVER FOR LINE FIVE EQUIVALENT WILL BE ACCEPTED; HOWEVER, BIDDERS MAY PROVIDE PRICING FOR  THE BRAND OR AN EQUIVALENT 

FOR LINES ONE, TWO, THREE, SEVEN, EIGHT, NINE, AND TWELVE

COST PER SQ. FT. FOR NORTHERN TIMBERS OR EQUIVALENT

COST PER SQ. FT. FOR VINYL COMPOSITION TILE

10% MARKUP ON WHOLESALE PRICING INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO SYNTHETIC HAIR OR JUTE PADDING, TREADS, REDUCERS, PATCHES, DOUBLE GLUE, ETC.

COST PER SQ. FT. FOR ARMSTRONG RUBBER FLOOR TILE OR EQUIVALENT ROUND RAISED PATTERN

COST PER SQ. FOR ARMSTRONG SAFETY ZONE™ SLIP-RETARDANT TILE OR EQUIVALENT

COST PER SQUARE YARD FOR RIP UP, REMOVAL AND CARTAGE TO CERTIFIED RECLAMATION FACILITY

NAME AND LOCATION OF RECLAMATION FACILITY CARPET CYCLE ,LLC  ROSELLE, NJ 



ITEM NO. TYPE DESCRIPTION

GLUED/DOUBLE 

GLUED OR SELF 

STICK

BRAND/COLLECTION

 BRAND OR EQUIVALENT 

ACCEPTABLE FOR LINES THAT ARE 

NOT SHADED, INSERT BRAND AND 

LINE

LABOR COST PER 

SQUARE YARD FOR 

NEW INSTALLATIONS

MATERIALS COST 

DELIVERED FOB 

DESTINATION  PER 

SQUARE YARD FOR NEW 

INSTALLATION

TOTAL FOR LABOR AND 

MATERIALS FOR NEW 

INSTALLATIONS 

DELIVERED AND 

INSTALLED

1 28.0 oz Unitary Back Performance Broadloom GLUED
PHILADELPHIA QUEEN COMMERCIAL DIVIDEND 

J0081 OR EQUIVALENT 

EF Contract Archive #ACH 

Broadloom *
 $                      13.00  $                              18.90  $                            31.90 

2 28.0 oz Unitary Back Performance Broadloom GLUED
PHILADELPHIA QUEEN COMMERCIAL VOCATION III 

54272 OR EQUIVALENT 
EF Contract Loft #6LFT Broadloom*  $                      13.00  $                              26.80  $                            39.80 

3 26.0 oz Unitary Back Performance Broadloom GLUED
PHILADELPHIA QUEEN COMMERCIAL VOCATION III 

54270 OR EQUIVALENT 

EF Contract Relay #6RLY 

Broadloom *
 $                      13.00  $                              16.00  $                            29.00 

4 28 oz. Action Back Class 1 Moderate GLUED PATCRAFT/SOCCRATES II 28 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

5 Carpet Tile/Modular 17 oz. GLUED OR SS LEES WORK IT, TILE 17 OR EQUIVALENT EF Contract Polaris #TPLR Modular *  $                      13.00  $                              20.80  $                            33.80 

6 Carpet Tile/Modular 17 oz. GLUED OR SS LEES BENDING EARTH COLLECTION
EF Contract Contact Sport #TCON 

Modular *
 $                      13.00  $                              28.05  $                            41.05 

7 Carpet Tile/Modular 17 oz. GLUED OR SS LEES CLASS ACT
EF Contract Common Thread 

#TCMT Modular *
 $                      13.00  $                              29.80  $                            42.80 

8 Carpet Tile/Modular 22 oz. GLUED OR SS LEES FLAMESTITCH III
EF Contract Batiste II #TBTT Modular 

*
 $                      13.00  $                              34.95  $                            47.95 

9 Carpet Tile/Modular 26 oz. GLUED OR SS QUEEN/CHANGE IN ATTITUDE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

10 Carpet Tile/Modular 24 oz.   INCLUDED PATRCRAFT/BIG SPLASH/MODULAR NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

11 Carpet Tile/Modular 25 oz. GLUED OR SS MOHAWK NEWCOMER EF Contract Access #AX Modular *  $                      13.00  $                              44.20  $                            57.20 

12 Carpet Tile/Modular 26 oz. GLUED OR SS LEES FACULTY REMIX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

13 Roppe Northern Timbers  $                        3.75  $                                4.39  $                              8.14 

14 Congoleum Alternatives **  $                        2.00  $                                1.00  $                              3.00 

15
Armstrong Rubber Tile Raised 

Square Pattern
 $                        3.50  $                              10.55  $                            14.05 

16
Armstrong Rubber Tile Raised 

Round Pattern
 $                        3.50  $                              10.55  $                            14.05 

17 Armstrong Safety Zone  $                        2.25  $                                7.75  $                            10.00 

18  $                            12.75 

COST PER SQ. FT. FOR ARMSTRONG RUBBER FLOOR TILE OR EQUIVALENT SQUARE RAISED PATTERN

CK09MERCER2021-22 CARPET AND FLOORING PROPOSAL FOR A PERIOD OF TWO (2) YEARS WITH OPTION TO EXTEND ONE (1) YEAR

COMMERCIAL INTERIORS DIRECT

*THE BRANDS REFERENCED BELOW ON LINES FOUR, FIVE, NINE, TEN, AND TWELVE ARE CURRENTLY INSTALLED IN FACILITIES THROUGHOUT THE COUNTY HOWEVER FOR LINE FIVE EQUIVALENT WILL BE ACCEPTED; HOWEVER, BIDDERS MAY PROVIDE 

PRICING FOR  THE BRAND OR AN EQUIVALENT FOR LINES ONE, TWO, THREE, SEVEN, EIGHT, NINE, AND TWELVE

COST PER SQ. FT. FOR NORTHERN TIMBERS OR EQUIVALENT

COST PER SQ. FT. FOR VINYL COMPOSITION TILE

10% MARKUP ON WHOLESALE PRICING INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO SYNTHETIC HAIR OR JUTE PADDING, TREADS, REDUCERS, PATCHES, DOUBLE GLUE, ETC.

COST PER SQ. FT. FOR ARMSTRONG RUBBER FLOOR TILE OR EQUIVALENT ROUND RAISED PATTERN

COST PER SQ. FOR ARMSTRONG SAFETY ZONE™ SLIP-RETARDANT TILE OR EQUIVALENT

COST PER SQUARE YARD FOR RIP UP, REMOVAL AND CARTAGE TO CERTIFIED RECLAMATION FACILITY 12.75$                                                                   

NAME AND LOCATION OF RECLAMATION FACILITY CARPET CYCLE ,LLC  ROSELLE, NJ 



ITEM NO. TYPE DESCRIPTION

GLUED/DOUBLE 

GLUED OR SELF 

STICK

BRAND/COLLECTION

 BRAND OR EQUIVALENT 

ACCEPTABLE FOR LINES THAT ARE 

NOT SHADED, INSERT BRAND AND 

LINE

LABOR COST PER 

SQUARE YARD FOR 

NEW 

INSTALLATIONS

MATERIALS COST 

DELIVERED FOB 

DESTINATION  PER 

SQUARE YARD FOR 

NEW INSTALLATION

TOTAL FOR LABOR AND 

MATERIALS FOR NEW 

INSTALLATIONS 

DELIVERED AND 

INSTALLED

1 28.0 oz Unitary Back Performance Broadloom GLUED
PHILADELPHIA QUEEN COMMERICAL DIVIDEND J0081 OR 

EQUIVALENT 
Shaw Scoreboard II 28 oz 54675  $                       8.50  $                      14.50  $                            23.00 

2 28.0 oz Unitary Back Performance Broadloom GLUED
PHILADELPHIA QUEEN COMMERICAL VOCATION III 54272 

OR EQUIVALENT 
Shaw Capital III 28 oz. 54280  $                       8.50  $                      13.34  $                            21.84 

3 26.0 oz Unitary Back Performance Broadloom GLUED
PHILADELPHIA QUEEN COMMERICAL VOCATION III 54270 

OR EQUIVALENT 
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

4 28 oz. Action Back Class 1 Moderate GLUED PATCRAFT/SOCCRATES II 28  $                       8.50  $                      23.30  $                            31.80 

5 Carpet Tile/Modular 17 oz. GLUED OR SS LEES WORK IT, TILE 17 OR EQUIVALENT NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

6 Carpet Tile/Modular 17 oz. GLUED OR SS LEES BENDING EARTH COLLECTION NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

7 Carpet Tile/Modular 17 oz. GLUED OR SS LEES CLASS ACT NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

8 Carpet Tile/Modular 22 oz. GLUED OR SS LEES FLAMESTITCH III NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

9 Carpet Tile/Modular 26 oz. GLUED OR SS QUEEN/CHANGE IN ATTITUDE  $                       8.50  $                      19.62  $                            28.12 

10 Carpet Tile/Modular 24 oz.   INCLUDED PATRCRAFT/BIG SPLASH/MODULAR  $                       8.50  $                      24.27  $                            32.77 

11 Carpet Tile/Modular 25 oz. GLUED OR SS MOHAWK NEWCOMER NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

12 Carpet Tile/Modular 26 oz. GLUED OR SS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

13 Shaw In The Grain II 30 ml.  $                       0.50  $                        2.28  $                              2.78 

14 Armstrong Excelon  $                       1.10  $                        0.85  $                              1.95 

15 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

16 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

17 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

18  $                            14.00 

COST PER SQ. FT. FOR ARMSTRONG RUBBER FLOOR TILE OR EQUIVALENT SQUARE RAISED PATTERN

CK09MERCER2021-22 CARPET AND FLOORING PROPOSAL FOR A PERIOD OF TWO (2) YEARS WITH OPTION TO EXTEND ONE (1) YEAR

BUZZY'S CARPET 

*THE BRANDS REFERENCED BELOW ON LINES FOUR, FIVE, NINE, TEN, AND TWELVE ARE CURRENTLY INSTALLED IN FACILITIES THROUGHOUT THE COUNTY HOWEVER FOR LINE FIVE EQUIVALENT WILL BE ACCEPTED; HOWEVER, BIDDERS MAY PROVIDE PRICING FOR  THE BRAND 

OR AN EQUIVALENT FOR LINES ONE, TWO, THREE, SEVEN, EIGHT, NINE, AND TWELVE

COST PER SQ. FT. FOR NORTHERN TIMBERS OR EQUIVALENT

COST PER SQ. FT. FOR VINYL COMPOSITION TILE

10% MARKUP ON WHOLESALE PRICING INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO SYNTHETIC HAIR OR JUTE PADDING, TREADS, REDUCERS, PATCHES, DOUBLE GLUE, ETC.

COST PER SQ. FT. FOR ARMSTRONG RUBBER FLOOR TILE OR EQUIVALENT ROUND RAISED PATTERN

COST PER SQ. FOR ARMSTRONG SAFETY ZONE™ SLIP-RETARDANT TILE OR EQUIVALENT

COST PER SQUARE YARD FOR RIP UP, REMOVAL AND CARTAGE TO CERTIFIED RECLAMATION FACILITY

NAME AND LOCATION OF RECLAMATION FACILITY CARPET CYCLE ,LLC  ROSELLE, NJ 



ITEM NO. TYPE DESCRIPTION

GLUED/DOUBLE 

GLUED OR SELF 

STICK

BRAND/COLLECTION

 BRAND OR EQUIVALENT 

ACCEPTABLE FOR LINES THAT 

ARE NOT SHADED, INSERT 

BRAND AND LINE

LABOR COST PER 

SQUARE YARD FOR 

NEW 

INSTALLATIONS

MATERIALS COST 

DELIVERED FOB 

DESTINATION  PER 

SQUARE YARD FOR 

NEW INSTALLATION

TOTAL FOR LABOR 

AND MATERIALS FOR 

NEW INSTALLATIONS 

DELIVERED AND 

INSTALLED

1 28.0 oz Unitary Back Performance Broadloom GLUED
PHILADELPHIA QUEEN COMMERICAL DIVIDEND J0081 OR 

EQUIVALENT 
 $                                     31.25  $                     21.90  $                            2.20  $                        55.35 

2 28.0 oz Unitary Back Performance Broadloom GLUED
PHILADELPHIA QUEEN COMMERICAL VOCATION III 54272 

OR EQUIVALENT 
 $                                     31.25  $                     21.90  $                            2.20  $                        55.35 

3 26.0 oz Unitary Back Performance Broadloom GLUED
PHILADELPHIA QUEEN COMMERICAL VOCATION III 54270 

OR EQUIVALENT 
 $                                     31.25  $                     21.90  $                            2.20  $                        55.35 

4 28 oz. Action Back Class 1 Moderate GLUED PATCRAFT/SOCCRATES II 28 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

5 Carpet Tile/Modular 17 oz. GLUED OR SS LEES WORK IT, TILE 17 OR EQUIVALENT  $                                     37.50  $                     18.75  $                            2.20  $                        58.45 

6 Carpet Tile/Modular 17 oz. GLUED OR SS LEES BENDING EARTH COLLECTION  $                                     37.50  $                     18.75  $                            2.20  $                        58.45 

7 Carpet Tile/Modular 17 oz. GLUED OR SS LEES CLASS ACT  $                                     37.50  $                     18.75  $                            2.20  $                        58.45 

8 Carpet Tile/Modular 22 oz. GLUED OR SS LEES FLAMESTITCH III  $                                     37.50  $                     18.75  $                            2.20  $                        58.45 

9 Carpet Tile/Modular 26 oz. GLUED OR SS QUEEN/CHANGE IN ATTITUDE  $                                     37.50  $                     18.75  $                            2.20  $                        58.45 

10 Carpet Tile/Modular 24 oz.   INCLUDED PATRCRAFT/BIG SPLASH/MODULAR  $                                     37.50  $                     18.75  $                            2.20  $                        58.45 

11 Carpet Tile/Modular 25 oz. GLUED OR SS MOHAWK NEWCOMER  $                                     37.50  $                     18.75  $                            2.20  $                        58.45 

12 Carpet Tile/Modular 26 oz. GLUED OR SS LEES FACULTY REMIX  $                                     37.50  $                     18.75  $                            2.20  $                        58.45 

13 5.00$                                         $                       6.25  $                            0.50  $                        11.75 

14 2.20$                                         $                       4.40  $                            0.50  $                           7.10 

15 5.00$                                         $                       6.60  $                            0.50  $                        12.10 

16 9.50$                                         $                       5.00  $                            0.50  $                        15.00 

17 9.50$                                         $                       5.00  $                            0.50  $                        15.00 

18  $                           6.00 

COST PER SQ. FT. FOR ARMSTRONG RUBBER FLOOR TILE OR EQUIVALENT SQUARE RAISED PATTERN

CK09MERCER2021-22 CARPET AND FLOORING PROPOSAL FOR A PERIOD OF TWO (2) YEARS WITH OPTION TO EXTEND ONE (1) YEAR

ACCESS COMPUTER FLOORS,LLC 

*THE BRANDS REFERENCED BELOW ON LINES FOUR, FIVE, NINE, TEN, AND TWELVE ARE CURRENTLY INSTALLED IN FACILITIES THROUGHOUT THE COUNTY HOWEVER FOR LINE FIVE EQUIVALENT WILL BE ACCEPTED; HOWEVER, BIDDERS MAY PROVIDE PRICING FOR  

THE BRAND OR AN EQUIVALENT FOR LINES ONE, TWO, THREE, SEVEN, EIGHT, NINE, AND TWELVE

COST PER SQ. FT. FOR NORTHERN TIMBERS OR EQUIVALENT

COST PER SQ. FT. FOR VINYL COMPOSITION TILE

10% MARKUP ON WHOLESALE PRICING INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO SYNTHETIC HAIR OR JUTE PADDING, TREADS, REDUCERS, PATCHES, DOUBLE GLUE, ETC.

COST PER SQ. FT. FOR ARMSTRONG RUBBER FLOOR TILE OR EQUIVALENT ROUND RAISED PATTERN

COST PER SQ. FOR ARMSTRONG SAFETY ZONE™ SLIP-RETARDANT TILE OR EQUIVALENT

COST PER SQUARE YARD FOR RIP UP, REMOVAL AND CARTAGE TO CERTIFIED RECLAMATION FACILITY

NAME AND LOCATION OF RECLAMATION FACILITY CARPET CYCLE ,LLC  ROSELLE, NJ 



ITEM NO. TYPE DESCRIPTION

GLUED/DOUBLE 

GLUED OR SELF 

STICK

BRAND/COLLECTION

 BRAND OR EQUIVALENT ACCEPTABLE FOR 

LINES THAT ARE NOT SHADED, INSERT 

BRAND AND LINE

LABOR COST PER 

SQUARE YARD FOR NEW 

INSTALLATIONS

MATERIALS COST DELIVERED 

FOB DESTINATION  PER 

SQUARE YARD FOR NEW 

INSTALLATION

TOTAL FOR LABOR AND 

MATERIALS FOR NEW 

INSTALLATIONS DELIVERED 

AND INSTALLED

1 28.0 oz Unitary Back Performance Broadloom GLUED
PHILADELPHIA QUEEN COMMERICAL DIVIDEND J0081 OR 

EQUIVALENT 
PHILLI 54766-28OZ FRANCHISE II  $                              5.89  $                                     15.56  $                                   21.45 

2 28.0 oz Unitary Back Performance Broadloom GLUED
PHILADELPHIA QUEEN COMMERICAL VOCATION III 54272 OR 

EQUIVALENT 
PHILLI 54675-28 OZ SCOREBOARD II  $                              5.89  $                                     15.56  $                                   21.45 

3 26.0 oz Unitary Back Performance Broadloom GLUED
PHILADELPHIA QUEEN COMMERICAL VOCATION III 54270 OR 

EQUIVALENT 
NEYLAND 2603  $                              5.89  $                                       8.99  $                                   14.88 

4 28 oz. Action Back Class 1 Moderate GLUED PATCRAFT/SOCCRATES II 28 TILE  $                              8.49  $                                     31.20  $                                   39.69 

5 Carpet Tile/Modular 17 oz. GLUED OR SS LEES WORK IT, TILE 17 OR EQUIVALENT  $                              8.49  $                                     31.20  $                                   39.69 

6 Carpet Tile/Modular 17 oz. GLUED OR SS LEES BENDING EARTH COLLECTION  $                              8.49  $                                     31.20  $                                   39.69 

7 Carpet Tile/Modular 17 oz. GLUED OR SS LEES CLASS ACT  $                              8.49  $                                     31.20  $                                   39.69 

8 Carpet Tile/Modular 22 oz. GLUED OR SS LEES FLAMESTITCH III  $                              8.49  $                                     31.20  $                                   39.69 

9 Carpet Tile/Modular 26 oz. GLUED OR SS QUEEN/CHANGE IN ATTITUDE  $                              8.49  $                                     26.79  $                                   35.28 

10 Carpet Tile/Modular 24 oz.   INCLUDED PATRCRAFT/BIG SPLASH/MODULAR  $                              8.49  $                                     31.20  $                                   39.69 

11 Carpet Tile/Modular 25 oz. GLUED OR SS MOHAWK NEWCOMER  $                              8.49  $                                     15.56  $                                   24.05 

12 Carpet Tile/Modular 26 oz. GLUED OR SS LEES FACULTY REMIX  $                              8.49  $                                     31.20  $                                   39.69 

13  $                                  -    $                                       7.89  $                                     7.89 

14  $                                  -    $                                       0.79  $                                     0.79 

15  $                                  -    $                                       8.69  $                                     8.69 

16  $                                  -    $                                       8.69  $                                     8.69 

17  $                                  -    $                                       6.45  $                                     6.45 

18  $                                     4.95 

COST PER SQ. FT. FOR ARMSTRONG RUBBER FLOOR TILE OR EQUIVALENT SQUARE RAISED PATTERN

CK09MERCER2021-22 CARPET AND FLOORING PROPOSAL FOR A PERIOD OF TWO (2) YEARS WITH OPTION TO EXTEND ONE (1) YEAR

BEST VALUE RUGS& CARPET 

*THE BRANDS REFERENCED BELOW ON LINES FOUR, FIVE, NINE, TEN, AND TWELVE ARE CURRENTLY INSTALLED IN FACILITIES THROUGHOUT THE COUNTY HOWEVER FOR LINE FIVE EQUIVALENT WILL BE ACCEPTED; HOWEVER, BIDDERS MAY PROVIDE PRICING FOR  THE BRAND OR AN EQUIVALENT FOR 

LINES ONE, TWO, THREE, SEVEN, EIGHT, NINE, AND TWELVE

COST PER SQ. FT. FOR NORTHERN TIMBERS OR EQUIVALENT

COST PER SQ. FT. FOR VINYL COMPOSITION TILE

10% MARKUP ON WHOLESALE PRICING INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO SYNTHETIC HAIR OR JUTE PADDING, TREADS, REDUCERS, PATCHES, DOUBLE GLUE, ETC.

COST PER SQ. FT. FOR ARMSTRONG RUBBER FLOOR TILE OR EQUIVALENT ROUND RAISED PATTERN

COST PER SQ. FOR ARMSTRONG SAFETY ZONE™ SLIP-RETARDANT TILE OR EQUIVALENT

COST PER SQUARE YARD FOR RIP UP, REMOVAL AND CARTAGE TO CERTIFIED RECLAMATION FACILITY

NAME AND LOCATION OF RECLAMATION FACILITY CARPET CYCLE ,LLC  ROSELLE, NJ 


