BID RESULTS

CKO9MERCER2022-02 LUMBER AND BULDING SUPPLIES FOR A PERIOD OF ONE (1)
YEAR FOR THE COUNTY OF MERCER AND CO-OP

BID OPENING DATE: MARCH 1,2022

NO. OF BIDDERS:

1

NAME OF BIDDER:

TAGUE LUMBER,INC.

ADDRESS 325 MEDIA STATION RD
CITY, STATE, ZIP MEDIA, PA 19063
CONTACT JEFF SANDAVER
TELEPHONE 215-848-2500

FAX 215-848-0433
E-MAIL JANDAVER@TAGUELUMBER.COM
NJ SAVI DESIGNATION N/A

EXTEND TO COOPERATIVE YES

INSURANCE AND INDEMNIFICATION

SIGNED AND DATED

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP FORM OK

IRAN CERTIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED
EXHIBIT A INCLUDED

EIC REQUIRED IF AWARDED

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1

SIGNED AND DATED

HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS NO
CONTINUITY OF SERVICE NO
EXCEPTIONS NONE
FATAL FLAW NO



mailto:JANDAVER@TAGUELUMBER.COM

CKO9MERCER2022-02 BUILDING MATERIALS PROPOSAL - THE COUNTY WILL ACCEPT THE BRAND NAMES STATED OR AN EQUIVALENT BRAND

TAGUE LUMBER,INC.

niM CATEGORY BUILDING MATERIAL DESCRIPTION CASE COUNT | COST PER CASE COUNT | VENDOR CAsE COuNt | €031 FOR VERDOR
1 ADHESIVE 36- Titebond Construction ADH 2902 24 | NO BID
2 ADHESIVES Vinyl Floor Tile Adhesive (Gallon) 1 | NO BID
3 ADHESIVES Tile Bound Il Wood Glue 1 Gal Bottles 1 | NOBID
4 ADHESIVES Vinyl Cove Base Adhesive, 24- 11 oz Tubes / Cs (CASE) 1 | NO BID
5 ADHESIVES PL200 Multi-Purpose Adhesive, 12- 11 oz Tubes / Cs (CASE) 12 | NOBID
3 ADHESIVES White Late Caulking-, Paintable, 12- 11 oz Tubes / Cs (CASE) 12 | NO BID
7 ADHESIVES White Silicone Caulking, Paintable, 12- 11 oz- Tubes / Cs (CASE) 12 | NO BID
8 ADHESIVES Clear Silicone Caulking- 11 oz Tubes, 12 Tubes / Cs (CASE) 12 | NO BID
9 ADHESIVES Glazing Compound 11 oz. Tubes, 12 Tubes/Cs (CASE) 12 | NO BID
10 ADHESIVES Mortar Mix - 80 Ib bags 1 | NOBID
11 ADHESIVES Gravel Mix - 80 Ib bags 1 | NOBID
12 ADHESIVES Sand Mix - 80 Ib bags 1 | NOBID
13 ADHESIVES Portland Cement - 94 Ib bags 1 | NOBID
14 CERAMIC & QUARRY TILE GROUT 7 Ib bags sand grout poly blend 1 | NOBID
15 CERAMIC & QUARRY TILE GROUT 5 Ib bags wall grout 12x24 bag 1 | NOBID
16 CERAMIC & QUARRY TILE GROUT 1 gallon container of floor sealer 1 | NOBID
17 CERAMIC & QUARRY TILE SUB FLOOR 3"X 5" X 1/4" backer board 1 | NOBID
18 CERAMIC & QUARRY TILE SUB FLOOR 3"x 8" x 1/2" backer board 1 | NOBID
19 COMPOSITE DECKING(TREX) 5/4" x 6" x 20' windchester grey & saddle Fiberon 11% 86.94 | $ 1.00 | $ 86.94
20 COMPOSITE DECKING(TREX) 5/4" x 6" x 16' windchester grey & saddle Fiberon 11% 69.55 | $ 1.00 | $ 69.55
21 COMPOSITE DECKING(TREX) 50 Ib. ss decking screws 2 %2 * long 1 | NOBID
22 COMPOSITE RAILING (FIBERON) Straight 8 ft. x 42" 1 | NOBID
23 COMPOSITE RAILING (FIBERON) Straight 6 ft. x 42" 1 | NOBID
24 COMPOSITE RAILING (FIBERON) Stair kits — 6" x 36" 1 | NOBID
25 COMPOSITE RAILING (FIBERON) Surface mount brackets for concrete 1 | NOBID
26 COMPOSITE RAILING (FIBERON) Post sleeve — 108" x 4 x 4 NO BID
27 COMPOSITE RAILING (FIBERON) Post caps (Standard size is 4" x 4") 1 | NOBID
28 CONSTRUCTION TUBES 12" x 12" 1 | NOBID
29 CONSTRUCTION TUBES 16" x 12" 1 | NOBID
30 CONSTRUCTION TUBES 18" x 12 1 | NOBID
31 NGED PATIO DOORS (OUTSWING & INSWING) VINYL (FRENCHWOC :g?dev’j;"e“oo series- 3 ft unit (pre-hung) with Standard Jom- ¢ 9/16" and Door 1 [nosiD
32 INSULATION (JOHNS MANVILLE OR EQUIVALENT) Wide faces R-13 insulation - 3 1/2" x 15" 1 | NOBID
33 INSULATION (JOHNS MANVILLE OR EQUIVALENT) R-19 kraft faced fiber glass insulation - 6" x 15" 1 | NO BID
34 INSULATION (JOHNS MANVILLE OR EQUIVALENT) Great stuff insulating foam 12 oz. cans 12 | NO BID
35 PVC MATERIALS(AZEK) Adhesive - 16 oz cans 6| NO BID
36 PVC MATERIALS(AZEK) Corner board frontier 5/4 x 4" x 4" x 10" 11% 80.43 | $ 1.00 | $ 80.43
37 PVC MATERIALS(AZEK) Corner board frontier 5/4 x 4" x 4" x 20 11% 160.86 | $ 1.00|$ 160.86
38 PVC MATERIALS(AZEK) Sheets — traditional 12" x 4" x 10" 11% 17875 | $ 1.00|$ 178.75
39 PVC MATERIALS(AZEK) Sheets — traditional %" x 4" x 12" 11% 347.56 | $ 1.00|$ 347.56
40 PVC MATERIALS(AZEK) Trim board sizes frontier 1" x 4" x 18’ 1% 30.36 | $ 100 % 30.36
41 PVC MATERIALS(AZEK) Trim board sizes frontier 1" x 6" x 18’ 1% 49.20 | $ 1.00|$ 49.20
42 PVC MATERIALS(AZEK) Trim board sizes frontier 1" x 8" x 18" 11% 6291 | $ 1.00 | $ 69.21
43 PVC MATERIALS(AZEK) Trim board sizes frontier 1" x 10" x 18" 1% 79.66 | $ 100 % 79.66
44 PVC MATERIALS(AZEK) Trim board sizes frontier 1" x 12" x 18’ 11% 9730 | $ 1.00 | $ 97.30
45 PVC MATERIALS(AZEK) Trim board sizes frontier 5/4" x 4" x 18’ 11% 40.66 | $ 1.00 | $ 40.06
46 PVC MATERIALS(AZEK) Trim board sizes frontier 5/4" x 6" x 18" 11% 5833 | $ 1.00|$ 58.33
47 PVC MATERIALS(AZEK) Trim board sizes frontier 5/4" x 8" x 18" 11% 7804 | $ 1.00|$ 78.04
48 PVC MATERIALS(AZEK) Trim board sizes frontier 5/4" x 10" x 18’ 11% 10231 | $ 1.00|$ 102.31
49 PVC MATERIALS(AZEK) Stainless Steel Screws 8 x 2 1/2 trim head white (qty 350) NO BID
50 ROOFING 15 Ib. felt 1 | NO BID
51 ROOFING Ice Water Shield Underlayment 66.8 2sq per roll 1 | NOBID
52 ROOFING Wet or Dry Roof Cement - 5 gal. containers 1 | NOBID
53 ROOFING Aluminum Roof Coating - 5 gal.cans 1 | NO BID
54 VINYL SOFFIT SIDING WHITE Vinyl F-channel 12" x 6" 1 | NO BID




CKO9MERCER2022-02 BUILDING MATERIALS PROPOSAL - THE COUNTY WILL ACCEPT THE BRAND NAMES STATED OR AN EQUIVALENT BRAND

TAGUE LUMBER,INC.
niM CATEGORY BUILDING MATERIAL DESCRIPTION CASE COUNT | COST PER CASE COUNT | VENDOR CAsE COuNt | €031 FOR VERDOR
55 VINYL SOFFIT SIDING WHITE Basket weave vinyl soffit perf t4 1 | NOBID
56 VINYL SOFFIT SIDING WHITE J-channel - white 5/8" 1 | NO BID
57 VINYL SOFFIT SIDING WHITE J-channel - white 1/2" 1 | NO BID
58 VINYL SOFFIT SIDING WHITE White aluminum coil pvc 24" x 50' 1 | NO BID
59 VINYL SOFFIT SIDING WHITE Nichols Aluminum Nails 1 1/4" White Trim Nails 1 Ib 1 | NO BID
60 VINYL WINDOW REPLACEMENTS (IDEAL) White exterior, insulated glass with low e with half screen 22" x 30" 1 | NOBID
61 VINYL WINDOW REPLACEMENTS (IDEAL) White exterior, insulated glass with low e with half screen 24" x 38" 1 | NOBID
62 VINYL WINDOW REPLACEMENTS (IDEAL) White exterior, insulated glass with low e with half screen 36" x 36" 1 | NOBID
63 VINYL WINDOW REPLACEMENTS (IDEAL) White exterior, insulated glass with low e with half screen 24" x 48" 1 | NOBID
64 VINYL WINDOWS NEW CONSTRUCTION (ANDERSON) Double hung low e with screens 36" x 48" tw30310 1 | NOBID
65 VINYL WINDOWS NEW CONSTRUCTION (ANDERSON) Double hung low e with screens 36" x 36" tw30210 1 | NOBID
66 VINYL WINDOWS NEW CONSTRUCTION (ANDERSON) Double hung low e with screens 24" x 48" tw20310 1 | NOBID
67 SHEETROCK- (EACH) 4x8x'% 11% 16.61 | $ 1.00|$ 16.61
68 SHEETROCK- (EACH) 4x10x % 11% 2062 | $ 1.00|$ 20.62
69 SHEETROCK- (EACH) 4x8x5/8 11% 1885 | $ 1.00|$ 18.85
70 SHEETROCK- (EACH) 4x10x5/8 11% 2246 | $ 1.00|$ 22.46
71 SHEETROCK- (EACH) 4x12x5/8 11% 2695 | $ 1.00 | $ 26.95
72 SHEETROCK- (EACH) 4x12x % 11% 2474 | $ 1.00 | $ 24.74
73 SHEETROCK- (EACH) 4 x 8 x 2 Moisture Resistant 11% 2079 | $ 1.00 | $ 20.79
74 SHEETROCK- (EACH) 4 x 8 x 5/8 Moisture Restrained 11% 2225 | $ 1.00 | $ 22.25
75 COMPOUND Spackling Compound- 5 gal pails 11% 23.05 | $ 1.00 | $ 23.05
76 TAPE- (EACH) Perforated Spackling Tape / 250' rolls 1 | NOBID
77 CORNER BEAD 1" x 14" x 10" Metal Comer Bead 1 | NOBID
78 J CHANNEL " x 10" J-Channel, Plastic 1 | NOBID
79 J CHANNEL 5/8" x 10" J-Channel, Plastic 1 | NOBID
80 DRY WALL SCREWS Dry-wall Screws- coarse- No.2 Phillips size 1" 10m 1 | NOBID
81 DRY WALL SCREWS Dry-wall Screws- coarse- No.2 Phillips size 1 1/4" 8m 1 | NOBID
82 DRY WALL SCREWS Dry-wall Screws- coarse- No.2 Phillips size 1 5/8" 5m 1 | NOBID
83 DRY WALL SCREWS Dry-wall Screws- coarse- No.2 Phillips size 2" 3.5m 1 | NOBID
84 DRY WALL SCREWS Dry-wall Screws- coarse- No.2 Phillips size 2 1/2" 2.5m 1 | NOBID
85 DRY WALL SCREWS Dry-wall Screws- coarse- No.2 Phillips size 3" 2m 1 | NOBID
86 DRY WALL SCREWS Dry-wall Screws- fine- No.2 Phillips size 1" 10m 1 | NOBID
87 DRY WALL SCREWS Dry-wall Screws- fine- No.2 Phillips size 1 1/4" 8m 1 | NOBID
88 DRY WALL SCREWS Dry-wall Screws- fine- No.2 Phillips size 1 5/8" 5m 1 | NOBID
89 DRY WALL SCREWS Dry-wall Screws- fine- No.2 Phillips size 2" 3.5m 1 | NOBID
90 DRY WALL SCREWS Dry-wall Screws- fine- No.2 Phillips size 2 1/2" 2.5m 1 | NOBID
91 DRY WALL SCREWS Dry-wall Screws- fine- No.2 Phillips size 3" 2m 1 | NOBID
92 STEEL STUD 2x4x8'25GA 1 | NOBID
93 STEEL STUD 2x4x10"25GA 1 | NOBID
94 STEEL STUD 2x4x12'25GA 1 | NOBID
95 STEEL STUD 2x4x 10’ Steel Sole/Top Plate 25 GA 1 | NOBID
96 STEEL STUD 2x4x8'-20GA 1 | NOBID
97 STEEL STUD 2x4x10"-20 GA 1 | NOBID
98 STEEL STUD 2x4x12'-20 GA 1 | NOBID
99 L SHELF BRACKETS (EACH) 12" x 9 1/2" w/Support Arm 1 | NOBID
100 L SHELF BRACKETS (EACH) 20" x 13" w/Support Arm & Closet Pole Holder 1 | NOBID
101 L SHELF BRACKETS (EACH) 16 x 20 L-Shelf Bracket w/Support Arm 1 | NOBID
102 THREADED STEEL RODS - / YARD Vi x 36" 1 | NOBID
103 THREADED STEEL RODS - / YARD 3/8" x 36" 1 | NOBID
104 THREADED STEEL RODS - / YARD %" x 36" 1 | NOBID
105 THREADED STEEL RODS - / YARD 5/16" 1 | NOBID
106 ROLL 6 MIL CLEAR PLASTIC 20" x 100" 1 | NOBID
107 ROLL 6 MIL CLEAR PLASTIC 8’ x 100 1 | NOBID
108 TAPE- (EACH) 1" x 60 Yds Masking 1 | NOBID
109 TAPE- (EACH) 2" x 60 Yds Masking 1 | NOBID




CKO9MERCER2022-02 BUILDING MATERIALS PROPOSAL - THE COUNTY WILL ACCEPT THE BRAND NAMES STATED OR AN EQUIVALENT BRAND

TAGUE LUMBER,INC.
niM CATEGORY BUILDING MATERIAL DESCRIPTION CASE COUNT | COST PER CASE COUNT | VENDOR CAsE COuNt | €031 FOR VERDOR
110 TAPE- (EACH) 2" Duct 1 | NO BID
111 TAPE- (EACH) 2" x 60 Yds Blue Painters Tape 1 | NOBID
112 NAILS COMMON - PER 5 LB BOX 6D 1 | NO BID
113 NAILS COMMON - PER 5 LB BOX 8D 1 | NO BID
114 NAILS COMMON - PER 5 LB BOX 10D 1 | NO BID
115 NAILS COMMON - PER 5 LB BOX 12D 1 | NOBID
116 NAILS COMMON - PER 5 LB BOX 12" Galvanized Spikes (50LB) 1 | NOBID
17 FINISHING NAILS - PER 5 LB BOX 3D 1 | NOBID
118 FINISHING NAILS - PER 5 LB BOX 4D 1 | NOBID
119 FINISHING NAILS - PER 5 LB BOX 6D 1 | NOBID
120 FINISHING NAILS - PER 5 LB BOX 8D 1 | NOBID
121 FINISHING NAILS - PER 5 LB BOX 10D 1 | NOBID
122 SUSPENDED CEILING ACOUSTICAL TILE / Box Armstrong (10 PCs/Cs) Square Edge - White (2 x 4 Box) 1 | NOBID
123 SUSPENDED CEILING ACOUSTICAL TILE / Box Armstrong (16 PCs/Cs) Square Edge - White (2 x 2 Box) No. 934 1 | NOBID
124 SUSPENDED CEILING ACOUSTICALTILE / Box Amstrong 2 T-Bar White (Simplicity), 60 Pcs/Box 1| NOBID
125 SUSPENDED CEILING ACOUSTICALTILE / Box Amstrong 4’ T-Bar White (Simplicity), 60 Pcs/Box 1| NOBID
126 SUSPENDED CEILING ACOUSTICALTILE / Box Armstrong 12 Heavy Duty 5-Bar White, Simplicity 25 Pcs/Box 1| NOBID
127 SUSPENDED CEILING ACOUSTICAL TILE / Box Armstrong 10" Wall Angle White, Simplicity, 40 PCs / Box 1 | NOBID
128 SUSPENDED CEILING ACOUSTICAL TILE / Box Armstrong USG-DX 12" Main Tee, White (20 PER CTN) 1 | NOBID
129 SUSPENDED CEILING ACOUSTICAL TILE / Box Armstrong USG-DX 2' Cross Tee, White (60 PER CTN) 1 | NOBID
130 SUSPENDED CEILING ACOUSTICAL TILE / Box Armstrong USG-DX 4' Cross Tee, White (60 PER CTN) 1 | NOBID
131 SUSPENDED CEILING ACOUSTICAL TILE / Box Armstrong USG-M-7 12" Wall Angle, White 1 | NOBID
132 FINISHES Minwax Brand Oil Stain (Asst'd Colors) - / Qt 1 | NOBID
133 FINISHES Minwax Brand Oil Gloss Polyurethane - / Qt 1 | NOBID
134 FINISHES Minwax Brand Oil Satin Polyurethane - / Qt 1 | NOBID
135 FINISHES Clear Wood Preservative - / Gal. 1 | NO BID
136 FINISHES Paint Thinner - / Gal. 1 | NOBID
137 FINISHES Denatured Alcohol - / Gal. 1 | NOBID
138 FINISHES Linseed QOil - / Gal. 1 | NOBID
139 FINISHES Paint Remover - / Ga. 1 | NOBID
140 FINISHES Elmer's Brand Carpenter’'s Wood Filler - / Pint 1 | NOBID
141 FINISHES Lacquer Thinner - / Gal. 1 | NOBID
142 SHELF STANDARDS & ARMS- (EACH) 3' Shelf Standards Alum Finish 1 | NOBID
143 SHELF STANDARDS & ARMS- (EACH) 4’ Shelf Standards Alum Finish 1 | NOBID
144 SHELF STANDARDS & ARMS- (EACH) 6' Shelf Standards Alum Finish 1 | NOBID
145 SHELF STANDARDS & ARMS- (EACH) 10" Shelf Arms Alum Finish 1 | NOBID
146 SHELF STANDARDS & ARMS- (EACH) 12" Shelf Arms Alum Finish 1 | NOBID
147 DOUBLE HEAD NAILS 8P /Lb 1 | NOBID
148 DOUBLE HEAD NAILS 8P / 50 Lbs 1 | NOBID
149 DOUBLE HEAD NAILS 10P / Lb 1 | NOBID
150 DOUBLE HEAD NAILS 10P / 50 Lbs 1 | NOBID
151 DOUBLE HEAD NAILS 16P / Lb 1 | NOBID
152 DOUBLE HEAD NAILS 16P / 50 Lbs 1 | NOBID
153 COMMON NAILS 60P / 50 Ibs 1 | NOBID
154 COMMON NAILS 60P Galvanized / 50 Lb 1 | NOBID
155 COMMON NAILS 8P /50Lb 1 | NOBID
156 COMMON NAILS 10P /b 1 | NOBID
157 COMMON NAILS 10P / 50 Lb (PER BOX) 1 | NOBID
158 COMMON NAILS 16P / Lb 1 | NOBID
159 COMMON NAILS 16P / 50 Lb 1 | NOBID
160 COMMON NAILS 20P /Lb 1 | NOBID
161 COMMON NAILS 20P / 50 Lb 1 | NOBID
162 BOX NAILS 4P /50 Lb 1 | NOBID
163 BRIDGE DIV. 6P /50 Lb 1 | NOBID
164 BRIDGE DIV. 7P/ 50 Lb 1 | NOBID




CKO9MERCER2022-02 BUILDING MATERIALS PROPOSAL - THE COUNTY WILL ACCEPT THE BRAND NAMES STATED OR AN EQUIVALENT BRAND

TAGUE LUMBER,INC.
":rM CATEGORY BUILDING MATERIAL DESCRIPTION CASECOUNT | COST PER CASE COUNT | VENDOR CAsE COUNT | COST FOR VENDOR
165 NAILS Paslode 5-Packs Red Fuel Cell IMP(2-Packs per) #277 1 | NO BID
166 NAILS Paslode 5-Packs Trim Fuel Cell IMP(2-Packs per) 1 | NO BID
167 NAILS Paslode Finish Nails- 16 gauge angled 1 1/4" 1 | NO BID
168 NAILS Paslode Finish Nails- 16 gauge angled 1 1/2" 1 | NO BID
169 NAILS Paslode Finish Nails- 16 gauge angled 2" 1 | NO BID
170 NAILS Paslode Finish Nails- 16 gauge angled 2 1/2" 1 | NOBID
171 NAILS Paslode Finish Nails- 16 gauge straight 1 1/4" 1 | NO BID
172 NAILS Paslode Finish Nails- 16 gauge straight 1 1/2" 1 | NO BID
173 NAILS Paslode Finish Nails- 16 gauge straight 2" 1 | NO BID
174 NAILS Paslode Finish Nails- 16 gauge straight 2 1/2" 1 | NO BID
175 NAILS Paslode Nails- 2 3/8" x 113- 8D common 1 | NOBID
176 NAILS Paslode Nails- 2 3/8" x 113- 10D common 1 | NOBID
177 NAILS Ramset Concrete Nails- Box of 100- 1 1/2" 1 | NOBID
178 NAILS Ramset Concrete Nails- Box of 100- 2* 1 | NOBID
179 NAILS Ramset Concrete Nails- Box of 100-2 1/2" 1 | NOBID
180 NAILS Ramset Concrete Nails- Box of 100- 3" 1 | NOBID
181 NAILS Ramset Loads/Charges/Cargas- .27 cal.- 100 gty .- strips- red 1 | NOBID
182 NAILS Ramset Loads/Charges/Cargas- .27 cal.- 100 gty.- strips- green 1 | NOBID
183 NAILS Ramset Loads/Charges/Cargas- .27 cal.- 100 gty.- strips- yellow 1 | NOBID
184 ASPHALT IMPREGNATED 4" x 10" x 2" 1 | NOBID
185 ASPHALT IMPREGNATED 6" x 10" x 12" 1 | NOBID
186 CONCRETE NAILS 1"/ Lb fluted 1 | NOBID
187 CONCRETE NAILS 1"/ 50 Lb (PER BOX) 1 | NOBID
188 CONCRETE NAILS 2" /b 1 | NO BID
189 CONCRETE NAILS 2"/ 50 Lb (PER BOX) 1 | NOBID
190 CONCRETE NAILS 3"/Llb 1 | NO BID
191 CONCRETE NAILS 3"/ 50 Lb (PER BOX) 1 | NOBID
192 CONCRETE NAILS PVC Pipe 4" - / Foot 1 | NOBID
193 CONCRETE NAILS Plastic 20" x 100" x 6 Mil 1 | NOBID
194 CONCRETE NAILS Plastic 10" x 100" x 6 Mil 1 | NOBID
195 MISCELLANEOUS 5 (cases) - General Purpose Blade 7 V4" 5 per pack 25 pcs 1 | NOBID
196 MASONRY: CULTURED STONE MATERIAL 2 (qgty) - Mortar Type “N” Bags (50 Cube) (80 LBS. PREPARED) per bag 1| NOBID
INSERT DISCOUNT TO
197 ENTER BRAND NAME AND SUBMIT CATALOG WITH PRICING WITH BID AT o% | TR o OF
WHOLESALE COST
198 INTERIOR DOORS-6 PANEL MOLDED INTERIOR DOOR UNIT PRE- (=+OR-)___ % NO BID
199 VINYL WINDOW REPLACEMENTS (IDEAL) (=+OR-)__ % NO BID
200 VINYL WINDOWS NEW CONSTRUCTION (ANDERSON) (=+OR-)_ % NO BID
201 HINGED PATIO DO?FI;SE:‘LCHWOOD)& ) VINYL (=+O0R-)___ % |noBiD
| A T ot AT e D ey 5 w0
203 LUMBER ONLY RAND+0M LENG;HS WEEKLY PRICING

LUMBER BENCHMARK PRICING

RANDOM LENGTHS WEEKLY PRICING
Bidders shall provide an upcharge to the pricing stated in the Random Lengths Weekly Report for all lumber products. The Random Lengths Weekly Report provides prices
for more than 1,600 items of softwood lumber, panels, and other wood products.

PAYMENT

When invoicing the County for lumber, the awarded Vendor shall attach a copy of the Random Lengths weekly pricing to theirinvoice and reflect the upcharge on the

invoice.




AB2022-06 REPLACEMENT OF COUNTY BRIDGE #415.2 (STRUCTURE #11D1502), CARRYING LOWER FERRY ROAD OVER GOLD RUN

BID RESULTS

BID OPENING DATE: MARCH 2,2022

BIDS RECEIVED

8

NAME OF BIDDER

DIACO CONSTRUCTION DBA GRADE

UNDERGROUND UTILTIES CORP. CMS CONSTRUCTION INC. EARLE ASPHALT COMPANY COLONNELLI BROTHERS, INC. LIMA CHARLIE CONSTRUCTION MARBRO, INC. CONSTRUCTION MOUNT CONSTRUCTION CO.INC
ADDRESS 711 COMMERCE ROAD 521 NORTH AVENUE P.O BOX 556 400 SOUTH RIVER STREET 1 BROAD STREET, SUITE 4 127 PINE STREET P.O. BOX 134 110 PENNSYLVANIA AVE 427 S. WHITE HORSE PIKE
CITY, STATE, ZIP LINDEN, NJ 07036 PLAINFIELD, NJ 07060 FARMINGDALE, NJ 07727 HACKENSACK, NJ 07601 FREEHOLD , NJ 07728 MONTCLAIR, NJ 07042 PATERSON, NJ 07503 BERLIN, NJ 08009
CONTACT RICH GOMES CARLOS DASILVA BRIAN M. COOPER LISA COLONELLI GEORGE LUCAS FRANK MARUCCI JR. RALPH DIACO MICHAEL MAZZARELLA
TELEPHONE 908-862-8936 908-668-4368 732-308-1113 201-440-118 833-242-2427 973 744 8383 973-925-4021 856 768 8493
FAX 908-862-8690 908-718-4005 732- 3080- 1034 201-440-8282 732-955-8301 973 746 5898 856 753 1453
RGOMES@UNDERGROUNDUTILITIESCOR @ ESTIMATING @LIMACHARLIECONSTRUCTI @ MMAZZARELLA@MOUNTCONTRUCTI
E-MAIL REOMES UNDEE?,Z?\;JNDUT‘U"ESCOR IMPEREIRACMSCONSTRUCTION@GMAIL.COM BCOOPER@EARLECO.COM LCOLONNELLI@COLONNELLI.COM ESTIMATING L\(l\}/::(r::l;\\;iL\ECONSTRUCT\ MAR9400@ COMCAST.NET RALPH@GRADECONSTRUCTION.COM MMAZZARELL?WTS;NTCONTRUCTI
MINORITY AND SMALL BUSINESS DISABLED VETERAN OWNED BUSINESS
NJ SAVI DESIGNATION SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE OWNED ENTERPRISE N/A N/A ENTERPRISE SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE N/A
ADDENDUM NO.ONE INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
ML RUBERTON CONSTRUCTION CO.
STRUCTURAL STEEL SUBCONTRACTOR IN-HOUSE IN-HOUSE IN-HOUSE IN-HOUSE IN-HOUSE IN-HOUSE IN-HOUSE INC., BRC OK, PW#48392 EXPIRES

8.7.23

TRAVELERS CASUALTY & SURETY CO.OF

UNITED STATES FIRE INSURANCE CO.10%

GREAT MIDWEST INSURANCE CO. 10% | FIDELITY & DEPOSIT CO OF MARYLAND, |LIBERTY MUTUAL INSURANCE COMPANY LIBERTY MUTUAL INSURANCE

BID BOND AMERICA 10% NTE 20K BERKLEY INSURANCE CO. 10% NTE 20K | FEDERAL INSURANCE CO. 1-% NTE 20K NTE 20K NTE 20K 10% NTE 20K 10% NTE 20K COMPANY 10% NTE 20K

'CONSENT OF SURETY DAVID H. PAGE AIF WITH POA MICHAEL DUGAN AIF WITH POA CASSANDRA BAEZ AIF WITH POA LISA NOSAL AIF WITH POA RICHARD V. DOBBS AIF WITH POA ANTHONY PAOLAZZI AIF WITH POA WILLIAM D. HAAS AIF WITH POA JOHN P. SEDOR AIF WITH POA

INDEMNIFICATION AND INSURANCE SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

IRAN CERT SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

PREVAILING WAGE CERTIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

EXHIBIT B INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

AA201 REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED

PW CONTRACTOR REG. 55489 EXPIRES 8.25.23 669103 EXPIRES 2.24.23 18315 EXPIRES 5.5.23 606273 EXPIRES 7.18.22 723226 EXPIRES 4.14.23 607153 EXPIRES 6.13.22 18315 EXPIRES 5.5.21 605531 EXPIRES 6.5.22

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION oK oK oK oK OK OK OK OK

NON-COLLUSION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

SAFETY CERT SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED
|EQUIPMENT CERT SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

THREE REFERENCES INCLUDED, ENGINEER TO REVIEW INCLUDED, ENGINEER TO REVIEW INCLUDED, ENGINEER TO REVIEW INCLUDED, ENGINEER TO REVIEW INCLUDED, ENGINEER TO REVIEW INCLUDED, ENGINEER TO REVIEW INCLUDED, ENGINEER TO REVIEW INCLUDED, ENGINEER TO REVIEW

FEDERAL DEBARMENT FORM SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS YES YES YES YES YES YES NO YES

TOTAL BID AMOUNT S 1,714,486.00 | § 2,238,003.00 | § 2,392413.13 | § 2,413835.00 | § 2,484,484.00 | $ 2,491,117.00 | $ 2,676,988.31 | § 3,515,000.00
|EXCEPTIONS NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE
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PROPOSAL FORM FOR AB2022-06 REPLACEMENT OF COUNTY BRIDGE #41 STRUCTURE #11D1502), CARRYING LOWER FERRY ROAD OVER GOLD RUN
DIACO CONSTRUCTION DBA GRADE
UNDERGROUND UTILITIES CORP. CMS CONSTRUCTION EARLE ASPHALT COMPANY COLONNELLI BROTHERS, INC. LIMA CHARLIE CONSTRUCTION MABRO INC. CONSTRUCTION MOUNT CONSTRUCTION
PAY ITEN NO. | NaDOT TEMNO. | DESCRIPTION o [contractauanmy| L | e UNITPRICE cost UNITPRICE cost UNITPRICE cost UNITPRICE cost UNITPRICE cost UNIT PRICE cosT UNIT PRICE cosT UNIT PRICE cost
1 | MOBILIZATION s f i $ 6000000 | 5 6000000 | 3 4500000 | 5 4500000 |$ 23502803 [5 23502803 |5 2000000 [s 24000000 |3 2000000 [s 24900000 |5 2000000 [s 24000000 |5 6191399 [ s 91399 [s as000000 [s 35000000
PR e [CAUTION FENCE__|1F Jzs % m 5 5003 64500 | 5 1200 [ 2568000 | § 2505 53750 |5 100 |3 21500 | 5 w00 s 86000 | § 001 |5 2155 262 |5 60630 | 3 500 |5 193500
3 [issorom ;‘Eﬁg;”a'ﬂéi” n 615 765 0 $ 700 |5 591500 | 5 700 |'s 591500 | § 500 |5 422500 | 5 100 |5 84500 [ s 250 |'s 2n250 |s 500 |s 422500 | a2 |s 3.557.45 | s 1000 |5 8.450.00
o rsaoson e T o g g 5 12500 | 5 50000 [ 5 15000 | 3 6000 | $ 12500 | $ 50000 |3 10000 | 3 40000 | 12500 | 5 50000 | $ 001 [ 004 |'s 20797 |5 83188 | s 805.00 | § 322000
5 |meossu L OTING TmBY Jue s s s 100 |5 3500 [ 5 5000 [ 5 175000 | § 1500 [ 3 52500 |5 5000 [ 5 175000 | 2000 |5 70000 [ 5 1000 |5 35000 [ 5 5828 |5 20890 | 5 w00 s 1.505.00
o [t s i 1 5 250000 [ § 250000 | 5 350000 | 5 350000 | $ 50000 | $ 50000 | 3 150000 [ 150000 | 200000 | $ 200000 | $ 150000 | 150000 | 157497 | 157497 | 467500 | s 467500
OILONLY
7 |mern EMERGENCYSPILL  [UN 1 i $ 50000 | 50000 | 50000 [ 5 50000 | $ 75000 | $ 75000 |3 75000 [ 5 75000 [ 3 100 |5 100 |5 90000 [ 5 50000 [ 5 110248 | 5 110248 | 5 115000 | 5 115000
s rssooow g 3 $ 100 |5 600 |3 15000 [ § 90000 | § 005 |5 030 |5 3500 |5 21000 [ 5 10000 [ 5 0000 | $ 001 [ 006 |5 001 [ 006 |5 13000 | $ 78000
5 rssooon M M 3 100 |5 1000 |3 15000 | § 150000 | 3 005 |5 050 [ 100 |5 1000 |3 5000 |5 50000 [ $ 001 |5 0105 001 |5 010 00 |3 50000
10 oo 5 5 5 o0 [v 2500 | 5 2500 | 5 62500 | § 005 |5 1255 oo |5 2500 | 5 1500 |5 37500 | 5 001 |5 025 |3 001 |5 025 |3 2000 | 5 50000
1o oz CoNsTRUCTION SiGNS ~[sF 1400 [E 5 2000 [ 3 2800000 | § 1800 |5 2520000 | § 100 [$ 140000 | 3 1000 |5 1400000 [ $ 1000 |3 1400000 | 5 1400 [ 5 19.60000 | $ 263 |3 3026200 | 3 1o s 1540000
CONSTRUCTION
w |meze it ir 0 &) $ 3000 |5 240000 [ § 5000 |5 400000 | § 100 [$ 8000 |3 3000 [ 5 240000 | 5 100 | 8000 |5 001 [s 080 |5 5559 |5 443120 |8 10500 | $ 840000
PORTABLE VARRIAGLE
15 |rsoson e o v 2 2 $ 500000 [ § 1000000 [ $ 750000 | 3 1500000 | § 500000 [$ 1000000 [$ 750000 | 1500000 [ $ 500000 | 1000000 [ $ 550000 | 3 100000 [ $ 230996 | s 461992 |3 600000 | § 1200000
w | UNFORMEDPOLICE 51, 525,000 00 s 100 |'s 25,000.00 | § 100 s 25,000.00 | § 100 |5 25,000.00 | 5 100 |3 2500000 | 3 100 | s 2500000 | 3 100 |'s 2500000 [ 100 |'s 2500000 [ 100 |'s 25,00000
OFFIGERS ALLOWANCE 3 - 000 - 000 ! 000
5 [1o00am :gf:;’:ﬁ;r boLL 5500000 s 100 |'s 5,000.00 | s 100 s 500000 | § 100 |5 5,000.00 [ $ 100 |3 500000 [$ 100 | 500000 [$ 100 | s 500000 |3 100 |'s 500000 |3 100 | s 500000
| o 5500000 s 100 |5 500000 | § 100 |'s 500000 | § 100 s 5,000.00 | 100 |5 500000 | 100 |5 500000 | 100 |5 500000 | s 100 | 500000 | 100 s 500000
| VIBRATION HONITORING [Ls 1 1 5 1000000 | $ 1000000 [ $ 3200000 | § 3200000 | § 705000 | $ 705000 | $ 750000 | § 750000 | 500000 | 500000 | $ 1200000 [ $ 1200000 [ $ 419992 |3 419992 |3 1622500 [ $ 1622500
[rR CLEARING SITE s i i s 3000000 | 3 3000000 | 3 2500000 | 3 2500000 [§ 3800000 |5 3600000 [+ 7300000 | § 7300000 | 5 2500000 | 3 2500000 | 3 2500000 | 3 2500000 | 5 Eran Eran 3000000 | 3 30,000.00
o |oozoe Excavaon, TesTPT oy 10 10 $ 25000 | 250000 [ § 25000 [ 5 250000 | $ 10000 | $ 100000 | 3 100 |5 1000 | 20000 | § 200000 [ § 15000 [ § 150000 [ 9094 | 90940 [ 5 30500 [ $ 305000
O P NN oy 1855 1685 170 $ w000 |3 7420000 | 5 4500 | 3 8347500 | § 3500 | s 6492500 |3 1000 |3 18555000 | 3 3000 | s 5565000 [ $ 4000 | 3 7420000 | $ 367 |3 6245785 | 3 10500 | 5 194.775.00
DiseosaL oF
2 | o romuame [pow $10,00000 s 100 s 10,00000 [ 100 s 10,00000 | § 100 |s 10,000.00 | 100 |3 10000.00 | s 100 |3 10000.00 | 3 100 [s 1000000 | $ 100 |'s 10000.00 | 3 100 | s 10,000.00
SOILS ALLOWANCE
ATERIAL SAVPLING
AND ANALYSES,
z | s o 5500000 s 100 |5 500000 | § 100 |'s 500000 | § 100 s 5,000.00 | 100 |5 500000 | 100 |5 500000 | 100 |5 500000 | § 100 | 500000 | s 100 s 500000
LLOWANCE
DENSE GRADED
ER Y AGGREGATEBASE  [sY se0 50 o0 5 1000 |5 980000 [ § 1200 | 176000 [ 5 1300 [ s 1274000 | 5 1500 | 1470000 | § 800 |3 784000 | 3 1500 [ 5 1470000 [ $ 126 | 103480 | 5 5000 |5 4900000
lcouRse. & THicK
2 Jaowaow [TAcK CoAT Joa a0 0 0 3 600 [+ 8000 | 5 19000 | 5 1520000 | 5 005 [+ 400 [+ o0 [s 8000 |5 o0 s 8000 |5 1600 [ 3 128000 | 5 1050 |5 84000 [ 3 1500 [ 1:20000
5 Jaowan [OTMKASPHAT SSM fron & 50 g $ 20000 [ 5 17.60000 | 5 21000 | 18.48000 | 5 nsoo |'s 1012000 | 5 13500 [ $ 1188000 | 5 20000 [ 17.60000 | 5 17500 | s 15.40000 | § nzaz|s 10.306.56 | $ 12500 | 5 11,00000
54 SURFACE COURSE
E e oo 122M [ron a7 315 2 $ 12500 |'§ 4337500 | 3 19500 | s 6766500 | 8 9700 [ s 3365900 | 12500 | 5 2337500 [ nsoo |'s 3990500 [ s 17500 | s 072500 | 5 10am s 3751417 [ 5 12500 | 5 4337500
A E ey ov 5 s d $ 30000 | 150000 [ 75000 | 8 375000 | 5 5000 [ s 25000 | 8 10000 | 5 50000 |5 50000 |5 2550000 [ s 150000 | 5 750000 | s 44904 [ s 224520 [ 80000 | 3 400000
n |eoroe e L & 50 g $ 10000 | § 880000 | 5 16500 | s 1452000 | 5 9300 [ s 818400 | 5 7500 [ s 660000 [ s 6000 |5 528000 [ s 8200 |3 721600 [ 3 3295 |3 2899.60 | s 15000 | 5 1320000
n Jozon e e uv g s $ 80000 |5 240000 | 5 1.20000 [ § 360000 | 5 40000 | 8 1.20000 [ § 15000 | 5 45000 [ s 50000 [ s 1.50000 | 5 65000 [ 3 195000 | 5 w767 [s 125301 | 5 67500 |3 202500
aozora INLET TYPE B m 2 2 3 500000 | 5 1000000 | 5 450000 | 5 500000 | 5 450000 | 5 500000 | 5 750000 | 8 1500000 | 5 750000 | 3 1500000 | 5 450000 | 5 00000 | 5 336550 |3 73160 |3 525000 [ 10:500.00
[RECONSTRUCTED
MANHOLE, USING
s faozieon e s e & | 2 g s 80000 [ $ 160000 | 120000 [ 240000 | $ 70000 | 3 140000 | 3 100 |5 200 |5 500000 | 1000000 | § 100000 | 200000 | 3 297801 |3 595602 |3 102500 | 205000
ARTICULATED
PR CONGRETEBLOCK  [sv 40 550 0 s 16500 [ 5 7095000 | 16500 [ 5 7095000 [ § 22500 |5 9675000 |8 1500 |5 4945000 | s 2500 |5 9675000 | 3 1500 |5 49.45000 | 2723 |3 9770850 | 3 25000 [ $ 107,50000
aTTING, OPEN CELL
HOT WX ASPHALT
n [aeone e ngtior O = 25 2 g s 5500 |5 143000 [ 600 |5 166400 [ 5 7500 [ 195000 | 3 1500 |3 299000 |3 1500 |5 299000 | s w00 s 104000 [ 5 223 |5 0398 [ 5 2500 |3 585000
E (S O 76 57 o $ 2500 |'$ 190000 | § 1500 |5 114000 | 5500 | $ 418000 [ s 25.00 | 3 190000 | 5 2500 | s 190000 | 3 3500 | 5 266000 [ 3 1406 | s 10766 | 3 10000 [ 7,60000
57 18" CONCRETE
E e e onone i3 1o 0 o0 s 3500 |5 385000 [ § 4500 |5 495000 | $ 3500 | § 385000 | 3 100 |5 1000 |3 250 |5 275000 | s 5000 |5 550000 | s 73 s 426030 | 3 4000 |5 440000
BEAM GUIDE RAL
% [aosocam ottt 75 11 2 s 80 |5 1452500 [ 5 9500 |'s 1662500 | $ 8800 | 1540000 [ 100 |5 17500 [ 7500 |5 1312500 [ 5 7500 |5 1312500 [ $ w0 |s 1212750 [ § 8500 |5 1487500
[TANGENT GUIDE RAL
o [aosoam TERMNAL POWDER ~ |uN g g $ 556500 [ 3 1669500 | 5 595000 [ § 1785000 | $ 530000 [$ 1590000 [ 450000 | $ 1350000 [ 5 450000 [ 5 1350000 [ 5 529500 [ $ 1588500 [ § 551239 |3 1653717 [ 5 616500 | 3 18.495.00
w  [aososen v g g $ 440000 [ 3 1320000 [ 5 45500 [ 5 1365000 | $ 300000 | 3 9.00000 | s 250000 | § 750000 | 5 250000 [ $ 750000 | 3 399500 [ $ 1198500 [ § sz | 1055229 [ § 450000 [ 5 1350000
R X Rerric sTRPES ¢ |IF Jrss |3 s 3 o0 |5 75500 | 3 5003 226500 | $ 210]s 1585.50 | 3 200 [ 151000 | 5 250 [ 186750 | 5 80 |5 155900 | 5 e s 142695 |5 300 |5 226500
cRasH custion
COUPRESSIVE BARRIER,
w0 oo COUPRESSE BARRER Juv 1 1 $ 2356000 | 5 2356000 |3 200000 | 3 200000 |§ 2450000 [$ 2450000 |3 2800000 | 3 2800000 | 3 2500000 | § 2500000 | § 2000000 | 3 2000000 | 27,6003 | 27,6003 | 3675000 | 5 3675000
(POWDER COATED)
REGULATORY AND
o forao Bt s o g $ 7500 |5 7500 |5 4500 |5 40500 | 3 8800 |§ 79200 | w000 |5 36000 [ 5 5000 [ 5 45000 [ 5 7500 |5 67500 |5 4200 |5 37800 [ 5 s500 |5 49500
2 |estose o e OV WATER | 200 215 25 $ 12000 [ 5 28.800.00 | § 295.00 | s 7080000 | § 15000 | $ 3600000 |5 13200 [ 5 3168000 | 5 95.00 | s 2280000 | s 12000 [ 2880000 | 10299 [ 3 2471760 | 3 6500 |'s 15.600.00
6 fastaen 5 vives anpBOKES  |un 2 2 $ 350000 [ § 7.00000 | 3 250000 [ 5 500000 | $ 225000 | 450000 |3 350000 [ 5 700000 | § 350000 [ $ 700000 | § 210000 [ $ 420000 [ $ IR B 237978 |3 527500 | 3 1055000
W e 7 steELCASNG__|LF |52 2 3 15000 | 5 7580000 |3 16000 | 5 532000 | $ 12500 |5 650000 |5 100 |5 520 s 15000 | 5 750000 |3 27500 | 5 1330000 | 5 2715 |5 cei07¢ |3 15000 |3 588000
s |esa0oep ;ggﬁ;‘;gw‘/:gs;mm 3 100 100 5 10000 [ 5 1000000 | 5 22000 | s 2200000 | $ 3500 | $ 3,50000 [$ 100 [s 10000 [ 6500 |'s 650000 | 3 20000 | s 20,00000 | 7160 |'s 706000 | 3 15000 [ 3 15,000.00
TENPORARY SEWER
6 [ososame I 1 1 $ 1000000 | 3 1000000 [ $ 2500000 | 5 2500000 | $ 350000 | 350000 | 100 |5 100 |5 500000 [ 5 500000 [ 5 500000 [ $ 500000 | 3 257895 |3 257895 |3 1775000 [ 3 1775000
a7 |esaoner o PROTECTON 1 1 $ 1000000 | § 1000000 | § 1500000 | § 1500000 | § 7.500.00 | § 7.500.00 | s 50000 | § 50000 |5 550000 |3 550000 |3 2550000 | 3 250000 [ 3 366627 [ 3 366627 | 3 800000 | $ 8,000.00




ool SREADING, & |sv |ass |m 5 $ 800 |3 364000 [ 3 800 s 364000 | $ 440 |5 200200 | $ 200 |5 91000 | 5 500 s 227500 | s 700 |5 318500 | 3 a5 s 197925 | s 400 |5 182000
[BORROW T0PSOL___[ov 5 [0 3 5 3500 | 3 192500 | 3 4500 |3 247500 | 5 6500 |5 357500 | 5 5000 | 5 275000 | 5 000 |3 220000 | 5 5000 |§ 275000 |3 5150 |5 173250 | 5 5000 |5 330000
225 255 0 $ 200 |3 57000 [ 5 200 |5 57000 [ 5 350 |3 99750 [ 5 300 |8 85500 [ 5 150 | 42750 [ 5 200 |'s 57000 [ $ 735 |5 200475 |8 800 |'s 228000
s 155 0 5 200 |3 35000 [ 5 200 |5 35000 [ 5 350 |5 61250 [ 5 200 |5 35000 [ 5 200 |3 35000 [ 5 200 |'s 35000 [ $ 1260 |3 220500 | s 1300 |8 227500
4e0 410 [0 5 200 [+ 52000 | 5 1005 45000 | 5 100 s 45000 | 5 200 |5 52000 | 5 200 [ 52000 | 5 500 s 230000 | 3 158 [ s 72680 |3 175 s 505.00
110571 v 0 0 5 35000 [ 5 7.00000 | $ 42500 |5 850000 [ 5 8800 [ 5 176000 [ 100 |5 2000 [ 5 25000 [ 5 500000 | 3 15000 [ § 300000 [ § 13125 [ 5 262500 |8 13500 [ § 270000
s [stoom oty B oy &3 & $ 35000 [ 5 700000 | 5 45000 | 900000 [ 5 47000 | 9,40000 | s 100 | 2000 |5 30000 | 3 600000 | 15000 | $ 300000 | $ 26249 | s 524980 | s 27500 | 3 550000
CLEARING SITE, BRIDGE
E o s 1 1 5 5000000 | 5000000 | § 3500000 | 3500000 | 8500000 | $ 8500000 | $ 8500000 |3 8500000 |3 24597550 [s 24597550 |8 7500000 | 7500000 | 2044308 | 2044308 | 11026000 | s 11026000
CONTROLLED LOW-
s [aoson oo o 55 55 5 20000 |5 1100000 [ $ 6500 |5 357500 [ 5 2500 [ 5 1237500 | 5 35000 [ 5 1925000 [ $ 35000 | 1925000 [ $ 17500 |5 962500 [ $ ragsa |5 818620 [ § 48500 [ $ 26,675.00
N 0 Jaes 5 3 w000 |3 1720000 | 5 4500 |3 1935000 | 5 7500 | 5 5225000 | 3 3500 |5 1505000 | 5 5500 |5 2365000 | 3 7500 |5 5225000 | 3 5050 |5 2592900 | 3 12500 | 5 5575000
s [ s 1 1 5 4000000 | 5 4000000 |3 17500000 | 3 17500000 | 3 00s |3 00s |5 as000000 s 8000000 |3 20000000 [s 20000000 |3 ssmeseso [s  ss2eseco |s sizsasas s eizsmsas|s  eiszio00 s es2i000
s [ i 25,000 25,000 5 265 |3 7420000 | 400 |5 11200000 | 3 350 |'s 9800000 | $ 250 |5 7000000 | 275 | 77.00000 | 209 |'s 58.52000 | 226 |'s 6328000 | 300 |'s 8400000
o [son v 0 0 5 80000 [ $ 1280000 | 5 120000 | 1920000 [ 5 50000 [ 5 800000 [ 5 75000 | 1200000 [ $ 120000 | 1920000 [ $ 55000 [ $ 880000 [ $ 94586 [ 5 1513376 [ 5 175000 | 28,000.00
o 2 [ |2 3 45000 | 5 5670000 |3 55000 | 5 10710000 | 3 30000 | 5 5760000 | 3 45000 | 5 5670000 | 5 38500 | 5 4651000 | 5 40000 | 5 5040000 | 5 5926 | 5 306676 |3 52500 | 5 4615000
v 2 2 5 80000 [ $ 3360000 | § 95000 [ 5 39.90000 | § 185000 | 77.70000 | 200000 [ § 8400000 | 3 135000 | 5670000 | 150000 | 6300000 | 163147 | d8.521.74 | 177500 | 8 74,550.00
[ 5 [0 | 3 70000 | 3 3500000 | 3 45000 | 5 2250000 | 3 56000 | 5 2600000 | 3 60000 | 3 3000000 | 3 42500 | 5 2125000 | 3 47500 | 5 2575000 | 3 21245 | 5 1062450 | 5 155000 | 5 7750000
s [sos ir 52 52 5 800000 [§ 41600000 |5 748000 |5 38896000 [ § 10000 |5 57200000 [ 3 750000 |5 39000000 [$ 950000 |5 49400000 | 5 900000 [§ 46300000 |5 781450 |3 40635400 [ 5 812500 [s 42250000
6 [ v 1o 1o 5 40000 |5 7.60000 | 3 193000 [ 3667000 |3 340000 [ 5 4460000 [ 250000 [ § 47.50000 | 250000 [ § 47.50000 | 200000 [ $ 3800000 |3 213018 |3 warsaz |3 300000 [ § 57,00000
o [sone v 115 115 5 95000 [ 5 109.25000 | 140000 [ 161.00000 | 3 75000 [ 5 8625000 | $ 95000 [ 5 109.25000 | 3 80000 [ 5 9200000 | 3 000 [ 5 49.00000 | 39930 [ 5 91950 [ 80000 [ 5 92,00000
o [sonwe v o o 5 95000 [ 5 1140000 | 5 7200 |5 86400 [ 5 90000 [ 5 1080000 [ 5 110000 [ 1320000 [ 5 95000 [ 5 1140000 [ $ 100000 | 1200000 [ $ 126061 | 5 1512732 [ $ 17500 ['$ 210000
PRECAST CONCRETE
& [ v 0 0 5 31000 |5 7130000 | 91500 s 21045000 | 8 100000 [s 23000000 |5 100000 [s 23000000 | '3 100000 [s 23000000 |5 125000 [s 28750000 |3 sw29 s 21833670 |5 Li0s00 [s 25415000
erinGe APPROACH SLAB)
STEEL 4 B4R BRIDGE
o [sonee e i e e 5 41000 |5 3526000 | § 41000 |5 3526000 | 5 48900 [ 5 4205400 | 3 55000 [ 5 4730000 | 3 45000 [ 5 3870000 | § 39200 [ 5 3371200 | 3 37175 |8 3197050 | 3 59500 [ 5 5117000
st v CORECATE o o00 510 %0 $ 250 |5 225000 |'§ 400 |5 360000 | 5 500 |5 450000 | 5 500 |5 450000 | § 300 s 270000 | § 100 [ 50000 [ 423 | 3807.00 | s 600 |5 540000
7o [sstomw POLVESTERPOLIMER [sr 450 450 $ noo s 3795000 | 1200 | s 41,40000 | 5500 [ s 18975000 [ 3000 [s 10350000 | § 1400 | s 4830000 | § 2000 [ 900000 | 5 1491 s 51.439.50 | 5 6500 |3 224,250.00
e 5 | e a0 20 3 w000 |3 500000 | 5 2500 | 5 500000 | 5 800 |3 560000 | 5 4500 |5 500000 | 5 2500 | 5 500000 |3 5000 |5 600000 | 3 5079 |5 1215800 | 5 5000 [ 5 10.000.00
i i 3 400000 | 5 400000 | 5 550000 | 5 550000 | 5 400000 | 5 400000 | 5 180000 | § 180000 | § 200000 | 5 200000 | 5 150000 | 5 150000 | 5 139396 | 5 139396 | 5 275000 | § 275000
760 520 o0 5 700 |5 5396000 | 3 500 [ s 3420000 | 5 000 |5 4560000 | 5 4000 |5 3040000 | § 4500 |5 3420000 | § 9000 | 68.40000 | .52 |5 6803520 | 12500 [ 5 9500000
52 52 5 2500 | 1170000 [ 5 2000 |5 1144000 | 5 17000 | '3 884000 [ 5 1500 |3 598000 | $ 2000 [ 5 1144000 [ 5 21500 [ $ 1118000 [ $ 21495 [ 5 117896 [ 5 31500 [ 5 1638000
TOTAL BID PRICE s 1,716,486.00 | 2,238,003.00] § 2392413.3| § 2,013,835.00 | § 2,084,084.00 | § 2,091,117.00 | § 2,676,08831 | § 3,515,000.00




