BID RESULTS

AB2022-13 LABORATORY TESTING SERVICES FOR THE MERCER COUNTY CORRECTION CENTER FOR A
PERIOD OF TWO (2) YEARS WITH THE OPTION TO EXTEND ONE (1) YEAR

BID OPENING DATE: APRIL 5,2022

NUMBER OF BIDDERS

2

NAME OF BIDDER

LABORATORY CORP. OF
AMERICA HOLDINGS

ATLANTIC DIAGNOSTIC
LABORATORIES, LLC

ADDRESS

69 FIRST AVNUE

3520 PROGRESS DRIVE, SUITE C

CITY, STATE, ZIP

RARITAN, NJ 08869

BENSALEM, PA 19020

CONTACT SUMMAR MIR DARIN DOMENICO
TELEPHONE 908-328-2075 267 -525- 2470
FAX 908-526-5188 215-447-3280
E-MAIL MIRS@LABCORP.COM DARIN@ADLLAB.NET
NJ SAVI DESIGNATION N/A N/A

INSURANCE AND INDEMNIFICATION
REQUIREMENTS

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

IRAN CERTIFICATION

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK
STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED
EXHIBIT A INCLUDED INCLUDED

EMPLOYEE INFORMATION CERTIFICATE

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

42915 EXPIRES 2.15.24

NJ CLINICAL LABORATORY LICENSE

INCLUDED , EXPIRES 12.31.22

INCLUDED , EXPIRES 12.31.22

CLIA CERTIFICATE

ID#31D0125232 EXPIRES
2.27.23

ID # 39D0927666 EXPIRES
7.22.23

QUALIFICATION STATEMENT

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

THREE CLIENT REFERENCES

INCLUDED, CC TO REVIEW

INCLUDED, CC TO REVIEW

EXTEND BEYOND 60 DAYS YES YES
CONTINUITY OF SERVICES YES YES
DISCOUNT RATE 70% 0%
LAB SERVICES YEAR ONE S 49,946.29 | S 64,455.04
LAB SERVICES YEAR TWO S 49,946.29 | S 64,455.04
LAB SERVICES YEAR THREE S 49,946.29 | S 64,455.04
GRAND TOTAL TESTING S 149,838.87 | $ 193,365.12
GRAND TOTAL PHLEBOTOMY DID NOT PROVIDE PRICING | $ 46,800.00
GRAND TOTAL THREE YEARS S 240,165.12
YES, TO BE REVIEWED DID
EXCEPTIONS NOT BID ON ALL LAB TEST OR NO

FOR PHLEBOTOMY TESTING



mailto:MIRS@LABCORP.COM
mailto:DARIN@ADLLAB.NET

. EST. # OF = 2 = 2 5 2
TEST TESTS ES ) ES o 3 o
AB2022-13 PROPOSAL FORM LABORATORY TESTING SERVICES FOR THE MERCER COUNTY CORRECTION CENTER

BIDDER: LABCORP YEAR ONE YEAR TWO OPTION YEAR THREE
ABO Grouping and Rho(D) Typing 1% 10.60 | $ 10.60 | $ 10.60 | $ 10.60 | $ 10.60 | $ 10.60
Aerobic Bacterial Culture 42]'$ 1379 | $ 579.18 | $ 1379 | $ 579.18 | $ 1379 1% 579.18
AFP, Serum, Tumor Marker 1% 3273 | $ 3273 1% 3273 | $ 3273 1% 32731 % 32.73
ALA Delta, Random Urine 1% 69.39 | $ 69.39 | $ 69.39 | $ 69.39 | $ 69.39 | $ 69.39
Albumin, Serum s 945($ 9.45(% 945($ 9.45(% 9.45($ 9.45
Ammonia, Plasma 7| $ 25.45 | $ 16543 | $ 25.45 | $ 165.43 | $ 2545 | $ 165.43
Amylase, Serum 71'$ 1304 | % 8476 | $ 1304 | $ 8476 |$ 1304 | % 84.76
Anaerobic and Aerobic Culture 46 $ 38.50 | $ 1,771.00 | $ 38.50 | $ 1,771.00 | $ 38.50 | $ 1,771.00
Antibody Screen 13 10.68 | $ 1068 | $ 10.68 | $ 10.68 | $ 10.68 | $ 10.68
Antinuclear Antibodies Direct 11$ 8.50 [ $ 850 |$% 8.50 [ $ 850 |$% 8.50 [ $ 8.50
Basic Metabolic Panel (8) 326] § 4.00 | $ 1,304.00 | $ 4.00 | $ 1,304.00 | $ 4.00 [ $ 1,304.00
Beta Strep Gp A Culture 1% 13.04 | $ 13.04 | $ 13.04 | $ 13041 % 1304 | $ 13.04
Bilirubin, Direct 13 9.45[$ 9.45(% 945($ 9.45(% 945($ 9.45
Bilirubin, Tofal 1[5 945 % 9453 9.45 [ $ 9453 9.45 [ $ 9.45
Blood Culture, Routine 2| $ 2223 | $ 3335]$% 2223 | $ 3335]$% 2223 | $ 33.35
B-Type Natriuretic Peptide 1% 64.31 | $ 6431 | $ 64.31 | $ 64.31 | $ 64.31 | $ 64.31
BUN 13 9.45[$ 9.45(% 945($ 9.45(% 945($ 9.45
C difficile Toxins A+8, EIA 2| $ 35.00 | $ 7000 | $ 35.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 3500 | $ 70.00
CA27.29 2| $ 4296 | $ 64.44 | $ 4296 | $ 64.44 | $ 4296 | $ 64.44
Calcium, lonized, Serum 1% 2634 | $ 2634 1% 2634 | $ 2634 1% 2634 | $ 26.34
Calcium, Serum 1% 9.45| % 9.451% 9.45| % 9451 % 945 (% 9.45
Carbamazepine(Tegretol), S 7| $ 980 | $ 63701 $ 980 [ $ 63701 % 980 [$ 63.70
CBC With Differential/Platelet 515| $ 250 [ $ 1.287.50 | $ 250 [ $ 1,287.50 | $ 250 [ $ 1,287.50
CBC, Platelet, No Differential 271 $ 250 | $ 67.50 | $ 250 ($ 67.50 | $ 250 | $ 67.50
CBC/Differential (No Platelet) 13 893 1% 893 1% 893 (% 893 1% 893 (% 8.93
CD4/CD8 Ratio Profile 5% 70.88 | $ 31896 | $ 70.88 | $ 31896 | $ 70.88 | $ 318.96
Ceruloplasmin 11$ 19.78 | $ 19.78 | $ 19.78 | $ 19.78 | $ 19.78 | $ 19.78
Chlamydia Antibodies, IgG s 3876 | $ 3876 |$% 3876 | $ 3876 |$% 3876 | $ 38.76
Chlamydia pneumoniae(IgG/M) 11$ 95.00 | $ 95.00 | $ 95.00 | $ 95.00 | $ 95.00 | $ 95.00
Chlamydia trachomatis, NAA 1% 12.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 12.00
Chlamydia/GC Amplification 271% 17.50 | $ 463.75 | $ 17.50 | $ 463.75 | $ 17.50 | $ 463.75
Cholesterol, Total 89| $ 450 [ $ 39825 | % 4.50 [ $ 39825 % 4.50 [ $ 398.25
Comp. Metabolic Panel (14) 292 $ 4751 % 1,387.00 | $ 4751 % 1,387.00 | $ 4751 % 1,387.00
C-Peptide, Serum s 3544 | $ 3544 | % 3544 | $ 3544 1% 3544 | % 35.44
Creatine Kinase,Total,.Serum 4] $ 270 $% 9451 % 270 1% 9451 % 2701 % 9.45
Creatinine, Serum 113 9.45] % 9.451% 9.45($ 9.451% 9.45($ 9.45
Cystic Fibrosis Profile s 135.00 | $ 13500 | $ 13500 | $ 13500 | $ 13500 [ $ 135.00
Cytomegalovirus (CMV) Ab, IgG 113 20.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 20.00
D-Dimer 13 5775 | $ 57.751% 5775 | $ 57.751% 5775 | $ 57.75
Digoxin, Serum 2| $ 3019 | $ 4529 | $ 3019 | % 4529 | $ 3019 1% 45.29
Ethanol, Blood s 22.50 | $ 2250 | $ 22.50 | $ 2250 $ 2250 | $ 22.50
Factor VIII Activity 113 61.25 | $ 61.25| % 61.25 | $ 61.25| $ 6125 | $ 61.25
Fe+TIBC+Fer+Transf 11 % 5521 | % 5521 1% 5521 (% 5521 1% 5521 % 55.21
Ferritin, Serum 8l$ 11.60 | $ 87.00 | $ 11.60 | $ 87.00 | $ 11.60 | $ 87.00
Folate (Folic Acid), Serum 11$ 27.04 | $ 2704 1% 2704 | $ 2704 1% 27.04 1% 27.04
Fungus (Mycology) Culture 1% 29.31 | $ 2931 1% 2931 1% 2931 1% 2931 1% 29.31
G-6-PD, Quant, Blood and RBC 1s 30.28 | $ 3028 | $ 30.28 | $ 3028 |$ 30.28 | $ 30.28
Genital Culture, Routine 1% 22.84 | $ 2284 | % 2284 | $ 2284 | % 2284 | $ 22.84
Genital Mycoplasmas NAA, Swab 11$ 9450 | $ 9450 | $ 9450 | $ 9450 | $ 94.50 | $ 94.50

GenoSure(R) MG 1
$ - 13 - 1% - 13 - 1% - 193 -

Gest. Diabetes 1-Hr Screen 11$ 424 1'% 424 1% 424 1% 424 1% 424 | % 4.24
Glucose, Serum 1% 9.45] % 9451 % 9.45| % 9451 % 9.45| % 9.45
HBsAg Screen 2l $ 591 1% 5319 1% 591 1% 5319 1% 591 1% 53.19
HBV/HCV (Profile VIII) s 10334 [ $ 10334 | $ 103.34 [ $ 103.34 | $ 103.34 [ $ 103.34
hCG,Beta Subunit, Qnt, Serum 8l $ 687 | $ 5153 1% 687 | $ 5153 1% 687 | $ 51.53
hCG,Beta Subunit,Qual,Serum 7| $ 6.89 | $ 4479 | $ 689 | $ 4479 | $ 689 | $ 44.79
HCV Ab w/Rflx to Verification 71$ 10.60 | $ 68.90 | $ 10.60 | $ 68.90 | $ 10.60 | $ 68.90
HCV Antibody 13| $ 875[% 109.38 | $ 875(% 109.38 | $ 875[% 109.38
HCV Genotyping Non Reflex 11$ 371.00 | $ 371.00 | $ 371.00 | $ 371.00 | $ 371.00 | $ 371.00
HCV RNA PCR Qn Rfx NS3/4A 1% 129.00 | $ 129.00 | $ 129.00 | $ 129.00 | $ 129.00 | $ 129.00
HCV RNA, PCR, Qualitative s 12500 | $ 12500 | $ 12500 | $ 12500 | $ 12500 | $ 125.00
HCV RT-PCR, Quant (Graph) s 140.00 | $ 140.00 | $ 140.00 | $ 14000 | $ 140.00 | $ 140.00
HDL Cholesterol 1% 550 | % 550 | % 550 | % 550 | % 550 | $ 5.50
Helper Suppressor Short Prof. 1% 11603 | $ 11603 | $ 11603 | $ 11603 | $ 11603 | $ 116.03
Helper T-Lymph-CD4 423 2500 | $ 1,037.50 | $ 25.00 | $ 1,037.50 | $ 25.00 | $ 1,037.50
Hemoglobin Alc 120f $ 785]% 938.08 | $ 785]% 938.08 | $ 785]% 938.08
Hep A Ab, IgM 5| $ 7.68 | $ 34.56 | $ 7.68 | $ 34.56 | $ 7.68 | $ 34.56
Hep A Ab, Total 5% 2573 | $ 128.65 | $ 2573 | $ 128.65 | $ 2573 | $ 128.65
Hep A(Rflx To IgM) 1s 2573 | $ 25731 $ 2573 | $ 2573 1% 2573 | $ 2573
Hep B Core Ab, IgM s 976 $ 976 |$ 976 [ $ 976 % 976 [ $ 9.76
Hep B Core Ab, Tot 2| $ 27131 $ 4070 | $ 27131 $ 4070 | $ 2713 1% 40.70
Hep B Surface Ab 100 $ 2459 | $ 24590 | $ 2459 | $ 24590 | $ 2459 | $ 245.90
Hep Be Ag 1s 2844 | $ 28441 $ 2844 | $ 2844 1% 2844 | $ 28.44
Hepatic Function Panel (7) 64] $ 10.50 | $ 672.00 | $ 10.50 | $ 672.00 | $ 10.50 | $ 672.00
Hepatitis Panel (4) 6| $ 32.10 | $ 176.55 | $ 32.10 | $ 176.55 | $ 32.10 | $ 176.55
Hgb Frac. Profile 2| $ 6497 | $ 97.46 | $ 6497 | $ 97.46 | $ 6497 | $ 97.46
Hgb+Hct 1% 8.66 | $ 8.66 9% 8.66 | $ 8.66 | % 8.66 % 8.66
HP5+HAVIgM+HBcIgM+HBeAb+Ag 2| $ 247.36 | $ 371.04 | $ 247.36 | $ 371.04 | $ 247.36 | $ 371.04
HSV 1 and 2-Specific Ab, IgG 2| $ 63.35 | $ 95.03 | $ 63.35 | $ 95.03 | $ 6335 | $ 95.03
HSV, IgM I/Il Combination 13 28.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 28.00
Tnsulin 1[5 2345 $ 2345 $ 2345 $ 2345 $ 23.45 | 3 23.45
Iron and TIBC 9l $ 1890 | $ 160.65 | $ 1890 | $ 160.65 | $ 1890 | $ 160.65
Iron, Serum 1[5 945 % 945 % 945 % 945 % 9.45 [ $ 9.45
Lamotrigine (Lamictal), Serum 1% 46.64 | $ 46.64 | $ 46.64 | $ 46.64 | $ 46.64 | $ 46.64
LDH 1[5 945 % 945 % 945 % 945 % 9.45 [ $ 9.45
Levetiracetam (Keppra), S 15| $ 2250 | $ 337.50 | $ 2250 | $ 337.50 | $ 22.50 | $ 337.50
Lipase, Serum 7% 375|% 2438 | % 375]% 2438 | % 3751 % 24.38
Lipid Cascade 10| $ 640 | $ 60.80 | $ 640 $ 60.80 | $ 640 % 60.80
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Lipid Panel 1611 $ 6.40 | $ 1,030.40 | $ 6.40 | $ 1,030.40 | $ 6.40 | $ 1,030.40
Lipid Panel With LDL/HDL Ratio 1|3 640 % 640 | $ 640 $ 640 | $ 640 $ 6.40
Lithium (Eskalith(R)), Serum 12| $ 530 | % 63.60 | $ 5301 % 63.60 | $ 530 | % 63.60
Lower Respiratory Culture s 2284 | $ 2284 | $ 2284 | $ 2284 | $ 2284 | $ 22.84
Magnesium, Serum 46| $ 4251 % 2338 1% 4251 % 2338 | % 425($% 23.38
Microalbumin, Random Urine 58] $ 2328 | $ 1,338.60 | $ 2328 | $ 1,338.60 | $ 2328 | $ 1,338.60
Neisseria gonorrhoea Ab,Total 1% - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
NMR LipoProfile 2| $ 28.10 | $ 5620 | $ 28.10 | $ 5620 % 28.10 | $ 56.20
Occult Blood, Fecal, IA 41 $ 13.49 | $ 4722 | $ 13.49 | $ 4722 | $ 13.49 | $ 47.22
Ova + Parasite Exam 2| $ 13791 % 2069 | $ 1379 % 20.69 | $ 1379 $ 20.69
Oxcarbazepine (Trileptal),S 1% 4296 | $ 4296 | $ 4296 | $ 4296 | $ 42.96 | $ 42.96
Panel 083824 48] $ 7.00 | $ 33250 | $ 700 $ 33250 | $ 700 (% 332.50
Panel 083955 1% 7.00 | $ 700]$ 700 | % 700]$ 700 % 7.00
Pap IG, rix HPV all pth 150 $ 30.80 | $ 462.00 | $ 30.80 | $ 462.00 | $ 30.80 | $ 462.00
Pap Lb (Liquid-based) 150 $ 3605 | $ 54075 | $ 36.05 | $ 540.75 | $ 3605 | $ 540.75
Phenobarbital, Serum 2| $ 10.60 | $ 1590 | $ 10.60 | $ 1590 | $ 10.60 | $ 15.90
Phenytoin (Dilantin), Serum 60| $ 10.60 | $ 630.70 | $ 10.60 | $ 63070 | $ 10.60 | $ 630.70
Phosphorus, Serum 2| $ 350 | $ 5251% 350 | $ 5251% 350 (% 5.25
Porphobilinogen, Qn, Random Ur 1% 29.23 | $ 2923 1% 29.23 | $ 2923 1% 2923 | $ 29.23
Porphyrins, Qn, Random U 1% 34.39 | $ 3439 | $ 34.39 | $ 3439 | $ 3439 | $ 34.39
Prolactin 5| $ 3876 | % 193.80 | $ 38.76 | $ 19380 | $ 3876 % 193.80
Prostate-Specific Ag, Serum 14] $ 870 | $ 121.80 | $ 870 | $ 121.80 | $ 870 (% 121.80
Protein Total, Qn, 24-Hr Urine 1% 10.24 | $ 10.24 | $ 10.24 | $ 10.24 | $ 1024 | $ 10.24
Prothrombin Time (PT) 18| § 370 % 434.75 | $ 370 % 434.75 | $ 370($ 434.75
PSA Total+% Free 8l $ 53.38 | $ 42704 | $ 53.38 | $ 42704 | $ 5338 | $ 427.04
PSA, Ultrasensitive W/O Serial 1% 48.65 | $ 48.65 | $ 48.65 | $ 48.65 | $ 48.65 | $ 48.65
PT and PTT 4| $ 740 | $ 40.70 | $ 740 | % 40.70 | $ 7401 % 40.70
PTH, Intact 13 47.78 | $ 47.78 | $ 47.78 | $ 4778 | $ 47.78 | $ 47.78
PTT, Activated 4] $ 370 % 1295 | $ 370 $ 12951 % 370($ 12.95
QuantiFERON TB Gold (In Tube) 13 86.15 | $ 66.15 | $ 66.15 | $ 66.15 | $ 66.15 | $ 66.15
Renal Panel (10) s 11.03 | $ 1103 % 11.03 [ $ 1103 1% 11.03 [ $ 11.03
Reticulocyte Count 4% 1041 | $ 3644 | $ 1041 | $ 36.44 | $ 1041 | $ 36.44
Rheumatoid Arthritis Factor 2% 8.68 | $ 13.02 % 8.68 [ $ 13.02 1% 8.68 [ $ 13.02
RNA Qualitative s B - |3 B BB - |3 -
RNA, PCR (NonGraph) rfx/Geno 3|$ 140.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 140.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 140.00 | $ 350.00
RNA, Real Time PCR (Graph) 26| $ 125.00 | $ 3,250.00 | $ 12500 | $ 3,250.00 | $ 12500 [ $ 3,250.00
RNA, Real Time PCR (Non-Graph) 14| $ 105.00 | $ 1,470.00 | $ 105.00 | $ 1,470.00 | $ 105.00 | $ 1,470.00
RPR 164 $ 212 (% 346.62 | $ 212($ 346.62 | $ 212 % 346.62
RPR, Rfx Qn RPR/Confirm TP 2,029| $ 9.63 % 1953446 |$ 9.63|$ 1953446 |$ 9.63 | $ 1953446
Rubella Antibodies, IgG 3| $ 19.74 | $ 4935]% 1974 | $ 4935] % 19741 % 49.35
Rubella Anfibodies, IgM 1B 3439 | $ 3439 | $ 3439 | $ 3439 | $ 3439 | $ 34.39
Sedimentation Rate-Westergren 10| $ 3.18 | % 3180 | % 3.18 1% 3180 | % 3181 % 31.80
Serotonin, Serum 113 87.06 | $ 87.06 | $ 87.06 | $ 87.06 | $ 87.06 | $ 87.06
Sodium, Serum 13 9451 % 9.451% 9451 % 9.451% 9451 % 9.45
Stool Culture 113 11.92 | $ 11.92 | $ 11.92 | $ 11.92 | $ 11921 % 11.92
Sulfonylurea Screen QT, Ur 11$ 3825 | % 3825|% 3825 | % 3825|% 38.25 | $ 38.25
T pallidum Ab (FTA-Ab) s 30.80 | $ 30.80 | $ 30.80 | $ 30.80 | $ 30.80 | $ 30.80
T pallidum Screening Cascade 11$ 30.80 | $ 3080 | $ 30.80 | $ 3080 | $ 30.80 | $ 30.80
T3 Uptake 171 $ 223 [$ 3791 1% 223 |$ 3791 1% 223 | % 37.91
T4 and TSH 1s 837 1% 837 1% 837 (% 837 1% 837 (% 8.37
Testosterone, Serum 2| $ 4498 | $ 6747 | $ 4498 | $ 67.47 | $ 4498 | $ 67.47
Thyroxine (T4) 36| $ 2211% 79.56 | $ 2211% 79.56 | $ 2211% 79.56
Thyroxine (T4) Free, Direct, S 3| $ 33.86 | $ 84.651% 33.86 | $ 84.651% 33.86 | $ 84.65
Toxoplasma gondii Ab, IgG, Qn 11$ 2500 | $ 2500 | $ 2500 | $ 2500 | $ 25.00 | $ 25.00
Toxoplasma gondii Ab,IgM,Qn 1% 25.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 25.00
TPA Activity s 108.00 | $ 108.00 | $ 108.00 | $ 108.00 | $ 108.00 | $ 108.00
Transferrin 4| $ 2354 | $ 141.24 | $ 23.54 | $ 141.24 | $ 23.54 | $ 141.24
Trich vag by NAA 1s 3500 | $ 3500 | $ 35.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 35.00
Trichomonas Culture 2| $ 23.45 | $ 3518 | $ 23.45 | $ 3518 | $ 23.45 | $ 35.18
Triglycerides 11$ 450 | $ 450 | % 450 | $ 450 | % 450 | $ 4.50
Triiodothyronine (T3) 5% 32.64 | $ 146.88 | $ 32.64 | $ 146.88 | $ 32.64 | $ 146.88
TSH 46| $ 6161 % 28336 | $ 616 1% 28336 | $ 616 % 283.36
Upper Respiratory Culture 5| $ 2284 | $ 102.78 | $ 2284 | $ 102.78 | $ 2284 | $ 102.78
Uric Acid, Serum 6l $ 5301 % 29.151$ 530 [ $ 29.151$ 530 [ $ 29.15
Urinalysis, Complete 2| $ 2121 % 424 1% 2121 % 424 1% 2121 % 4.24
Urinalysis, Routine 362| $ 325|% 1,176.50 | $ 325|% 1,176.50 | $ 3251 % 1,176.50
Urine Culture, Routine 46| $ 582 (% 26772 | $ 582 (% 26772 | $ 582 (% 267.72
Valproic Acid (Depakote)(R).S 31| $ 10.86 | $ 33123 | § 1086 | $ 33123 | $ 1086 | $ 331.23
Vancomycin Peak, Serum 1% 3220 | $ 3220 | $ 3220 | $ 3220 | $ 3220 | $ 32.20
Vancomycin Trough, Serum 1% 3220 [ $ 3220 | % 3220 | $ 3220 | % 3220 | $ 32.20
Varicella-Zoster V Ab, 1IgG 2| $ 15.09 | $ 22.64 | $ 15.09 | $ 22.64 | $ 15.09 | $ 22.64
Vitamin B12 2| $ 30.45 | $ 45.68 | $ 30.45 | $ 45.68 | $ 30.45 | $ 45.68
Vitamin B12 and Folate 2|3 57.49 | $ 8624 | $ 57.49 | $ 8624 | $ 57.49 | $ 86.24
Vitamin D, 25-Hydroxy 4] % 1680 | $ 67.20 | $ 1680 | $ 67.20 | $ 16.80 | $ 67.20
White Blood Cells (WBC), Stool 1% 17.06 | $ 17.06 | $ 17.06 | $ 17.06 | $ 17.06 | $ 17.06
TOTAL TESTS 5,184 $  49.946.29 $ 4994629 $ 4994629

PHLEBOTOMY HOURS HOURLY RATE YEAR ONE HOURLY RATE YEAR TWO HOURLY RATE [ OP YEAR THREE
PHLEBOTOMY HOURS* 780| $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
GRAND TOTAL TESTING $ 149,838.87
GRAND TOTAL PHLEBOTOMY $ -
GRAND TOTAL THREE YEARS $ 149,838.87
ADDITIONAL REQUESTS DISCOUNTED AT 70%
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BIDDER: ATLANTIC DIAGNOSTIC

LABORATORIES, LLC YEAR ONE YEARTWO OPTION YEAR THREE
ABO Grouping and Rho(D) Typing e 200 [ $ 2001 % 200 | $ 2001 $% 200 [ $ 2.00
Aerobic Bacterial Culture 42| $ 9.00 | $ 378.00 | $ 9.00 | $ 378.00 | $ 900 | $ 378.00
AFP, Serum, Tumor Marker 1% 1020 | $ 1020 | $ 1020 | $ 1020 | $ 1020 | $ 10.20
ALA Delta, Random Urine 13 20.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 20.00
Albumin, Serum 1% 1.80 | $ 180 | $ 1.80 [ $ 180 | $ 1.80 [ $ 1.80
Ammonia, Plasma 7] $ 600 | $ 39.00 | $ 600 | $ 39.00 | $ 600 | $ 39.00
Amylase, Serum 71$ 4.50 | $ 29251$% 450 | $ 29251 % 450 | $ 29.25
Anaerobic and Aerobic Culture 46] $ 18.00 | $ 828.00 | $ 18.00 | $ 828.00 | $ 18.00 | $ 828.00
Antibody Screen 13 1000 | $ 1000 | $ 1000 | $ 1000 | $ 1000 | $ 10.00
Antinuclear Antibodies Direct 1% 780 | % 780 | % 780 | % 780 |% 7.80 | $ 7.80
Basic Metabolic Panel (8) 326] $ 9.30 | $ 3,031.80 | $ 9.30 | $ 3,031.80 | $ 930 [ $ 3,031.80
Beta Strep Gp A Culture 1% 12.00 | $ 1200 | $ 1200 | $ 1200 | $ 12.00 | $ 12.00
Bilirubin, Direct 13 4.50 | $ 450 1$ 450 | $ 450 1% 450 | $ 4.50
Bilirubin, Total 1% 300 | $ 300 |$ 300 | $ 300 1% 300 [ $ 3.00
Blood Culture, Routine 2|$ 900 | $ 1350 | $ 900 | $ 1350 | $ 900 | $ 13.50
B-Type Natriuretic Peptide 119% 3794 | $ 3794 1% 3794 (% 3794 1% 3794 1% 37.94
BUN 13 300 | % 300 1% 300 | $ 300 1% 300 $ 3.00
C difficile Toxins A+B, EIA 2| $ 12.50 | $ 25.00 | $ 1250 | § 25.00 | $ 1250 | $ 25.00
CA27.29 2|$ 23.00 | $ 3450 | $ 23.00 | $ 3450 | $ 23.00 | $ 34.50
Calcium, lonized, Serum 119% 1470 | $ 1470 | $ 1470 | $ 1470 | $ 1470 | $ 14.70
Calcium, Serum 13 300 | $ 3001% 300 | $ 300 1% 300 (% 3.00
Carbamazepine(Tegretol), S 7|'$ 10.00 | $ 6500 | $ 10.00 | $ 6500 | $ 10.00 | $ 65.00
CBC With Differential/Platelet 5150 $ 500 [ $ 2,575.00 | $ 500 | $ 2,575.00 | $ 500 | $ 2,575.00
CBC, Platelet, No Differential 271 $ 480 | % 129.60 | $ 480 | % 129.60 | $ 480 | $ 129.60
CBC/Differential (No Platelet) 13 500 | % 500 1% 500 | $ 500 1% 500 | $ 5.00
CD4/CD8 Ratio Profile 5% 55.00 | $ 24750 | $ 55.00 | $ 24750 | $ 55.00 | $ 247.50
Ceruloplasmin 1% 600 | $ 600 |$ 600 | $ 600 | $ 6.00 | $ 6.00
Chlamydia Antibodies, IgG 1% 10.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 1000 | $ 10.00
Chlamydia pneumoniae(IgG/M) 1% 1500 | $ 1500 | $ 1500 | $ 1500 | $ 1500 | $ 15.00
Chlamydia frachomatis, NAA 1 38.00 | $ 38.00 | $ 38.00 | $ 38.00 | $ 38.00 | $ 38.00
Chlamydia/GC Amplification 271 $ 76.00 | $ 2,014.00 | $ 7600 | $ 201400 | $ 76.00 | $ 2,014.00
Cholesterol, Total 891 % 300 | $ 26550 | $ 300 | $ 26550 | $ 3.00 (% 265.50
Comp. Metabolic Panel (14) 292] § 10.50 | $ 3,066.00 | $ 10.50 | $ 3,066.00 | $ 10.50 | $ 3,066.00
C-Peptide, Serum 1% 22.00 | $ 22.00 | $ 2200 | $ 2200 | $ 2200 | $ 22.00
Creatine Kinase, Total,Serum 4] $ 480 | $ 1680 | $ 480 | $ 1680 | $ 4.80 | $ 16.80
Creatinine, Serum 1% 3.00 [ $ 3.00|$% 300 | $ 300|% 300 | $ 3.00
Cystic Fibrosis Profile 13 556.00 [ $ 556.00 | $ 556.00 [ $ 556.00 | $ 556.00 | $ 556.00
Cytomegalovirus (CMV) Ab, IgG 1% 1200 | $ 1200 | $ 1200 | $ 1200 | $ 1200 | $ 12.00
D-Dimer 13 500 | % 500 1% 500 | $ 5001% 500 | $ 5.00
Digoxin, Serum 2| $ 1500 | $ 22.50 | $ 1500 | $ 22.50 | $ 1500 | $ 22.50
Ethanol, Blood 13 1200 | $ 1200 | $ 1200 | $ 1200 | $ 1200 | $ 12.00
Factor VIII Activity 1% 24.00 | $ 24.00 | $ 24.00 | $ 24.00 | $ 24.00 | $ 24.00
Fe+TIBC+Fer+Transf 13 4290 | $ 4290 | $ 4290 | $ 4290 | $ 4290 | $ 42.90
Ferritin, Serum 8l % 1600 | $ 120.00 | $ 1600 | $ 120.00 | $ 1600 | $ 120.00
Folate (Folic Acid), Serum 1% 10.50 | $ 1050 | $ 1050 | $ 1050 | $ 10.50 | $ 10.50
Fungus (Mycology) Culture 1% 800 | $ 800 |$ 8.00 | $ 8.00|$ 8.00 | $ 8.00
G-6-PD, Quant, Blood and RBC 13 720 % 7201% 720 | $ 7201% 720 % 7.20
Genital Culture, Routine 1% 9.00 | $ 9.00|$ 9.00 | $ 9.00|$ 9.00 | $ 9.00
Genital Mycoplasmas NAA, Swab 13 111.00 [ $ 111.00 | $ 111.00 [ $ 111.00 | $ 111.00 [ $ 111.00
GenoSure(R) MG 1% 14100 [ $ 14100 | $ 14100 [ $ 14100 | $ 14100 [ $ 141.00
Gest. Diabetes 1-Hr Screen 1% 500 | $ 500 | % 500 | $ 500 | % 5.00 | $ 5.00
Glucose, Serum 1% 400 | $ 400 |$ 400 | $ 400 |$ 400 | $ 4.00
HBsAg Screen 1% 1400 | $ 126.00 | $ 1400 | $ 126.00 | $ 1400 | $ 126.00
HBV/HCV (Profile VIII) 13 60.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 60.00
hCG,Beta Subunit, Qnt, Serum 8l $ 1139 | $ 8543 % 11391$% 8543 % 11391% 85.43
hCG,Beta Subunit,Qual.Serum 71'$ 300 | % 19.50 | $ 300 | % 1950 | $ 300 | $ 19.50
HCV Ab w/Rflx to Verification 71$ 19.00 | $ 12350 | $ 19.00 | $ 12350 | $ 19.00 | $ 123.50
HCV Antibody 13| $ 19.00 | $ 237.50 | $ 19.00 | $ 237.50 | $ 19.00 | $ 237.50
HCV Genotyping Non Reflex 13 28772 $ 287721 % 28772 $ 287721 % 28772 $ 287.72
HCV RNA PCR Qn Rfx NS3/4A 113 42179 [ $ 42179 | $ 42179 [ $ 42179 | $ 42179 [ $ 421.79
HCV RNA, PCR, Qualitative 113 38.00 | $ 38.00 | $ 38.00 | $ 38.00 | $ 38.00 | $ 38.00
HCV RT-PCR, Quant (Graph) 13 38.00 | $ 38.00 | $ 38.00 | $ 38.00 | $ 38.00 | $ 38.00
HDL Cholesterol 13 800 (% 800 |% 800 [$ 800 % 800 |$ 8.00
Helper Suppressor Short Prof. e 55.00 | $ 55.00 | $ 55.00 | $ 55.00 | $ 5500 | $ 55.00
Helper T-Lymph-CD4 423 2993 | $ 1,242.10 | $ 2993 1% 1,242.10 | $ 2993 1% 1,242.10
Hemoglobin Alc 1201 $ 6.60 | $ 78870 | $ 6.60 | $ 78870 | $ 6.60 | $ 788.70
Hep A Ab, IgM 5% 12.60 | $ 5670 | $ 12.60 | $ 5670 | $ 12.60 | $ 56.70
Hep A Ab, Total 5| % 1200 | $ 60.00 | $ 1200 | $ 60.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 60.00
Hep A(Rflx To IgM) 13 12.00 | $ 1200 | $ 1200 | $ 1200 | $ 1200 | $ 12.00
Hep B Core Ab, IgM 1% 15.00 | $ 1500 | $ 1500 | $ 1500 | $ 1500 | $ 15.00
Hep B Core Ab, Tot 2| $ 1500 | $ 2250 | $ 1500 | $ 2250 | $ 1500 | $ 22.50
Hep B Surface Ab 100 $ 12.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 120.00
Hep Be Ag 13 12.00 | $ 1200 | $ 1200 | $ 1200 | $ 1200 | $ 12.00
Hepatic Function Panel (7) 641 $ 700 | $ 448.00 | $ 700 | $ 448.00 | $ 700 | $ 448.00
Hepatitis Panel (4) '3 45.00 | $ 24750 | $ 45.00 | $ 24750 | $ 4500 | $ 247.50
Hgb Frac. Profile 2|$ 600 | $ 900 % 600 | $ 9001 $%$ 600 | $ 9.00
Hgb+Hct 13 300 | $ 300|$% 300 | $ 300|$% 300 (% 3.00
HP5+HAVIgM+HBCIgM+HBeAb+Ag 2% 83.00 | $ 12450 | $ 83.00 | $ 12450 | $ 83.00 | $ 124.50
HSV 1 and 2-Specific Ab, IgG 2|$ 27.00 | $ 40.50 | $ 27.00 | $ 40.50 | $ 27.00 | $ 40.50
HSV, IgM I/l Combination 13 27.00 | $ 27.00 | $ 27.00 | $ 27.00 | $ 27.00 | $ 27.00
Insulin 13 25.60 | $ 25.60 | $ 25.60 | $ 25.60 | $ 25.60 | $ 25.60
Iron and TIBC 9l $ 1120 | $ 9520 | $ 1120 | $ 9520 | $ 1120 | $ 95.20
Iron, Serum 1% 450 [ $ 450 | $ 450 | $ 450 | $ 450 | $ 4.50
Lamotrigine (Lamictal), Serum 1% 1454 | $ 1454 | $ 1454 | $ 1454 | $ 1454 | $ 14.54
LDH 13 420 | $ 420 1% 420 | $ 420 1% 420 | $ 4.20
Levetiracetam (Keppra), S 151'% 1454 | $ 21810 | $ 1454 | $ 21810 | $ 14.54 | $ 218.10
Lipase, Serum 71'$ 450 [ $ 29251 % 450 | $ 29251 % 450 | $ 29.25




. EST. # OF = 2 = = = 2
TEST TESTS z 6 z 6 z 8
AB2022-13 PROPOSAL FORM LABORATORY TESTING SERVICES FOR THE MERCER COUNTY CORRECTION CENTER

Lipid Cascade 100 $ 1500 | $ 14250 | $ 1500 | $ 14250 | $ 1500 | $ 142.50
Lipid Panel 161] $ 1500 | $ 241500 | $ 1500 | $ 241500 | $ 1500 | $ 2,415.00
Lipid Panel With LDL/HDL Ratio 13 1500 | $ 1500 | $ 1500 | $ 1500 | $ 1500 | $ 15.00
Lithium (Eskalith(R)), Serum 121 % 9.00 | $ 108.00 | $ 900 | $ 108.00 | $ 900 |$ 108.00
Lower Respiratory Culture 1% 9.00 | $ 9.00|$% 9.00 | $ 9.00|%$ 900 | $ 9.00
Magnesium, Serum 4l $ 4.50 | $ 24751 % 4.50 | $ 24751$% 450 | $ 24.75
Microalbumin, Random Urine 58] $ 430 | $ 24725 | $ 430 | $ 24725 | $ 430 | $ 247.25
Neisseria gonorrhoea Ab,Total 1% 36.00 | $ 36.00 | $ 36.00 | $ 36.00 | $ 36.00 | $ 36.00
NMR LipoProfile 23 3462 | % 6924 | $ 3462 | $ 6924 | $ 3462 | $ 69.24
Occult Blood, Fecal, IA 4% 370 | % 12951$% 370 | $ 12951$ 370 | $ 12.95
Ova + Parasite Exam 2| $ 24.30 | $ 36.45 | $ 2430 | $ 36.45 | $ 2430 | $ 36.45
Oxcarbazepine (Trileptal).s e 1454 | $ 1454 1% 1454 | $ 1454 1% 14.54 | $ 14.54
Panel 083824 48] $ 55.00 | $ 261250 | $ 55.00 | $ 261250 | $ 5500 | $ 2,612.50
Panel 083955 s 116.00 [ $ 116.00 | $ 116.00 [ $ 116.00 | $ 116.00 | $ 116.00
Pap IG, rix HPV all pth 15| $ 44.00 | $ 660.00 | $ 44.00 | $ 660.00 | $ 44.00 | $ 660.00
Pap Lb (Liquid-based) 151 $ 18.00 | $ 270.00 | $ 18.00 | $ 270.00 | $ 18.00 | $ 270.00
Phenobarbital, Serum 2| $ 1280 | $ 1920 | $ 1280 | $ 1920 | $ 12.80 | $ 19.20
Phenytoin (Dilantin), Serum 40l $ 14.65 1% 871.68 | $ 14.65 1% 871.68 | $ 14.65 1 $ 871.68
Phosphorus, Serum 2| $ 300 (% 450 | $ 300 | % 450 | $ 3.00 | $ 4.50
Porphobilinogen, Qn, Random Ur 1% 750 | $ 750 |$ 7.50 | $ 750 | $ 750 | % 7.50
Porphyrins, Qn, Random U 1% 750 | $ 750 $ 7.50 | $ 750 | $ 7.50 | $ 7.50
Prolactin 5% 20.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 100.00
Prostate-Specific Ag, Serum 4] $ 1500 | $ 210.00 | $ 1500 | $ 210.00 | $ 1500 | $ 210.00
Protein Total, Qn, 24-Hr Urine 1% 180 | $ 180 | $ 180 | $ 180 | $ 180 | $ 1.80
Prothrombin Time (PT) e $ 300 (% 35250 | $ 300 | $ 352.50 | $ 300 [ $ 352.50
PSA Total+% Free 8l % 2400 | $ 192.00 | $ 2400 | $ 192.00 | $ 2400 | $ 192.00
PSA, Ultrasensitive W/O Serial 13 24.00 | $ 24.00 | $ 2400 | $ 24.00 | $ 2400 | $ 24.00
PT and PTT '3 8.00[$ 44.00 | $ 8.00[$ 44.00 | $ 800 |$ 44.00
PTH, Intact 1% 54.00 | $ 54.00 | $ 54.00 | $ 54.00 | $ 54.00 | $ 54.00
PTT, Activated 4% 3.00[$ 1050 | $ 300 | $ 1050 | $ 300 $ 10.50
QuantiFERON TB Gold (In Tube) 13 100.00 [ $ 100.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 100.00
Renal Panel (10) 13 9.60 [ $ 9.60 | $ 9.60 | $ 9.60 | $ 9.60 [ $ 9.60
Reticulocyte Count 4] $ 400 | $ 1400 | $ 400 | $ 1400 | $ 400 | $ 14.00
Rheumatoid Arthritis Factor 2| $ 450 | $ 6751 % 450 | $ 6751 % 450 | $ 6.75
RNA Qualitative 13 38.00 | $ 38.00 | $ 38.00 | $ 38.00 | $ 38.00 | $ 38.00
RNA, PCR (NonGraph) rix/Geno 3% 300.00 | $ 750.00 | $ 300.00 [ $ 750.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 750.00
RNA, Real Time PCR (Graph) 260 $ 38.00 | $ 988.00 | $ 38.00 | $ 988.00 | $ 38.00 | $ 988.00
RNA, Real Time PCR (Non-Graph) 141 $ 38.00 | $ 53200 | $ 38.00 | $ 53200 | $ 38.00 | $ 532.00
RPR 164] $ 150 | $ 245251 % 150 | $ 245251 % 150 | $ 245.25
RPR, Rfx Qn RPR/Confirm TP 2,029] $ 1500 | $ 3042750 | $ 1500 | $ 3042750 | $ 1500 | $  30.,427.50
Rubella Antibodies, IgG 3|$ 12.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 30.00
Rubella Antibodies, IgM 13 12.00 | $ 1200 | $ 1200 | $ 1200 | $ 1200 | $ 12.00
Sedimentation Rate-Westergren 100 $ 150 | $ 1500 | $ 150 | $ 1500 | $ 150 | $ 15.00
Serotonin, Serum 13 3520 | $ 3520 | $ 3520 | $ 3520 | $ 3520 | $ 35.20
Sodium, Serum 1% 390 | $ 390 |% 390 | % 390 |% 390 | % 3.90
Stool Culture 13 9.00 [ $ 9001 % 900 | $ 9001 $ 900 | $ 9.00
Sulfonylurea Screen QT, Ur s 1500 | $ 1500 | $ 1500 | $ 1500 | $ 15.00 | $ 15.00
T pallidum Ab (FTA-Ab) 13 1500 | $ 1500 | $ 1500 | $ 1500 | $ 1500 | $ 15.00
T pallidum Screening Cascade s 1500 | $ 1500 | $ 1500 | $ 1500 | $ 15.00 | $ 15.00
T3 Uptake 171% 600 [ $ 102.00 | $ 600 | $ 102.00 | $ 600 | $ 102.00
T4 and TSH 13 33.00 | $ 33.00 | $ 33.00 | $ 33.00 | $ 33.00 | $ 33.00
Testosterone, Serum 2| $ 3200 | $ 4800 | $ 3200 | $ 4800 | $ 32.00 | $ 48.00
Thyroxine (T4) 36| $ 600 [ $ 21600 | $ 600 [ $ 21600 | $ 600 [ $ 216.00
Thyroxine (T4) Free, Direct, S 313 600 [ $ 1500 | $ 600 | $ 1500 | $ 600 | $ 15.00
Toxoplasma gondii Ab, IgG, Qn 1% 1200 | $ 1200 | $ 1200 | $ 1200 | $ 1200 | $ 12.00
Toxoplasma gondii Ab,IgM.Qn 13 1500 | $ 1500 | $ 1500 | $ 1500 | $ 1500 | $ 15.00
TPA Activity 13 10.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 10.00
Transferrin '3 1520 | $ 9120 | $ 1520 | $ 9120 | $ 1520 | $ 91.20
Trich vag by NAA 13 3851 | $ 3851 1% 3851 | % 3851 1% 38.51 | % 38.51
Trichomonas Culture 2|$ 2500 | $ 3750 | $ 2500 | $ 3750 | $ 2500 | $ 37.50
Triglycerides i B 730 (% 7301% 730 | $ 730|$ 730 [ $ 7.30
Triiodothyronine (T3) 5% 600 [ $ 27.00 | $ 600 | $ 27.00 | $ 600 | $ 27.00
TSH 46| $ 23.00 | $ 1,058.00 | $ 23.00 | $ 1,058.00 | $ 23.00 | $ 1,058.00
Upper Respiratory Culture 5| % 9.00 | $ 40.50 | $ 9.00 | $ 40.50 | $ 9.00 | $ 40.50
Uric Acid, Serum 4l $ 300 | $ 16.50 | $ 300 | $ 16.50 | $ 300 |$ 16.50
Urinalysis, Complete 2|$ 3.00 | $ 6.00 | $ 3.00 | $ 600 | $ 300 (% 6.00
Urinalysis, Routine 362] $ 2.00 | $ 72400 | $ 2.00 | $ 72400 | $ 2.00 | $ 724,00
Urine Culture, Routine 461 $ 6.00 | $ 27600 | $ 6.00 | $ 27600 | $ 600 | $ 276.00
Valproic Acid (Depakote)(R).S 31 $ 10.00 | $ 305.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 305.00 | $ 1000 | $ 305.00
Vancomycin Peak, Serum 1% 12.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 1200 | $ 12.00
Vancomycin Trough, Serum 1% 1200 | $ 1200 | $ 1200 | $ 1200 | $ 1200 | $ 12.00
Varicella-Zoster V Ab, IgG 2| $ 12.60 | $ 1890 | $ 1260 | $ 1890 | $ 12.60 | $ 18.90
Vitamin B12 2% 1500 | $ 2250 | $ 15.00 | $ 2250 | $ 15.00 | $ 22.50
Vitamin B12 and Folate 2|$ 26.00 | $ 39.00 | $ 26.00 | $ 39.00 | $ 2600 | $ 39.00
Vitamin D, 25-Hydroxy 4% 30.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 120.00
White Blood Cells (WBC), Stool s 476 | $ 476 | $ 476 | $ 476 | $ 476 [ $ 4.76
TOTAL TESTS 5,184 $  64,455.04 $  64,455.04 $  64,455.04

PHLEBOTOMY HOURS HOURLY RATE YEAR ONE HOURLY RATE YEAR TWO HOURLY RATE | OP YEAR THREE
PHLEBOTOMY HOURS* 780] $ 19.00 | $§  14.820.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 15,600.00 | $ 21.00|$ 16380.00
GRAND TOTAL TESTING $ 193,365.11
GRAND TOTAL PHLEBOTOMY $  46,800.00
GRAND TOTAL THREE YEARS $ 240,165.11
ADDITIONAL REQUESTS DISCOUNTED AT 0%




BID RESULTS

CKO9MERCER2022-02B REBID OF LUMBER AND BULDING SUPPLIES FOR A PERIOD
OF TWO YEARS FOR THE COUNTY OF MERCER AND CO-OP

BID OPENING DATE: APRIL 6,2022

NO. OF BIDDERS:

1

NAME OF BIDDER:

HEATH LUMBER CO.

ADDRESS 1580 NORTH OLDEN AVENUE
CITY, STATE, ZIP EWING, NJ 08638
CONTACT GARY PATRICELLI
TELEPHONE 609.392.1166

FAX 609.396.8050

E-MAIL MGOODWINO306@GMAIL.COM
NJ SAVI DESIGNATION SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE
EXTEND TO COOPERATIVE YES

INSURANCE CERTIFICATE INCLUDED
INSURANCE AND INDEMNIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED
NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP

SIGNED AND DATED

IRAN CERTIFICATION

SIGNED AND DATED

EXHIBIT A OK

EIC CERT#6184 EXPIRES 12/15/26

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 SIGNED AND DATED

HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS YES

CONTINUITY OF SERVICE YES

EXCEPTIONS YES, DIFFERENT COUNTS, SIZES FOR
ITEMS

FATAL FLAW NO



mailto:MGOODWIN0306@GMAIL.COM

CKO9MERCER2022-02B REBID FOR BUILDING MATERIALS PROPOSAL - THE COUNTY WILL ACCEPT THE BRAND NAMES STATED OR AN EQUIVALENT BRAND

ITEM # CATEGORY BUILDING MATERIAL DESCRIPTION CASE COUNT COS;:)EURN(:ASE VENDOR CASE COUNT COé'LI;CE)?:gElJILI:-OR
1 ADHESIVE 36- Titebond Construction ADH 2902 241% 1CASE | $ 91.87
2 ADHESIVES Vinyl Floor Tile Adhesive (Gallon) 1% 1EACH | $ 22.72
3 ADHESIVES Tile Bound Il Wood Glue 1 Gal Bottles 113 1CASE | $ 23.25
4 ADHESIVES Vinyl Cove Base Adhesive, 24- 11 oz Tubes / Cs (CASE) 113 1CASE | $ 69.30
5 ADHESIVES PL200 Multi-Purpose Adhesive, 12- 11 oz Tubes / Cs (CASE) 12]% 1CASE | $ 25.65
6 ADHESIVES White Late Caulking-, Paintable, 12- 11 oz Tubes / Cs (CASE) 12]% 1CASE | $ 23.40
7 ADHESIVES White Silicone Caulking, Paintable, 12- 11 oz- Tubes / Cs (CASE) 12]% 1CASE | $ 101.25
8 ADHESIVES Clear Silicone Caulking- 11 oz Tubes, 12 Tubes / Cs (CASE) 1219 1CASE | $ 81.75
9 ADHESIVES Glazing Compound 11 oz. Tubes, 12 Tubes/Cs (CASE) 1219 1CASE | $ 4485
10 ADHESIVES Mortar Mix - 80 Ib bags 113 BAG | $ 7.09
11 ADHESIVES Gravel Mix - 80 Ib bags 113 BAG | $ 6.43
12 ADHESIVES Sand Mix - 80 Ib bags 113 PER- 60LB BAG | $ 797
13 ADHESIVES Portland Cement - 94 Ib bags 113 94LB BAG | $ 17.28
14 CERAMIC & QUARRY TILE GROUT 7 Ib bags sand grout poly blend 113 EACH | $ 9.70
15 CERAMIC & QUARRY TILE GROUT 5 Ib bags wall grout 12x24 bag 113 EACH | $ 6.40
16 CERAMIC & QUARRY TILE GROUT 1 gallon container of floor sealer 113 EACH ] $ 19.28
17 CERAMIC & QUARRY TILE SUB FLOOR 3"X 5" X 1/4" backer board 113 EACH | $ 19.40
18 CERAMIC & QUARRY TILE SUB FLOOR 3"x 5"x 1/2" backer board 113 EACH | $ 19.40
19 COMPOSITE DECKING(TREX) 50 Ib. ss decking screws 2 /2 " long 113 2000 PER BOX | $ 273.06
20 COMPOSITE RAILING (FIBERON) Straight 8 ft. x 42" 113 NO BID

21 COMPOSITE RAILING (FIBERON) Straight 6 ft. x 42" 113 NO BID
22 COMPOSITE RAILING (FIBERON) Stair kits — 6" x 36" 113 NO BID
23 COMPOSITE RAILING (FIBERON) Surface mount brackets for concrete 113 NO BID
24 COMPOSITE RAILING (FIBERON) Post sleeve — 108" x 4 x 4 NO BID
25 COMPOSITE RAILING (FIBERON) Post caps (Standard size is 4" x 4") 113 NO BID
26 CONSTRUCTION TUBES 12" x 12 113 EACH | $ 38.91
27 CONSTRUCTION TUBES 16" x 12 113 EACH | $ 107.77
28 CONSTRUCTION TUBES 18" x 12 113 EACH | $ 141.57
29 PATIO DOORS (OUTSWING & INSWING) VINYL (FRENC gzge[;?; ‘:&? ;fv”;; 3 ftunit (pre-hung) with Standard Jam- 6 9/16" s EACH | $ 1,805.79
30 INSULATION (JOHNS MANVILLE OR EQUIVALENT) [Wide faces R-13 insulation -3 1/2"x 15" 1% PKG | $ 57.77
31 INSULATION (JOHNS MANVILLE OR EQUIVALENT) [R-19 kraft faced fiber glass insulation - 6" x 15" 1% PKG | $ 58.67
32 INSULATION (JOHNS MANVILLE OR EQUIVALENT) |Great stuff insulating foam 12 oz. cans 12]% I CASE | $ 84.00
33 ROOFING 15 Ib. felt 1% NO BID
34 ROOFING Ice Water Shield Underlayment 66.8 2sq per roll 113 NO BID
35 ROOFING Wet or Dry Roof Cement - 5 gal. containers 113 EACH | $ 41.46
36 ROOFING Aluminum Roof Coating - 5 gal.cans 113 EACH | $ 82.92
37 VINYL SOFFIT SIDING WHITE Vinyl F-channel 12" x 6" 1% PCS|$ 12.53
38 VINYL SOFFIT SIDING WHITE Basket weave vinyl soffit perf t4 1% PCS|$ 23.57
39 VINYL SOFFIT SIDING WHITE J-channel - white 5/8" 1% PCS|$ 16.12
40 VINYL SOFFIT SIDING WHITE J-channel - white 1/2" 1% PCS|$ 10.80




CKO9MERCER2022-02B REBID FOR BUILDING MATERIALS PROPOSAL - THE COUNTY WILL ACCEPT THE BRAND NAMES STATED OR AN EQUIVALENT BRAND

ITEM # CATEGORY BUILDING MATERIAL DESCRIPTION CASE COUNT COS:;:)EURN(:ASE VENDOR CASE COUNT COé'LI;CE)?:gEUI:EOR
41 VINYL SOFFIT SIDING WHITE White aluminum coil pvc 24" x 50' 113 NO BID
42 VINYL SOFFIT SIDING WHITE Nichols Aluminum Nails 1 1/4" White Trim Nails 1 b 113 NO BID
43 VINYL WINDOW REPLACEMENTS (IDEAL) White exterior, insulated glass with low e with half screen 22" x 30" 1% NO BID
44 VINYL WINDOW REPLACEMENTS (IDEAL) White exterior, insulated glass with low e with half screen 24" x 38" 1% NO BID
45 VINYL WINDOW REPLACEMENTS (IDEAL) White exterior, insulated glass with low e with half screen 36" x 36" 113$ NO BID
46 VINYL WINDOW REPLACEMENTS (IDEAL) White exterior, insulated glass with low e with half screen 24" x 48" 113$ NO BID
47 [VINYL WINDOWS NEW CONSTRUCTION (ANDERSON)|Double hung low e with screens 36" x 48" tw30310 113 NO BID
48 [VINYL WINDOWS NEW CONSTRUCTION (ANDERSON)|Double hung low e with screens 36" x 36" tw30210 113 NO BID
49 [VINYL WINDOWS NEW CONSTRUCTION (ANDERSON)|Double hung low e with screens 24" x 48" tw20310 113 NO BID
50 TAPE- (EACH) Perforated Spackling Tape / 250’ rolls 113 NO BID
51 CORNER BEAD 17" x 1 %" x 10" Metal Cormner Bead 113 NO BID
52 J CHANNEL %" x 10" J-Channel, Plastic 113 EACH | $ 1.61
53 J CHANNEL 5/8" x 10" J-Channel, Plastic 113 EACH | $ 1.61
54 DRY WALL SCREWS Dry-wall Screws- coarse- No.2 Phillips size 1" 10m 113 EACH ] $ 84.68
55 DRY WALL SCREWS Dry-wall Screws- coarse- No.2 Phillips size 1 1/4" 8m 113$ EACH | $ 72.43
56 DRY WALL SCREWS Dry-wall Screws- coarse- No.2 Phillips size 1 5/8" 5m 113$ EACH | $ 57.06
57 DRY WALL SCREWS Dry-wall Screws- coarse- No.2 Phillips size 2" 3.5m 113 EACH ] $ 51.87
58 DRY WALL SCREWS Dry-wall Screws- coarse- No.2 Phillips size 2 1/2" 2.5m 113$ EACH | $ 58.25
59 DRY WALL SCREWS Dry-wall Screws- coarse- No.2 Phillips size 3" 2m 113 EACH ] $ 61.06
60 DRY WALL SCREWS Dry-wall Screws- fine- No.2 Phillips size 1" 10m 113 EACH ] $ 84.68
61 DRY WALL SCREWS Dry-wall Screws- fine- No.2 Phillips size 1 1/4" 8m 113 EACH | $ 72.43
62 DRY WALL SCREWS Dry-wall Screws- fine- No.2 Phillips size 1 5/8" 5m 113 EACH | $ 57.06
63 DRY WALL SCREWS Dry-wall Screws- fine- No.2 Phillips size 2" 3.5m 113 EACH | $ 51.87
64 DRY WALL SCREWS Dry-wall Screws- fine- No.2 Phillips size 2 1/2" 2.5m 113 EACH | $ 58.25
65 DRY WALL SCREWS Dry-wall Screws- fine- No.2 Phillips size 3" 2m 113 EACH | $ 61.06
66 STEEL STUD 2x4x8' 25GA 113 EACH | $ 9.29
67 STEEL STUD 2x4x10" 25GA 113 EACH | $ 10.76
68 STEEL STUD 2x4x12'25GA 113 EACH | $ 12.92
69 STEEL STUD 2 x4 x 10’ Steel Sole/Top Plate 25 GA 113 EACH | $ 11.51
70 STEEL STUD 2x4x8' -20GA 1% EACH | $ 10.51
71 STEEL STUD 2x4x10"-20 GA 1% EACH | $ 13.13
72 STEEL STUD 2x4x12'-20 GA 1% EACH | $ 15.76
73 L SHELF BRACKETS (EACH) 12" x 9 1/2" w/Support Arm 1% 12X8-EACH | $ 3.85
74 L SHELF BRACKETS (EACH) 20" x 13" w/Support Arm & Closet Pole Holder 1% 20X10-EACH | $ 2.53
75 L SHELF BRACKETS (EACH) 16 x 20 L-Shelf Bracket w/Support Arm 113 20X13-EACH 6.38
76 THREADED STEEL RODS - / YARD V4" x 36" 113 EACH | $ 1.34
77 THREADED STEEL RODS - / YARD 3/8" x 36" 1% EACH | $ 229
78 THREADED STEEL RODS - / YARD " x 36" 1% EACH | $ 3.89
79 THREADED STEEL RODS - / YARD 5/16" 1% EACH | $ 1.87
80 ROLL 6 MIL CLEAR PLASTIC 20" x 100’ 1% EACH | $ 86.30
81 ROLL 6 MIL CLEAR PLASTIC 8'x 100 1% EACH | $ 48.80




CKO9MERCER2022-02B REBID FOR BUILDING MATERIALS PROPOSAL - THE COUNTY WILL ACCEPT THE BRAND NAMES STATED OR AN EQUIVALENT BRAND

ITEM # CATEGORY BUILDING MATERIAL DESCRIPTION CASE COUNT COS:;:)EURN(:ASE VENDOR CASE COUNT COé'LI;CE)?:gEUI:EOR
82 TAPE- (EACH) 1" x 60 Yds Masking 113 EACH | $ 1.74
83 TAPE- (EACH) 2" x 60 Yds Masking 113 EACH | $ 3.30
84 TAPE- (EACH) 2" Duct 113 EACH | $ 429
85 TAPE- (EACH) 2" x 60 Yds Blue Painters Tape 1% EACH | $ 7.88
86 NAILS COMMON - PER 5 LB BOX 6D 113 EACH | $ 13.98
87 NAILS COMMON - PER 5 LB BOX 8D 113 EACH | $ 13.98
88 NAILS COMMON - PER 5 LB BOX 10D 113 EACH | $ 13.98
89 NAILS COMMON - PER 5 LB BOX 12D 113 EACH | $ 13.98
90 NAILS COMMON - PER 5 LB BOX 12" Galvanized Spikes (50LB) 113 NO BID
1 FINISHING NAILS - PER 5 LB BOX 3D 113 EACH | $ 14.29
92 FINISHING NAILS - PER 5 LB BOX 4D 113 EACH | $ 14.29
93 FINISHING NAILS - PER 5 LB BOX 6D 113 EACH | $ 14.29
94 FINISHING NAILS - PER 5 LB BOX 8D 113 EACH | $ 14.29
95 FINISHING NAILS - PER 5 LB BOX 10D 113 EACH | $ 14.29
96 SUSPENDED CEILING ACOUSTICAL TILE / Box Armstrong (10 PCs/Cs) Square Edge - White (2 x 4 Box) 113 BOX | $ 86.19
97 SUSPENDED CEILING ACOUSTICAL TILE / Box Armstrong (16 PCs/Cs) Square Edge - White (2 x 2 Box) No. 934 113 BOX | $ 100.27
98 SUSPENDED CEILING ACOUSTICAL TILE / Box Armstrong 2' T-Bar White (Simplicity), 60 Pcs/Box 1N B PC|$ 377
99 SUSPENDED CEILING ACOUSTICAL TILE / Box Armstrong 4' T-Bar White (Simplicity), 60 Pcs/Box 1N B PC|$ 7.41
100 SUSPENDED CEILING ACOUSTICAL TILE / Box Armstrong 12" Heavy Duty 5-Bar White, Simplicity 25 Pcs/Box 1N B PC|$ 16.60
101 SUSPENDED CEILING ACOUSTICAL TILE / Box Armstrong 10" Wall Angle White, Simplicity, 40 PCs / Box 1N B PC|$ 16.60
102 SUSPENDED CEILING ACOUSTICAL TILE / Box Armstrong USG-DX 12" Main Tee, White (20 PER CTN) 113 NO BID
103 SUSPENDED CEILING ACOUSTICAL TILE / Box Armstrong USG-DX 2' Cross Tee, White (60 PER CTN) 113 NO BID
104 SUSPENDED CEILING ACOUSTICAL TILE / Box Armstrong USG-DX 4’ Cross Tee, White (60 PER CTN) 113 NO BID
105 SUSPENDED CEILING ACOUSTICAL TILE / Box Armstrong USG-M-7 12" Wall Angle, White 113 NO BID
106 FINISHES Minwax Brand Qil Stain (Asst'd Colors) - / Qt 1N B EACH | $ 11.47
107 FINISHES Minwax Brand Oil Gloss Polyurethane - / Qit 113 EACH | $ 16.12
108 FINISHES Minwax Brand Oil Satin Polyurethane - / Qt 113 EACH | $ 16.12
109 FINISHES Clear Wood Preservative - / Gal. 113 EACH | $ 18.18
110 FINISHES Paint Thinner - / Gal. 113 EACH | $ 8.07
m FINISHES Denatured Alcohol - / Gal. 1% EACH | $ 10.00
112 FINISHES Linseed Oil - / Gal. 1% EACH | $ 31.65
113 FINISHES Paint Remover - / Ga. 1% EACH | $ 14.54
114 FINISHES Elmer’s Brand Carpenter’s Wood Filler - / Pint 1% EACH | $ 4.00
115 FINISHES Lacquer Thinner - / Gal. 1% EACH | $ 15.80
116 SHELF STANDARDS & ARMS- (EACH) 3' Shelf Standards Alum Finish 113 EACH | $ 2.59
17 SHELF STANDARDS & ARMS- (EACH) 4" Shelf Standards Alum Finish 113 EACH | $ 3.48
118 SHELF STANDARDS & ARMS- (EACH) 4" Shelf Standards Alum Finish 1% EACH | $ 4.88
19 SHELF STANDARDS & ARMS- (EACH) 10" Shelf Arms Alum Finish 1% EACH | $ 1.63
120 SHELF STANDARDS & ARMS- (EACH) 12" Shelf Arms Alum Finish 1% EACH | $ 1.83
121 DOUBLE HEAD NAILS 8P /Lb 113 EACH | $ 2.88
122 DOUBLE HEAD NAILS 8P / 50 Lbs 1% EACH | $ 70.00




CKO9MERCER2022-02B REBID FOR BUILDING MATERIALS PROPOSAL - THE COUNTY WILL ACCEPT THE BRAND NAMES STATED OR AN EQUIVALENT BRAND

ITEM # CATEGORY BUILDING MATERIAL DESCRIPTION CASE COUNT COS:;:)EURN(:ASE VENDOR CASE COUNT COé'LI;CE)?:gEUI:EOR
123 DOUBLE HEAD NAILS 10P /b 1N B EACH | $ 2.88
124 DOUBLE HEAD NAILS 10P / 50 Lbs 113 EACH | $ 70.00
125 DOUBLE HEAD NAILS 16P /b 1N B EACH | $ 2.88
126 DOUBLE HEAD NAILS 16P / 50 Lbs 113 EACH | $ 70.00
127 COMMON NAILS 60P / 50 Ibs 113 EACH | $ 68.75
128 COMMON NAILS 60P Galvanized / 50 Lb 113 EACH | $ 102.50
129 COMMON NAILS 8P /50 Lb 113 EACH | $ 61.25
130 COMMON NAILS 10P /b 1]$ EACH | $ 3.13
131 COMMON NAILS 10P / 50 Lb (PER BOX) 113 EACH | $ 61.25
132 COMMON NAILS 16P / Lb 1]$ EACH | $ 400
133 COMMON NAILS 16P /50 Lb 113 EACH | $ 61.25
134 COMMON NAILS 20P /b 1]$ EACH | $ 525
135 COMMON NAILS 20P /50 Lb 113 EACH | $ 70.00
136 BOX NAILS 4P / 50 Lb 113 EACH | $ 80.00
137 BRIDGE DIV. 6P /50 Lb 113 EACH | $ 80.00
138 BRIDGE DIV. 7P /50 Lb 113 EACH | $ 80.00
139 NAILS Paslode 5-Packs Red Fuel Cell IMP(2-Packs per) #277 113 1PACK/EACH | $ 13.63
140 NAILS Paslode 5-Packs Trim Fuel Cell IMP(2-Packs per) 113$ EACH | $ 13.63
141 NAILS Paslode Finish Nails- 16 gauge angled 1 1/4" 113 EACH | $ 19.76
142 NAILS Paslode Finish Nails- 16 gauge angled 1 1/2" 113 EACH | $ 23.32
143 NAILS Paslode Finish Nails- 16 gauge angled 2" 113 EACH | $ 27.05
144 NAILS Paslode Finish Nails- 16 gauge angled 2 1/2" 113 EACH | $ 29.62
145 NAILS Paslode Finish Nails- 16 gauge straight 1 1/4" 113 EACH | $ 11.27
146 NAILS Paslode Finish Nails- 16 gauge straight 1 1/2" 113 EACH | $ 13.39
147 NAILS Paslode Finish Nails- 16 gauge straight 2" 113 EACH | $ 17.68
148 NAILS Paslode Finish Nails- 16 gauge straight 2 1/2" 113 EACH | $ 22.94
149 NAILS Paslode Nails- 2 3/8" x 113- 8D common 113 EACH | $ 60.25
150 NAILS Paslode Nails- 2 3/8" x 113- 10D common 113 EACH | $ 9486
151 NAILS Ramset Concrete Nails- Box of 100- 1 1/2" 113 EACH | $ 9.40
152 NAILS Ramset Concrete Nails- Box of 100- 2" 113 EACH | $ 9.76
153 NAILS Ramset Concrete Nails- Box of 100- 2 1/2" 1% EACH | $ 12.69
154 NAILS Ramset Concrete Nails- Box of 100- 3" 113 EACH | $ 12.90
155 NAILS Ramset Loads/Charges/Cargas- .27 cal.- 100 gty.- strips- red 1% EACH | $ 10.22
156 NAILS Ramset Loads/Charges/Cargas- .27 cal.- 100 gty.- strips- green 1% EACH | $ 10.22
157 NAILS Ramset Loads/Charges/Cargas- .27 cal.- 100 gty.- strips- yellow 113 EACH | $ 10.22
158 ASPHALT IMPREGNATED 4" x 10" x V2" 113 NO BID
159 ASPHALT IMPREGNATED 6" x 10" x V2" 1% NO BID
160 CONCRETE NAILS 1"/ Lb fluted 1% EACH | $ 3.50
161 CONCRETE NAILS 1"/ 50 Lb (PER BOX) 1% NO BID
162 CONCRETE NAILS 2" /Llb 113 EACH | $ 3.50
163 CONCRETE NAILS 2" / 50 Lb (PER BOX) 1% NO BID




CKO9MERCER2022-02B REBID FOR BUILDING MATERIALS PROPOSAL - THE COUNTY WILL ACCEPT THE BRAND NAMES STATED OR AN EQUIVALENT BRAND

COST PER CASE COST FOR VENDOR
ITEM # CATEGORY BUILDING MATERIAL DESCRIPTION CASE COUNT COUNT VENDOR CASE COUNT CASE COUNT

164 CONCRETE NAILS 3"/Lb 1N B EACH | $ 3.50
165 CONCRETE NAILS 3" /50 Lb (PER BOX) 113 NO BID
166 CONCRETE NAILS PVC Pipe 4" - / Foot 113 NO BID
167 CONCRETE NAILS Plastic 20" x 100" x 6 Mil 113 EACH | $ 98.75
168 CONCRETE NAILS Plastic 10" x 100" x 6 Mil 113 EACH | $ 55.00
169 MISCELLANEOUS 5 (cases) - General Purpose Blade 7 4" 5 per pack 25 pcs 113$ 1IPKOF5 | $ 27.50
170 MASONRY: CULTURED STONE MATERIAL 2 (aty) - Mortar Type "N" Bags (50 Cube) (80 LBS. PREPARED) per bal 1ls NO BID

INSERT DISCOUNT

TO RETAIL COST

ENTER BRAND NAME AND SUBMIT CATALOG WITH PRICING WITH BID OR UPCHARGE ENTE‘;:éSégJI:T OR
TO WHOLESALE
Ccost
172 PR DOORS-6 PANEL MOLDED INTERIOR DOOR UNIT PRE-HUNG (=+OR-) %o 25% MARGIN
173 VINYL WINDOW REPLACEMENTS (IDEAL) (=+OR-) 7% 25% MARGIN
174 | VINYL WINDOWS NEW CONSTRUCTION (ANDERSON)| (=+OR-) %o 25% MARGIN
175 PATIO DOORS (OUTSWING & INSWING) VINYL (FRENCHWOOD) (=+OR-) 7 25% MARGIN
MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS NOT STATED UPCHARGE TO _

176 WHOLESALE COST OR DISCOUNT TO RETAIL COST (=+OR-)____7 25% MARGIN
177 LUMBER ONLY RANDOM LENGTHS WEEKLY PRICING *) % 25% MARGIN

+ %

LUMBER BENCHMARK PRICING

RANDOM LENGTHS WEEKLY PRICING

Bidders shall provide an upcharge fo the pricing stated in the Random Lengths Weekly Report for all lumber products.
The Random Lengths Weekly Report provides prices for more than 1,600 items of softwood lumber, panels, and other

wood products.

PAYMENT

When invoicing the County for lumber, the awarded Vendor shall attach a copy of the Random Lengths weekly
pricing fo their invoice and reflect the upcharge on the invoice.




