			RID R	ESULTS				
		AP201	-,	OR THE MERCER COUNTY BOARD OF ELECT	PACIFICATIONS			
BIO OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 28.2023								
BIDS RECEIVED	14		DID OF LINING DATE	E. FEBRUART 20,2020				
NAME OF BIDDER	J&J STAFFING RESOURCES	ABACUS CORPORATION	COMPUNNEL INC.	STAFF TODAY	IMCS GROUP INC.	ATRIUM STAFFING, LLC	RESOURCE LOGISTICS INC.	
ADDRESS	1814 EAST ROUTE 70 SUITE 300	610 GUSRYAN ST.	103 MORGAN LANE SUITE 102	1875 NW CORPORATE BLVD SUITE 120	9901 VALLEY RANCH PARKWAY, STE 3020	387 PARK AVE S.	39 MILLTOWN ROAD	
CITY, STATE, ZIP	CHERRY HILL, N.L 08003	BALTIMORE, MD 21224	PLAINSBORO, N.I.08536	BOCA RATON, FL 33431	IRVING TX. 75063	NEW YORK, NY 10016	FAST BRUNSWICK, N.I 08816	
CONTACT	SEAN E. MALADY	MICHAEL P. BRADY	ASHISH YADAV	ANDREA GOODWIN	MUSTAFA KHAN	FARI PENNEY	VENKATESH P. IYER	
TELEPHONE	856-424-0199	443-961-7871	609-606-9010	800-928-5561	972-919-6600	212-292-0550	732-659-9177	
FAX	856-489-7525	410-633-1976	609-750-0981	877-858-6263	972-692-5896	212-272-0330	732-553-0568	
E-MAIL	SEAN.MALADY@JJSTAFF.COM	MB@ABACUSCORPORATION.COM	GOVT@COMPUNNEL.COM	ANDREA.GOODWIN@HANSTAFF.COM	PRESALES@IMCSGROUP.NET	EPENNEY@ATRIUMSTAFF.COM	GOVT@RESOURCE-LOGISTICS.COM	
nj savi designation	N/A	N/A	MINORITY BUSINESS ENTERPRISE	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
ADDENDUM NO.ONE	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	
INDEMNIFICATION AND INSURANCE	SIGNED AND DATED	SIGNED AND DATED	SIGNED AND DATED	SIGNED AND DATED	SIGNED AND DATED	SIGNED AND DATED	SIGNED AND DATED	
RUSSIA/IRAN CERT	SIGNED AND DATED	SIGNED AND DATED	SIGNED AND DATED	SIGNED AND DATED	REQUIRED IF AWARDED	SIGNED AND DATED	REQUIRED IF AWARDED	
EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1	SIGNED AND DATED	SIGNED AND DATED	SIGNED AND DATED	SIGNED AND DATED	SIGNED AND DATED		SIGNED AND DATED	
STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP	SIGNED AND DATED	SIGNED AND DATED	SIGNED AND DATED	SIGNED AND DATED	SIGNED AND DATED	SIGNED AND DATED	SIGNED AND DATED	
EXHIBIT A	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	REQUIRED IF AWARDED	REQUIRED IF AWARDED	REQUIRED IF AWARED	INCLUDED		
EIC	5896 EXPIRES 9.15.24	REQUIRED IF AWARDED	REQUIRED IF AWARDED	64853 EXPIRES 07.15.24	REQUIRED IF AWARED	REQUIRED IF AWARDED	REQUIRED IF AWARDED	
CONTINUITY OF OPERATION	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES		YES	
NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION	OK	REQUIRED IF AWARDED	REQUIRED IF AWARDED	OK	REQUIRED IF AWARED	REQUIRED IF AWARDED	REQUIRED IF AWARDED	
NEW JERSEY LICENSE	CT0015501 EXP. 6.30.23	CTO401400 EXPIRES 6.30.23	TPO303300 EXPIRES 6.30.23	HP015200 EXPIRES 6.30.23	TP060400 EXP. 6.30.23	CT0428402 EXP. 6.30.23.	NOT INCLUDED	
THREE REFERENCES	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	
HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	
HOURLY RATE	\$ 23.95		\$ 25.00		\$ 27.00	\$ 29.00	7	
EXCEPTIONS	NONE	NONE	NONE	NONE	NONE	NONE	NONE	
NAME OF BIDDER	CHANGING TECHNOLOGIES INC.	AMERICAN HEALTHCARE ENTERPRISES, LLC	PANTHER GROUP STAFFING	INDUSTRIAL STAFFING SERVICES INC. DBA EQUILIEM	PRIORITY GROUP SERVICES LLC.	E-LOGIC, INC.	STRATFORD SOLUTIONS INC.	
ADDRESS	3602 13TH ST. NW. UNIT B							
CITY, STATE, ZIP	3002 1311131. 1444, G1411 B	2700 POST OAK BLVD SUITE 2100	369 LEXINGTON AVENUE SUITE 316	25 KENNEDY BLVD. SUITE 200	4989 STELTON RD.	1025 CONNECTICUT AVENUE NW STE 1000	NO BID	
	WASHINGTON, DC 20010	2700 POST OAK BLVD SUITE 2100 HOUSTON, TX 77056	369 LEXINGTON AVENUE SUITE 316 NEW YORK, NY 10017	25 KENNEDY BLVD. SUITE 200 EAST BRUNSWICK, NJ 08816	4989 STELTON RD. SOUTH PLAINFIELD, NJ 07080		NO BID	
CONTACT						1000	NO BID	
CONTACT TELEPHONE	WASHINGTON, DC 20010	HOUSTON, TX 77056	NEW YORK, NY 10017	EAST BRUNSWICK, NJ 08816	SOUTH PLAINFIELD, NJ 07080	1000 WASHINGTON DC. 20036	NO BID	
	WASHINGTON, DC 20010 DANIELLE LOGAN	HOUSTON, TX 77056 REBEKAH OMORUYI	NEW YORK, NY 10017 SEAN COGDELL	EAST BRUNSWICK, NJ 08816 JOURDAN BLOCK	SOUTH PLAINFIELD, NJ 07080 EZEKIEL SEGUN OLANIYI	1000 WASHINGTON DC. 20036 LUIS F. PADDILLA	NO BID	
TELEPHONE	WASHINGTON, DC 20010 DANIELLE LOGAN 202-688-3631	HOUSTON, TX 77056 REBEKAH OMORUYI 832-434-2887	NEW YORK, NY 10017 SEAN COGDELL 212-490-2233	EAST BRUNSWICK, NJ 08816 JOURDAN BLOCK 646-652-0985	SOUTH PLAINFIELD, NJ 07080 EZEKIEL SEGUN OLANIYI 347-985-3863	1000 WASHINGTON DC. 20036 LUIS F. PADDILLA 202-499-7837	NO BID	
TELEPHONE FAX	WASHINGTON, DC 20010 DANIELLE LOGAN 202-688-3631 202-688-3632	HOUSTON, TX 77056 REBEKAH OMORUYI 832-434-2887 N/A	NEW YORK, NY 10017 SEAN COGDELL 212-490-2233 781-672-2570	EAST BRUNSWICK, NJ 08816 JOURDAN BLOCK 646-652-0985 732-238-2152	SOUTH PLAINFIELD, NJ 07080 EZEKIEL SEGUN OLANIYI 347-985-3863 212-898-0458	1000 WASHINGTON DC. 20036 LUIS F. PADDILLA 202-499-7837 703-349-6228	NO BID	
TELEPHONE FAX E-MAIL	WASHINGTON, DC 20010 DANIELLE LOGAN 202-688-3631 202-688-3632 BIDS@CHANGING.NET	HOUSTON, TX 77056 REBEKAH OMORUYI 832-434-2887 N/A VENDOR@AHEFEDERAL.COM	NEW YORK, NY 10017 SEAN COGDELL 212-490-2233 781-672-2570 HROSS@THEPANTERGROUP.COM	EAST BRUNSWICK, NJ 08816 JOURDAN BLOCK 646-652-0985 732-238-2152 JOURDAN@EQUILLEM.COM	SOUTH PLAINFIELD, NJ 07080 EZEKIEL SEGUN OLANIYI 347-985-3863 212-898-0458 PRIORITYCARESHOME@GMAIL.COM	1000 WASHINGTON DC. 20036 LUIS F. PADDILLA 2002-499-7837 703-349-6228 LPADILLA@E-LOGIC.US	NO BID	
TELEPHONE FAX E-MAIL NJ SAVI DESIGNATION	WASHINGTON, DC 20010 DANIELLE LOGAN 202-688-3631 202-688-3632 BIDS@CHANGING.NET N/A	HOUSTON, TX 77056 REBEKAH OMORUYI 832-434-2887 N/A VENDOR@AHEFEDERAL.COM N/A	NEW YORK, NY 10017 SEAN COGDELL 212-490-2233 781-672-2570 HROSS@HEPANTERGROUP.COM MINORITIY BUSINESS ENTERPISE	EAST BRUNSWICK, NJ 08816 JOURDAN BLOCK 644-552-0985 732-238-2152 JOURDAN@EQUILLEM.COM SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE	SOUTH PLAINFIELD, NJ 07080 EZEKIEL SEGUN OLANIYI 347-985-3863 212-898-0458 PRIORITYCARESHOME@GMAIL.COM N/A	1000 WASHINGTON DC. 20036 LUIS F. PADDILLA 202-499-7837 703-349-6228 LPADILL@E-LOGIC.US N/A	NO BID	
TELEPHONE FAX E-MAIL NJ SAVI DESIGNATION ADDENDUM NO.ONE	WASHINGTON, DC 20010 DANIELLE LOGAN 202-688-3631 202-688-3632 BIDS@CHANGING.NET N/A INCLUDED	HOUSTON, TX 77056 REBEKAH OMORUYI 832-434-2887 N/A VENDOR®AHEFEDRAL COM N/A INCLUDED	NEW YORK, NY 10017 SEAN COGDELL 212-490-2233 781-672-2570 HROSS@THEPANTERGROUP.COM MINORITY BUSINESS ENTERPISE INCLUDED	EAST BRUNSWICK, NJ 08816 JOURDAN BLOCK 646-652-0985 732-238-2152 JOURDAN@FQUILLEM.COM SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE INCLUDED	SOUTH PLAINFIELD, NJ 07080 EZEKIEL SEGUN OLANIYI 347-985-3863 212-898-0458 PRIORITYCARESHOME@GMAIL.COM N/A INCLUDED	1000 WASHINGTON DC. 20036 LUIS F. PADDILLA 202-499-7837 703-349-6228 LPADILLA@E-LOGICUS N/A INCLUDED	NO BID	
TELEPHONE FAX E-MAIL NJ SAVI DESIGNATION ADDENDUM NO, ONE INDEMNIFICATION AND INSURANCE	WASHINGTON, DC 20010 DANIELLE LOGAN 202-688-3631 202-688-3632 BIDS@CHANGING.NET N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED	HOUSTON, TX 77056 REBEKAH OMORUYI 832-434-2887 N/A VENDOR@AHEFEDERAL.COM N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED	NEW YORK, NY 10017 SEAN COGDELL 212-490-2233 781-572-2570 HROSS@THEPANTERGROUP.COM MINORITY BUSINESS ENTERPISE INCLUDED SIGNED AND DAIED	EAST BRUNSWICK, NJ 08816 JOURDAN BLOCK 646-552-0785 732-238-2152 JOURDAN@EQUILIEM.COM SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED	SOUTH PLAINFIELD, NJ 07080 EZEKIEL SEGUN OLANIYI 347-985-3863 212-898-0458 PRIORITYCARESHOME@GMAILCOM N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED	1000 WASHINGTON DC. 20036 LUIS F. PADDILLA 202-499-7837 703-349-6228 LPADILLA@E-LOGICUS N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED	NO BID	
TELEPHONE FAX E-MAIL NJ SAVI DESIGNATION ADDENDUM NO, ONE INDEMNIFICATION AND INSURANCE RUSSIA/IRAN CERT	WASHINGTON, DC 20010 DANIELLE LOGAN 202-688-3631 202-688-3652 BIDS@CHANGING.NET N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED	HOUSTON, TX 77056 REBEKAH OMORUYI 832-434-2887 N/A VENDOR@AHEFEDERAL.COM N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED	NEW YORK, NY 10017 SEAN COGDELL 212-490-2233 781-672-2570 HROSS@THEPANTERGROUP.COM MINORITIY BUSINESS ENTERPISE INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED	EAST BRUNSWICK, NJ 08816 JOURDAN BLOCK 646-652-0985 732-238-2152 JOURDAN@EQUILIEN.COM SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED	SOUTH PLAINFIELD, NJ 07080 EZEKIEL SEGUN OLANIVI 347-985-3863 212-998-0458 PRIORITYCARESHOME@GMAIL.COM N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED	1000 WASHINGTON DC. 20036 LUIS F. PADDILLA 202-499-7837 703-349-6228 LPADILL@E-LOGICUS N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED	NO BID	
TELEPHONE FAX E-MAIL NJ SAVI DESIGNATION ADDENDUM NO, ONE INDEMNIFICATION AND INSURANCE RUSSIA/RAN CERT EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1	WASHINGTON, DC 20010 DANIELLE LOGAN 202-688-3631 202-688-3632 BIDS@CHANGING.NET N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED	HOUSTON, TX 77056 REBEKAH OMORUYI 832-434-2887 N/A VENDOR®AHEFEDERAL COM N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED	NEW YORK, NY 10017 SEAN COGDELL 212-490-2233 781-672-2570 HROSS@THEPANTERGROUP.COM MINORITIY BUSINESS ENTERPISE INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED	EAST BRUNSWICK, NJ 08816 JOURDAN BLOCK 646-652-0785 732-238-2152 JOURDAN@FQUILLEM.COM SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REGUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED	SOUTH PLAINFIELD, NJ 07080 EZEKIEL SEGUN OLANIYI 347-985-3863 212-898-0458 PRIORITYCARESHOME@GMAIL.COM N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED	1000 WASHINGTON DC. 20036 LUIS F. PADDILLA 202-499-7837 703-349-6228 LPADILLA@E-LOGICUS N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED	NO BID	
TELEPHONE FAX E-MAIL NJ SAVI DESIGNATION ADDENDUM NO, ONE INDEMNIFICATION AND INSURANCE RUSSIA/IRAN CERT EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP	WASHINGTON, DC 20010 DANIELLE LOGAN 202-688-3631 202-688-3632 BIDS@CHANGING.NET N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED	HOUSTON, TX 77056 REBEKAH OMORUYI 832-434-2887 N/A VENDOR@AHEFEDERAL.COM N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED	NEW YORK, NY 10017 SEAN COGDELL 212-490-2233 781-572-2570 HROSS@THEPANTERGROUP.COM MINORITY BUSINESS ENTERPISE INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED	EAST BRUNSWICK, NJ 08816 JOURDAN BLOCK 646-552-0785 732-238-2152 JOURDAN@EQUILIEM.COM SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED	SOUTH PLAINFIELD, NJ 07080 EZEKIEL SEGUN OLANIYI 347-985-3863 212-898-0458 PRIORITYCARESHOME@GMAILCOM N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF, AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED	1000 WASHINGTON DC. 20036 LUIS F. PADDILLA 202-499-7837 703-349-6228 IPADILLA@E-LOGICUS N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED JF. AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED	NO BID	
TELEPHONE FAX E-MAIL NJ SAVI DESIGNATION ADDENDUM NO, ONE INDEMNIFICATION AND INSURANCE RUSSIA/IRAN CERT EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP	WASHINGTON, DC 20010 DANIELLE LOGAN 202-688-3631 202-688-3632 BIDS@CHANGING.NET N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED INCLUDED INCLUDED	HOUSTON, TX 77056 REBEKAH OMORUYI 832-434-2887 N/A VENDOR@AHEFEDERAL.COM N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED INCLUDED INCLUDED	NEW YORK, NY 10017 SEAN COGDELL 212-490-2233 781-672-2570 HROSS@THEPANTERGROUP.COM MINORITY BUSINESS ENTERPISE INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED INCLUDED INCLUDED	EAST BRUNSWICK, NJ 08816 JOURDAN BLOCK 646-652-0985 732-238-2152 JOURDANGEQUILLEM.COM SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE INCLUDED SIGNED AND DAIED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DAIED SIGNED AND DAIED SIGNED AND DAIED INCLUDED	SOUTH PLAINFIELD, NJ 07080 EZEKIEL SEGUN OLANIYI 347-985-3863 212-998-0458 PRIORITYCARESHOME@GMAIL.COM N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED INCLUDED INCLUDED	1000 WASHINGTON DC. 20036 LUIS F. PADDILLA 202-499-7837 703-349-6228 LPADILLA@E-LOGICUS N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED INCLUDED INCLUDED	NO BID	
TELEPHONE FAX E-MAIL NJ SAVI DESIGNATION ADDENDUM NO, ONE INDEMNIFICATION AND INSURANCE RUSSIA/IRAN CERT EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP EXHIBIT A EIC	WASHINGTON, DC 20010 DANIELLE LOGAN 202-688-3631 202-688-3632 BIDS@CHANGING.NET N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED INCLUDED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED	HOUSTON, TX 77056 REBEKAH OMORUYI 832-434-2887 N/A VENDOR®AHEFEDERAL COM N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED	NEW YORK, NY 10017 SEAN COGDELL 212-490-2233 781-672-2570 HROSS@THEPANTERGROUP.COM MINORITY BUSINESS ENTERPISE INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED	EAST BRUNSWICK, NJ 08816 JOURDAN BLOCK 646-652-0785 732-238-2152 JOURDANGEQUILLEM COM SIGNED AND DATED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED	SOUTH PLAINFIELD, NJ 07080 EZEKIEL SEGUN OLANIYI 347-985-3863 212-898-0458 PRIORITYCARESHOME@GMAIL.COM N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED	1000 WASHINGTON DC. 20036 LUIS F, PADDILLA 202-499-7837 703-349-6228 LPADILLA@E-LOGICUS N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED	NO BID	
TELEPHONE FAX E-MAIL NJ SAVI DESIGNATION ADDENDUM NO, ONE INDEMNIFICATION AND INSURANCE RUSSIA/IRAN CERT EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP EXHIBIT A EIC CONTINUITY OF OPERATION	WASHINGTON, DC 20010 DANIELLE LOGAN 202-688-3631 202-688-3632 BIDS@CHANGING.NET N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED YES	HOUSTON, TX 77056 REBEKAH OMORUYI 832-434-2887 N/A VENDOR®AHEFEDERAL.COM N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED INCLUDED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED YES	NEW YORK, NY 10017 SEAN COGDELL 212-490-2233 781-572-2570 HROSS@THEPANTERGROUP.COM MINORITY BUSINESS ENTERPISE INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED INCLUDED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED YES	EAST BRUNSWICK, NJ 08816 JOURDAN BLOCK 646-552-0785 732-238-2152 JOURDAN@EQUILIEM.COM SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED INCLUDED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED	SOUTH PLAINFIELD, NJ 07080 EZEKIEL SEGUN OLANIYI 347-985-3863 212-898-0458 PRIORITYCARESHOME@GMAILCOM N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED YES	1000 WASHINGTON DC. 20036 LUIS F. PADDILLA 202-499-7837 703-349-6228 LPADILLA@E-LOGICUS N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED FOR THE SIGNED AND DATED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED YES	NO BID	
TELEPHONE FAX E-MAIL NJ SAVI DESIGNATION ADDENDUM NO.ONE INDEMNIFICATION AND INSURANCE RUSSIA/IRAN CERT EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP EXHIBIT A EIC CONTINUITY OF OPERATION NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION	WASHINGTON, DC 20010 DANIELLE LOGAN 202-688-3631 202-688-3632 BIDS@CHANGING NET N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED YES REQUIRED IF AWARDED	HOUSTON, TX 77056 REBEKAH OMORUYI 832-434-2887 N/A VENDOR®AHEFEDRAL COM N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED YES REQUIRED IF AWARDED	NEW YORK, NY 10017 SEAN COGDELL 212-490-2233 781-672-2570 HROSS@THEPANTERGROUP.COM MINORITY BUSINESS ENTERPISE INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED FREQUIRED IF AWARDED YES REQUIRED IF AWARDED YES REQUIRED IF AWARDED	EAST BRUNSWICK, NJ 08816 JOURDAN BLOCK 646-652-0785 732-238-2152 JOURDANGEQUILLEM.COM SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED YES OK	SOUTH PLAINFIELD, NJ 07080 EZEKIEL SEGUN OLANIYI 347-985-3863 212-898-0458 PRIORITYCARESHOME@GMAIL.COM N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED YES REQUIRED IF AWARDED	1000 WASHINGTON DC. 20036 LUIS F. PADDILLA 202-499-7837 703-349-6228 LPADILLA@E-LOGICUS N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED YES YES REQUIRED IF AWARDED YES REQUIRED IF AWARDED	NO BID	
TELEPHONE FAX E-MAIL NJ SAVI DESIGNATION ADDENDUM NO.ONE INDEMMINICATION AND INSURANCE RUSSIA/IRAN CERT EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP EXHIBIT A EIC CONTINUITY OF OPERATION NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION THREE REFERENCES	WASHINGTON, DC 20010 DANIELLE LOGAN 202-688-3631 202-688-3632 BIDS@CHANGING.NET N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED YES REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED	HOUSTON, TX 77056 REBEKAH OMORUYI 832-434-2887 N/A VENDOR@AHEFEDERAL.COM N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED YES REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED	NEW YORK, NY 10017 SEAN COGDELL 212-490-2233 781-672-2570 HROSS@THEPANTERGROUP.COM MINORITIY BUSINESS ENTERPISE INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED YES REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED	EAST BRUNSWICK, NJ 08816 JOURDAN BLOCK 646-652-0785 732-238-2152 JOURDANGEQUILLEM.COM SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED YES OK INCLUDED	SOUTH PLAINFIELD, NJ 07080 EZEKIEL SEGUN OLANIYI 347-985-3863 212-898-0458 PRIORITYCARESHOME@GMAIL.COM N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED YES REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED	1000 WASHINGTON DC. 20036 LUIS F. PADDILLA 202-499-7837 703-349-6228 LPADILLA@E-LOGICUS N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED YES REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED	NO BID	
TELEPHONE FAX E-MAIL NJ SAVI DESIGNATION ADDENDUM NO.ONE INDEMNIFICATION AND INSURANCE RUSSIA/IRAN CERT EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP EXHIBIT A EIC CONTINUITY OF OPERATION NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION THREE REFERENCES NEW JERSEY LICENSE	WASHINGTON, DC 20010 DANIELLE LOGAN 202-688-3631 202-688-3632 BIDS@CHANGING.NET N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED YES REGUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED NOT INCLUDED	HOUSTON, TX 77056 REBEKAH OMORUYI 832-434-2887 N/A VENDOR®AHEFEDRAL COM N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED YES REQUIRED IF AWARDED YES REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED NOT INCLUDED	NEW YORK, NY 10017 SEAN COGDELL 212-490-2233 781-672-2570 HROSS@THEPANTERGROUP.COM MINORITY BUSINESS ENTERPISE INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED YES REQUIRED IF AWARDED YES REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED NOT INCLUDED NOT INCLUDED	EAST BRUNSWICK, NJ 08816 JOURDAN BLOCK 646-652-0785 732-238-2152 JOURDANGEQUILLEM.COM SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED YES OK INCLUDED NOT INCLUDED	SOUTH PLAINFIELD, NJ 07080 EZEKIEL SEGUN OLANIYI 347-985-3863 212-898-0458 PRIORITYCARESHOME@GMAIL.COM N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED YES REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED NOT INCLUDED NOT INCLUDED	1000 WASHINGTON DC. 20036 LUIS F. PADDILLA 202-499-7837 703-349-4228 LPADILLA@E-LOGICUS N/A INCLUDED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED YES REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED NOT INCLUDED NOT INCLUDED NOT INCLUDED	NO BID	

BID RESULTS

CK09MERCER2023-02 AERIAL DISPENSING HELICOPTER FOR USE BY MOSQUITO DEPARTMENT AND THE MERCER COUNTY COOPERATIVE CONTRACT PURCHASING SYSTEM FOR A PERIOD OF TWO (2) YEARS

BID OPENING DATE: MARCH 1, 2023					
NUMBER OF BIDDERS	1				
NAME	HELICOPTER APPLICATORS, INC.				
ADDRESS	1670 YORK RD.				
CITY, STATE, ZIP	GETTYSBURG, PA. 17325				
CONTACT	KIRK A. MARTIN				
TELEPHONE	717-337-1370				
FAX	717-337-1527				
E-MAIL	KMARTIN@HELICOPTERAPPLICATORS.COM				
nj savi designation	N/A				
EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1	SIGNED AND DATED				
STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP	SIGNED AND DATED				
INSURANCE AND INDEMINICATION	SIGNED AND DATED				
RUSSIAN/IRAN CERT	REQUIRED IF AWARDED				
NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERT	OK				
EEO/ AFFIRMATIVE ACTION	SIGNED AND DATED				
EIR (EMPLOYEE INFO REPORT)	32652 EXP. 7.15.2023				
WILL EXTEND TO COOP	YES				
CONTINUITY OF OPERATION	YES				
HOLD BEYOND 60 DAYS	YES				
REFERENCES	INCLUDED				
EXCEPTIONS	NONE				
COST PER HOUR (YEAR ONE)	\$3,517.50				
COST PER HOUR (YEAR TWO)	\$3,693.50				