
NUMBER OF RESPONDENTS 1

NAME OF RESPONDENT SIMDUCTIVE GOLF INSTRUCTION, LLC 

ADDRESS 22 PICASSO CT. 

CITY, STATE, ZIP EAST WINDSOR, NJ 08520

CONTACT ROBERT R. CORBO

TELEPHONE 732-598-3832

FAX N/A 

 E-MAIL ROBBMCGA21@GMAIL.COM

NJ SAVI DESIGNATION N/A 

INSURANCE AND INDEMNIFICATION REQUIREMENTS SIGNED AND DATED

EEO/AFFIRMATIVE ACTION SIGNED AND DATED

EIC REQUIRED IF AWARDED

RUSSIA/IRAN FORM SIGNED AND DATED 

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP SIGNED AND DATED

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REFERENCES INCLUDED PC TO REVIEW

BUSINESS PLAN NOT INCLUDED 

FINANCIAL STATEMENTS INCLUDED PC TO REVIEW

EXCEPTIONS NONE 

RFP RESULTS

CC2022-15B REBID OF CONCESSIONAIRE FOR THE OPERATION OF GOLF INSTRUCTION PROGRAMS AT ALL 

FIVE (5) COUNTY-OWNED GOLF COURSE FACILITIES AND RENTAL OF INDOOR LESSON AND OFFICE SPACE 

FOR THE MERCER COUNTY PARK COMMISSION

OPENING DATE:  MARCH 28,2023

mailto:ROBBMCGA21@GMAIL.COM


SIMDUCTIVE GOLF INSTRUCTION, LLC 

CONTRACT TERMS 
COUNTY PROPOSED MIN. 

MONTHLY RATE 
PROPOSED MONTHLY RATE 

YEAR ONE- 4/1/23-3/31/24  $                                   4,500.00  $                                            4,500.00 

YEAR TWO-4/1/24-3/31/25  $                                   4,500.00  $                                            4,500.00 

YEAR THREE-4/1/25-3/31/26  $                                   4,500.00  $                                            4,500.00 

OPTION YEAR- 4/1/26-3/31/27  $                                   4,500.00  $                                            4,500.00 

OPTION YEAR- 4/1/27-3/31/28  $                                   4,500.00  $                                            4,500.00 

YEAR ONE- 4/1/23-3/31/24 2% 2%

YEAR TWO-4/1/24-3/31/25 2% 2%

YEAR THREE-4/1/25-3/31/26 2% 2%

OPTION YEAR- 4/1/26-3/31/27 2% 2%

OPTION YEAR- 4/1/27-3/31/28 2% 2%

CC2022-15B COST PROPOSAL PAGE 

CC2022-15B REBID OF CONCESSIONAIRE FOR THE OPERATION OF GOLF INSTRUCTION 

PROGRAMS AT ALL FIVE (5) COUNTY-OWNED GOLF COURSE FACILITIES AND RENTAL OF 

INDOOR LESSON AND OFFICE SPACE FOR THE MERCER COUNTY PARK COMMISSION

MONTHLY MIN. % TO BE PAID FOR  SALES OF SPECIAL SERVICES AND HARD GOODS 



NUMBER OF BIDDERS : 5

NAME OF BIDDER ATLANTIC STATES LUBRICANTS CORP PETROCHOICE LLC. SAFETY-KLEEN SYSTEMS, INC. 
SSCA INDUSTRIES INC. DBA SSC 

PETROLEUM
PPC LUBRICANTS LLC. 

ADDRESS 145 GAZZA BLVD
640 FREEDOM BUSINESS CENTER 

DRIVE
42 LONG WATER DRIVE 202 WHITE ROAD 35 DREXEL DRIVE

CITY, STATE, ZIP FARMINGDALE NY 11735 KING OF PRUSSIA, PA, 19406 NORWELL, MA 02061 JACKSON NJ. 08527 BAY SHROE, NY 11706

CONTACT CRAIG LANGE LAURA SEMEL SHAYNN MAHAN MICHAEL SAMET DOMINICK SINISI

TELEPHONE 908-892-2791 267-656-9309 781-792-5000 732-908-8165 631-234-8900

FAX 631-752-3056 N/A 781-585-9797 N/A N/A 

E-MAIL CLANGE@THEOILNET.COM ISEMEL@PETROCHOICE.COM
MAHAN.SHAYNN@CLEANHARBORS.C

OM
OIL@SSCPETROLEUM.COM CONTRACTORDERS@RELADYNE.COM

NJ SAVI DESIGNATION N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

ADDENDUM NO. 1 INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED 

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

INSURANCE AND INDEMINICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

RUSSIAN/IRAN CERT SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED 

NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERT OK REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED OK OK

EEO/ AFFIRMATIVE ACTION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

EIR (EMPLOYEE INFO REPORT) INCLUDED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED 

WILL EXTEND TO COOP YES YES NOT INCLUDED YES YES

CONTINUITY OF OPERATION NO YES YES YES NOT INCLUDED 

HOLD BEYOND 60 DAYS NO YES YES NO NOT INCLUDED 

REFERENCES INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED 

EXCEPTIONS NONE YES NONE NONE NONE

FATAL FLAW NONE NONE NONE NONE
YES VENDOR DID NOT INCLUDE COST  

PROPOSAL PAGE 

BID RESULTS

CK09MERCER2023-03 VARIOUS OILS AND LUBRICANTS FOR THE COUNTY OF MERCER AND THE MERCER COUNTY COOPERATIVE CONTRACT PURCHASING SYSTEM FOR A PERIOD OF SIX 6 MONTHS WITH AN OPTION TO EXTEND SIX(6) MONTHS

BID OPENING DATE: MARCH 28, 2023

mailto:CLANGE@THEOILNET.COM
mailto:ISEMEL@PETROCHOICE.COM
mailto:MAHAN.SHAYNN@CLEANHARBORS.COM
mailto:MAHAN.SHAYNN@CLEANHARBORS.COM
mailto:OIL@SSCPETROLEUM.COM
mailto:CONTRACTORDERS@RELADYNE.COM


FIRST 6 

MONTHS

SECOND 6 

MONTHS
EXCEPTIONS

FIRST 6 

MONTHS

SECOND 6 

MONTHS
EXCEPTIONS

FIRST 6 

MONTHS

SECOND 6 

MONTHS
EXCEPTIONS

FIRST 6 

MONTHS

SECOND 6 

MONTHS
EXCEPTIONS

• PER GAL 11.05$            11.53$    NO 13.70$       13.87$       NO 9.26$      9.26$      NO 15.50$    16.27$    NO

• PER GAL 16.81$            12.25$    NO 13.91$       14.09$       NO 11.00$    11.00$    NO 13.00$    13.65$    NO

• PER GAL 12.25$            13.00$    NO 13.91$       14.09$       NO 11.25$    11.25$    NO 15.50$    14.47$    NO

• PER DRUM 548.86$          575.36$  NO 677.05$     685.85$     NO 515.80$  515.80$  NO -$        -$        NO

• PER DRUM 638.98$          665.48$  NO 775.50$     785.58$     NO 600.95$  600.95$  NO 900.00$  945.00$  NO

• PER GAL 10.25$            10.73$    NO 14.50$       14.68$       NO 9.29$      9.29$      NO -$        -$        NO

• PER DRUM 485.24$          511.75$  NO 631.40$     639.60$     YES 506.74$  506.74$  NO -$        -$        NO

•
PER GAL 38.89$            39.35$    NO 26.28$       26.62$       YES 21.70$    21.70$    NO 34.50$    36.22$    NO

• PER DRUM 803.31$          829.82$  NO 1,934.90$  1,934.90$  NO 858.42$  858.42$  NO 850.00$  892.50$  NO

•
PER GAL NO BID NO BID  X 8.95$          9.06$          YES 5.75$      5.75$      

NO
-$        -$        

NO

•
PER DRUM 528.13$          561.25$  NO 465.32$     475.65$     NO 450.00$  450.00$  NO 500.00$  525.00$  NO

PER GAL

 $              2.30  $      2.81  NO  NO BID  NO BID  X  $      2.64  $      2.64  NO  $      2.75  $      2.90  NO 

PER DRUM
 $          212.95  $  239.46  NO  NO BID  NO BID  X  $  227.56  $  227.56  NO  $  229.00  $  240.45  NO 

DIESEL EMISSION FLUID (DEF)  PARK COMMISSION 

1638 OLD TRENTON RD. TRENTON, NJ

FLEETGUARD 50/50 PREDILUTED EXTENDED 

LIFE EX COMPLEAT OAT OR EQUAL
ANTI FREEZE/COOLANT  PARK COMMISSION 1638 OLD 

TRENTON RD. TRENTON, NJ

FLEETGUARD 50/50 PREDILUTED EXTENDED 

LIFE EX COMPLEAT OAT OR EQUAL

DIESEL EMISSION FLUID (DEF)  (DOT-I 300 SCOTCH RD, 

BLDGS 1 & 4 W. TRENTON NJ

ANTI FREEZE/COOLANT  (DOT-I 300 SCOTCH RD, BLDGS 

1 & 4 W. TRENTON NJ

HYDRAULIC OIL   PARK COMMISSION 1638 OLD 

TRENTON RD. TRENTON, NJ

AW32 ECOPOWER

AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID  (DOT-I 300 SCOTCH 

RD, BLDGS 1 & 4 W. TRENTON NJ

ALLISON TRANSYND TES 295 SYNTHETIC 

TRANS FLUID OR EQUAL

AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID  PARK 

COMMISSION 1638 OLD TRENTON RD. TRENTON, NJ

PEAK SYN DEXV1 LV

CHEVRON THF 1000 OR EQUAL

MOTOR OIL (DOT-I 300 SCOTCH RD, BLDGS 1 & 4 W. 

TRENTON NJ

15W40 (CK4) (SEMI-SYNTHETIC)

DEXOS 0W20

DEXOS 5W30
MOTOR OIL  PARK COMMISSION 1638 OLD TRENTON 

RD. TRENTON, NJ

10W30 MOBIL SPECIAL X1

15W40 ULTRA LX

HYDRAULIC OIL  (DOT-I 300 SCOTCH RD, BLDGS 1 & 4 

W. TRENTON NJ

PROPOSAL PAGE CK09MERCER2023-03 VARIOUS OILS AND LUBRICANTS FOR THE COUNTY OF MERCER AND THE MERCER COUNTY COOP

ATLANTIC STATES LUBRICANTS 

CORP
PETROCHOICE LLC. SAFETY-KLEEN SYSTEMS, INC. 

SSCA INDUSTRIES INC. DBA 

SSC PETROLEUM



NUMBER OF BIDDERS 3

NAME OF BIDDER STARR TRANSIT CO, INC. A-1 LIMOUSINE INC THE ARC/MERCER INC 

ADDRESS 2531 EAST STATE STREET EXT 2 EMMONS DRIVE 180 EWINGVILLE RD 

CITY, STATE, ZIP HAMILTON, NJ 08619 PRINCETON, NJ 08540 EWING, NJ 08638

CONTACT PETER BOROWSKY JEFFERY T. STARR STEVE COOK 

TELEPHONE 609-584-1764 609-919-2003 609-406-0181

FAX 609-951-9330 609-406-9258

EMAIL PBOROWSKY@STARRTOURS.COM JSTARR@A1LIMO.COM SCOOK@ARCMERCER.ORG

NJ SAVI DESIGNATION N/A N/A N/A

EXTEND BEYOND 60 DAYS YES YES YES

EMERGENCY SERVICES YES YES YES 

INSURANCE AND INDEMNIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK OK

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

EIC 1622 EXPIRES 10.15.25 3993 EXPIRES 6.15.25 REQUIRED IF AWARDED 

EXHIBIT A INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED 

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

RUSSIA/IRAN CERTIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

REFERENCES 

INCLUDED, USING AGENCY TO 

REVIEW 

INCLUDED, USING AGENCY TO 

REVIEW NOT INCLUDED 

QUALIFICATION STATEMENT INCLUDED INCLUDED NOT INCLUDED 

VEHICLE INVERTORY INFORMATION INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED 

ARPA DOCUMENTS INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED 

EXCEPTIONS NONE YES, COUNTY TO REVIEW NONE  

BID RESULTS

AB2023-11 BUS OPERATOR FOR THE ROUTE 130 TRANSPORTATION EXPANSION FOR THE COUNTY OF MERCER- ARPA 

BID OPENING DATE:  MARCH 30,2023

mailto:PBOROWSKY@STARRTOURS.COM
mailto:JSTARR@A1LIMO.COM
mailto:SCOOK@ARCMERCER.ORG


Year Bid Price Per Mile

Multiply by No of Miles 

Annually (329 MILES EACH 

WEEKDAY) 

Totals

APRIL 2023-DECEMBER 

2023
 $                                                  3.70 62,510  $                                  231,287.00 

JANUARY 2024-

DECEMBER 2024
 $                                                  4.16 83,566  $                                  347,634.56 

GRAND TOTAL  $                                  578,921.56 

PROJECT COST 2023 2024

FUEL 30,000.00$                                               39,000.00$                                   

VEHICLE USE & 

MAINTENANCE 37,800.00$                                               50,000.00$                                   

INSURANCE 8,000.00$                                                 11,000.00$                                   

LABOR 105,000.00$                                             150,000.00$                                 

TOTAL COSTS 180,800.00$                                             250,000.00$                                 

PROFITS 43,000.00$                                               58,000.00$                                   

COST PROPOSAL FORM 

STARR TRANSIT 

MERCER COUNTY ROUTE 130 CONNECTION BUS SERVICE

PROPOSAL SHEET – PROJECT COSTS – PROFIT



Year Bid Price Per Mile

Multiply by No of Miles 

Annually ( 329 MILES EACH 

WEEKDAY)

Totals

APRIL 2023-DECEMBER 

2023
 $                                               5.775 62,510  $                                 360,995.25 

JANUARY 2024-

DECEMBER 2024
 $                                               5.775 83,566  $                                 482,593.65 

GRAND TOTAL  $                                 843,588.90 

PROJECT COST 2023 2024

FUEL 87,038.62$                                               87,038.62$                                      

VEHICLE USE & 

MAINTENANCE 71,013.64$                                               71,013.64$                                      

INSURANCE 51,946.85$                                               51,946.85$                                      

LABOR 243,638.92$                                             243,638.92$                                    

TOTAL COSTS 453,638.03$                                             453,638.03$                                    

PROFITS 28,955.62$                                               28,955.62$                                      

COST PROPOSAL FORM 

A-1 LIMOUSINE INC 

MERCER COUNTY ROUTE 130 CONNECTION BUS SERVICE

PROPOSAL SHEET – PROJECT COSTS – PROFIT



Year Bid Price Per Mile

Multiply by No of Miles 

Annually (329 MILES EACH 

WEEKDAY)

Totals

APRIL 2023-DECEMBER 

2023
 $                                                  6.73 62,510  $                                  420,692.30 

JANUARY 2024-

DECEMBER 2024
 $                                                  7.17 83,566  $                                  599,168.22 

GRAND TOTAL  $                              1,019,860.52 

PROJECT COST 2023 2024

FUEL 53,430.00$                                               75,397.20$                                   

VEHICLE USE & 

MAINTENANCE 47,474.00$                                               66,975.85$                                   

INSURANCE 6,415.50$                                                 9,050.79$                                     

LABOR 173,434.95$                                             250,548.50$                                 

TOTAL COSTS 280,754.45$                                             401,972.34$                                 

PROFITS N/A N/A

COST PROPOSAL FORM 

ARC MERCER 

MERCER COUNTY ROUTE 130 CONNECTION BUS SERVICE

PROPOSAL SHEET – PROJECT COSTS – PROFIT



NO. OF BIDDERS: 1

NAME OF BIDDER MERCER GROUP INTERNATIONAL OF NJ, INC.

ADDRESS 1519 CALHOUN STREET

CITY, STATE, ZIP TRENTON, NJ 08638

CONTACT NICHOLAS PACITTI 

TELEPHONE 609-341-9100

FAX N/A 

E-MAIL NPACITTI@MERCERGROUP.COM

NJ SAVI DESIGNATION N/A 

INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS SIGNED AND DATED 

BID GUARANTEE HARCO NATIONAL INSURANCE CO. 10% NTE 20K

CONSENT OF SURETY KATHLEEN M. COEN AIF WITH POA 

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP SIGNED AND DATED 

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 SIGNED AND DATED 

EXHIBIT A INCLUDED 

EMPLOYEE INFORMATION CERTIFICATE 6719 EXPIRES 2.15.2026

RUSSIA/IRAN CERT SIGNED AND DATED 

NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE OK

CONTINUITY OF OPERATIONS DURING 

EMERGENCY
YES 

HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS YES 

VEHICLE DEDICATION AFFADAVIT SIGNED AND DATED 

CERTIFICATE OF PUBLIC CONVENIENCE 

AND NECESSITY APPROVAL LETTER 
INCLUDED,  SW2776

BIDDER QUESTIONNAIRE INCLUDED 

EQUIPMENT CERTIFICATION INCLUDED 

EXCEPTIONS NONE 

TOTAL YEAR ONE  $                                                                 159,314.20 

TOTAL YEAR TWO  $                                                                 176,848.36 

TOTAL YEAR THREE  $                                                                 181,794.12 

GRAND TOTAL THREE YEARS  $                                                                 517,956.68 

BID RESULTS

AB2023-06 REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL OF SOLID WASTE AND RECYCLABLES FROM VARIOUS 

LOCATIONS IN MERCER COUNTY

BID OPENING: MARCH 30,2023

mailto:NPACITTI@MERCERGROUP.COM


Type, Year One Size
Unit Cost 1 x 

per week 

Annual rate (Unit Cost 

X 52)

Number of 

Containers
Total Annual Rate

Unit Cost 2 x 

per week 

Annual rate 

(Unit Cost X 

52)

Number of 

Containers
Total Annual Rate

Unit Cost 3 x 

per week 

Annual rate (Unit 

Cost X 52)

Number of 

Containers
Total Annual Rate

ARM COMMINGLED  2 cubic yards  $          2.97  $                        154.44 3  $                           463.32 

ARM COMMINGLED  3 cubic yards  $          2.97  $                        154.44 3  $                           463.32 

ARM COMMINGLED  4 cubic yards  $          2.97  $                        154.44 2  $                           308.88 

ARM COMMINGLED  6 cubic yards  $          2.97  $                        154.44 7  $                        1,081.08  $          6.03  $      313.56 1  $                            313.56 

ARM COMMINGLED  8 cubic yards  $          2.97  $                        154.44 3  $                           463.32 

ARM COMMINGLED  96 Gallon  $          2.97  $                        154.44 4  $                           617.76 

Unit Cost 1 x 

per week 

Annual rate (Unit Cost 

X 52)

Number of 

Containers
Total Annual Rate

Unit Cost 2 x 

per week 

Annual rate 

(Unit Cost X 

52)

Number of 

Containers
Total Annual Rate

Unit Cost 3 x 

per week 

Annual rate (Unit 

Cost X 52)

Number of 

Containers
Total Annual Rate

GENERAL WASTE  2 cubic yards  $        12.93  $                        672.36 7  $                        4,706.52  $        25.89  $   1,346.28 2  $                         2,692.56 

GENERAL WASTE  3 cubic yards  $        19.26  $                     1,001.52 5  $                        5,007.60  $        38.31  $   1,992.12 1  $                         1,992.12 

GENERAL WASTE  4 cubic yards  $        24.38  $                     1,267.76 5  $                        6,338.80 

GENERAL WASTE  6 cubic yards  $        78.95  $        11.00 3  $                              33.00  $      118.45  $                 6,159.40 1  $             6,159.40 

GENERAL WASTE  8 cubic yards  $        42.37  $                     2,203.24 1  $                        2,203.24  $        84.76  $   4,407.52 4  $                       17,630.08 

GENERAL WASTE  10 cubic yards  $        69.68  $                     3,623.36 3  $                      10,870.08  $      209.03  $               10,869.56 1  $           10,869.56 

GENERAL WASTE  30 cubic yards  $      190.00  $                     9,880.00 4  $                      39,520.00 

TOTAL  $                      72,043.92  $                       22,661.32  $           17,028.96 

TOTAL FOR YEAR ONE 111,734.20$                      

Type, Year TWO Size
Unit Cost 1 x 

per week 

Annual rate (Unit Cost 

X 52)

Number of 

Containers
Total Annual Rate

Unit Cost 2 x 

per week 

Annual rate 

(Unit Cost X 

52)

Number of 

Containers
Total Annual Rate

Unit Cost 3 x 

per week 

Annual rate (Unit 

Cost X 52)

Number of 

Containers
Total Annual Rate

ARM COMMINGLED  2 cubic yards  $          3.06  $                        159.12 3  $                           477.36 

ARM COMMINGLED  3 cubic yards  $          3.06  $                        159.12 3  $                           477.36 

ARM COMMINGLED  4 cubic yards  $          3.06  $                        159.12 2  $                           318.24 

ARM COMMINGLED  6 cubic yards  $          3.06  $                        159.12 7  $                        1,113.84  $          6.21  $      322.92 1  $                            322.92 

ARM COMMINGLED  8 cubic yards  $          3.06  $                        159.12 3  $                           477.36 

ARM COMMINGLED  96 Gallon  $          3.06  $                        159.12 4  $                           636.48 

Unit Cost 1 x 

per week 

Annual rate (Unit Cost 

X 52)

Number of 

Containers
Total Annual Rate

Unit Cost 2 x 

per week 

Annual rate 

(Unit Cost X 

52)

Number of 

Containers
Total Annual Rate

Unit Cost 3 x 

per week 

Annual rate (Unit 

Cost X 52)

Number of 

Containers
Total Annual Rate

GENERAL WASTE  2 cubic yards  $        13.31  $                        692.12 7  $                        4,844.84  $        26.67  $   1,386.84 2  $                         2,773.68 

GENERAL WASTE  3 cubic yards  $        19.84  $                     1,031.68 5  $                        5,158.40  $        39.46  $   2,051.92 1  $                         2,051.92 

GENERAL WASTE  4 cubic yards  $        25.11  $                     1,305.72 5  $                        6,528.60 

GENERAL WASTE  6 cubic yards  $        81.32  $   4,228.64 3  $                       12,685.92  $      122.00  $                 6,344.00 1  $             6,344.00 

GENERAL WASTE  8 cubic yards  $        44.64  $                     2,321.28 1  $                        2,321.28  $        87.30  $   4,539.60 4  $                       18,158.40 

GENERAL WASTE  10 cubic yards  $        73.86  $                     3,840.72 3  $                      11,522.16  $      215.30  $               11,195.60 1  $           11,195.60 

GENERAL WASTE  30 cubic yards  $      195.00  $                   10,140.00 4  $                      40,560.00 

TOTAL  $                      74,435.92  $                       35,992.84  $           17,539.60 

TOTAL FOR YEAR TWO 127,968.36$                      

Type, Year THREE Size
Unit Cost 1 x 

per week 

Annual rate (Unit Cost 

X 52)

Number of 

Containers
Total Annual Rate

Unit Cost 2 x 

per week 

Annual rate 

(Unit Cost X 

52)

Number of 

Containers
Total Annual Rate

Unit Cost 3 x 

per week 

Annual rate (Unit 

Cost X 52)

Number of 

Containers
Total Annual Rate

ARM COMMINGLED  2 cubic yards  $          3.15  $                        163.80 3  $                           491.40 

ARM COMMINGLED  3 cubic yards  $          3.15  $                        163.80 3  $                           491.40 

ARM COMMINGLED  4 cubic yards  $          3.15  $                        163.80 2  $                           327.60 

ARM COMMINGLED  6 cubic yards  $          3.15  $                        163.80 7  $                        1,146.60  $          6.40  $      332.80 1  $                            332.80 

ARM COMMINGLED  8 cubic yards  $          3.15  $                        163.80 3  $                           491.40 

ARM COMMINGLED  96 Gallon  $          3.15  $                        163.80 4  $                           655.20 

Unit Cost 1 x 

per week 

Annual rate (Unit Cost 

X 52)

Number of 

Containers
Total Annual Rate

Unit Cost 2 x 

per week 

Annual rate 

(Unit Cost X 

52)

Number of 

Containers
Total Annual Rate

Unit Cost 3 x 

per week 

Annual rate (Unit 

Cost X 52)

Number of 

Containers
Total Annual Rate

GENERAL WASTE  2 cubic yards  $        13.71  $                        712.92 7  $                        4,990.44  $        27.47  $   1,428.44 2  $                         2,856.88 

GENERAL WASTE  3 cubic yards  $        20.44  $                     1,062.88 5  $                        5,314.40  $        40.64  $   2,113.28 1  $                         2,113.28 

GENERAL WASTE  4 cubic yards  $        25.86  $                     1,344.72 5  $                        6,723.60 

GENERAL WASTE  6 cubic yards  $        83.76  $   4,355.52 3  $                       13,066.56  $      125.66  $                 6,534.32 1  $             6,534.32 

GENERAL WASTE  8 cubic yards  $        45.98  $                     2,391.00 1  $                        2,391.00  $        89.92  $   4,675.84 4  $                       18,703.36 

GENERAL WASTE  10 cubic yards  $        76.08  $                     3,956.16 3  $                      11,868.48  $      221.45  $               11,515.40 1  $           11,515.40 

GENERAL WASTE  30 cubic yards  $      200.00  $                   10,400.00 4  $                      41,600.00 

TOTAL  $                      76,491.52  $                       37,072.88  $           18,049.72 

TOTAL FOR YEAR THREE 131,614.12$                      

175.00$  UNIT PRICE  FOR EACH WILL CALL PICK UP

GENERAL WASTE

GRAND TOTAL FOR ALL THREE YEARS 371,316.68$                               

RECYCLING AND WASTE RATES YEAR ONE THROUGH THREE

RECYCLED MATERIALS

RECYCLED MATERIALS

GENERAL WASTE

GENERAL WASTE

RECYCLING AND WASTE RATES YEAR ONE THROUGH THREE

AB2023-06 RECYCLING AND WASTE RATES YEAR ONE THROUGH THREE

RECYCLED MATERIALS



YEAR ONE SIZE
TOTAL COST RENTAL AND HAUL 1 X 

PER WEEK
ANNUAL RATE

NUMBER OF 

CONTAINERS
TOTAL CHARGE

 OPEN BOX (HAUL ONLY)  40 CY YD  $                                            195.00  $                    10,140.00                                   1  $                       10,140.00 

YEAR ONE SIZE
TOTAL COST RENTAL AND HAUL 1 X 

PER WEEK MONITORED
ANNUAL RATE

NUMBER OF 

COMPACTORS
TOTAL CHARGE

 SELF-CONTAINED COMPACTORS   30 CY YD  $                                            360.00  $                    18,720.00                                   1  $                       18,720.00 

 SELF-CONTAINED COMPACTOR 

REAR LOAD FOR CORRECTION 

CENTER 

 34 CY YD  $                                            360.00  $                    18,720.00                                   1  $                       18,720.00 

 TOTAL PER YEAR ONE 47,580.00$                       

YEAR TWO SIZE
TOTAL COST RENTAL AND HAUL 1 X 

PER WEEK
ANNUAL RATE

NUMBER OF 

CONTAINERS
TOTAL CHARGE

 OPEN BOX (HAUL ONLY)  40 CY YD  $                                            200.00  $                    10,400.00                                   1  $                       10,400.00 

YEAR TWO SIZE
TOTAL COST RENTAL AND HAUL 1 X 

PER WEEK MONITORED
ANNUAL RATE

NUMBER OF 

COMPACTORS
TOTAL CHARGE

 SELF-CONTAINED COMPACTORS   30 CY YD  $                                            370.00  $                    19,240.00                                   1  $                       19,240.00 

 SELF-CONTAINED COMPACTOR 

REAR LOAD FOR CORRECTION 

CENTER 

 34 CY YD  $                                            370.00  $                    19,240.00                                   1  $                       19,240.00 

 TOTAL PER YEAR TWO 48,880.00$                       

YEAR THREE SIZE
TOTAL COST RENTAL AND HAUL 1 X 

PER WEEK
ANNUAL RATE

NUMBER OF 

CONTAINERS
TOTAL CHARGE

 OPEN BOX (HAUL ONLY)  40 CY YD  $                                            205.00  $                    10,660.00                                   1  $                       10,660.00 

YEAR THREE SIZE
TOTAL COST RENTAL AND HAUL 1 X 

PER WEEK MONITORED
ANNUAL RATE

NUMBER OF 

COMPACTORS
TOTAL CHARGE

 SELF-CONTAINED COMPACTORS   30 CY YD  $                                            380.00  $                    19,760.00                                   1  $                       19,760.00 

 SELF-CONTAINED COMPACTOR 

REAR LOAD FOR CORRECTION 

CENTER 

 34 CY YD  $                                            380.00  $                    19,760.00                                   1  $                       19,760.00 

 TOTAL PER YEAR THREE 50,180.00$                       

GRAND TOTAL THREE YEARS 146,640.00$       

 ROLL-OFF CONTAINERS 

 COMPACTORS WITH MONITORING SYSTEM 

AB2023-06 ROLL OFF CONTAINERS AND COMPACTORS MONTHLY RENTAL AND WEEKLY PULL CHARGES FOR YEARS ONE THROUGH THREE

 ROLL-OFF CONTAINERS 

 COMPACTORS WITH MONITORING SYSTEM 

 ROLL-OFF CONTAINERS 

 COMPACTORS WITH MONITORING SYSTEM 


