
NUMBER OF BIDDERS 1

NAME RES GREAT LAKES, LLC. 

ADDRESS 467 EAST CHURCH ROAD

CITY, STATE, ZIP KING OF PRUSSIA, PA 19406

CONTACT JAMES LOFFERT

TELEPHONE 240-522-8113

FAX N/A

E-MAIL JLOFFERT@RES.US

NJ SAVI DESIGNATION N/A

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 SIGNED AND DATED 

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP SIGNED AND DATED 

INSURANCE AND INDEMINICATION SIGNED AND DATED 

RUSSIAN/IRAN CERT SIGNED AND DATED 

NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERT REQUIRED IF AWARDED 

EEO/ AFFIRMATIVE ACTION SIGNED AND DATED 

EIR (EMPLOYEE INFO REPORT) REQUIRED IF AWARDED 

CONTINUITY OF OPERATION NO

HOLD BEYOND 60 DAYS NO

NJ DEP COMM. PESTICIDE  APPLICATOR 

LIC.
LIC # 558988, EXP. 10.32.23

NJ DEP COMM. PESTICIDE BUSINESS 

APPLICATOR LIC.
LIC# 90534B, EXP. 10.31.23

REFERENCES
INCLUDED TO BE REVIEWED BY 

REQUESTING DEPT

EXCEPTIONS YES, PC TO REVIEW 

BID RESULTS

AB2023-12 SPECIFICATIONS FOR A ON-CALL INVASIVE SPECIES MANAGEMENT 

AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS THROUGH OUT MERCER COUNTY PARKLANDS AND 

OPEN SPACE PROPERTIES FOR THE COUNTY OF MERCER PARK COMMISSION

BID OPENING DATE: APRIL 4, 2023

mailto:JLOFFERT@RES.US


ITEM UNIT COST 
1 PER HOUR 494.68$                  

2 PER HOUR 494.50$                  

3 PER HOUR 517.26$                  

4 PER HOUR 541.06$                  

5 PER HOUR 704.15$                  

6 PER HOUR 261.35$                  

7 PER HOUR 239.92$                  

8 PER HOUR 355.63$                  

9 PER HOUR 268.49$                  

10 PER HOUR 424.88$                  

11 PER HOUR SEE EXCEPTION

12 PER HOUR 275.63$                  

13 PER HOUR 242.30$                  

14 PER HOUR 204.20$                  

15 PER HOUR 232.78$                  

16 PER HOUR 223.25$                  

17 PER HOUR 202.78$                  

18 PER HOUR 223.25$                  

19 PER HOUR 222.78$                  

20 PER HOUR 222.78$                  

21 PER HOUR 225.63$                  

22 PER HOUR 147.86$                  

23 PER SITE 142.78$                  

24 10% 10%

NJDEP AQUATIC USE PERMIT APPLICATION PREPARATION  & SUBMITTAL 

CHEMICAL MARK-UP PERCENTAGE 

WICK/WIPE ON TREATEMENT, INCLUDING APPLICATOR

CUT STUMP TREATMENT, INCLUDING APPLICATOR

QUARRY/STEEP TERRAIN BACK PACK APPLICATION

QUARRY/STEEP TERRAIN ATV/UTV WITH TANK SPRAYER APPLICATION

QUARRY/STEEP TERRAIN TRUCK WITH TANK SPRAYER APPLICATION

WOODCHIPPER, INCLUDING OPERATOR

CHEMICAL TRUNK INJECTION, INCLUDING APPLICATOR

SKID STEER WITH FORESTRY HEAD, INCLUDING OPERATOR

ATV/UTV WITH TANK SPRAYER, INCLUDING APPLICATOR

ATV/UTV WITH TOW BEHIND BRUSH HOG INCLUDING APPLICATOR

ATV/UTV WITH TOW BHIND SPRAYING INCLUDING APPLICATOR

TRUCK WITH TANK SPRAYER, INCLUDING APPLICATOR 

AMPHIBIOUS VEHICLE WITH TANK SPRAYER, INCLUDING APPLICATOR

BOAT WITH TANK SPRAYER, INCLUDING APPLICATOR

GROUND APPLICATION WITH BOOM SPRAYER

BROADCAST PRE-EMERGENT APPLICATION 

MANUAL METHODS (CHAINSAW, TRIMMERS, HAND SAWS): PER CREW MEMBER

BACKPACK OF PUMP SPRAYER, INCLUDING APPLICATOR: PER CREW MEMBER 

SKID STEER WITH BRUSH HOG, INCLUDING OPERATOR

AB2023-12 COST PROPOSAL 
METHOD

SIDE- ARM MOWING, INCLUDING OPERATOR

MOWING/BRUSH HOGGING, INCLUDING OPERATOR

TREE/SHRUB REMOVAL BY BRUSH GRUBBING, INCLUDING OPERATOR



NUMBER OF BIDDERS 7

NAME OF BIDDER AMERICAN BITUMINOUS COMPANY, INC. BRITTON INDUSTRIES LLC TRAP ROCK INDUSTRIES LLC DOSCH KING COMPANY,INC CRAFCO, INC. 
GARDEN STATE ASPHALT MATERIALS 

INC. 

WALTER R. EARLE COMPANY-

MORRISVILLE LLC 

ADDRESS 100 MAIN STREET 227 BAKERS BASIN RD PO BOX 419 16 TROY HILL ROAD  6165 W. DETROIT STREET 100 BILBY ROAD PO BOX 728

CITY, STATE, ZIP W. COLLINGSWOOD HEIGHTS, NJ 08059 LAWRENCEVILLE, NJ 08648 KINGSTON, NJ 08528 WHIPPANY, NJ 07981 CHANDLER, AZ 85226 HACKETTSTOWN, NJ 07840 FARMINGDALE NJ, 07727

CONTACT PATRICK POLAZZO KIM FROST MICHAEL J. CROWLEY PETER KING TODD ZIEMS JOSEPH AHART BRIAN COOPER

TELEPHONE 856-456- 2899 844-274-8866 609 -252- 8927 973-887-0145 602 -276- 0406 908-850-5000 732-308-1113

FAX 856- 456 -6749 215-295-3333 609- 497- 0135 973-887-4942 480 -961- 0513 908-850-3737 732-308-1034

E-MAIL PSANCHEZ@AACNJ.COM KFROST@BRITTONINDUSTRIES.COM TRISALES@TRAPROCK.COM GENERALINFO@DOSCHKING.COM BIDS@CRAFCO.COM JAHART@GARDENSTATEASPHALT.COM BCOOPER@EARLECO.COM 

NJ SAVI DESIGNATION N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE N/A

PLANT LOCATION: 1701 RIVER ROAD, BURLINGTON, NJ 08016 227 BAKERS BASIN RD, LAWRENCEVILLE NJ, 08648
120 ROUTE 31, PENNINGTON, NJ 08534 

(PROVIDED VARIOUS LOCATIONS) 

1680 E. RACE STREET, ALLENTOWN, PA 

18109

100 BIKBY ROAD, HACKETTSTOWN,NJ 

07840

14 STEELE ROAD NORTH,MORRISVILLE ,PA 

19067 

ADDENDUM NO.ONE INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED 

EXTEND TO THE COUNTY CO-OP NO YES NO YES YES NO NO

INSURANCE AND INDEMNIFICATION REQUIREMENTS SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION REQUIRE IF AWARDED OK OK OK OK OK OK

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

RUSSIA/IRAN CERTIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

EXHIBIT A INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED 

EIC 62395 EXPIRES 1.15.27 37740 EXPIRES 11.15.29 81 EXPIRES 4.15.26 15756 EXPIRES 6.15.28 31247 EXPIRES 8.15.25 6476 EXPIRES 11.15.26 57198 EXPIRES 3.15.2024

HOLD BEYOND 60 DAYS YES YES YES YES YES YES YES 

CONTINUITY OF SERVICE YES NO YES YES YES YES YES

EXCEPTIONS NONE 
YES, DOT TO REVIEW/MIN. LOAD FOR EACH 

MATERIAL OFFERED IS ONE TRIAXLE
NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE 

BID RESULTS

CK09MERCER2023-04 ROAD MATERIALS FOR THE COUNTY OF MERCER AND THE MERCER COUNTY COOPERATIVE CONTRACT PURCHASING SYSTEM FOR A PERIOD OF ONE (1) YEAR WITH AN OPTION TO EXTEND ONE (1) YEAR

BID OPENING DATE: APRIL 5,2023

mailto:PSANCHEZ@AACNJ.COM
mailto:KFROST@BRITTONINDUSTRIES.COM
mailto:TRISALES@TRAPROCK.COM
mailto:GENERALINFO@DOSCHKING.COM
mailto:BIDS@CRAFCO.COM
mailto:JAHART@GARDENSTATEASPHALT.COM
mailto:BCOOPER@EARLECO.COM


ITEM NO
ROAD MATERIALS FOR THE COUNTY OF MERCER AND COOP MEMBERS - COST 

PER TON MUST BE CONSISTENT FOR THE COUNTY AND COOP MEMBERS IF THE 

AWARDED CONTRACTOR CHOOSES TO EXTEND PRICING.

COUNTY 

REQUIREMENTS  IN 

TONS OR 

GALLONS

UNIT COST 

PER TON OR 

GALLON

TOTAL COST

UNIT COST 

PER TON OR 

GALLON

TOTAL COST

UNIT COST 

PER TON OR 

GALLON

TOTAL COST
UNIT COST PER TON 

OR GALLON
TOTAL COST

UNIT COST PER TON 

OR GALLON
TOTAL COST

UNIT COST PER TON 

OR GALLON
TOTAL COST

UNIT COST PER TON 

OR GALLON
TOTAL COST

1 OR 

1A

BITUMINOUS CONCRETE SURFACE COURSE SUPERPAVE HOT MIX ASPHALT 

12.5M-64 (F.O.B. PLANT) OR 1A: 9.5M-64 (F.O.B. PLANT)
5,000 66.95$          334,750.00$            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 60.00$                     300,000.00$            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 67.00$                     335,000.00$            

1 OR 

1A

BITUMINOUS CONCRETE SURFACE COURSE SUPERPAVE HOT MIX ASPHALT 

12.5M-64 (DELIVERED TO COUNTY PROJECT SITE) OR 1A: 9.5M-64 

(DELIVERED TO COUNTY PROJECT SITE)

35,000 69.00$          2,415,000.00$         NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 61.00$                     2,135,000.00$         NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 75.00$                     2,625,000.00$         

2
BITUMINOUS STABILIZED BASE COURSE SUPERPAVE HOT MIX ASPHALT 19M-

64 (F.O.B. PLANT) 
6,000 65.95$          395,700.00$            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 59.00$                     354,000.00$            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 64.00$                     384,000.00$            

3
BITUMINOUS STABILIZED BASE COURSE SUPERPAVE HOT MIX ASPHALT 19M-

64 (DELIVERED TO COUNTY PROJECT SITE) 
6,000 69.00$          414,000.00$            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 60.00$                     360,000.00$            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 72.00$                     432,000.00$            

4
EZ STREET OR EQUIVALENT HIGH PERFORMANCE COLD ASPHALT MIX 

(F.O.B. PLANT) 
100 172.50$        17,250.00$              NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

5B
PLANT MIX BITUMINOUS PAVEMENTS P-401B (DELIVERED TO COUNTY 

PROJECT SITE)
1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 95.00$                     95.00$                     NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 100.00$                   100.00$                   

5C
PLANT MIX BITUMINOUS PAVEMENTS P-401C (DELIVERED TO COUNTY 

PROJECT SITE)
1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 95.00$                     95.00$                     NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 100.00$                   100.00$                   

5D
PLANT MIX BITUMINOUS PAVEMENTS P-401D (DELIVERED TO COUNTY 

PROJECT SITE)
1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 95.00$                     95.00$                     NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 100.00$                   100.00$                   

6 PERMANENT ASPHALT REPAIR MATERIAL (F.O.B PLANT) 1 172.50$        172.50$                   NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 180.00$                   180.00$                   NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

7 COARSE AGGREGATE #8 (3/8") (F.O.B. PLANT) 1 NO BID NO BID 35.95$          35.95$                     NO BID NO BID 50.00$                     50.00$                     NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

8 COARSE AGGREGATE #57 (3/4") ( F.O.B. PLANT) 1 NO BID NO BID 36.95$         36.95$                     NO BID NO BID 27.00$                     27.00$                     NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

9 COARSE AGGREGATE #4 (1 1/2") ( F.O.B. PLANT) 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 30.00$                     30.00$                     NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

10 COARSE AGGREGATE #2 (2 1/2") ( F.O.B. PLANT) 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 30.00$                     30.00$                     NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

11 WASHED 1 1/2" SEPTIC STONE (F.O.B. PLANT) 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 35.00$                     35.00$                     NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

12 4" STONE (2" TO 6") (F.O.B. PLANT) 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 40.00$                     40.00$                     NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

13 SMALL CORE STONE (6" TO 9") (F.O.B. PLANT) 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 40.00$                     40.00$                     NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

14 LARGE CORE STONE (5" TO 15") (F.O.B. PLANT) 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 40.00$                     40.00$                     NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

15 HAMMER STONE 24" (F.O.B. PLANT) 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 60.00$                     60.00$                     NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

16 JETTY ROCK (F.O.B. PLANT) 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 75.00$                     75.00$                     NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

17 STONE DUST/SCREENINGS (F.O.B. PLANT) 1 NO BID NO BID 28.95$         28.95$                     NO BID NO BID 25.00$                     25.00$                     NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

18 1" BLEND (F.O.B. PLANT) 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 21.00$                     21.00$                     NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

19 1 1/2" BLEND (F.O.B. PLANT) 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 22.00$                     22.00$                     NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

20 2 1/2" BLEND (F.O.B. PLANT) 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 23.00$                     23.00$                     NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

21 DENSE GRADED AGGREGATE BASE COURSE (F.O.B. PLANT) 1 NO BID NO BID 29.95$          29.95$                     NO BID NO BID 21.00$                     21.00$                     NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

22* TACK COAT (CUTBACK ASPHALT) GALLON (F.O.B. PLANT) OR 22A 15,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 7.60$                       114,000.00$            6.95$                       104,250.00$            NO BID NO BID 

22A*
TACK COAT (EMULSIFIED ASPHALT) GALLON (F.O.B. PLANT) (INSERT COST PER 

GALLON IF PRICING IS HIGHER OR LOWER THAN CUTBACK) OR 22
15,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 5.60$                       84,000.00$              4.95$                       74,250.00$              NO BID NO BID 

23* PG6422 COST PER GALLON (DELIVERED TO ROAD SITE) OR 23A 3,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 10.60$                     31,800.00$              NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

23A* PG7622 COST PER GALLON (DELIVERED TO ROAD SITE) OR 23 3,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

24 CRACKMASTER 3405 OR EQUIVALENT HOT POUR CRACK SEALANT 60,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.62$            37,200.00$              NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

COURSE AGGREGATE ALLOWANCE ($200,000.00) INSERT COST PER TON (OPEN END)

BITUMINOUS CONCRETE SURFACE COURSE SUPERPAVE HOT MIX ASPHALT 9.5M-64 OR 

12.5M-64 (F.O.B. PLANT) THE COUNTY WILL AWARD A PRIMARY CONTRACT

BITUMINOUS CONCRETE SURFACE COURSE SUPERPAVE HOT MIX ASPHALT 9.5M-64 OR 

12.5M-64 (DELIVERED)

BITUMINOUS STABILIZED BASE COURSE, SUPERPAVE HOT MIX ASPHALT 19M-64 (F.O.B. 

PLANT) THE COUNTY WILL AWARD A PRIMARY CONTRACT

BITUMINOUS STABILIZED BASE COURSE, SUPERPAVE HOT MIX ASPHALT 19M-64 

(DELIVERED)

EZ STREET OR EQUIVALENT HIGH PERFORMANCE COLD ASPHALT MIX (F.O.B. PLANT)

PLANT MIX BITUMINOUS PAVEMENTS P-401 B, C OR D, DELIVERED ALLOWANCE 

($150,000.00) INSERT COST PER TON (OPEN END) (AIRPORT)

CK09MERCER2023-04 PROPOSAL PAGE FOR ROAD MATERIALS FOR THE COUNTY OF MERCER COOPERATIVE CONTRACT PURCHASING SYSTEM 

AMERICAN BITUMINOUS 

COMPANY, INC.
BRITTON INDUSTRIES LLC CRAFCO, INC. TRAP ROCK 

WALTER R. EARLE COMPANY-MORRISVILLE 

LLC 
DOSCH KING COMPANY GARDEN STATE ASPHALT MATERIALS INC. 


