
NUMBER OF BIDDERS 3

NAME KNE CORPORATION CYPRIUM SOLUTIONS INC. FIRSTLINE LOCKSMITH LLC

ADDRESS 3 VILLAGE GREEN NORTH, 6069 MAIN STREET 2277 HIGHWAY 33 STE 406

CITY, STATE, ZIP PLYMOUTH, MA. 02360 EAST PETERSBURG, PA. 17520 HAMILTON, NJ 08690

CONTACT VICTOR A CONKLIN ANDREW FUTTY MICHAEL DICICCO

TELEPHONE 781-762-8344 717-519-6600 732-65-7883

FAX N/A N/A 732-656-7884

E-MAIL VICTOR@KNECORP.COM RAF@CYPRIUMSOLUTIONS.COM MD@FIRSTLINELOCKSMITH.COM

NJ SAVI DESIGNATION N/A N/A N/A

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

EIC/ AA302 INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

INSURANCE AND INDEMINICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

RUSSIAN IRAN FORM REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED

NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERT OK OK OK

EEO/ AFFIRMATIVE ACTION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

PREVAILIING WAGE CERT OF COMPLIANCE INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

 NJ PUBLIC WORKS CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION #616456,  EXPIRE 7.13.2023 #630954, EXIPIRES 11.17.2024 REQUIRED IF AWARDED

INTREPID MICROPOINT DETECTION TRAINING 

CERT.
REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED

ELECTRICAL CONTRACTOR LICENSE NOT INCLUDED 
CYPRIUM SOLUTIONS INC., OK                           

LIC. # 34EB01289300, EXP. 03.31.2024                          
NOT INCLUDED

FIRE ALARM, BURGLAR ALARM AND LOCKSMITH 

ADIVISORY LICENSE
NOT INCLUDED NOT INCLUDED 

FIRSTLINE LOCKSMITH LLC, MICHAEL DI 

CICCO, OK, 34X00017200, EXP. 1.31.2028

CONTINUITY OF OPERATION YES YES YES

HOLD BEYOND 60 DAYS YES YES YES

REFERENCES INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

EXCEPTIONS NONE NONE NONE

GRAND TOTAL  $                                                                 275,500.00  $                                                        332,300.00  $                                                530,000.00 

BID RESULTS

AB2023-15 PREVENTIVE MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR FOR LOCKING SYSTEMS AND RELATED EQUIPMENT FOR A PERIOD OF TWO (2) YEARS FOR THE MERCER COUNTY CORRECTION CENTER

BID OPENING: APRIL 25, 2023

mailto:VICTOR@KNECORP.COM
mailto:RAF@CYPRIUMSOLUTIONS.COM
mailto:MD@FIRSTLINELOCKSMITH.COM


TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL 

92,500.00$    103,500.00$  175,000.00$  

97,500.00$    105,500.00$  175,000.00$  

190,000.00$  209,000.00$  350,000.00$  

TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL 

 $    85,500.00  $ 123,300.00  $ 180,000.00 

AB2023 -15 PROPOSAL FOR PREVENTATIVE MAINTENANCE AND REPAIRS OF LOCKING SYSTEMS AND RELATED EQUIPMENT FOR THE MERCER COUNTY COUNTY CORRECTION CENTER FOR A 

PERIOD OF TWO (2) YEARS 

AB2023-15 PREVENTIVE MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR FOR LOCKING SYSTEMS AND RELATED EQUIPMENT FOR A PERIOD OF TWO (2) YEARS FOR THE MERCER COUNTY CORRECTION CENTER

INCLUDES WEEKLY, MONTHLY , QUARTERLY AND ANNUAL) KNE CORPORATION CYPRIUM SOLUTIONS INC. FIRSTLINE LOCKSMITH LLC.

PREVENTATIVE MAINTENANCE COST YEAR ONE 500 185.00$                      207.00$                      350.00$                      

THE COUNTY WILL PAY ACTUAL HOURS WORK
ESTIMATED NUMBER OF 

HOURS 
COST PER HOUR COST PER HOUR COST PER HOUR

PREVENTATIVE MAINTENANCE COST YEAR TWO 500 195.00$                      211.00$                      350.00$                      

GRAND TOTAL YEAR ONE & TWO

530,000.00$                                         

TWO HUNDRED SEVENTY FIVE 

THOUSAND FIVE HUNDRED 

DOLLARS AND NO CENTS 00/100 

CENT

THREE HUNDRED THIRTY TWO 

THOUSAND THREE HUNDERED 

DOLLARS

FIE HUNDRED THIRTY THOUSAND 

DOLLARS 

HOURLY RATE FOR REPAIRS AND/OR REPLACEMENT (OUTSIDE OF 

PREVENTATIVE MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR) PERFORMED 

DURING NORMAL WORKING HOURS DEFINED AS 8:00AM 

THROUGH 5:00PM

ESTIMATED NUMBER OF 

HOURS 
COST PER HOUR COST PER HOUR COST PER HOUR

450  $                      190.00  $                      274.00  $                      400.00 

GRAND TOTAL BID AMOUNT IN WRITTEN/TYPED WORD

GRAND TOTAL BID AMOUNT 275,500.00$                                         332,300.00$                                         



NO. OF BIDDERS: 1

NAME OF BIDDER: HEATH LUMBER CO.

ADDRESS 1580 N. OLDEN AVE.

CITY, STATE, ZIP EWING NJ.

CONTACT GARY PATRICELLI

TELEPHONE 609-392-1166

FAX 609-396-8050

E-MAIL SALES @HEATHLUMBER.COM

NJ SAVI DESIGNATION SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE

EXTEND TO COOPERATIVE YES

INSURANCE AND INDEMNIFICATION REQUIRED IF AWARDED 

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP SIGNED AND DATED

RUSSIA IRAN CERTIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED

EEO AFFIRMATIVE ACTION SIGNED AND DATED

EXHIBIT A INCLUDED 

EIC INCLUDED 

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 SIGNED AND DATED

HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS YES

CONTINUITY OF SERVICE YES

EXCEPTIONS YES, AGENCIES TO REVIEW 

BID RESULTS

CK09MERCER2023-06 LUMBER AND BUILDING MATERIALS FOR THE COUNTY OF 

MERCER AND THE MERCER COUNTY COOPERATIVE CONTRACT PURCHASING 

SYSTEM FOR A PERIOD OF ONE (1) YEAR WITH AND OPTION TO EXTEND ONE (1) 

YEAR

BID OPENING DATE: APRIL 26, 2023



CATEGORY BUILDING MATERIAL DESCRIPTION
CASE/BAGS/UNIT 

COUNT
COST PER CASE COUNT VENDOR CASE COUNT

COST FOR VENDOR 

CASE COUNT

1 ADHESIVE 36- Titebond Construction ADH 2902 24                         1 CASE 95.70$                   

2 ADHESIVES Vinyl Floor Tile Adhesive (Gallon) 1                           1 CASE 24.50$                   

3 ADHESIVES Tile Bound II Wood Glue 1 Gal Bottles 1                           1 CASE 25.40$                   

4 ADHESIVES Vinyl Cove Base Adhesive, 24- 11 oz Tubes / Cs (CASE) 1                           1 CASE 81.30$                   

5 ADHESIVES PL200 Multi-Purpose Adhesive, 12- 11 oz Tubes / Cs (CASE) 12                         1 CASE 28.65$                   

6 ADHESIVES White Late Caulking-, Paintable, 12- 11 oz Tubes / Cs (CASE) 12                         1 CASE 26.70$                   

7 ADHESIVES White Silicone Caulking, Paintable, 12- 11 oz- Tubes / Cs (CASE) 12                         1 CASE 115.40$                 

8 ADHESIVES Clear Silicone Caulking- 11 oz Tubes, 12 Tubes / Cs (CASE) 12                         1 CASE 81.75$                   

9 ADHESIVES Glazing Compound 11 oz. Tubes, 12 Tubes/Cs (CASE) 12                         1 CASE 51.00$                   

10 ADHESIVES Mortar Mix - 80 lb bags 1                           9.00$                     

11 ADHESIVES Gravel Mix - 80 lb bags 1                           6.50$                     

12 ADHESIVES Sand Mix - 80 lb bags (60 LBS EXCEPTIONS) 1                           9.25$                     

13 ADHESIVES Portland Cement - 94 lb bags (47 LBS EXCEPTIONS) 1                           NO BID 

14 CERAMIC & QUARRY TILE GROUT 7 lb bags sand grout poly blend 1                           10.73$                   

15 CERAMIC & QUARRY TILE GROUT 5 lb bags wall grout  12x24 bag 1                           6.72$                     

16 CERAMIC & QUARRY TILE GROUT 1 gallon container of floor sealer 1                           20.25$                   

17 CERAMIC & QUARRY TILE SUB FLOOR 3" X 5" X 1/4" backer board 1                           16.35$                   

18 CERAMIC & QUARRY TILE SUB FLOOR 3" x 5" x 1/2" backer board 1                           18.64$                   

19 COMPOSITE DECKING(TREX) 5/4” x 6” x 20’ windchester grey & saddle Fiberon 1                           102.00$                 

20 COMPOSITE DECKING(TREX) 5/4” x 6” x 16’ windchester grey & saddle Fiberon 1                           82.00$                   

21 COMPOSITE DECKING(TREX) 50 lb. ss decking screws 2 ½ “ long 1                           NO BID 

22 COMPOSITE RAILING (FIBERON) Straight 8 ft. x 42” 1                           260.00$                 

23 COMPOSITE RAILING (FIBERON) Straight 6 ft. x 42” 1                           195.00$                 

24 COMPOSITE RAILING (FIBERON) Stair kits – 6’ x 36” 1                           195.00$                 

25 COMPOSITE RAILING (FIBERON) Surface mount brackets for concrete 1                           62.00$                   

26 COMPOSITE RAILING (FIBERON) Post sleeve – 108” x 4 x 4 166.00$                 

27 COMPOSITE RAILING (FIBERON) Post caps (Standard size is 4" x 4") 1                           13.00$                   

28 CONSTRUCTION TUBES 12” x 12’ 1                           33.06$                   

29 CONSTRUCTION TUBES 16” x 12’ 1                           91.56$                   

30 CONSTRUCTION TUBES 18” x 12’ 1                           120.28$                 

31 HINGED PATIO DOORS (OUTSWING & INSWING) VINYL (FRENCHWOOD)
Anderson 400 series- 3 ft unit (pre-hung) with Standard Jam- 6 9/16" and Door 

Hardware
1                           2,627.00$              

32 INSULATION (JOHNS MANVILLE OR EQUIVALENT) Wide faces R-13 insulation - 3 1/2" x 15" 1                           61.99$                   

33 INSULATION (JOHNS MANVILLE OR EQUIVALENT) R-19 kraft faced fiber glass insulation - 6" x 15" 1                           59.64$                   

34 INSULATION (JOHNS MANVILLE OR EQUIVALENT) Great stuff insulating foam 12 oz. cans 12                         1 CASE 103.00$                 

35 PVC MATERIALS(AZEK) Adhesive - 16 oz cans 6                           1 CASE 210.00$                 

36 PVC MATERIALS(AZEK) Corner board frontier 5/4 x 4” x 4” x 10’ 1                           73.89$                   

37 PVC MATERIALS(AZEK) Corner board frontier 5/4 x 4” x 4” x 20’ 1                           45.00$                   

38 PVC MATERIALS(AZEK) Sheets – traditional ½” x 4’ x 10’ 1                           173.75$                 

39 PVC MATERIALS(AZEK) Sheets – traditional ¾” x 4’ x 12’ 1                           NO BID 

40 PVC MATERIALS(AZEK) Trim board sizes frontier 1” x 4” x 18’ 1                           33.39$                   

41 PVC MATERIALS(AZEK) Trim board sizes frontier 1” x 6” x 18’ 1                           52.48$                   

42 PVC MATERIALS(AZEK) Trim board sizes frontier 1” x 8” x 18’ 1                           68.99$                   

43 PVC MATERIALS(AZEK) Trim board sizes frontier 1” x 10” x 18’ 1                           88.06$                   

44 PVC MATERIALS(AZEK) Trim board sizes frontier 1” x 12” x 18’ 1                           107.26$                 

45 PVC MATERIALS(AZEK) Trim board sizes frontier  5/4” x 4” x 18’ 1                           44.44$                   

46 PVC MATERIALS(AZEK) Trim board sizes frontier 5/4” x 6” x 18’ 1                           70.93$                   

47 PVC MATERIALS(AZEK) Trim board sizes frontier 5/4” x 8” x 18’ 1                           91.95$                   

48 PVC MATERIALS(AZEK) Trim board sizes frontier 5/4” x 10” x 18’ 1                           116.95$                 

49 PVC MATERIALS(AZEK) Stainless Steel Screws 8 x 2 1/2 trim head white (qty 350)  1 BOX 32.00                     

50 ROOFING 15 lb. felt 1                           26.25$                   

51 ROOFING Ice Water Shield Underlayment 66.8 2sq per roll 1                           100.00$                 

52 ROOFING Wet or Dry Roof Cement – 5 gal. containers 1                           45.62$                   

53 ROOFING Aluminum Roof Coating – 5 gal.cans 1                           91.22$                   

54 VINYL SOFFIT SIDING WHITE Vinyl F-channel 12' x 6" 1                           11.75$                   

55 VINYL SOFFIT SIDING WHITE Basket weave vinyl soffit perf t4 1                           22.10$                   

56 VINYL SOFFIT SIDING WHITE J-channel - white 5/8" 1                           12.30$                   

57 VINYL SOFFIT SIDING WHITE J-channel - white 1/2" 1                           4.91$                     

58 VINYL SOFFIT SIDING WHITE White aluminum coil pvc 24" x 50' 1                           161.88$                 

59 VINYL SOFFIT SIDING WHITE Nichols Aluminum Nails 1 1/4" White Trim Nails 1 lb 1                           13.74$                   

60 VINYL WINDOW REPLACEMENTS (IDEAL) White exterior, insulated glass with low e with half screen 22” x 30” 1                           295.00$                 

61 VINYL WINDOW REPLACEMENTS (IDEAL) White exterior, insulated glass with low e with half screen 24” x 38” 1                           295.00$                 

62 VINYL WINDOW REPLACEMENTS (IDEAL) White exterior, insulated glass with low e with half screen 36” x 36” 1                           295.00$                 

63 VINYL WINDOW REPLACEMENTS (IDEAL) White exterior, insulated glass with low e with half screen 24” x 48” 1                           689.00$                 

CK09MERCER2023-06 BUILDING MATERIALS PROPOSAL - THE COUNTY WILL ACCEPT THE BRAND NAMES STATED OR AN EQUIVALENT BRAND



CATEGORY BUILDING MATERIAL DESCRIPTION
CASE/BAGS/UNIT 

COUNT
COST PER CASE COUNT VENDOR CASE COUNT

COST FOR VENDOR 

CASE COUNT

CK09MERCER2023-06 BUILDING MATERIALS PROPOSAL - THE COUNTY WILL ACCEPT THE BRAND NAMES STATED OR AN EQUIVALENT BRAND

64 VINYL WINDOWS NEW CONSTRUCTION (ANDERSON) Double hung low e with screens 36” x 48”  tw30310 1                           598.00$                 

65 VINYL WINDOWS NEW CONSTRUCTION (ANDERSON) Double hung low e with screens 36” x 36”  tw30210 1                           598.00$                 

66 VINYL WINDOWS NEW CONSTRUCTION (ANDERSON) Double hung low e with screens 24” x 48”  tw20310 1                           598.00$                 

67 SHEETROCK- (EACH) 4 x 8 x ½ 1                           16.40$                   

68 SHEETROCK- (EACH) 4 x 10 x ½ 1                           20.50$                   

69 SHEETROCK- (EACH) 4 x 8 x 5/8 1                           20.40$                   

70 SHEETROCK- (EACH) 4 x 10 x 5/8 1                           25.50$                   

71 SHEETROCK- (EACH) 4 x 12 x 5/8 1                           30.60$                   

72 SHEETROCK- (EACH) 4 x 12 x ½ 1                           24.89$                   

73 SHEETROCK- (EACH) 4 x 8 x ½ Moisture Resistant 1                           20.40$                   

74 SHEETROCK- (EACH) 4 x 8 x 5/8 Moisture Restrained 1                           24.13$                   

75 COMPOUND Spackling Compound- 5 gal pails 1                           20.99$                   

76 TAPE- (EACH) Perforated Spackling Tape /  250’ rolls 1                           7.59$                     

77 CORNER BEAD 1 ¼” x 1 ¼” x 10’ Metal Corner Bead 1                           3.20$                     

78 J CHANNEL ½” x 10’ J-Channel, Plastic 1                           1.51$                     

79 J CHANNEL 5/8” x 10’ J-Channel, Plastic 1                           1.41$                     

80 DRY WALL SCREWS Dry-wall Screws- coarse- No.2 Phillips size 1"  10m 1                           82.32$                   

81 DRY WALL SCREWS Dry-wall Screws- coarse- No.2 Phillips size 1 1/4"  8m 1                           70.44$                   

82 DRY WALL SCREWS Dry-wall Screws- coarse- No.2 Phillips size 1 5/8"  5m 1                           55.44$                   

83 DRY WALL SCREWS Dry-wall Screws- coarse- No.2 Phillips size 2"  3.5m 1                           50.38$                   

84 DRY WALL SCREWS Dry-wall Screws- coarse- No.2 Phillips size 2 1/2"  2.5m 1                           56.63$                   

85 DRY WALL SCREWS Dry-wall Screws- coarse- No.2 Phillips size 3"  2m 1                           55.44$                   

86 DRY WALL SCREWS Dry-wall Screws- fine- No.2 Phillips size 1"  10m 1                           82.32$                   

87 DRY WALL SCREWS Dry-wall Screws- fine- No.2 Phillips size 1 1/4"  8m 1                           70.44$                   

88 DRY WALL SCREWS Dry-wall Screws- fine- No.2 Phillips size 1 5/8"  5m 1                           58.20$                   

89 DRY WALL SCREWS Dry-wall Screws- fine- No.2 Phillips size 2"  3.5m 1                           50.38$                   

90 DRY WALL SCREWS Dry-wall Screws- fine- No.2 Phillips size 2 1/2"  2.5m 1                           56.63$                   

91 DRY WALL SCREWS Dry-wall Screws- fine- No.2 Phillips size 3"  2m 1                           55.44$                   

92 STEEL STUD 2 x 4 x 8’ 25 GA 1                           9.49$                     

93 STEEL STUD 2 x 4 x 10’ 25 GA 1                           10.99$                   

94 STEEL STUD 2 x 4 x 12’ 25 GA 1                           13.99$                   

95 STEEL STUD 2 x 4 x 10’ Steel Sole/Top Plate 25 GA 1                           7.36$                     

96 STEEL STUD 2 x 4 x 8’ - 20 GA 1                           7.79$                     

97 STEEL STUD 2 x 4 x 10’ - 20 GA 1                           11.38$                   

98 STEEL STUD 2 x 4 x 12’ - 20 GA 1                           11.49$                   

99 L SHELF BRACKETS (EACH) 12” x 9 1/2” w/Support Arm 1                           4.04$                     

100 L SHELF BRACKETS (EACH) 20” x 13” w/Support Arm & Closet Pole Holder (20X10) EXCEPTION) 1                           2.63$                     

101 L SHELF BRACKETS (EACH) 16 x 20 L-Shelf Bracket w/Support Arm 1                           6.74$                     

102 THREADED STEEL RODS - / YARD ¼” x 36" 1                           1.63$                     

103 THREADED STEEL RODS - / YARD 3/8” x 36" 1                           2.90$                     

104 THREADED STEEL RODS - / YARD ½” x 36" 1                           5.07$                     

105 THREADED STEEL RODS - / YARD 5/16” 1                           2.34$                     

106 ROLL 6 MIL CLEAR PLASTIC 20’ x 100’ 1                           81.00$                   

107 ROLL 6 MIL CLEAR PLASTIC 8’ x 100’ 1                           34.20$                   

108 TAPE- (EACH) 1” x 60 Yds Masking 1                           1.70$                     

109 TAPE- (EACH) 2” x 60 Yds Masking 1                           3.34$                     

110 TAPE- (EACH) 2” Duct 1                           4.72$                     

111 TAPE- (EACH) 2” x 60 Yds Blue Painters Tape 1                           8.19$                     

112 NAILS COMMON - PER 5 LB BOX 6D 1                           66.20$                   

113 NAILS COMMON - PER 5 LB BOX 8D 1                           10.00$                   

114 NAILS COMMON - PER 5 LB BOX 10D 1                           10.00$                   

115 NAILS COMMON - PER 5 LB BOX 12D 1                           10.00$                   

116 NAILS COMMON - PER 5 LB BOX 12” Galvanized Spikes (50LB) 1                           2.00$                     

117 FINISHING NAILS - PER 5 LB BOX 3D 1                           NO BID 

118 FINISHING NAILS - PER 5 LB BOX 4D 1                           13.00$                   

119 FINISHING NAILS - PER 5 LB BOX 6D 1                           13.00$                   

120 FINISHING NAILS - PER 5 LB BOX 8D 1                           13.00$                   

121 FINISHING NAILS - PER 5 LB BOX 10D 1                           13.00$                   

122 SUSPENDED CEILING ACOUSTICAL TILE / Box Armstrong (10 PCs/Cs) Square Edge - White (2 x 4 Box) 1                           77.13$                   

123 SUSPENDED CEILING ACOUSTICAL TILE / Box Armstrong (16 PCs/Cs) Square Edge - White (2 x 2 Box) No. 934 1                           65.88$                   

124 SUSPENDED CEILING ACOUSTICAL TILE / Box Armstrong 2’ T-Bar White (Simplicity), 60 Pcs/Box 1                           $212.40

125 SUSPENDED CEILING ACOUSTICAL TILE / Box Armstrong 4’ T-Bar White (Simplicity), 60 Pcs/Box 1                           417.00$                 

126 SUSPENDED CEILING ACOUSTICAL TILE / Box Armstrong 12’ Heavy Duty 5-Bar White, Simplicity 25 Pcs/Box 1                           523.75$                 

127 SUSPENDED CEILING ACOUSTICAL TILE / Box Armstrong 10’ Wall Angle White, Simplicity, 40 PCs / Box  (12' EXCEPTION) 1                           622.40$                 



CATEGORY BUILDING MATERIAL DESCRIPTION
CASE/BAGS/UNIT 

COUNT
COST PER CASE COUNT VENDOR CASE COUNT

COST FOR VENDOR 

CASE COUNT

CK09MERCER2023-06 BUILDING MATERIALS PROPOSAL - THE COUNTY WILL ACCEPT THE BRAND NAMES STATED OR AN EQUIVALENT BRAND

128 SUSPENDED CEILING ACOUSTICAL TILE / Box Armstrong USG-DX 12’ Main Tee, White (20 PER CTN) 1                           NO BID 

129 SUSPENDED CEILING ACOUSTICAL TILE / Box Armstrong USG-DX 2’ Cross Tee, White (60 PER CTN) 1                           NO BID 

130 SUSPENDED CEILING ACOUSTICAL TILE / Box Armstrong USG-DX 4’ Cross Tee, White (60 PER CTN) 1                           NO BID 

131 SUSPENDED CEILING ACOUSTICAL TILE / Box Armstrong USG-M-7 12’ Wall Angle, White 1                           NO BID 

132 FINISHES Minwax Brand Oil Stain (Asst’d Colors) - / Qt 1                           11.47$                   

133 FINISHES Minwax Brand Oil Gloss Polyurethane - / Qt 1                           16.00$                   

134 FINISHES Minwax Brand Oil Satin Polyurethane - / Qt 1                           16.00$                   

135 FINISHES Clear Wood Preservative - / Gal. 1                           24.85$                   

136 FINISHES Paint Thinner - / Gal. 1                           9.22$                     

137 FINISHES Denatured Alcohol - / Gal. 1                           11.32$                   

138 FINISHES Linseed Oil - / Gal. 1                           36.27$                   

139 FINISHES Paint Remover - / Ga. 1                           15.37$                   

140 FINISHES Elmer’s Brand Carpenter’s Wood Filler - / Pint 1                           6.50$                     

141 FINISHES Lacquer Thinner - / Gal. 1                           14.55$                   

142 SHELF STANDARDS & ARMS- (EACH) 3’ Shelf Standards Alum Finish 1                           2.93$                     

143 SHELF STANDARDS & ARMS- (EACH) 4’ Shelf Standards Alum Finish 1                           3.93$                     

144 SHELF STANDARDS & ARMS- (EACH) 6’ Shelf Standards Alum Finish 1                           5.52$                     

145 SHELF STANDARDS & ARMS- (EACH) 10” Shelf Arms Alum Finish 1                           1.83$                     

146 SHELF STANDARDS & ARMS- (EACH) 12” Shelf Arms Alum Finish 1                           2.06$                     

147 DOUBLE HEAD NAILS 8P / Lb 1                           2.70$                     

148 DOUBLE HEAD NAILS 8P / 50 Lbs 1                           66.20$                   

149 DOUBLE HEAD NAILS 10P / Lb 1                           2.70$                     

150 DOUBLE HEAD NAILS 10P / 50 Lbs 1                           66.20$                   

151 DOUBLE HEAD NAILS 16P / Lb 1                           66.20$                   

152 DOUBLE HEAD NAILS 16P / 50 Lbs 1                           98.69$                   

153 COMMON NAILS 60P / 50 lbs 1                           64.00$                   

154 COMMON NAILS 60P Galvanized / 50 Lb 1                           2.70$                     

155 COMMON NAILS 8P / 50 Lb 1                           64.00$                   

156 COMMON NAILS 10P / Lb 1                           2.70$                     

157 COMMON NAILS 10P / 50 Lb (PER BOX) 1                           64.00$                   

158 COMMON NAILS 16P / Lb 1                           2.70$                     

159 COMMON NAILS 16P / 50 Lb 1                           64.00$                   

160 COMMON NAILS 20P / Lb 1                           2.70$                     

161 COMMON NAILS 20P / 50 Lb 1                           NO BID 

162 BOX NAILS 4P / 50 Lb 1                           75.00$                   

163 BRIDGE DIV. 6P /50 Lb 1                           75.00$                   

164 BRIDGE DIV. 7P / 50 Lb 1                           75.00$                   

165 NAILS Paslode 5-Packs Red Fuel Cell IMP(2-Packs per) #277 1                           27.50$                   

166 NAILS Paslode 5-Packs Trim Fuel Cell IMP(2-Packs per) 1                           14.45$                   

167 NAILS Paslode Finish Nails- 16 gauge angled 1 1/4" 1                           21.74$                   

168 NAILS Paslode Finish Nails- 16 gauge angled 1 1/2" 1                           25.64$                   

169 NAILS Paslode Finish Nails- 16 gauge angled 2" 1                           29.75$                   

170 NAILS Paslode Finish Nails- 16 gauge angled 2 1/2" 1                           32.58$                   

171 NAILS Paslode Finish Nails- 16 gauge straight 1 1/4" 1                           12.18$                   

172 NAILS Paslode Finish Nails- 16 gauge straight 1 1/2" 1                           15.00$                   

173 NAILS Paslode Finish Nails- 16 gauge straight 2" 1                           20.00$                   

174 NAILS Paslode Finish Nails- 16 gauge straight 2 1/2" 1                           25.00$                   

175 NAILS Paslode Nails- 2 3/8" x 113- 8D common 1                           90.00$                   

176 NAILS Paslode Nails- 2 3/8" x 113- 10D common- EXCEPTION 3" 1                           63.00$                   

177 NAILS Ramset Concrete Nails- Box of 100- 1 1/2" 1                           10.00$                   

178 NAILS Ramset Concrete Nails- Box of 100- 2" 1                           10.00$                   

179 NAILS Ramset Concrete Nails- Box of 100- 2 1/2" 1                           13.20$                   

180 NAILS Ramset Concrete Nails- Box of 100- 3" 1                           13.20$                   

181 NAILS Ramset Loads/Charges/Cargas- .27 cal.- 100 qty.- strips- red 1                           18.00$                   

182 NAILS Ramset Loads/Charges/Cargas- .27 cal.- 100 qty.- strips- green 1                           18.00$                   

183 NAILS Ramset Loads/Charges/Cargas- .27 cal.- 100 qty.- strips- yellow 1                           18.00$                   

184 ASPHALT IMPREGNATED 4” x 10’ x ½” 1                           3.50$                     

185 ASPHALT IMPREGNATED 6” x 10’ x ½” 1                           5.14$                     

186 CONCRETE NAILS 1” / Lb fluted 1                           3.40$                     

187 CONCRETE NAILS 1” / 50 Lb (PER BOX) 1                           104.00$                 

188 CONCRETE NAILS 2” / Lb 1                           3.40$                     

189 CONCRETE NAILS 2” / 50 Lb (PER BOX) 1                           104.00$                 

190 CONCRETE NAILS 3” / Lb 1                           3.40$                     

191 CONCRETE NAILS 3” / 50 Lb (PER BOX) 1                           NO BID 



CATEGORY BUILDING MATERIAL DESCRIPTION
CASE/BAGS/UNIT 

COUNT
COST PER CASE COUNT VENDOR CASE COUNT

COST FOR VENDOR 

CASE COUNT

CK09MERCER2023-06 BUILDING MATERIALS PROPOSAL - THE COUNTY WILL ACCEPT THE BRAND NAMES STATED OR AN EQUIVALENT BRAND

192 CONCRETE NAILS PVC Pipe 4” - / Foot 1                           NO BID 

193 CONCRETE NAILS Plastic 20’ x 100’ x 6 Mil 1                           82.00$                   

194 CONCRETE NAILS Plastic 10’ x 100’ x 6 Mil 1                           42.00$                   

195 MISCELLANEOUS 5 (cases) - General Purpose Blade 7 ¼” 5 per pack 25 pcs 1                           1 PACK - 75 PIECES TOTAL 135.00$                 

196 MASONRY: CULTURED STONE MATERIAL 2 (qty) - Mortar Type “N” Bags (50 Cube) (80 LBS. PREPARED) per bag 1                           7.41$                     

197 ENTER BRAND NAME 

 INSERT DISCOUNT TO 

RETAIL COST OR 

UPCHARGE TO 

WHOLESALE COST 

 ENTER DISCOUNT OR 

WHOLESALE 

198 INTERIOR DOORS-6 PANEL MOLDED INTERIOR DOOR UNIT PRE-HUNG (= + OR -) _____% 25 MARGIN

199 VINYL WINDOW REPLACEMENTS (IDEAL) (= + OR -) ______% 25 MARGIN

200 VINYL WINDOWS NEW CONSTRUCTION (ANDERSON) (= + OR -) _____% 30 MARGIN

201 HINGED PATIO DOORS (OUTSWING & INSWING) VINYL (FRENCHWOOD) (= + OR -) ______% 20 MARGIN

202
MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS NOT STATED UPCHARGE TO WHOLESALE COST OR 

DISCOUNT TO RETAIL COST 
(= + OR -) ______% 28 MARGIN

203 LUMBER ONLY RANDOM LENGTHS WEEKLY PRICING +________% (+)__________% DID NOT PROVIDE % 

LUMBER BENCHMARK PRICING

RANDOM LENGTHS WEEKLY PRICING

Bidders shall provide an upcharge to the pricing stated in the Random Lengths Weekly Report for all lumber products. The Random Lengths Weekly Report provides prices for more than 1,600 

items of softwood lumber, panels, and other wood products.

PAYMENT 

When invoicing the County for lumber, the awarded Vendor shall attach a copy of the Random Lengths weekly pricing to their invoice and reflect the upcharge on the invoice. 


