
AWARD FOR TWO YEARS ; ONE ADDENDUM RELEASED 

NUMBER OF RESPONDENTS

NAME OF BIDDER SITEONE LANDSCAPE SUPPLY 

ADDRESS 209 BAKERS BASIN ROAD

CITY, STATE, ZIP LAWRENCEVILLE, NJ 08648

CONTACT BID DEPARTMENT

TELEPHONE 800-321-5325 EXT 2550

FAX 248-581-1433

E-MAIL BIDS@SITEONE.COM

EXTEND TO COOP NO 

ADDENDUM NO.ONE SIGNED AND DATED

CONTINUITY OF OPERATIONS WILL NOT PROVIDE

IRAN CERTIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED

INSURANCE AND INDEMNIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED

LOCATED WITHIN 30 MINUTES FROM TRENTON, NJ 6.1 Miles

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK

STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE OK

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 SIGNED AND DATED

EXHIBIT A OK

EIC 34998 EXPIRES 2.15.19

CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE REQUIRED IF AWARDED

EXTEND BEYOND 60 DAYS OR UNTIL CONTRACT IS AWARDED YES

EXCEPTIONS YES, SEE PAGE 45

FATAL FLAW NO

BID RESULTS

CK09MERCER2017-26 NURSERY SUPPLIES FOR MERCER COUNTY CO-OP

BID OPENING DATE: NOVEMBER 10,2017 POST PONE TO NOVEMBER 14,2017

mailto:BIDS@SITEONE.COM


DESCRIPTION SIZE/PACKAGE SHEMIN

ANNUALS

1 BEGONIA 4.5" 15/PK NO BID 

2 CABBAGE/KALE 8" NO BID 

3 CHRYS GARDEN 8" PREM NO BID 

4 IMPATIENS 4.5" PK/15 NO BID 

5 MARIGOLDS 4.5" PK/15 NO BID 

6 PANSY 4.5" FLAT/15 NO BID 

7 PETUNIA WAVE 4.5" PK/15 NO BID 

8 SALVIA 4.5" PK/15 NO BID 

9 VINCA VINE 4.5" PK/15 NO BID 

PERENNIALS

10 ASTILBE DEUTSCHLAND  1GAL POT 7.00$                                      

11 ASTILBE FANAL RED 1GAL POT 7.00$                                      

12 CHRYSANTHEMUM BECKY 1GAL POT 7.00$                                      

13 COREOPSIS MOONBEAM 1GAL POT 7.00$                                      

14 DIANTHUS CAES.TINY RUBY 1GAL POT 7.00$                                      

15 DICENTRA SPECTABILIS 1GAL POT 7.00$                                      

16 ECHINACEA MAGNUS 1GAL POT 7.00$                                      

17 FERN JAPANESE PAINTED 1GAL POT 9.00$                                      

18 GRASS CALAMAGAR K FOREST 2GAL POT 11.00$                                    

19 GRASS FESTUCA ELIJAH BLU 1GAL POT 8.50$                                      

20 GRASS MISC GRACILLIMUS 3GAL POT 14.00$                                    

21 GRASS PENNISETUM HAMELN 2GAL POT 11.00$                                    

22 HEM PARDON ME 1GAL POT 7.50$                                      

23 HEM STELLA D'ORO 1GAL POT 6.50$                                      

24 HEUCHERA PALACE PURPLE 1GAL POT 7.00$                                      

25 HOSTA FRANCEE 1GAL POT 8.75$                                      

26 HOSTA PATRIOT 1GAL POT 8.75$                                      

27 HOSTA SIEB ELEGANS 1GAL POT 8.75$                                      

28 IRIS CEASARS BROTHER 1GAL POT 8.50$                                      

29 LAVENDULA PROVENCE 1GAL POT 9.50$                                      

30 NEPETA WALKERS LOW 1GAL POT 7.00$                                      

31 PEROVSKIA ATRIPLICIFOLIA 1GAL POT 7.00$                                      

32 RUDBECKIA FUL GOLDSTRUM 1GAL POT 7.00$                                      

33 SEDUM AUTUMN JOY 1GAL POT 8.00$                                      

TREES AND SHRUBS

34 ACER RUBR OCT GLORY 2.0/2.5" CALIPER 185.00$                                  

35 ACER RUBR RED SUN 2.5/3.0" CALIPER 245.00$                                  

36 ACER SACHARM GRN MT 2.0/2.5" CALIPER 245.00$                                  

37 AZALEA DVW 3GAL POT 17.50$                                    

38 AZALEA HINO-CRIMSON 3GAL POT 17.50$                                    

39 AZALEA TRADITION 3GAL POT 17.50$                                    

40 BERBERIS T A CRIM PYG 3GAL POT 18.50$                                    

41 BERBERIS T A ROSE GL 3GAL POT 18.50$                                    

42 BETULA N HERITAGE CL 6/7' FT 95.00$                                    

43 BUXUS MICR KOR GRN MTN 3GAL POT 32.00$                                    

44 BUXUS MICR KOR GRN VELVT 3GAL POT 32.00$                                    

45 BUXUS MICR KOR GRN VELVT 5GAL POT 42.00$                                    

46 BUXUS MICR WINT GEM 3GAL POT 32.00$                                    

47 CERCIS CANAD 6/7' FT 95.00$                                    

48 CORNUS FL CH CHIEF 6/7' FT 125.00$                                  

49 CORNUS FL CH PRNCS 6/7' FT 125.00$                                  

50 CUPRESSOCYP LEYLANDI 15GAL POT 110.00$                                  

51 DEUTZIA GRAC NIKKO 3GAL POT 21.50$                                    

52 EUONYMUS ALAT COMP 3GAL POT 27.00$                                    

53 HYDRANGEA MAC ENDLSS SUMR 3GAL POT 32.00$                                    

54 HYDRANGEA MAC NIKKO BLU 3GAL POT 29.00$                                    

55 ILEX CREN COMPACTA 3GAL POT 19.00$                                    

56 ILEX CREN HOOGENDORN 3GAL POT 19.00$                                    

57 ILEX GLABR SHAMROCK 3GAL POT 21.00$                                    

58 ILEX MES BL PRINCE 3GAL POT 31.00$                                    

59 ILEX MES BL PRINCESS 3GAL POT 31.00$                                    

60 JUNIPER CH PRO NANA 3GAL POT 14.00$                                    

61 JUNIPER CH SARGENT 3GAL POT 14.00$                                    

62 JUNIPER HOR WILTONI 3GAL POT 14.00$                                    

63 LAGERSTROM / MUSK 15GAL POT 115.00$                                  

64 LAGERSTROM / NATCHZ 15GAL POT 115.00$                                  

65 LAGERSTROM / TUSCA 15GAL POT 115.00$                                  

66 LIRIOPE MUSC GREEN 1GAL POT 4.75$                                      

67 LIRIOPE MUSC VAR 1GAL POT 4.75$                                      

68 PICEA ABIES 6/7' FT 110.00$                                  

69 PICEA PUNGENS 6/7' FT 125.00$                                  

70 PINUS STROBUS SS 6/7' FT 110.00$                                  

71 PRUNUS C THUNDRCLD 2.0/2.5" CALIPER 165.00$                                  

72 PRUNUS LAU OTTO LUYKEN 24/30" CALIPER 42.00$                                    

73 PRUNUS LAU SCHIPKAEN 30/36" CALIPER 49.00$                                    

74 PRUNUS LAU SCHIPKAEN 36/48" CALIPER 58.00$                                    

75 PRUNUS SER KWANZAN 2.0/2.5" CALIPER 175.00$                                  

76 PRUNUS SUB SN FOUNT 2.0/2.5" CALIPER 195.00$                                  

77 PSEUDOTSUGA MENZI 6/7' FT 130.00$                                  

78 QUERCUS PALUSTRIS 2.0/2.5" CALIPER 195.00$                                  

79 QUERCUS RUBRA 2.0/2.5" CALIPER 210.00$                                  

80 RHODO BOURSAULT 3GAL POT 34.00$                                    

81 RHODO CHINOIDES 3GAL POT 34.00$                                    

82 RHODO NOVA ZEMBLA 3GAL POT 34.00$                                    

83 RHODO PJM 3GAL POT 32.00$                                    

84 ROSA KNOCK OUT 3GAL POT 19.00$                                    

85 ROSA KNOCK OUT DOUBLE 3GAL POT 20.00$                                    

86 SPIRAEA BUM A WATERER 3GAL POT 14.50$                                    

87 SPIRAEA BUM GLD FLAME 3GAL POT 14.50$                                    

88 SPIRAEA JP GLD MOUND 3GAL POT 14.50$                                    

89 SPIRAEA JP LIT PRINCESS 3GAL POT 14.50$                                    

90 SYRINGA PAT MISS KIM 3GAL POT 27.00$                                    

91 TAXUS M DENSI 5GAL POT 24.00$                                    

92 THUJA OCC EM GREEN 5/6' FT 60.00$                                    

93 TSUGA CANADEN 6/7' FT 135.00$                                  

94 VIBURNUM CARLESI I  3GAL POT 29.00$                                    

95 VIBURNUM DENT CH LUSTRE 5GAL POT 42.00$                                    

96 WEIGELA FL WINE & ROSE 3GAL POT 28.00$                                    

97 NATIVE PLANTS

98 WARM SEASON GRASS, SEDGE, RUSH, VARIOUS 

SPECIES. NO BUTIVARS
1/2 GAL POT 5.00$                                      

99 WARM SEASON GRASS, SEDGE, RUSH, VARIOUS 

SPECIES. NO CULTIVARS.
1 GAL POT 8.00$                                      

100 WILDFLOWERS, VARIOUS SPECIES.  NO CULTIVARS COST PER PLUG 1.15$                                      

101 WILDFLOWERS, VARIOUS SPECIES.  NO CULTIVARS PINT 4.25$                                      

102 WILDFLOWERS, VARIOUS SPECIES.  NO CULTIVARS 1/2 GAL  6.50$                                      

103 FERNS, VARIOUS SPECIES.  NO CULTIVARS PLUG 1.25$                                      

104 FERNS, VARIOUS SPECIES.  NO CULTIVARS PINT 4.50$                                      

105 FERNS, VARIOUS SPECIES.  NO CULTIVARS 1/2 GAL 6.50$                                      

106 SHRUB VARIOUS SPECIES, NO CULTIVARS 1/2 GAL 7.00$                                      

107 SHRUB VARIOUS SPECIES, NO CULTIVARS GAL 11.00$                                    

108 TREE, VARIOUS SPECIES. NO CULTIVARS COST PER PLUG 8.00$                                      

109 TREE, VARIOUS SPECIES. NO CULTIVARS GAL 19.00$                                    

110 TREE, VARIOUS SPECIES. NO CULTIVARS 2 GAL 24.00$                                    

NATIVE SEED MIXES

111 NATIVE POLLINATOR MIX 50 LB BAG NO BID 

112 WILDFLOWER MEADOW 50 LB BAG NO BID 

113 WETLAND WILDFLOWER MIX 50 LB BAG NO BID 

114 SHORT MEADOW GRASSES 50 LB BAG NO BID 

115 TALL MEADOW GRASSES 50 LB BAG NO BID 

NATIVE GRASS SEED

116 BIG BLUESTEM PER POUND NO BID 

117 LITTLE BLUESTEM PER POUND NO BID 

118 BROOMSEDGE PER POUND NO BID 

119 INDIAN GRASS PER POUND NO BID 

120 PURPLE LOVE GRASS PER POUND NO BID 

121 SWITCHGRASS PER POUND NO BID 

122 CANADA WILDRYE PER POUND NO BID 

123 VIRGINIA WILDRYE PER POUND NO BID 

124 AUTUMN BENTGRASS PER POUND NO BID 

125 PURPLE TOP/GREASE GRASS PER POUND NO BID 

MULCH PRICE PER CUBIC YARD

126 BLACK DOUBLE GROUND MULCH DELIVERED COST PER CY NO BID 

127 BLACK DOUBLE GROUND MULCH PICK-UP BY AGENCY COST PER CY NO BID 

128 BROWN DOUBLE GROUND MULCH DELIVERED COST PER CY NO BID 

129 BROWN DOUBLE GROUND MULCH PICK-UP BY AGENCY COST PER CY NO BID 

130 RIVER JACK 5 - 8" COST PER TON COST PER TON NO BID 

131 DISCOUNT FOR ITEMS NOT LISTED INSERT DISCOUNT FOR ITEMS NOT LISTED 20%



NO. OF RESPONDENTS: 4 NO BID

NAME OF BIDDER 
KLBL INC. D/B/A VIC GERARD GOLF 

CARS
GOLF CAR SPECIALTIES E-Z-GO, DIV. OF TEXTRON, INC TURF EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLY COMPANY

ADDRESS 281 SQUANKUM ROAD 136 WASHINGTON STREET 1451 MARVIN GRIFFIN ROAD 8015 DORSEY RUN ROAD

CITY, STATE, ZIP FARMINGDALE, NJ 07727 GLOUCESTER CITY, NJ 08030 AUGUSTA, GA 
JESSUP, MD 20794

CONTACT WILLIAM LYNCH JOHN T. MYERS RUSTY MC GAHEE

TELEPHONE 732 938 4464 856 742 8725 845.637.7641

FAX 732 938 3211 856 742 1011 706.826.1165

E-MAIL SALES@VGGC.NET JOHN2GOLFCARSPECIALTIES.COM NROBERTO@TEXTRON.COM

BID DEPOSIT CASHIERS CHECK INCLUDED $20K
AMERICAN SOUTHERN INSURANCE COMPANY 

NTE 10%  

TRAVELERS CASUALTY AND SURETY 

COMPANY OF AMERICA $20K

CONSENT OF SURETY NOT INCLUDED DOUGLAS A OLT, AIF WITH POA CYNTHIA FARRELL, AIF WITH POA

BUSINESS REGISTRATION INCLUDED INCLUDED TEXTRON INC.

INSURANCE INDEMNIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

INSURANCE REQUIRED FROM AWARDED 

VENDOR
REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED

STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE CERTIFICATE OK OK OK

EIC 37276 EXPIRES 7/15/19 32911 EXPIRES 9/15/23 2832 EXPIRES 12/15/18

EXHIBIT A INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

IRAN CERTIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

EMERGENCY CONTINGENCY PLAN YES   YES   YES

HOLD PRICING YES   YES   YES

DRAFT LEASE AGREEMENT INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

REFERENCES INCLUDED NOT INCLUDED INCLUDED 

COST FOR LEASE FOR THREE YEAR TERM

COST PER CART ANNUALLY                                                    829.33                                                                           760.77                                                       751.56 

ANNUAL LEASE FOR 215 CARTS INCLUDING 

MAINTENANCE
                                            178,305.95                                                                    163,565.55                                                161,585.40 

COST FOR LEASE FOR THREE YEARS FOR 215 

CARTS
 534, 917.85                                                                    490,696.65                                                484,756.20 

COST ANNUALLY FOR SINGLE RIDER MOBILITY 

CAR
 INCLUDED   INCLUDED   INCLUDED  

COST FOR THREE YEARS FOR SINGLE RIDER 

MOBILITY CAR
 INCLUDED  INCLUDED  INCLUDED 

COST FOR LEASE AND MAINTENANCE OF THREE 

(3) UTILITY CARTS
                                                1,620.00                                                                        1,479.96                                                    1,474.44 

COST ANNUALLY FOR MAINTENANCE OF THREE 

(3) UTILITY CARTS
                                                4,860.00                                                                        4,439.88                                                    4,423.32 

COST FOR THREE YEARS FOR UTILITY CARTS WITH 

CARGO BEDS
                                              14,580.00                                                                      13,319.64                                                  13,269.96 

TOTAL COST FOR 219 CARTS FOR  THREE YEAR 

LEASE
                                            569,477.85                                                                    522,513.45                                                578,928.48 

OPTION YEAR FOUR

COST PER CART FOR FOURTH YEAR                                                    742.94                                                                           760.77                                                       703.56 

FOURTH YEAR LEASE FOR 215 CARTS INCLUDING 

MAINTENANCE
                                            159,732.10                                                                    163,565.55                                                151,265.40 

COST FOR SINGLE RIDER MOBILITY CAR  INCLUDED  INCLUDED  INCLUDED 

COST FOR LEASE AND MAINTENANCE OF ONE 

UTILITY CART
                                                1,356.00                                                                        1,479.96                                                    1,474.44 

COST FOR THREE                                                 4,068.00                                                                        4,439.88                                                    4,423.32 

TOTAL COST FOR OPTION YEAR FOUR                                             169,524.10                                                                    174,171.15                                                162,656.16 

DAILY RENTAL RATE PER DAY FOR ADDITIONAL 

CART TYPES  YEARS ONE THROUGH THREE 

TWO PASSENGER                                                      55.00                                                                             39.00  50.00 CAR/DAY 

FOUR PASSENGER                                                    110.00                                                                           110.00  $200.00 CAR/DAY 

SIX PASSENGER                                                    135.00                                                                           135.00  $200.00 CAR/DAY 

EIGHT PASSENGER                                                    195.00  N/A  N/A 

DAILY RENTAL RATE PER DAY FOR ADDITIONAL 

CART TYPES YEAR FOUR

TWO PASSENGER                                                      55.00                                                                             39.00  50.00 CAR/DAY 

FOUR PASSENGER                                                    110.00                                                                           110.00  $200.00 CAR/DAY 

SIX PASSENGER                                                    135.00                                                                           135.00  $200.00 CAR/DAY 

EIGHT PASSENGER                                                    195.00  N/A  N/A 

EXCEPTIONS NONE NONE REAR SUSPENSION-SEE ATTACHED

FATAL FLAW NO NO NO

                                                                                                               BID RESULTS

                  AB2017-35 LEASE, SERVICE OF GOLF CARTS FOR THE MERCER COUNTY PARK COMMISSION FOR A PERIOD OF THREE YEARS WITH 

THE OPTION TO EXTEND ONE YEAR

                                                                                                                  November 15, 2017

mailto:SALES@VGGC.NET
mailto:NROBERTO@TEXTRON.COM

