BID RESULTS

CKO9MERCER2017-22 ELECTRICAL PARTS AND SUPPLIES FOR THE COUNTY OF MERCER AND THE COOPERATIVE CONTRACT PURCHASING SYSTEM FOR A PERIOD OF TWO YEARS

January 11, 2018

PARTIAL AWARDS FOR A PERIOD OF TWO
'YEARS, BASED UPON HIGHEST DISCOUNT TO
TRA-SER BENCHMARK, AWARD SORTED BY
VENDOR AND DESCRIPTION FOR AGENCIES

NO. OF BIDDERS:

SCAN AND RETAIN ALL RECORDS

NAME OF BIDDER:

FRANKLIN - GRIFFITH, LLC.

COOPER ELECTRIC SUPPLY CO.

GRAYBAR ELECTRIC CO. INC.,

PEMBERTON ELECTRICAL SUPPLY CO., LLC

ADDRESS 5 SECOND STREET 3477 RT. 9 NORTH 800 HUYLER STREET 140 MT.HOLLY BYPASS, UNIT #7

CITY, STATE, ZIP TRENTON, NJ 08611 FREEHOLD, NJ 07728 TETERBORO, NJ 07608 LUMBERTON, NJ 08048
CONTACT WILLIAM WALKER Il TANIA RODRIGUES KYLE KOCH BRIAN K. HORNER

TELEPHONE 609.695.6121 914.829.4604 201.596.2662 609.518.7877

FAX 609.695.3217 732.308.4606 201.596.2650 609.518.7097

E-MAIL W.WALKER@FRANKELEC.COM GOVBIDS@COOPER-ELECTRIC.COM JOSEPH.GARCIA@GRAYBAR.COM BHORNER@PEMBERTONELECTRICAL.COM
ADDENDUM - ADDENDUM NO. ONE OK OK OK OK

EXTEND TO CO-OPERATIVE YES YES NO YES

INSURANCE REQUIRED FROM AWARDED
VENDOR

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

INSURANCE AND INDEMNIFICATION

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION

OK

OK

OK

OK

STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE

OK

OK

OK

OK

IRAN CERTIFICATION

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

EXHIBIT A

OK

OK

OK

OK

EIC

CERT#55544 EXPIRES 2/15/19

CERT#1237 EXPIRES 4/15/19

CERT #1087 EXPIRES 2/15/19

CERT#32804 8/15/23

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS YES YES YES YES
'CONTINUITY OF SERVICE YES YES YES YES
TRA-SER CERTFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED
EXCEPTIONS NONE NONE NONE NONE

FATAL FLAW NO NO NO NO
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TANUTACTURE

INSERT DISCOUNT FROM INSERT DISCOUNT| MANUFACTURER IF | INSERT DISCOUNT INSERT DISCOUNT | MANUFACTURER IF INSERT DISCOUNT FROM TRA
DEC“"L‘&'};X‘;;E‘“" (Or TRA-SER, COLUMN alnmﬁgfﬁgﬁm\ﬁm FROM TRA-SER, BIDDING AN FROM TRA-SER, | R IF BA':‘D'"G FROM TRA-SER, BIDDING AN MAN”::?;SIE\;‘A':E‘L'TDD'"G SER PRICING, COLUMN
THREE COLUMN THREE EQUIVALENT cowmnThree | _..2N._. | COLUMNTHREE | EQUIVALENT THREE
GRIFFITH COOPER GRAYBAR PEMBERTON AWARD HIGHEST DISCOUNT
3m
TERMINALS 36% 40%) 10% 42% PEMBERTON 42%
ELECTRICAL TAPE 36% 40% 20% 39% COOPER 40%|
UNIVERSAL
HID ELECTRONIC BALLASTS 847 25% NO BID 86%) PEMBERTON 86%
STANDARD HID RAII ASTS NO RID) 25%) NO BID| RA% PEMBERTON RA%
FI OURFSCFNT FI FECTRONIC BAITASTS /7% 25%) NO BID) 8% PEMBERTON 8%,
MAGNETIC BALLASTS 89% 25%) NO BID, 89% GRIFFITH & PEMBERTON! 89%
IQleAcN%APH 11IGS TERMINAIS AND YA AN%| NO RID| ARZ] PEMBERTON AR%Z|
MERSEN
STANDARD SMALL DIMENSION AND 69%, 20%) NO BID| 68%, GRIFFITH 69%)
STANDARD FUSETRON 69%| 20%, NO BID 72% PEMBERTON 72%)
CROUSE HINDS
COMMEFRCIAI | OCKNUTS AND 71%) A0%) 50%, 75% PEMBERTON 75%)
COMMERCIAL EMT FITTINGS 91%)| 40%) 50%| 90%, GRIFFITH 91%|
SYLVANIA
STANDARD LARGE LAMPS* NOT FIRM 89%) 20%, NO BID 91%) PEMBERTON 91%)
HOFFMAN
ENCLOSURES. CABINETS. WIRE 52%| 20%, NO BID 45%) GRIFFITH 52%)
HUBBELL
STANDARD COTMIERCTAT STTCTT AN %] 20% 15% 65% PEMBERTON 65%]
IDEAL
TOOIS TESTERS AND ACCFSSORIES A% 20%} 15%) 37%) PEMBERTON 37%)
LEVITON
WIRING DFVICFS. COMMFRCIAI AND 42%, 5%, 20%, 4£2%, GRIFFITH & PEMRFRTON 42%)
PANDUIT
WIRF 1IN PRONIICTS A3%] 20%, 10%] A5%] PEMBERTON A5%]
ST DO TRCETEATE AT 33%) 20%) 10% 33% GRIFFITH & PEMBERTON! 33%)
STRNGARD CARBTE TIES AND CRBIE TE o 207 1% 9% GRIFFT B3
SCHNEIDER SQUARE D 1
WIREMOLD
RACEWAY AND PLUGMOLD 28% 20%) 15% 30% PEMBERTON 30%
PVC PIPE 529 20% NO BID 58%) PEMBERTON 58%
STEEL PIPE 1% 20%, NO BID 40% GRIFFITH 41%]
KLIEN
T00LS 36% 20% 15% 27%) GRIFFITH 36%
TESTERS AND ACCESSORIES 38%] 20% 15% 39% PEMBERTON 399
‘GREENLEE
T00LS 36% 20% 15% 30%) GRIFFITH 36%
TESTERS AND ACCESSORIES 36%) 20% 10% 39% PEMBERTON 399
CANTEX
WEATHERPROOF COVERS 47% 25% NO BID 72% PEMBERTON 723
PVC CONDUIT. FITTINGS AND STRAPS b6%, 25%, NO BID) 68%, PEMBERTON 68%)
MULLBERRY
WEATHERPROOF BOXES AND COVERS 56% 18%| NO BID 58% PEMBERTON 58%)
STEEL CITY
METAL BOXES. COVERS AND FITTINGS 77%,| 18%, 25%, 79%, PEMBERTON 79%)
QUAZITE
UNDERGROUND PULL BOXES 31%) 18% NO BID 33% PEMBERTON 33%
INTERMATIC
TIMERS, PHOTO CONTROLS 35% 20% 15% 38% PEMBERTON 38%
BRIDGEPORT
CONDUIT FITTINGS. EMT CONDUIT AND 61%)| 30%, 60%, 65%) PEMBERTON 65%)
ARLINGTON
CABLE CONNECTORS 51%)| 30%, NO BID 57%) PEMBERTON 57%)
CuLLY
ANCHORS AND FASTENFRS A2%] AN%| NO RID)| 70%] PEMBERTON 70%|
COOPER B LINE
PIPE AND CARIF ACCFSSORIFS A%, 30%, 25%, A42%, PEMBERTON 42%,
SIEMENS
PANEL BOARDS, CIRCUIT BREAKERS,
AEETY SMTCTES AND BEEAKER 56% 5% NO BID 58% PEMBERTON 58%
CUTLER HAMMER
PANEL BOARDS, CIRCUIT BREAKERS,
AFETY SWITCHES. AND BREAKER 64% 5% NO BID 65% PEMBERTON 65%|
‘GENERAL ELECTRIC
PANEL BOARDS, CIRCUIT BREAKERS,
SAFETY SWITCHES, AND BREAKER 57% 5% NO BID 55% GRIFFITH 57%
ENCLOSURES
SIMKAR
LIGHTING 57% 15% NO BID 58% PEMBERTON 58%
PROGRESS
LIGHTING 339 15% NO BID) 39%] PEMBERTON 39%
RAB
LIGHTING 46%) 20% 12% 45% GRIFFITH 467
SEAGULL
LIGHTING 37% 15% NO BID 36% GRIFFITH 37%
LITHONIA
LIGHTING 55% 20% NO BID) 44%] GRIFFITH 55%
PEMCO
LIGHTING 447 5% NO BID) 51%] PEMBERTON 51%
KENALL
LIGHTING 347 5% NO BID) 35% PEMBERTON 35%
HUBBELL
LIGHTING 57% 5% NO RID)| 57% GRIFFITH & PEMRFRTON S7%
GENERAL ELECTRIC
LIGHTING A7%) 5%, A5%) 50% GRAYBAR AS%]




